Shew, Tammz

From: Tim Kern <TKern@flintequipco.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2017 2:43 PM

To: Shew, Tammy

Subject: Re: additional purchase for ITB#16-100683-Open Cab Backhoe Loaders

Yes, we can honor the price.

TIM KERN
SALES REPRESENTATIVE
Flint Equipment Company

4500 Wendell Dr. SW
Atlanta, GA 30336

(O) 404.691.9445
(M) 404.472.7034
(F) 404.696.1170

tkern@flintequipco.com
On Mar 14, 2017, at 2:38 PM, Shew, Tammy <tgarmon@dekalbcountyga.gov> wrote:
Hi Tim,
This isn’t going to the BOC now until April 25", Can you still hold the price for an additional purchase?

Thanks,
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From: Shew, Tammy
Sent: Tuesday, January 03, 2017 12:50 PM



