

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	The McPherson Companies, Inc.	Dilmor Oil Co.	Brewer-Hendley Oil Co.	Boswell Oil Co.	Taylor Enterprises Inc.	Northeast Lubricants Ltd.	Lubrication Engineers Inc.
1	Fluid Transmission 55 gallon drums	\$5.53 per unit	\$7.86 per unit	\$8.12 per unit	\$8.50 per unit	No Answer	\$9.25 per unit	\$31.89 per unit
2	Fluid Transmission 1 Quart	\$1.93 per unit	.95 per unit	\$2.79 per unit	\$2.95 per unit	No Answer	\$5.10 per unit	\$9.77 per unit
3	Fluid Transmission Synthetic (5 gallon)	\$12.36 per unit	\$8.21 per unit	\$8.91 per unit	\$18.50 per unit	No Answer	\$13.20 per unit	\$33.76 per unit
4	Fluid Transmission Synthetic (1 gallon)	\$12.56 per unit	\$3.80 per unit	\$11.16 per unit	\$18.50 per unit	No Answer	\$13.27 per unit	No Answer
5	Oil, Motor, 15W-40 with C14 (55 gallon drums)	\$6.40 per unit	\$6.62 per unit	\$6.67 per unit	\$6.65 per unit	No Answer	\$7.47 per unit	No Answer
6	Oil, Motor, 15W-40 with C14 (Bulk Delivery)	\$5.81 per unit	\$6.17 per unit	\$6.03 per unit	\$6.30 per unit	\$6.50 per unit	\$6.20 per unit	\$13.21 per unit
7	Oil, Motor, 15W-40 with C14, (1 gallon)	\$8.46 per unit	\$10.94 per unit	\$9.96 per unit	\$12.00 per unit	\$12.90 per unit	\$14.01 per unit	\$17.28 per unit
8	Oil, Motor, 5W-30, Synthetic Dexos, (Bulk)	\$6.64 per unit	\$7.47 per unit	\$6.87 per unit	\$7.50 per unit	\$6.90 per unit	\$7.20 per unit	\$32.49 per unit
9	Oil, Motor, 5W-30, Synthetic Dexos, M (1 Qt.)	\$2.34 per unit	\$2.94 per unit	\$2.79 per unit	\$2.40 per unit	\$4.95 per unit	\$5.21 per unit	\$9.80 per unit
10	Oil, Lubricant, Multi-Purpose Gear, SAE 75W-90, GL-5/MT-1, 120 lb. drums	\$1.99 per unit	\$1.58 per unit	\$2.00 per unit	\$2.35 per unit	\$4.25 per unit	\$2.57 per unit	\$13.82 per unit
11	Grease, Chassis Lubrication, EP-2, 400 lb. drums	\$1.62 per unit	\$1.74 per unit	\$1.69 per unit	\$2.30 per unit	\$2.31 per unit	\$2.44 per unit	\$7.61 per unit
12	Grease, Chassis Lubrication, EP-2, 120 lb. drums	\$1.72 per unit	\$1.93 per unit	\$1.975 per unit	\$2.40 per unit	\$2.34 per unit	\$2.58 per unit	\$7.81 per unit
13	Grease, Chassis Lubrication, MP-2, 400 lb. drums	\$3.10 per unit	\$1.48 per unit	\$1.985 per unit	\$2.00 per unit	\$3.57 per unit	\$2.28 per unit	\$5.65 per unit
14	Grease, Chassis Lubrication, MP-2, 120 lb. drums	\$3.18 per unit	\$1.64 per unit	\$2.115 per unit	\$2.05 per unit	\$3.57 per unit	\$2.46 per unit	\$5.84 per unit

Witness Signature: _____

Agent Signature: _____

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	The McPherson Companies, Inc.	Dilmor Oil Co.	Brewer-Hendley Oil Co.	Boswell Oil Co.	Taylor Enterprises Inc.	Northeast Lubricants Ltd.	Lubrication Engineers Inc.
15	Oil Transmission, SAE 10W CF, 5 gallon drums	\$8.85 per unit	\$7.60 per unit	\$8.99 per unit	\$9.75 per unit	\$10.50 per unit	\$10.74 per unit	No Answer
16	Fluid, Universal Tractor, 5 gallon drums	\$6.35 per unit	\$6.44 per unit	\$6.13 per unit	\$7.85 per unit	\$7.20 per unit	\$9.70 per unit	\$31.11 per unit
17	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 68AW, Low Temp., 5 gallon drums	\$5.95 per unit	\$14.85 per unit	\$5.57 per unit	\$4.95 per unit	\$16.10 per unit	\$8.85 per unit	\$28.79 per unit
18	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46AW, High Temp., (Bulk)	\$4.81 per unit	\$4.89 per unit	\$4.23 per unit	\$4.40 per unit	\$8.95 per unit	\$4.50 per unit	\$26.26 per unit
19	Fluid, Hydraulic, ISO 46AW, High Temp., 55 gallon drums	\$4.26 per unit	\$5.44 per unit	\$4.60 per unit	\$5.00 per unit	\$9.60 per unit	\$5.68 per unit	\$27.54 per unit
20	Gear Oil, HD 80W90, (120 lb. drums)	\$1.15 per unit	\$1.12 per unit	\$1.185 per unit	\$1.96 per unit	\$2.15 per unit	\$1.48 per unit	\$5.98 per unit
21	Grease, special with selected mineral oil, 12% modified bentonite thickener and extreme pressure additives, dropping pt. to 500 Fl, 35 lb. pails	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$65.00 per unit	\$129.95 per unit	\$142.06 per unit	\$256.74 per unit
22	Oil, Light, 55 gallon drums, LE Ind./Turbine Oil LE 4932 or equal	\$5.82 per unit	\$5.92 per unit	No Bid	\$12.55 per unit	\$9.40 per unit	\$5.87 per unit	\$20.43 per unit
23	Oil, Light, 55 gallon drums, LE Ind. Turbine Oil LE 6406 or equal	\$8.33 per unit	\$15.55 per unit	No Bid	\$16.25 per unit	\$13.90 per unit	\$40.76 per unit	\$28.39 per unit
24	Oil, Cylinder (Multi-purpose) 55 gallon drums	\$15.32 per unit	\$15.28 per unit	No Bid	\$11.00 per unit	\$10.00 per unit	\$7.56 per unit	\$43.18 per unit
25	Grease, cartridges, (40 per case) Lubrication Engineers LE 1275 Grease or equal	No Bid	\$90.30 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$30.00 per unit	No Bid	\$147.15 per unit

Witness Signature: _____

Agent Signature: _____

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	The McPherson Companies, Inc.	Dilmor Oil Co.	Brewer-Hendley Oil Co.	Boswell Oil Co.	Taylor Enterprises Inc.	Northeast Lubricants Ltd.	Lubrication Engineers Inc.
26	Vanguard Synthetic Lubricant for Air Compressors & Vacuum Pumps, 2 Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$53.65 per unit	No Bid	No Answer
27	Grease, cartridges, (40 per case) . Lubrication Engineers LE 3752 Grease or equal	No Bid	\$90.30 per unit	No Bid	\$96.60 per unit	\$30.00 per unit	\$148.47 per unit	\$379.66 per unit
28	Grease, gear compound, EP 320, 55 gallon drums, high temp. (LE 606 or equal)	No Bid	\$15.54 per unit	No Bid	\$12.00 per unit	\$10.10 per unit	\$7.85 per unit	\$43.18 per unit
29	Oil, gear Lube, 55 gallon drums, LE 1608 or equal	No Bid	\$17.02 per unit	No Bid	\$12.80 per unit	\$17.95 per unit	\$17.86 per unit	\$43.18 per unit
30	Oil, Hydraulic, ISO 46, 55 gallon drums, high temp, multi-purpose (LE or equal)	No Bid	\$5.92 per unit	No Bid	\$5.00 per unit	\$9.40 per unit	\$5.86 per unit	\$20.43 per unit
31	Oil, SAE 30, non-detergent, 55 gallon drums (LE or equal)	No Bid	\$13.39 per unit	No Bid	\$10.50 per unit	\$13.40 per unit	\$9.87 per unit	\$25.39 per unit
32	Oil, Engine, 55 gallon drums (LE 8800 or equal)	No Bid	\$6.62 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.95 per unit	\$7.47 per unit	\$21.63 per unit
33	Lubricant, gear (LE 9460 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.00 per unit	\$34.45 per unit	\$25.45 per unit	\$68.10 per unit
34	Lubricant, Air Compressor, 55 gallon drums (LE 6803 or equal)	No Bid	\$13.75 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.55 per unit	No Bid	\$33.81 per unit
35	Lubricant, Multi-Purpose Gear Oil, 55 gallon drums (LE 1604 or equal)	No Bid	\$15.28 per unit	No Bid	\$11.78 per unit	No Answer	\$7.42 per unit	\$5.94 per unit

Witness Signature: _____

Agent Signature: _____

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	The McPherson Companies, Inc.	Dilmor Oil Co.	Brewer-Hendley Oil Co.	Boswell Oil Co.	Taylor Enterprises Inc.	Northeast Lubricants Ltd.	Lubrication Engineers Inc.
36	Lubricant: Air Compressor, 5-gallon drums, S Rotary Compressor Oil SAE 15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Answer	No Bid	\$27.76 per unit
37	Oil, Special Turbine, Inhibited, (in 55 gallon); Industrial/Turbine Oil ISO VG 150/SAE 30 (only LE oil)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Answer	\$29.26 per unit	\$21.63 per unit
38	Oil, Light Spindle, 5 gallon buckets, ISO-32, SAE 10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Answer	\$16.04 per unit	\$69.79 per unit
39	Oil, Special Turbine, (55 gallon drums); Industrial/Turbine Oil ISO VG 150/SAE 30 (Only LE)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00 per unit	No Answer	\$31.11 per unit	\$28.39 per unit
40	Oil, Turbine, Inhibited, Food Grade, Anti foaming (5 gallon buckets) Industrial/Turbine Oil ISO VG 220	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$54.50 per unit	No Bid	\$51.80 per unit
41	Oil, Engine, Diesel, 55 gallon drums, 15W-40	No Bid	\$6.62 per unit	No Bid	\$7.00 per unit	\$7.95 per unit	\$7.47 per unit	\$13.76 per unit
42	Lube, Special Gear Compound for Cotta Gearbox, (5 Gallon Buckets), Anti foaming SAE 85W-140	No Bid	9.20 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.00 per unit	\$11.91 per unit	\$42.55 per unit
43	Oil, Turbine, Inhibited, Food Grade, Anti foaming (5 gallon buckets) Industrial/Turbine Oil ISO VG 150	38.75 per unit	20.83 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$46.00 per unit	No Bid	\$48.99 per unit
44	Oil, gear & bearing, 5 gallon buckets, Mobil SHC 626	36.50 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.30 per unit	No Bid	\$48.99 per unit

Witness Signature: _____

Agent Signature: _____

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	The McPherson Companies, Inc.	Dilmor Oil Co.	Brewer-Hendley Oil Co.	Boswell Oil Co.	Taylor Enterprises Inc.	Northeast Lubricants Ltd.	Lubrication Engineers Inc.
45	Chevron NLGEWAR Compound 220 Food Grade 5 gallon Buckets	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$54.75 per unit	No Bid	\$51.80 per unit
46	Oil, Compressor, (5 gallon buckets)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.25 per unit	\$44.20 per unit	\$35.95 per unit
47	Glycerin, Industrial grade (1 gallon cans)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Answer	No Bid	No Answer
48	Oil, Lubricant, Shell Rotella, SAE 15W-40, 100% CNG & LNG Oil, 400 lb. drums	6.58 per unit	\$14.86 per unit	\$11.76 per unit	\$11.75 per unit	\$13.95 per unit	\$2.30 per unit	\$26.66 per unit
49	Oil, Hydraulic, 55 gallon drums	No Bid	\$15.83 per unit	No Bid	\$17.50 per unit	\$17.95 per unit	\$41.60 per unit	\$42.00 per unit
50	Glycerin, Industrial grade (5 gallon cans)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Answer	No Bid	No Answer
51	Oil, Medium, 55 gallon drums (LE 4934 or equal)	\$5.46 per unit	\$5.92 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.60 per unit	\$6.11 per unit	\$20.43 per unit
52	Oil, Heavy, 55 gallon drums (LE 6405 or equal)	\$5.25 per unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.00 per unit	\$15.00 per unit	\$37.77 per unit	\$28.39 per unit
53	Oil, Engine, 55 gallon drums (LE 8420 or equal)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Answer	No Bid	\$25.39 per unit
Number of Solicitations Received: 7								

Recommended Vendors:

Dilmor Oil Company
 1951 W. Darlington St.
 Florence, SC 29501

Taylor Enterprises, Inc.
 1166 Logan Circle N.W.
 Atlanta, GA 30318

The McPherson Companies, Inc.
 5051 Cardinal Street
 Trussville, AL 35173

Lubrication Engineers, Inc.
 1919 E. Tulsa
 Wichita, KS 67216

Witness Signature: 
 Agent Signature: 