

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Bidder	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	Nextire	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
1	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P205/65R15	General Allmax, Ply 4, Tread 10	Gen. Allmax RT43 #1549300000 Tread 10	Firestone RR710, Tread 11	No Bid	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, Tread 9	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 9T, Tread 9	FST Champion Fuel Fighter, Ply 6, Tread 10	Fuzion, Ply 6, Tread 10	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, Tread 9	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, Tread 9
1a	Price Per Unit (50 Units)	\$63.00	\$59.73	\$67.00	No Bid	\$54.40	\$56.64	\$63.54	\$60.56	\$61.00	\$56.64
1b	Total Amount	\$3,100.00	\$2,986.50	\$3,350.00	No Bid	\$2,720.00	\$2,832.00	\$3,177.00	\$3,028.00	\$3,060.00	\$2,832.00
2	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P205/75R15	Gen. Grabber AT2, Ply 4, Tread 14	Gen. Grabber AT2 #1546300000 Tread 14	Firestone Winterforce 2, Tread 12	No Bid	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, Tread 9	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 9T, Tread 9	Firestone Winterforce Ply 4, Tread 12	Fuzion, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, Tread 9	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 4, Tread 9
2a	Price Per Unit (30 Units)	\$88.00	\$85.74	\$88.00	No Bid	\$63.00	\$65.85	\$85.34	\$71.35	\$70.00	\$65.85
2b	Total Amount	\$2,640.00	\$2,572.20	\$2,640.00	No Bid	\$1,890.00	\$1,975.50	\$2,560.20	\$2,140.50	\$2,100.00	\$1,975.50
3	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P215/60R15	General Allmax, Ply 4, Tread 11	Gen. Allmax RT43 #15495010000 Tread 11	BridgeStone Ecopia 422 Plus, Tread 10	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 10	No Bid	FST Champion Fuel Fighter, Ply 4, Tread 10	Fuzion, Ply 4, Tread 10	Sallun/Arrezzo, Ply 6, Tread 9	No Bid
3a	Price Per Unit (200 Units)	\$64.98	\$62.79	\$93.00	No Bid	\$58.00	No Bid	\$63.58	\$59.40	\$49.00	No Bid
3b	Total Amount	\$12,996.00	\$12,558.00	\$18,600.00	No Bid	\$11,600.00	No Bid	\$12,716.00	\$11,880.00	\$9,800.00	No Bid
4	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P215/60R16	General Allmax, Ply 4, Tread 11	Gen. Allmax RT43 #15497810000 Tread 11	Firestone RR710, Tread 10	No Bid	Kyleman/Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 9T, Tread 9	FST All Season Ply 4, Tread 12	Fuzion, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 6, Tread 9	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 4, Tread 9
4a	Price Per Unit (250 Units)	\$73.97	\$71.71	\$80.00	No Bid	\$59.00	\$65.00	\$72.60	\$63.11	\$70.00	\$65.00
4b	Total Amount	\$18,492.50	\$17,927.50	\$20,000.00	No Bid	\$14,750.00	\$16,250.00	\$18,150.00	\$15,777.50	\$17,000.00	\$1,225.00
5	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P215/70R14	General Allmax, Ply 4, Tread 12	Gen. Allmax RT43 #15495050000 Tread 12	Firestone Winterforce, Tread 13	No Bid	Cont. Allmax, Tread 12	No Bid	Firestone Winterforce, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Winterforce, Ply 4, Tread 12	Univoval Tiger AWF Tread 9	No Bid
5a	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$59.41	\$56.41	\$92.00	No Bid	\$58.00	No Bid	\$89.85	\$89.85	\$77.00	No Bid
5b	Total Amount	\$1,188.20	\$1,128.20	\$1,840.00	No Bid	\$1,160.00	No Bid	\$1,797.00	\$1,797.00	\$1,540.00	No Bid
6	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P215/70R15	General Allmax, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter #014910	Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter, Tread 11	No Bid	Ironman Hwy, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 9T, Tread 9	FST Champion Fuel Fighter, Ply 4, Tread 12	Fuzion, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 6, Tread 9	Goodyear Integrity, Ply 4, Tread 10
6a	Price Per Unit (30 Units)	\$64.51	\$59.21	\$59.21	No Bid	\$55.00	\$60.19	\$58.21	\$63.47	\$66.00	\$52.86
6b	Total Amount	\$1,935.30	\$1,776.30	\$1,776.30	No Bid	\$1,650.00	\$1,805.70	\$1,746.30	\$1,904.10	\$1,980.00	\$1,585.80
7	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P225/70R15	General Allmax, Ply 4, Tread 12	Gen. Allmax RT43 #15495060000 Tread 12	Firestone Dest. LE2, Tread 12	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Wrangler SDA, Ply 10S, Tread 11	Firestone Dest. LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Dest. LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler SDA, Ply 6, Tread 11	Goodyear Wrangler SDA, Ply 4, Tread 11
7a	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$73.95	\$70.95	\$88.53	No Bid	\$70.00	\$92.57	\$84.50	\$84.50	\$98.00	\$82.57
7b	Total Amount	\$1,479.00	\$1,419.00	\$1,770.60	No Bid	\$1,400.00	\$1,851.40	\$1,690.00	\$1,690.00	\$1,960.00	\$1,651.40
8	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P225/75R15	Powerking, Ply 8, Tread 10	Firestone Winterforce 2 UV #148419	Firestone Winterforce 2 UV #148419, Tread 13	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Wrangler LE2, Ply 4, Tread 11	Firestone Dest. LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Dest. LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler SDA, Ply 6, Tread 11	Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner AT, Ply 4, Tread 12
8a	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$55.00	\$113.00	\$113.00	No Bid	\$70.00	\$96.77	\$119.80	\$119.80	\$99.00	\$90.23
8b	Total Amount	\$1,100.00	\$2,260.00	\$2,260.00	No Bid	\$1,400.00	\$1,935.40	\$2,396.00	\$2,396.00	\$1,980.00	\$1,804.60
9	Brand Name & Tire Name OR # Ply and Tread Depth P235/70R15				No Bid						

Witness Signature: _____
Agent Signature: _____

BDC Award Approval Date: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Drive	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire, Inc.	Nextire	Goodyear Tires	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
9a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 12	Gen Altimax RT3J #1552710000 Tread 12	Firestone Dest AT, Tread 13	No Bid	Cont. Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 1025, Tread 11	Firestone Dest, LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Dest, LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 6, Tread 11	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 4, Tread 11
9b	Price Per Unit (100 Units)	\$76.00	\$74.77	\$79.00	No Bid	\$77.00	\$90.00	\$133.32	\$133.32	\$96.00	\$90.00
9c	Total Amount	\$7,600.00	\$7,477.00	\$9,900.00	No Bid	\$7,700.00	\$9,000.00	\$13,332.00	\$13,332.00	\$9,600.00	\$9,000.00
10	P235/75R15										
10a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	General HTS, Ply 4, Tread 12	Gen. Grabber HTS #04503120000 Tread 12	Firestone Dest, LE2 Tread 12	No Bid	Roadrunner, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Wrangler Radial, Ply 10585, Tread 13	Firestone Dest, LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Fuzion AT, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 6, Tread 13	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 4, Tread 11
10b	Price Per Unit (100 Units)	\$91.00	\$84.97	\$97.91	No Bid	\$68.00	\$65.70	\$100.21	\$64.90	\$70.00	\$90.00
10c	Total Amount	\$9,100.00	\$8,497.00	\$9,791.00	No Bid	\$6,800.00	\$6,570.00	\$10,021.00	\$6,490.00	\$7,000.00	\$9,000.00
11	P235/70R15										
11a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	General HTS, Ply 4, Tread 12	Gen. Grabber HTS60 #045064670000 Tread 12	Bridgestone Dueler H/L 422, Tread 10	No Bid	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 1001, Tread 9	FST All Season, Ply 4, Tread 12	Fuzion, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 6, Tread 13	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 4, Tread 10
11b	Price Per Unit (100 Units)	\$87.79	\$85.74	\$91.39	No Bid	\$76.00	\$78.00	\$91.52	\$75.64	\$84.00	\$78.00
11c	Total Amount	\$8,779.00	\$8,574.00	\$9,139.00	No Bid	\$7,600.00	\$7,800.00	\$9,152.00	\$7,564.00	\$8,400.00	\$7,800.00
12	P235/70R17										
12a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	General HTS, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Dest, LE2 #097776 Tread 13	Firestone Dest, LE2 #097776 Tread 13	No Bid	Goodyear Fortitude, Ply 4, Tread 11	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 1101, Tread 12	Firestone Dest, LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Dest, LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 8, Tread 12	Goodyear Fortitude HT, Ply 4, Tread 12
12b	Price Per Unit (400 Units)	\$107.79	\$103.02	\$103.02	No Bid	\$96.35	\$102.00	\$97.27	\$97.27	\$101.00	\$102.00
12c	Total Amount	\$43,116.00	\$41,208.00	\$41,208.00	No Bid	\$38,540.00	\$40,800.00	\$38,908.00	\$38,908.00	\$40,400.00	\$40,800.00
13	P235/65R17										
13a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	General HTS, Ply 4, Tread 12	Gen. Grabber HTS60 #04504840000 Tread 12	Firestone Dest AT, Tread 13	No Bid	Goodyear Fortitude, Ply 4, Tread 11	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 1101, Tread 11	Firestone Dest AT, Ply 4, Tread 12	Firestone Dest AT, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 6, Tread 11	Goodyear Fortitude HT, Ply 4, Tread 11
13b	Price Per Unit (50 Units)	\$115.00	\$112.77	\$117.00	No Bid	\$98.00	\$103.49	\$110.87	\$110.87	\$107.00	\$103.49
13c	Total Amount	\$5,750.00	\$5,638.50	\$5,850.00	No Bid	\$4,900.00	\$5,172.50	\$5,543.50	\$5,543.50	\$5,350.00	\$5,172.50
14	P255/70R15										
14a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	General HTS, Ply 4, Tread 12	Gen. Grabber HTS60 #0450420000 Tread 12	Firestone Dest, LE2 Tread 13	No Bid	Kyleman/Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Assurance CS Fuel Max, Ply 1111, Tread 11	Firestone Dest, LE2, Ply 4, Tread 12	Fuzion, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Assurance, Ply 6, Tread 11	Goodyear Assurance CS Fuel Max, Ply 4, Tread 11
14b	Price Per Unit (100 Units)	\$95.98	\$93.64	\$117.00	No Bid	\$89.00	\$106.00	\$113.10	\$84.58	\$109.00	\$106.00
14c	Total Amount	\$9,598.00	\$9,364.00	\$11,700.00	No Bid	\$8,900.00	\$10,600.00	\$11,310.00	\$8,458.00	\$10,900.00	\$10,600.00
15	P235/45R18										
15a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	General GMAX, Ply 4, Tread 11	Firestone All Season #00306 Tread 10	Firestone All Season #00306 Tread 10	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 94V, Tread 11	FST Firehawk AS, Ply 4, Tread 12	Fuzion Touring, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 6, Tread 11	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 4, Tread 11
15b	Price Per Unit (60 Units)	\$118.00	\$113.10	\$113.00	No Bid	\$78.00	\$100.00	\$107.17	\$75.00	\$105.00	\$100.00
15c	Total Amount	\$7,080.00	\$6,786.00	\$6,780.00	No Bid	\$4,680.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,430.20	\$4,500.00	\$6,300.00	\$6,000.00
16	L175/85R15										
16a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Gen. Grabber HD #04507140000 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	No Bid	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13
16b	Price Per Unit (100 Units)	\$103.86	\$99.44	\$102.67	No Bid	\$103.00	\$109.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$108.00	\$109.00
16c	Total Amount	\$10,386.00	\$9,944.00	\$10,267.00	No Bid	\$10,300.00	\$10,900.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,800.00	\$10,900.00
17	L1725/75R15										
17a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Gen. Grabber HD #04507160000 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	No Bid	Ironman AX, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Fuzion Touring, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 14
17b	Price Per Unit (150 Units)	\$108.94	\$104.65	\$111.00	No Bid	\$102.00	\$110.09	\$110.00	\$82.88	\$109.00	\$110.00
17c	Total Amount	\$16,341.00	\$15,697.50	\$16,650.00	No Bid	\$15,300.00	\$15,500.00	\$16,500.00	\$12,432.00	\$16,350.00	\$16,500.00

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BOC Award Approval Date: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Bid	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	Maxire	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
18	L1251/75R17 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Cooper HT5, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce #002774 Ply 10 Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	No Bid	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	No Bid	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Cooper HT3, Ply 10 Tread 12	No Bid
18B	Price Per Unit (30 Units)	\$133.00	\$109.46	\$108.46	No Bid	\$108.00	No Bid	\$125.74	\$125.74	\$149.00	No Bid
18C	Total Amount	\$3,990.00	\$3,283.80	\$3,253.80	No Bid	\$3,240.00	No Bid	\$3,772.20	\$3,772.20	\$4,470.00	No Bid
19	L1235/85R16 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Gen. Grabber HD #0450720000 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 15	No Bid	Ironman All-C, Ply 10, Tread 15	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT5, Ply 19, Tread 14
19B	Price Per Unit (150 Units)	\$144.77	\$110.77	\$114.39	No Bid	\$106.00	\$121.00	\$119.39	\$119.39	\$120.00	\$121.00
19C	Total Amount	\$17,215.50	\$16,615.50	\$17,158.50	No Bid	\$15,900.00	\$18,150.00	\$17,908.50	\$17,908.50	\$18,000.00	\$18,150.00
20	L1245/75R16 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Gen. Grabber HD #04507180000 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	No Bid	Gen. Grabber, 10 Ply Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 15	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13	Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 10, Tread 13
20B	Price Per Unit (600 Units)	\$106.22	\$105.16	\$109.50	No Bid	\$106.00	\$115.00	\$104.50	\$104.50	\$113.00	\$115.00
20C	Total Amount	\$63,762.00	\$63,096.00	\$65,700.00	No Bid	\$3,600.00	\$69,000.00	\$62,700.00	\$62,700.00	\$67,800.00	\$69,000.00
21	L1245/75R17 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Gen. Grabber HD #0450720000 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	No Bid	Ironman All City, Ply 10, Tread 15	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 15	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 14
21A	Price Per Unit (300 Units)	\$123.30	\$120.00	\$120.96	No Bid	\$115.00	\$140.00	\$110.96	\$110.96	\$139.00	\$140.00
21C	Total Amount	\$37,290.00	\$36,000.00	\$36,288.00	No Bid	\$34,500.00	\$42,000.00	\$33,288.00	\$33,288.00	\$41,700.00	\$42,000.00
22	L1255/70R17 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Gen. Grabber HD #04507220000 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 15	No Bid	Ky Lemans SUV, Ply 10, Tread 15	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 15	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Fuzion, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 15	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 15
22B	Price Per Unit (60 Units)	\$135.00	\$130.37	\$134.56	No Bid	\$119.00	\$160.00	\$127.56	\$109.36	\$160.00	\$160.00
22C	Total Amount	\$8,100.00	\$7,822.20	\$8,073.60	No Bid	\$7,140.00	\$9,600.00	\$7,653.60	\$6,561.60	\$9,600.00	\$9,600.00
23	L1255/75R16 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Gen. Grabber HD #04507190000 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 15	No Bid	Ky Lemans SUV, Ply 10, Tread 15	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Fuzion, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 10, Tread 14
23B	Price Per Unit (150 Units)	\$124.88	\$120.71	\$126.29	No Bid	\$117.00	\$145.00	\$121.29	\$97.22	\$145.00	\$145.00
23C	Total Amount	\$6,244.00	\$6,035.50	\$6,314.50	No Bid	\$5,550.00	\$7,250.00	\$6,064.50	\$4,561.00	\$7,250.00	\$7,250.00
24	L1275/70R18 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 16	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 16	No Bid	Ironman All City, Ply 10, Tread 15	Goodyear Transrunner AT, Ply 10, Tread 15	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Wrangler Trailrunner, Ply 10, Tread 15	Goodyear Transrunner AT, Ply 10, Tread 15
24B	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$151.00	\$145.65	\$145.65	No Bid	\$132.00	\$176.41	\$135.65	\$135.65	\$177.00	\$176.41
24C	Total Amount	\$3,020.00	\$2,913.00	\$2,913.00	No Bid	\$2,640.00	\$3,528.20	\$2,713.00	\$2,713.00	\$3,540.00	\$3,528.20
25	235/75R17.5 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Continental HT2, Ply 16, Tread 16	Toyo M1430 #520540 Ply 18, Tread 15	Continental HT2, Tread 16	No Bid	Ironman 1-109 HWY, Ply 16, Tread 16	Goodyear Regional RH5, Ply 16, Tread 16	CN HT2, Ply 16, Tread 15	CN HT2, Ply 16, Tread 15	Double Corn RT500, Load 1, Ply 18, Tread 16	Goodyear Regional RH5, Ply 16, Tread 18
25B	Price Per Unit (30 Units)	\$209.97	\$200.57	\$207.50	No Bid	\$139.00	\$275.00	\$215.00	\$215.00	\$165.00	\$225.00
25C	Total Amount	\$6,299.10	\$6,017.10	\$6,225.00	No Bid	\$4,170.00	\$8,250.00	\$6,450.00	\$6,450.00	\$4,950.00	\$8,250.00
26	245/70R19.5 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Continental HS3, Ply 14, Tread 18	Toyo M143 #562020 Ply 16, Tread 16	Firestone F5560 Plus, Tread 17	No Bid	Ironman 1-109 HWY, Ply 16, Tread 16	Kelly Armored RSA, Tread 16	FST F5560 Ply 14, Tread 17	CN Hybrid HS3, Tread 17	Double Corn RT600, Load 1, Ply 14, Tread 16	No Bid
26B	Price Per Unit (10 Units)	\$249.00	\$184.18	\$250.50	No Bid	\$157.00	\$190.00	\$212.99	\$219.00	\$170.00	No Bid
26C	Total Amount	\$2,490.00	\$1,841.80	\$2,505.00	No Bid	\$1,570.00	\$1,900.00	\$2,129.90	\$2,190.00	\$1,700.00	No Bid
27	255/70R22.5 Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Continental HT2, Ply 16, Tread 16	Toyo M1430 #520540 Ply 18, Tread 15	Continental HT2, Tread 16	No Bid	Ironman 1-109 HWY, Ply 16, Tread 16	Goodyear Regional RH5, Ply 16, Tread 16	CN HT2, Ply 16, Tread 15	CN HT2, Ply 16, Tread 15	Double Corn RT500, Load 1, Ply 18, Tread 16	Goodyear Regional RH5, Ply 16, Tread 18

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Bidder	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&K Tire Inc	Nextite	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
27a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply 16 & Tread Depth	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	Toyo M122 #548150 Ply 16 Tread 17	Continental HSR2, Tread 18	No Bid	Ironman 1.181 Hwy, Ply 16, Tread 18	Goodyear Marathon RSA, Tread 18	FST F5560 Ply 16, Tread 21	CN HSR2 SA, Tread 21	Double Con RT500, Tread 16	No Bid
27b	Price Per Unit (90 Units)	\$334.97	\$156.50	\$232.50	No Bid	\$165.00	\$265.00	\$249.50	\$225.00	\$205.00	No Bid
27c	Total Amount	\$181,797.76	\$12,225.00	\$18,600.00	No Bid	\$13,200.00	\$21,200.00	\$19,960.00	\$18,000.00	\$16,400.00	No Bid
28a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply and Tread Depth	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	Toyo M170 #546000 Ply 16 Tread 19	Firestone F5560 Plus, Ply 16, Tread 19	No Bid	Goodyear Marathon RSS, Ply 16, Tread 18	Goodyear Marathon RSA, Ply 16 Tread 22	FST F5560 Ply 16, Tread 21	CN HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 21	Goodyear Marathon RSA, Ply 16, Tread 22	No Bid
28b	Price Per Unit (300 Units)	\$302.93	\$205.86	\$275.50	No Bid	\$251.00	\$260.00	\$288.00	\$303.00	\$276.00	No Bid
28c	Total Amount	\$90,879.90	\$41,758.00	\$82,650.00	No Bid	\$75,300.00	\$78,000.00	\$86,400.00	\$90,900.00	\$82,800.00	No Bid
29a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply & Tread Depth	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	Continental HSR2 #0512088 Ply 16 Tread 23	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	No Bid	Goodyear Marathon RSA, Ply 16 Tread 22	Goodyear Marathon RSA, Ply 16 Tread 22	FST F5560 Ply 16, Tread 21	CN HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 21	Goodyear Marathon RSA, Ply 16, Tread 22	No Bid
29b	Price Per Unit (1000 Units)	\$279.11	\$277.50	\$277.50	No Bid	\$320.00	\$335.00	\$341.00	\$270.00	\$324.00	No Bid
29c	Total Amount	\$279,110.00	\$277,500.00	\$277,500.00	No Bid	\$320,000.00	\$325,000.00	\$341,000.00	\$270,000.00	\$324,000.00	No Bid
30a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply & Tread Depth	Continental HSC, Ply 16, Tread 24	Firestone T819 #157368 Ply 16 Tread 20	Firestone T819 #157368 Ply 16 Tread 20	No Bid	Goodyear Workhorse H5A, Ply 16, Tread 22	Goodyear Workhorse H5A, Ply 16, Tread 22	Firestone Perf T819, Ply 16, Tread 23	Firestone Perf T819, Ply 16, Tread 21	Goodyear Workhorse RSA, Ply 16, Tread 22	No Bid
30b	Price Per Unit (250 Units)	\$395.00	\$377.50	\$377.50	No Bid	\$389.00	\$390.92	\$390.00	\$390.00	\$391.00	No Bid
30c	Total Amount	\$98,750.00	\$94,375.00	\$94,375.00	No Bid	\$97,250.00	\$97,230.00	\$97,500.00	\$97,500.00	\$97,750.00	No Bid
31a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply & Tread Depth	Continental HAJ, Ply 20, Tread 24	Toyo M153 #500040 Ply 20 Tread 26	General Grabber OA, Ply 20, Tread 24	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 20, Tread 22	Goodyear G291, Ply 18(1), Tread 18	BridgeStone M870, Ply 20, Tread 23	CN HAJ3 City Service, Ply L, Tread 20	Goodyear G291, Ply 18, Tread 18	No Bid
31b	Price Per Unit (500 Units)	\$329.13	\$316.72	\$327.50	No Bid	\$310.00	\$410.00	\$451.45	\$329.00	\$410.00	No Bid
31c	Total Amount	\$164,565.00	\$158,360.00	\$163,750.00	No Bid	\$155,000.00	\$205,000.00	\$225,725.00	\$164,500.00	\$205,000.00	No Bid
32a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply & Tread Depth	Continental HRL, Ply 20, Tread 23	Toyo M149 #562010 Ply 20 Tread 20	General Grabber OA, Ply 24, Tread 21	No Bid	Duratrac A/P or Dunlop, Ply 20, Tread 21	Dunlop SP231, Tread 20	FST F5818 Ply 20, Tread 22	General Grabber, Tread 22	Doublecon 900 Tread 22	No Bid
32b	Price Per Unit (600 Units)	\$304.36	\$359.96	\$378.50	No Bid	Duratrac (\$391.00) Dunlop (\$421.00)	\$444.00	\$453.87	\$371.00	\$338.00	No Bid
32c	Total Amount	\$242,616.00	\$215,976.00	\$227,100.00	No Bid	(\$234,600.00) Dunlop (\$258,600.00)	\$266,400.00	\$272,322.00	\$222,600.00	\$202,800.00	No Bid
33a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL # Ply 20 & Tread Depth	Continental HRL, Ply 20, Tread 23	Toyo M149 #562090 Ply 20 Tread 21	General Grabber OA, Ply 20, Tread 21	No Bid	Ironman or Dunlop, Tread 23	Dunlop SP231, Tread 21	FST F5818 Ply 20, Tread 22	General Grabber, Tread 22	Doublecon 900 Tread 22	No Bid
33b	Price Per Unit (400 Units)	\$474.36	\$346.98	\$411.50	No Bid	Ironman (\$428.00) Dunlop (\$459.00)	\$485.00	\$495.00	\$405.00	\$410.00	No Bid
33c	Total Amount	\$189,744.00	\$138,792.00	\$164,600.00	No Bid	(\$171,200.00) Dunlop (\$183,600.00)	\$194,000.00	\$198,000.00	\$162,000.00	\$164,000.00	No Bid
34a	Range Ply 10 & Tread Depth	Harvest King, Load E, Tread 16	Gladitor F-3 #GL1594931164 Ply 12 Tread 11	Gladitor F-3 #GL1594931164 Load F, Ply 12 Tread 11	No Bid	Herc F3, Load F, Ply 12, Tread 17	Goodyear Laborer, Load E, Tread 10	Harvest King, Load E, Tread 14	Harvest King Load E, Tread 14	Nizam M5900, Ply 12, Tread 17/22	No Bid
34b	Price Per Unit (50 Units)	\$98.51	\$84.59	\$84.59	No Bid	\$139.00	\$152.00	\$115.25	\$115.25	\$149.18	No Bid

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Beat Drive	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc	Nestle	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
34C	Total Amount	\$4,925.50	\$4,229.50	\$4,229.50	No Bid	\$6,950.00	\$7,600.00	\$5,762.50	\$5,762.50	\$7,459.00	No Bid
35	12x16-5 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Load Range-Ply 10 & Tread Depth		Gladiator Skid Steer #GL1597122654 Load F, Ply 12 Tread 19	Gladiator Skid Steer #GL1597122654 Load F, Ply 12 Tread 19	No Bid	Carlisle Trac Chief, Load E, Tread 23	Goodyear American Miner Skid Steer, Load F12, Ply 12, Tread 40	Poweking Super, Load E, Ply 10, Tread 14	Poweking Super, Load E, Ply 10, Tread 14	Maxam H5916, Ply 10, Tread 23/32	No Bid
35D	Price Per Unit (100 Units)	\$406.43	\$97.38	\$97.38	No Bid	\$134.00	\$172.00	\$129.99	\$129.99	\$144.55	No Bid
35C	Total Amount	\$10,643.00	\$9,738.00	\$9,738.00	No Bid	\$13,400.00	\$17,200.00	\$12,999.00	\$12,999.00	\$14,455.00	No Bid
36	14x17-5 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Ply 16 & Tread Depth		Maxam H5907 Skid Steer #MAX60702 Tread 46	Maxam H5907 Skid Steer #MAX60702 Tread 46	No Bid	Carlisle Trac Chief, Load G, Tread 25	No Bid	Poweking 227, Ply 16, Tread 14	Poweking 227, Ply 16, Tread 14	Maxam H5916, Tread 25/32	No Bid
36D	Price Per Unit (30 Units)	\$213.20	\$457.39	\$457.93	No Bid	\$249.00	No Bid	\$247.00	\$247.00	\$306.73	No Bid
36C	Total Amount	\$6,396.00	\$13,737.90	\$13,737.90	No Bid	\$7,470.00	No Bid	\$247.00	\$2,410.00	\$9,201.90	No Bid
37	14-5-75-16-1 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Ply 10 & Tread Depth		Maxam H5900 #MAX6002 Tread 22	Maxam H5900 #MAX6002 Tread 22	No Bid	Hercules, Tread 21	Goodyear Ind Torque, Tread 26	Galaxy Ind Rib, Ply 12, Tread 19	Galaxy Ind Rib, Ply 12, Tread 19	Maxam H5900, Tread 22	No Bid
37D	Price Per Unit (30 Units)	No Bid	\$250.73	\$250.73	No Bid	\$277.00	\$397.00	\$269.91	\$269.91	\$283.67	No Bid
37C	Total Amount	No Bid	\$7,521.90	\$7,521.90	No Bid	\$8,310.00	\$11,910.00	\$8,097.30	\$8,097.30	\$8,510.10	No Bid
38	17-5x25 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Load Range-Ply 12 & Tread E-3/L-3		Agdura 2160 #100135, Load H	Agdura 2160 #100135, Load H, Ply 16	No Bid	Goodyear GRL DL3A, Load OTR	Goodyear GRL DL3A #2	Maxam 913, Load F, Ply 12, Tread 34	Maxam 913, Load F, Ply 12, Tread 34	Maxam H5913, Load H, Ply 16	No Bid
38B	Price Per Unit (3 Units)	No Bid	\$460.10	\$460.10	No Bid	\$650.00	\$650.00	\$625.56	\$625.56	\$738.42	No Bid
38C	Total Amount	No Bid	\$1,380.50	\$1,380.50	No Bid	\$1,950.00	\$1,950.00	\$1,877.80	\$1,877.80	\$2,159.20	No Bid
39	19-5Lx24 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Load Range-Ply & Tread R-4		Galaxy EZ Rider #GAL200039, Load F, Ply 12	Galaxy EZ Rider #GAL200039, Load F, Ply 12	No Bid	Goodyear American Backhoe, Load OTR	Goodyear American Backhoe 34, Ply 34	Galaxy EZ Rider Ply 12, Tread 34	Galaxy EZ Rider Ply 12, Tread 34	Titan RA, Load F, Ply 12	No Bid
39B	Price Per Unit (14 Units)	\$533.05	\$130.58	\$330.58	No Bid	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$389.61	\$389.61	\$480.52	No Bid
39C	Total Amount	\$7,462.70	\$4,628.12	\$4,628.12	No Bid	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$5,454.54	\$5,454.54	\$6,727.28	No Bid
40	20-5Rx25 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Load Range, Ply 20 & Tread E-3		Maxam H5300 #MAX03203, Load 193, Tread 2	Maxam H5300 #MAX03203, Load 193, Tread 2	No Bid	Goodyear GRL DL3A, Load OTR	Goodyear GRL DL3A #6	Maxam H5300, Load L, Tread 59	Maxam H5300, Tread 59	Maxam H5301, Load 2 star	No Bid
40B	Price Per Unit (10 Units)	\$1,099.00	\$1,056.37	\$1,056.37	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,150.00	\$1,150.00	\$1,332.63	No Bid
40C	Total Amount	\$10,990.00	\$10,563.70	\$10,563.70	No Bid	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$11,500.00	\$11,500.00	\$13,326.30	No Bid
41	21L-24 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Ply 16 & Tread Depth		Friction All Traction Utility #32727, Tread R-4	Friction All Traction Utility #32727, Tread R-4	No Bid	Goodyear American Backhoe	No Bid	Galaxy EZ Rider Ply 12, Tread 35	Galaxy EZ Rider Ply 12, Tread 35	Titan RA, Load F, Ply 12, Tread 35	No Bid
41B	Price Per Unit (10 Units)	No Bid	\$833.50	\$833.50	No Bid	\$630.00	No Bid	\$540.46	\$540.46	\$643.48	No Bid
41C	Total Amount	No Bid	\$16,670.00	\$16,670.00	No Bid	\$12,600.00	No Bid	\$10,809.20	\$10,809.20	\$12,849.00	No Bid
42	23-5Rx25 Brand Name & tire Name OPL & Load Range, Ply 20 & Tread E-3		Maxam H5300 #MAX031204, Load 201, Ply 2	Maxam H5300 #MAX031204, Load 201, Ply 2	No Bid	Goodyear GRL DL3A, Load OTR	Goodyear GRL DL3A #40	Maxam H5300, Load L, Tread 63	Maxam H5300, Tread 63	Maxam H5301, Load 2 star	No Bid
42B	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$1,413.39	\$1,384.17	\$1,384.17	No Bid	\$1,550.00	\$1,550.00	\$1,555.00	\$1,555.00	\$1,802.86	No Bid
42C	Total Amount	\$28,267.86	\$27,683.40	\$27,683.40	No Bid	\$31,000.00	\$31,000.00	\$31,100.00	\$31,100.00	\$36,057.20	No Bid
43	29-5Rx25				No Bid						No Bid

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Bid	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&B Tire Inc.	Nextie	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
43a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 8 Tread Depth: E 3	Powerking XRT, Load 2-	Maxam MS300 #MAX301247, Ply 2	Maxam MS300 #MAX31247, Load 216, Ply 2	No Bid	Goodyear RTB, Load OTR	Goodyear RTB, Ply 2 Load, Tread 13	Maxam MS300, Ply 20, Tread 74	Maxam MS300, Ply 20, Tread 74	Maxam MS301, Load 2 star	No Bid
43b	PRICE PER UNIT (10 UNITS)	\$2,913.30	\$1,616.17	\$2,606.17	No Bid	\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00	\$2,695.00	\$2,695.00	\$3,549.28	No Bid
43c	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$29,133.00	\$16,161.70	\$26,061.70	No Bid	\$48,000.00	\$48,000.00	\$26,950.00	\$26,950.00	\$35,492.80	No Bid
44	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 8 Tread	Harvest King, Load B, 4 Ply, Tread Turf	Carlisle Multi-Trac #CA574351, Load B, Ply 4	Carlisle Multi-Trac #CA574351, Load B, Ply 4	No Bid	Carlisle Multi-Trac, Ply 4, Tread 7	Kenda Super Turf, Ply 6, Tread 10	Hankook, Ply 4, Tread 10	Hankook, Ply 4, Tread 10	Wanling Powerking, Load 4, Ply 4, Tread 8/32	No Bid
44a	PRICE PER UNIT (20 UNITS)	\$35.49	\$38.80	\$38.80	No Bid	\$38.00	\$73.00	\$31.40	\$31.40	\$29.00	No Bid
44b	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$509.80	\$776.00	\$776.00	No Bid	\$1,160.00	\$1,460.00	\$628.00	\$628.00	\$580.00	No Bid
45	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 8 Tread	Super Turf, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 6	Gladiator Turf Master, #GL1548708808 Load B, Ply 4	Gladiator Turf Master, #GL1548708808 Load B, Ply 4	No Bid	Herz/Carlisle, Ply 4	Super Turf, Ply 6, Tread 10	Powerking, Ply 4, Tread 10	Powerking, Ply 4, Tread 10	Nanling Powerking, Load 4, Ply 4, Tread 8/32	No Bid
45a	PRICE PER UNIT (10 UNITS)	\$35.56	\$19.46	\$19.46	No Bid	\$39.00	\$78.00	\$32.35	\$32.35	\$33.00	No Bid
45b	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$355.60	\$194.60	\$194.60	No Bid	\$390.00	\$780.00	\$323.50	\$323.50	\$330.00	No Bid
46	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 8 Tread	Turf, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 12	Carlisle #CAS114091, Load B, Ply 4	Gladiator Turf Master, #GL1548701213 Load B, Ply 4	No Bid	Carlisle T SAV, Ply 4, Tread 12	Carlisle Turf Master, Load 16, Ply 10, Tread 10	Deestone, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 12	Deestone, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 12	Hankook Powerking, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 8	No Bid
46a	PRICE PER UNIT (50 UNITS)	\$47.22	\$28.64	\$28.64	No Bid	\$69.00	\$91.00	\$65.88	\$65.88	\$66.00	No Bid
46b	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$2,361.50	\$1,432.00	\$1,432.00	No Bid	\$3,450.00	\$4,550.00	\$3,294.00	\$3,294.00	\$3,300.00	No Bid
47	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 8 Tread	Turf, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 12	Carlisle #CAS114091, Load B, Ply 4	Carlisle #CAS114091, Load B, Ply 4	No Bid	Carlisle or Hiron, Ply 4, Tread 12	Turf Master, Load 16, Ply 10, Tread 10	Powerking, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 12	Powerking, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 12	Powerking, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 8	No Bid
47a	PRICE PER UNIT (50 UNITS)	\$55.58	\$75.89	\$75.89	No Bid	Carlisle (\$89.00) Hiron (\$3450.00)	\$81.00	\$55.80	\$55.80	\$60.00	No Bid
47b	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$2,779.00	\$3,794.50	\$3,794.50	No Bid	Carlisle (\$890.00) Hiron (\$3450.00)	\$4,050.00	\$2,790.00	\$2,790.00	\$3,000.00	No Bid
48	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 10 & Tread	Powerking, Load E, Ply 10, Tread 25	Galaxy Super Trencher #GAL160174 Load D, Ply 8	Galaxy Super Trencher #GAL160174 Load D, Ply 8	No Bid	Trencher, Tread 29	No Bid	Soudal Traction Master, Load E, Tread 24	Soudal Traction Master, Load E, Tread 24	Thon, Load E, Tread 24	No Bid
48a	PRICE PER UNIT (10 UNITS)	\$187.37	\$148.32	\$148.32	No Bid	\$165.00	No Bid	\$184.51	\$184.51	\$209.00	No Bid
48b	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$1,873.70	\$1,483.20	\$1,483.20	No Bid	\$650.00	No Bid	\$1,845.10	\$1,845.10	\$2,090.00	No Bid
49	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 20 & Tread	No Bid	Primex Loghlonster #PR464518 Tread 69	Primex Loghlonster #PR464518 Tread 69	No Bid	No Bid	Goodyear American Log Slider, Load H, Ply 16, Tread 35	Primex Master, Load L, Tread 69	Primex Master, Load L, Tread 69	Maxam MS931, Ply 20, Tread 64/32	No Bid
49a	PRICE PER UNIT (10 UNITS)	No Bid	\$1,644.84	\$1,644.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,053.00	\$1,888.96	\$1,888.96	\$1,984.82	No Bid
49b	TOTAL AMOUNT	No Bid	\$16,448.40	\$16,448.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$20,530.00	\$18,889.60	\$18,889.60	\$19,848.20	No Bid
50	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 18 & Tread	Seminole ST719, Load 16, Tread 16	Diamond Back DB685 #DA1015086520 Load H, Tread 18	Diamond Back DB685 #DA1015086520 Load H, Tread 18	No Bid	Ironman, Load H, Tread 16	Goodyear G114, Load H, Tread 15	Sailun, Load H, Tread 15	Sailun, Load H, Tread 15	Doublecan 500, Load H, Tread 16/32	No Bid
50a	PRICE PER UNIT (500 UNITS)	\$148.17	\$80.56	\$80.56	No Bid	\$128.00	\$215.00	\$132.87	\$132.87	\$143.00	No Bid
50b	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$74,085.00	\$40,280.00	\$40,280.00	No Bid	\$64,000.00	\$107,500.00	\$66,435.00	\$66,435.00	\$71,500.00	No Bid
51	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 6 & Tread	TBC Towmax, Load C, Tread 9	Triangle TR653 #TR110146530010 Load C	Triangle TR653 #TR110146530010 Load C	No Bid	Hiron Hwy, Load C, Tread 8	No Bid	Primewell, Load C, Tread 10	Primewell, Load C, Tread 10	TBC Trailer, Load B, Ply B, Tread 13/32	No Bid
51a	PRICE PER UNIT (20 UNITS)	\$36.84	\$25.42	\$25.42	No Bid	\$49.00	No Bid	\$35.86	\$35.86	\$49.00	No Bid
51b	TOTAL AMOUNT	\$720.80	\$508.40	\$508.40	No Bid	\$980.00	No Bid	\$717.20	\$717.20	\$980.00	No Bid
52	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range: Ply 8 Tread	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Bidder	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	Maxima	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
52a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPI, Load Range-Ply 8, & Tread (10 Units)	TBC Towman, Load D, Tread 10	Triangle TR653 #TR104533000 Load C, Ply 8	Triangle TR653 #TR1104533000 Load C, Ply 6	No Bid	Hylon H180, Load C, Ply 6, Tread 8	Goodyear Endurance ST, Load 105N, Tread 8	Primewell, Load D, Tread 10	Primewell, Load D, Tread 10	TBC Trailer, Load D, Ply 6, Tread 13/32	No Bid
52b	Price Per Unit	\$55.17	\$32.80	\$32.80	No Bid	\$53.00	\$99.30	\$50.62	\$50.62	\$57.00	No Bid
52c	Total Amount	\$553.70	\$328.00	\$328.00	No Bid	\$530.00	\$993.00	\$506.20	\$506.20	\$570.00	No Bid
53	Brand Name & Tire Name OPI, Load Range-Ply 8a, Tread Depth	TBC Towman, Load D, Tread 10	Triangle TR653, Load D	Triangle TR653, Load D	No Bid	Hylon JX2, Load B, Tread 9	Goodyear Endurance ST, Load 105N, Tread 8	Primewell, Load D, Tread 10	Primewell, Load D, Tread 10	TBC Trailer, Load E, Ply 10, Tread 14/32	No Bid
53a	Price Per Unit	\$57.12	\$45.06	\$45.06	No Bid	\$76.00	\$109.96	\$59.46	\$59.46	\$67.00	No Bid
53b	Total Amount	\$571.20	\$450.60	\$450.60	No Bid	\$760.00	\$1,099.60	\$594.60	\$594.60	\$670.00	No Bid
54	Brand Name & Tire Name OPI, Load Range-Ply 6, Tread (10 Units)	TBC Trailguide, Load E, Ply 10P, Tread 10	Triangle TR653, Load F, Ply 12	Triangle TR653, Load F, Ply 12	No Bid	Hylon, Load E, Ply 10, Tread 11	Goodyear Endurance ST, Load 105N, Tread 8	Omnikargo, Load C, Ply 6, Tread 10	Omnikargo, Load C, Ply 6, Tread 10	Saltus Trailer, Load F, Ply 12, Tread 18/32	No Bid
54a	Price Per Unit	\$95.50	\$60.98	\$60.98	No Bid	\$99.00	\$124.72	\$97.67	\$97.67	\$107.00	No Bid
54b	Total Amount	\$955.00	\$609.80	\$609.80	No Bid	\$990.00	\$1,247.20	\$976.70	\$976.70	\$1,070.00	No Bid
55	Goodyear G-316 Hwy Duraseal or Equal, Load Range H, Ply 8, Tread Depth	Continental HD, Ply 16, Tread 11	Toyo M170, Ply 16, Tread 19	Firestone F5561, Ply 16, Tread 21	No Bid	Goodyear G-316 Hwy Duraseal or eq, Ply 16, Tread 12	Goodyear G-316 Hwy Duraseal or eq, FST F5560, Ply 16, Tread 21	General RA, Ply 16, Tread 21	General RA, Ply 16, Tread 21	Goodyear G-316 Hwy Duraseal or Equal, Load G, Ply 14, Tread 12/32	No Bid
55a	Price Per Unit	\$299.00	\$205.86	\$297.50	No Bid	\$128.00	\$338.00	\$288.00	\$239.00	\$338.00	No Bid
55b	Total Amount	\$2990.00	\$2058.60	\$2975.00	No Bid	\$1280.00	\$3380.00	\$2880.00	\$2390.00	\$3380.00	No Bid
56	Goodyear Endurance Hwy Duraseal or Equal, Load Range H, Ply 8, Tread Depth	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	Toyo M170, Ply 16, Tread 19	General RA, Ply 16, Tread 20	No Bid	Goodyear Endurance Hwy, eq, Ply 16, Tread 22	Goodyear Endurance NSA, Ply 16, Tread 22	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 21	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 21	Goodyear Endurance NSA, Ply 16, Tread 22/32	No Bid
56a	Price Per Unit	\$302.93	\$205.86	\$351.50	No Bid	\$321.00	\$330.00	\$288.00	\$303.00	\$330.00	No Bid
56b	Total Amount	\$3029.30	\$617.80	\$7545.00	No Bid	\$3210.00	\$990.00	\$864.00	\$909.00	\$990.00	No Bid
57	Goodyear Endurance Hwy Duraseal or Equal, Load Range H, Ply 8, Tread Depth	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 23	No Bid	Goodyear Endurance Hwy, eq, Ply 16, Tread 22	Goodyear Endurance NSA, Ply 16, Tread 22	FST 561, Ply 16, Tread 21	Continental HSR2, Ply 16, Tread 21	Goodyear Marathon NSA, Ply 16, Tread 22/32	No Bid
57a	Price Per Unit	\$279.11	\$277.50	\$277.50	No Bid	\$316.00	\$385.00	\$341.00	\$270.00	\$225.00	No Bid
57b	Total Amount	\$139555.00	\$138750.00	\$138750.00	No Bid	\$188000.00	\$192500.00	\$170500.00	\$135000.00	\$162500.00	No Bid
58	Firestone T-831 or Equal, Load Range H, Ply 8, Tread Depth	Continental HD, Ply 16, Tread 26	Toyo M170, Ply 16, Tread 19	Firestone T-831, Ply 16, Tread 31	No Bid	Goodyear Marathon NSA, Ply 15, Tread 22	Goodyear Workhorse NSA (X3 682), Ply 16, Tread 28	FST T-831, Ply 16, Tread 31	FST T-831, Ply 16, Tread 31	Goodyear Armormax HSD, Tread 33/32	No Bid
58a	Price Per Unit	\$292.14	\$306.71	\$419.50	No Bid	\$330.00	\$500.00	\$432.00	\$432.00	\$500.00	No Bid
58b	Total Amount	\$29214.00	\$30671.00	\$41950.00	No Bid	\$3300.00	\$5000.00	\$43200.00	\$43200.00	\$5000.00	No Bid
59	Brand Name & Tire Name OPI, Load Range-Ply 4, Tread Depth	General Grabber HD, Ply 4, Tread 12	General Grabber HT560, Load 5, Tread 12	Firestone Dist. LE2, Tread 13	No Bid	Goodyear Wrangler SA, Ply SL, Tread 13	Goodyear Wrangler SA, Ply 113R, Tread 12	Fusion AT, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 13	Wild Trail, Load B, Ply 4, Tread 13	Goodyear Wrangler SA, Load E, Ply 10, Tread 14/32	Goodyear Wrangler SA, Load 4, Ply 4, Tread 12
59a	Price Per Unit	\$109.33	\$108.43	\$115.00	No Bid	\$167.00	\$112.00	\$80.10	\$96.00	\$115.00	\$112.00
59b	Total Amount	\$16399.50	\$16264.50	\$17250.00	No Bid	\$1670.00	\$16800.00	\$12015.00	\$14400.00	\$17250.00	\$16800.00
60					No Bid						

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

Bid Award Approval Date: _____
 BOC Award Approval Date: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Bid	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	Nextire	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
60a	General Grabber HD, Ply 10, Tread 14	\$122.69	General Grabber HD, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Tread 14	No Bid	Firestone Transforce HT1, Ply 10, Tread 13	Goodyear Wrangler SRB, Ply 10 (119R), Tread 14	Firestone Transforce HT2, Ply 10, Tread 15	Wild Trail, Ply 10, Tread 15	Toyo H/T, Ply 10, Tread 15/32	Goodyear Wrangler SRB, Ply 8, Tread 14
60b	Price Per Unit (30 Units)	\$4,124.70	\$122.00	\$120.96	No Bid	\$119.00	\$140.00	\$115.96	\$91.00	\$145.00	\$140.00
60c	Total Amount	\$5,134.70	\$6,100.00	\$6,048.00	No Bid	\$5,990.00	\$7,000.00	\$5,798.00	\$4,550.00	\$7,250.00	\$7,000.00
61	Goodyear Duratrac or Eq., Load Range E, Ply 8, Tread Depth L1245/5R17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Goodyear Duratrac, Ply 10 (121Q), Tread 18	Firestone Transforce AT2, Ply 10, Tread 14	General Grabber HD, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Duratrac or Eq., Ply 10, Tread 16/32	Goodyear Duratrac or Eq., Ply 10, Tread 18
61a	Price Per Unit (50 Units)	No Bid	\$120.00	\$125.00	No Bid	\$165.00	\$170.00	\$120.20	\$120.00	\$169.00	\$170.00
61b	Total Amount	No Bid	\$6,000.00	\$6,250.00	No Bid	\$8,250.00	\$8,500.00	\$6,010.00	\$6,000.00	\$8,450.00	\$8,500.00
62	Goodyear Duratrac or Eq., Load Range E, Ply 8, Tread Depth L1285/5R18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Goodyear Duratrac, Ply 10 (121Q), Tread 18	Firestone Dest AT, Ply 10, Tread 14	Firestone Dest AT, Ply 10, Tread 14	Goodyear Duratrac or Eq., Ply 10, Tread 16/32	Goodyear Duratrac or Eq., Ply 10, Tread 18
62a	Price Per Unit (60 Units)	No Bid	\$144.17	\$153.00	No Bid	\$175.00	\$100.00	\$145.12	\$145.12	\$179.00	\$180.00
62b	Total Amount	No Bid	\$5,000.00	\$9,180.00	No Bid	\$10,500.00	\$11,600.00	\$8,707.20	\$8,707.20	\$10,740.00	\$10,800.00
63	Continental or Eq., Load Range G, Ply 8, Tread Depth 305/70R22.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Goodyear Endurance R5A, Load J, Ply 14, Tread 19	Continental HSR2 SA, Ply 14, Tread 21	Continental HSR2 SA, Ply 14, Tread 22	Goodyear Endurance R5A, Ply 14, Tread 22/32	No Bid
63a	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$340.11	\$130.50	\$130.50	No Bid	\$381.00	\$295.00	\$324.00	\$324.00	\$295.00	No Bid
63b	Total Amount	\$4,081.32	\$6,610.00	\$6,610.00	No Bid	\$5,680.00	\$5,900.00	\$6,480.00	\$6,480.00	\$5,900.00	No Bid
64	Michelin Pilot XZ Hwy Only, Load Range, Ply 8, Tread Depth	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$427.00	No Bid	Michelin Pilot XZA Hwy Only, Load H, Ply 15, Tread 21	Michelin Pilot XZA Hwy Only, Load H, Ply 15, Tread 21	Michelin Pilot XZ Hwy Only, Load H, Ply 15, Tread 22/32	No Bid
64b	Price Per Unit (25 Units)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$427.00	No Bid	\$580.00	\$580.00	\$650.92	No Bid
64c	Total Amount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10,675.00	No Bid	\$14,500.00	\$14,500.00	\$16,273.00	No Bid
65	Continental or Eq., Load Range G, Ply 8, Tread Depth 315/80R22.5	\$440.00	\$277.59	\$427.50	No Bid	\$399.00	No Bid	Continental Urban HA3, Load L, Tread 23	Continental Urban HA3, Load L, Ply 20, Tread 21	Michelin Intercity, Load L, Ply 20, Tread 22/32	No Bid
65a	Price Per Unit (10 Units)	\$4,400.00	\$2,775.90	\$4,275.00	No Bid	\$3,990.00	No Bid	\$4,200.00	\$4,200.00	\$3,990.00	No Bid
65b	Total Amount	\$4,400.00	\$2,775.90	\$4,275.00	No Bid	\$3,990.00	No Bid	\$4,200.00	\$4,200.00	\$3,990.00	No Bid
66	Goodyear 291 Hwy, or Eq., Load Range J/L, Ply 8, Tread Depth	\$339.13	\$316.72	\$336.50	No Bid	\$399.00	\$410.00	\$451.45	\$329.00	\$408.00	No Bid
66a	Price Per Unit (500 Units)	\$169,565.00	\$158,360.00	\$168,250.00	No Bid	\$199,500.00	\$205,000.00	\$225,725.00	\$164,500.00	\$204,000.00	No Bid
66b	Total Amount	\$169,565.00	\$158,360.00	\$168,250.00	No Bid	\$199,500.00	\$205,000.00	\$225,725.00	\$164,500.00	\$204,000.00	No Bid
67	Goodyear G-296 Hwy, or Eq., Load Range J/L, Ply 20 & Tread Depth	\$404.36	\$359.96	\$378.50	No Bid	\$450.00	\$468.00	\$453.87	\$396.00	\$465.00	No Bid
67a	Price Per Unit (1000 Units)	\$404,360.00	\$359,960.00	\$378,500.00	No Bid	\$450,000.00	\$468,000.00	\$453,870.00	\$396,000.00	\$465,000.00	No Bid
67b	Total Amount	\$404,360.00	\$359,960.00	\$378,500.00	No Bid	\$450,000.00	\$468,000.00	\$453,870.00	\$396,000.00	\$465,000.00	No Bid
68	Goodyear G-296 Hwy, or Eq., Load Range L, Ply 20 & Tread Depth	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	FST FS818, Tread 22	CH HTCC, Ply 20, Tread 22	Goodyear G-296 /eq., Tread 22/32	No Bid
68a	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$453.87	\$396.00	\$465.00	No Bid
68b	Total Amount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,077.40	\$7,920.00	\$9,300.00	No Bid

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Drive	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	Nextra	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
68B	Price Per Unit (600 Units)	\$474.36	\$319.94	\$411.59	No Bid	\$483.00	\$510.00	\$495.00	\$436.00	\$498.00	No Bid
68C	Total Amount	\$284,616.00	\$191,984.00	\$266,952.00	No Bid	\$235,800.00	\$300,000.00	\$197,400.00	\$201,600.00	\$298,800.00	No Bid
69	P265/65R18				No Bid						
69a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range 5, Ply 8, Tread Depth	General Grabber HTS60, Ply 5, Tread 12	General Grabber HTS60, Load 5, Tread 12	BridgeStone Dueler HT, Tread 11	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 11	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 11T, Tread 11	Firestone Dest LE2, Ply 4, Tread 10	General Grabber HTS60, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 4, Tread 10/32	CV Assurance CS FM, Ply 4, Tread 11
69b	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$123.69	\$121.69	\$174.00	No Bid	\$118.00	\$134.52	\$125.77	\$119.69	\$139.00	\$128.49
69c	Total Amount	\$2,473.80	\$2,433.80	\$3,480.00	No Bid	\$2,360.00	\$2,690.40	\$2,515.40	\$2,393.80	\$2,780.00	\$2,569.80
70	P265/70R16				No Bid						
70a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range 5, Ply 8, Tread Depth	General Grabber HTS60, Ply 5, Tread 11	General Grabber HTS60, Load 5, Tread 12	Firestone Dest AT, Tread 13	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 12	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 11T, Tread 12	Firestone Fusion AT, Ply 4, Tread 10	Fusion AT, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 4, Tread 16/32	Goodyear Wrangler Fortitude HT, Ply 4, Tread 11
70b	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$101.00	\$99.00	\$127.00	No Bid	\$95.00	\$99.70	\$73.12	\$73.12	\$105.00	\$99.69
70c	Total Amount	\$2,020.00	\$1,980.00	\$2,540.00	No Bid	\$1,900.00	\$1,994.00	\$1,462.40	\$1,462.40	\$2,100.00	\$1,993.80
71	P235/70R17				No Bid						
71a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range 5, Ply 8, Tread	General Grabber HTS60, Ply 5, Tread 11	General Grabber HTS60, Load 5, Tread 11	BridgeStone Dueler HT, Tread 10	No Bid	Kelly Edge, Ply 4	Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 110S, Tread 12	Firestone Dest LE2, Ply 4, Tread 10	General Grabber HTS, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear SRA, Ply 4, Tread 16/32	CV Wrangler Trailrunner AT, Ply 4, Tread 12
71b	Price Per Unit (20 Units)	\$115.00	\$113.28	\$157.00	No Bid	\$110.00	\$125.18	\$121.18	\$111.12	\$130.00	\$122.07
71c	Total Amount	\$2,300.00	\$2,265.60	\$3,140.00	No Bid	\$2,200.00	\$2,503.60	\$2,423.60	\$2,222.40	\$2,600.00	\$2,443.40
72	P195/65R15				No Bid						
72a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range 5, Ply 8, Tread	General Allmax, Ply 5, Tread 11	Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter, Tread 10	Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter, Tread 10	No Bid	Ironman, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 91T, Tread 9	Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter, Ply 4, Tread 10	Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter, Ply 4, Tread 10	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 4, Tread 12/32	Goodyear Assurance A/S, Ply 4, Tread 9
72b	Price Per Unit (10 Units)	\$59.92	\$56.90	\$56.90	No Bid	\$54.00	\$55.94	\$54.90	\$54.90	\$60.00	\$55.93
72c	Total Amount	\$599.20	\$569.00	\$569.00	No Bid	\$540.00	\$559.40	\$549.00	\$549.00	\$600.00	\$559.30
73	P225/60VR16				No Bid						
73a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range 5, Ply 8, Tread	General GNAX Justice, Ply 4, Tread 10	General GNAX Justice, Tread 10	Firestone Firehawk PMA1, Tread 11	No Bid	Gen GNAX, LD 98V, Ply 5, Tr 10 or Gy Egn, LD 97V, Ply 6, Tr 12 or Bricoad, LD 98V, Ply 5, Tr 10	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 97V, Tread 12	General GNAX, Ply 4, Tread 10	General GNAX, Ply 4, Tread 10	No Bid	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Load 97V, Ply 6, Tread 12
73b	Price Per Unit (1000 Units)	\$75.53	\$77.66	\$76.65	No Bid	GNAX \$72.00 Gyead \$71.00 BF Goodrich \$71.00	\$90.00	\$75.66	\$75.66	No Bid	\$90.00
73c	Total Amount	\$75,530.00	\$77,660.00	\$76,650.00	No Bid	GNAX \$72,000.00 Gyead \$84,250.00 BF Goodrich \$71,000.00	\$90,000.00	\$75,660.00	\$75,660.00	No Bid	\$90,000.00
74	P235/55R17				No Bid						
74a	Brand Name & Tire Name OPL & Load Range 5, Ply 8, Tread	General GNAX Justice, Ply 4, Tread 10	General GNAX Justice, Tread 10	Firestone Firehawk GTZ, Tread 12	No Bid	Gen GNAX, LD 99V, Ply 5, Tr 10 or Gy Egn, LD 98V, Ply 5, Tr 11 or Bricoad, LD 99V, Ply 5, Tr 10	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 98V, Tread 11	General GNAX, Ply 4, Tread 10	General GNAX, Ply 4, Tread 10	No Bid	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Load 98V, Ply 5, Tread 11
74b	Price Per Unit (2000 Units)	\$87.93	\$90.08	\$100.70	No Bid	GNAX \$84.25 Gyead \$82.00 BF Goodrich \$82.00	\$107.00	\$83.08	\$83.08	No Bid	\$107.00
74c	Total Amount	\$175,860.00	\$180,160.00	\$221,400.00	No Bid	GNAX \$168,500.00 Gyead \$164,000.00 BF Goodrich \$164,000.00	\$214,000.00	\$166,160.00	\$166,160.00	No Bid	\$214,000.00
75	P265/60R17				No Bid						

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Drive	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	Nextiva	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
75a	Brand Name & Tire Name Opt. # Load Range 5, Ply 6, Tread	General GMAX Justice	General GMAX Justice, Tread 10	Firestone Firehawk GTV, Tread 11	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Ply 5 or Gy Egg or BF Goodrich, Ply 5	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 100W, Tread 11	General GMAX	General GMAX	No Bid	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Load 100W, Ply 6, Tread 10
75b	Price Per Unit (2000 Units)	\$108.79	\$110.95	\$122.40	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 101LO, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 5, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 97W, Ply 5, Tr 10	\$117.09	\$107.95	\$107.95	No Bid	\$117.00
75c	Total Amount	\$217,580.00	\$221,900.00	\$246,800.00	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 101LO, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 5, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 97W, Ply 5, Tr 10	\$234,000.00	\$215,900.00	\$215,900.00	No Bid	\$234,000.00
76		\$235,507.18			No Bid					No Bid	
76a	Brand Name & Tire Name Opt. # Load Ply 6, Tread	General GMAX Justice, Ply XL, Tread 10	General GMAX Justice, Tread 10	Firestone Firehawk GTZ, Tread 10	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 100W, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 100W, Ply 5, Tr 10	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 99W, Tread 11	General GMAX, Ply XL, Tread 10	General GMAX, Ply XL, Tread 10	No Bid	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Load 99W, Ply 6, Tread 11
76b	Price Per Unit (2000 Units)	\$111.11	\$113.27	\$137.98	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 100W, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 100W, Ply 5, Tr 10	\$119.00	\$110.27	\$110.27	No Bid	\$119.00
76c	Total Amount	\$222,220.00	\$226,540.00	\$279,960.00	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 100W, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 100W, Ply 5, Tr 10	\$238,000.00	\$220,540.00	\$220,540.00	No Bid	\$238,000.00
77	P225/60-18				No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 100W, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 100W, Ply 5, Tr 10				No Bid	
77a	Brand Name & Tire Name Opt. # Load 5, Ply 6, Tread	General GMAX Justice, Ply 4, Tread 10	General GMAX Justice, Tread 10	Firestone Firehawk GTZ, Tread 11	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 100W, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 100W, Ply 5, Tr 10	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Ply 99W, Tread 11	General GMAX, Ply 4, Tread 10	General GMAX, Ply 4, Tread 10	No Bid	Goodyear Eagle RSA, Load 99W, Ply 6, Tread 11
77b	Price Per Unit (400 Units)	\$97.26	\$99.39	\$115.94	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 100W, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 100W, Ply 5, Tr 10	\$115.00	\$96.39	\$96.39	No Bid	\$115.00
77c	Total Amount	\$38,904.00	\$39,756.00	\$47,176.00	No Bid	Gen. GMAX, Load 100W, Ply 5, Tread 10 or Gy Egg RSA, Ld 99W, Ply 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodrich Advent., L. 100W, Ply 5, Tr 10	\$46,000.00	\$38,556.00	\$38,556.00	No Bid	\$46,000.00
78		\$1822.5			No Bid					No Bid	
78a	26/32 mud/Snow (Tread & Unit Price)	Cont. H011 26 \$135.00	26/32 \$111.00	26/32 \$111.00	26/32 \$119.30- Marangoni Un tread	No Bid	27 \$173.45	26 \$116.31	26 \$116.31	26/32 \$118.00	No Bid
78b	Section w/Cap	\$20.00	10'	10'	R-120-\$20.00, R-133-\$25.00, R-135-\$30.00	No Bid	\$25.00	10'	10'	\$136.00	No Bid
78b	Spot w/Cap	\$4.00	No Cost	No Cost	R/C	No Bid	\$1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$120.00	No Bid
78b	Deepest Tread offered -mud/Snow (Unit Price)	No Bid	26/32 \$111.00	26/32 \$111.00	No Bid	No Bid	32 \$171.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
79	Section w/Cap	No Bid	10'	10'	R-120-\$20.00, R-133-\$25.00, R-135-\$30.00	No Bid	\$25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
79	Spot w/Cap	No Bid	No Cost	No Cost	R/C	No Bid	\$1.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION


ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Offer	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	Nertire	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
79a	26/32 mud/Snow (Tread & Unit Price)	Cont. HOLA 26 \$136.00	26/32 \$119.00	26/32 \$119.00	26/32 \$122.10- Marangoni Uniread R-120-\$20.00; R-133-\$25.00; R-135-\$30.00	No Bid	27 \$181.31	26 \$119.00	26 \$119.00	26/32 \$130.43	No Bid
	Section w/Cap	\$20.00	10'	10'	N/C	No Bid	\$35.00	10'	10'	\$138.00	No Bid
	Spot w/Cap	\$4.00	No Cost	No Cost	N/C	No Bid	\$1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$132.00	No Bid
79b	Deepest Tread offered mud/Snow (Unit Price)	No Bid	26/32 \$119.00	26/32 \$119.00	26/32 \$122.10	No Bid	32 \$185.21	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Section w/Cap	No Bid	10'	10'	R-120-\$20.00; R-133-\$25.00; R-135-\$30.00	No Bid	\$25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Spot w/Cap	No Bid	No Cost	No Cost	N/C	No Bid	\$1.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
80	315/80R22.5	No Bid				No Bid					No Bid
80a	26/32 mud/Snow (Tread & Unit Price)	Cont. HOLA 26 \$165.50	32/32 \$160.00	32/32 \$160.00	26/32 \$145.50 Marangoni Uniread R-120-\$20.00; R-133-\$25.00; R-135-\$30.00	No Bid	27 \$193.10	26 \$154.22	26 \$154.72	26/32 \$128.00	No Bid
	Section w/Cap	\$20.00	10'	10'	N/C	No Bid	\$25.00	10'	10'	\$146.00	No Bid
	Spot w/Cap	\$4.00	No Cost	No Cost	N/C	No Bid	\$1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$130.00	No Bid
80b	Deepest Tread offered mud/Snow (Unit Price)	No Bid	32/32 \$160.00	32/32 \$160.00	26/32 \$145.50	No Bid	32 \$214.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Section w/Cap	No Bid	10'	10'	R-120-\$20.00; R-133-\$25.00; R-135-\$30.00	No Bid	\$25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Spot w/Cap	No Bid	No Cost	No Cost	N/C	No Bid	\$1.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
81	215/75R17.5 Trailer Tire	No Bid				No Bid					No Bid
81a	15/32 (Tread Depth & Unit Price)	15 \$80.00	16/32 \$72.00	16/32 \$72.00	16/32 \$102.00 Marangoni Uniread	No Bid	16 \$85.11	15 \$68.00	15 \$68.00	15/32 \$86.96	No Bid
	Section w/Cap	\$20.00	10'	10'	R-120-\$20.00	No Bid	\$1.00	10'	10'	\$98.96	No Bid
	Spot w/Cap	\$1.00	No Cost	No Cost	N/C	No Bid	\$1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$88.96	No Bid
81b	Highway Tread (Tread & Unit Price)	No Bid	16/32 \$72.00	16/32 \$72.00	15/32 \$102.00	No Bid	16 \$72.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Section w/Cap	No Bid	10'	10'	R-120-\$20.00	No Bid	\$25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Spot w/Cap	No Bid	No Cost	No Cost	N/C	No Bid	\$1.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
82	12R34.5-Tread (32/32)-Tread offered & Unit Price	No Bid	32/32 \$159.00	32/32 \$159.00	26/32 \$131.50 Marangoni Uniread	No Bid	32/32 \$193.84	26 \$136.00	26 \$136.00	32/32 \$163.00	No Bid
	385/65R22.5-21/32 Mud & Snow -Tread offered & Unit Price	No Bid	20/32 \$135.00	20/32 \$135.00	21/32 \$210.00 RimTread	No Bid	23 \$239.96	21 \$145.00	21 \$145.00	20/32 \$149.00 (Oliver Pre Cure)	No Bid
	Section w/Cap	No Bid	10'	10'	N/A	No Bid	\$25.00	10'	10'	\$187.00	No Bid
	Spot w/Cap	No Bid	No Cost	No Cost	N/A	No Bid	\$1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$151.00	No Bid
CSBE	Participation/GFE (Yes/No)	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Vendor attended mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No)	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Vendor submitted cost in Separate Sealed Envelope (Yes/No)	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Vendor Included Cost in Other Areas Outside of Separate Sealed Envelope (Yes/No)	No	No	No	No	No	No	No	No	No	No

Witness Signature: _____
 Agent Signature: _____

BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Best Drive	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 1)	Southern Tire Mart (Bid No. 2)	J&R Tire Inc.	NexTire	Goodyear Tire	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 1)	Atlanta Commercial Tire (Bid 2)	Action Tire	Midtown Tire
Recommend Award to the Lowest, Responsive and Responsible Bidders											

Southern Tire Mart Best Drive Tire, LLC J&R Tire NexTire Commercial, Inc. Action Tire Co. Midtown Tire
 800 Hwy. 98 100 Hill Ind Blvd. 350 Bohannon Rd. PO Box 81 410 Lees Mill Rd. 2916 N. David Hills Rd.
 Columbia, MS 39429 Forest Park, GA 30297 Fairburn, GA 30213 Avondale Estates, GA 30007 Doraville, GA 30340 Forest Park, GA 30297 Atlanta, GA 30329

Witness Signature: 
 Agent Signature: _____