
ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 
1 P205/65R15 

1a

Brand Name & Tire
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

11

Firestone All 
Season,(004012), Ply SL, 

Tread 9 No Bid
General  Rt45, 4 ply, 

Tread 10/32
Ferintino, Ply 4, 

Tread 10/32
Firestone A/S,  4 Ply, 

Tread 10/32
Goodyear Assurance AS, 

4Ply, Tread 10/32 No Bid

Firestone All 
Season,(004012), Ply 4, 

Tread 9

1b
Price Per Unit

(50 Units) $83.66 $72.48 No Bid $75.00 $50.00 $66.00 $68.00 No Bid $65.97 

1c Total Amount
$4,183.00 $3,624.00 

No Bid $3,750.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $3,400.00 No Bid $3,298.50 

2 P215/60R16
No Bid

No Bid

2a

Brand Name & Tire
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax RT45, Ply 4, 

Tread 11

Firestone All 
Season,(013747) Ply SL, 

Tread 9 No Bid
General  Rt45, 4 ply, 

Tread 10/32
Ferintino, Ply 4, 

Tread 10/32
Firestone A/S,  4 Ply, 

Tread 10/32
Goodyear Assurance AS, 

4Ply, Tread 10/32 No Bid

Firestone All 
Season,(013747), Ply 4, 

Tread 9

2b
Price Per Unit         
(250 Units) $89.68 

$79.98 
No Bid $83.00 $52.00 $67.00 $70.00 No Bid $74.98 

2c Total Amount $22,420.00 $19,995.00 No Bid $20,750.00 $13,000.00 $16,750.00 $17,500.00 No Bid $18,745.00 

3 P235/70R16 No Bid No Bid

3a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HTS60, Ply 

4, Tread 11

Firestone Destination 
LE3,(014817)Ply SL, Tread 

10 No Bid
General HT, 4 ply, 

Tread 12/32
Arisun, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
Firestone A/S,  4 Ply, 

Tread 10/32
Goodyear Assurance AS, 

4Ply, Tread 10/32 No Bid

Firestone Destination 
LE3,(014817)Ply 4, 

Tread 10

3b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $117.98 $113.17 No Bid $115.00 $64.00 $80.00 $91.00 No Bid $110.31 

3c Total Amount $11,798.00 $11,317.00 No Bid $11,500.00 $6,400.00 $8,000.00 $9,100.00 No Bid $11,031.00 

4 P235/70R17 No Bid No Bid

4a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HTS60, Ply 

4, Tread 11

Firestone All 
Season,(005362), Ply SL, 

Tread 10 No Bid
General HTS, 4 ply, 

Tread 12/32
Arisun, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
Firestone Dest. ATZ, 4 

Ply, Tread 11/32
Wrangler Workhorse AT, 

Ply 4, Tread 12/32 No Bid

Firestone Destination 
LE3,(005362)Ply 4, 

Tread 10

4b
Price Per Unit         
(400 Units)

$134.33 $132.09 
No Bid $134.00 $82.00 $120.00 $132.00 No Bid $99.10 

4c Total Amount $53,732.00 $52,836.00 No Bid $53,600.00 $3,280.00 $48,000.00 $52,800.00 No Bid $39,640.00 

5 P255/65R17 No Bid No Bid

5a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HTS60, Ply 

4, Tread 11

Firestone Destination 
LE3,(005372)Ply SL, Tread 

10 No Bid
General HTS, 4 ply, 

Tread 12/32
Otani, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
Destination LE3, Ply 

4, Tread 11/32
Wrangler Fortitude, Ply 

4, Tread 12/32 No Bid

Firestone Destination 
LE3,(005372)Ply 4, 

Tread 10

5b
Price Per Unit

(50 Units) $137.00 $136.82 No Bid $134.00 
$91.00 $123.00 $114.00 

No Bid
$127.35 

5c Total Amount $6,850.00 $6,841.00 No Bid $6,700.00 $4,550.00 $6,150.00 $5,700.00 No Bid $6,367.50 

6 P255/70R16 No Bid No Bid

6a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HTS60, Ply 

4, Tread 11

Firestone Destination 
LE3,(005342)Ply SL, Tread 

10 No Bid
General HTS, 4 ply, 

Tread 12/32
Otani, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
Destination LE3, Ply 

4, Tread 11/32
Wrangler SRA, Ply 4, 

Tread 12/32 No Bid

Firestone Dest LE3 
(005342), Ply 4, 

Tread 10

6b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $131.48 $128.62 No Bid $129.00 $102.00 $117.00 

$121.00 
No Bid

$119.07 

6c Total Amount $13,148.00 $12,862.00 No Bid $12,900.00 $10,200.00 $11,700.00 $12,100.00 No Bid $11,707.00 

7 LT215/85R16 No Bid

7a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HD, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

Firestone Transforce 
HT3,(013891)Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
General Grabber HD, 

10 Ply, 14/32
Otani Ht, Ply 10, 

Tread 10/32
FS Transforce HT3, 
Ply 10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 
10, Tread 12/32 Goodyear W.H. HT, Ply 10

FST TRNFC HT3, 
(013891), Ply 10, 

Tread 14

7b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $126.83 $120.60 No Bid $124.00 $96.00 $109.00 $105.00 $112.00 $115.48 
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

7c Total Amount $8,300.00 $12,060.00 No Bid $12,400.00 $9,600.00 $10,900.00 $10,500.00 $11,200.00 $11,548.00 
8 LT225/75R16 No Bid

8a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HD, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

Firestone Transforce 
HT3,(013886)Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
 Grabber HD, 10 Ply, 

14/32
Otani Ht, Ply 10, 

Tread 10/32
FS Transforce HT3, 
Ply 10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 
10, Tread 12/32

Goodyear W.H. HT, Ply 10, 
Tread 14

FST TRNFC HT3, 
(013886), Ply 10, 

Tread 14

8b
Price Per Unit         
(150 Units) $136.88 $120.60 No Bid $129.00 $94.00 $110.00 $105.00 $112.00 $115.48 

8c Total Amount $20,532.00 $18,090.00 No Bid $19,350.00 $14,100.00 $16,500.00 $15,750.00 $16,800.00 $17,322.00 
9 LT225/75R17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth No Bid

Firestone Transforce 
HT2,(002774)Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FST TRNFC HT3, 
(002774), Ply 10, 

Tread 14

9b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units) No Bid $157.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.05 

9c Total Amount No Bid $4,718.40 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,111.50 

10 LT235/85R16 No Bid

10a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HD, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

Firestone Transforce 
HT3,(013892)Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
 Grabber HD, 10 Ply, 

14/32
Otani Ht, Ply 10, 

Tread 10/32
FS Transforce HT3, 
Ply 10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 
10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 10, 
Tread 15/32

FST TRNFC HT3, 
(013892), Ply 10, 

Tread 14

10b
Price Per Unit         
(150 Units) $135.89 $134.34 No Bid $134.00 $103.00 $124.00 $111.00 $119.00 $129.19 

10c Total Amount $20,384.00 $20,151.00 No Bid $20,100.00 $15,450.00 $18,600.00 $16,650.00 $17,850.00 $19,378.50 

11 LT245/75R16 No Bid

11a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HD, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

Firestone Transforce 
HT3,(013887)Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
 Grabber HD, 10 Ply, 

14/32
Zeetex Ht, Ply 10, 

Tread 10/32
FS Transforce HT3, 
Ply 10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 
10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 10, 
Tread 14/32

FST TRNFC HT3, 
(013887), Ply 10, 

Tread 14

11b
Price Per Unit         
(600 Units) $127.25 $128.64 No Bid $130.00 $100.00 $117.00 $105.00 $112.00 $123.51 

11c Total Amount $76,350.00 $77,184.00 No Bid $78,000.00 $60,000.00 $70,200.00 $63,000.00 $67,200.00 $74,106.00 

12 LT245/75R17 No Bid

12a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HD, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

Firestone Transforce 
HT3,(013889)Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
 Grabber HD, 10 Ply, 

14/32
Otani, Ply 10, Tread 

10/32
FS Transforce HT3, 
Ply 10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 
10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 10, 
Tread 13/32

FST TRNFC HT3, 
(013889), Ply 10, 

Tread 14

12b
Price Per Unit
(300 Units) $161.01 $147.53 No Bid $160.00 $101.00 $133.00 $141.00 $151.00 $133.19 

12c Total Amount $48,303.00 $44,259.00 No Bid $48,000.00 $30,300.00 $39,900.00 $42,300.00 $46,800.00 $39,957.00 

13 LT265/70R17 No Bid

13a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Grabber HTS, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

Firestone Transforce 
HT3,(013894)Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
 Grabber HD, 10 Ply, 

14/32
Otani, Ply 10, Tread 

10/32
FS Transforce HT3, 
Ply 10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 
10, Tread 12/32

Workhorse HT, Ply 10, 
Tread 14/32

FST TRNFC HT3, 
(013884), Ply 10, 

Tread 14

13b
Price Per Unit

(60 Units) $142.80 $177.55 No Bid $165.00 $109.00 $160.00 $131.00 $140.00 $172.38 

13c Total Amount $8,568.00 $10,653.00 No Bid $9,900.00 $6,540.00 $9,600.00 $7,860.00 $8,400.00 $10,342.80 

14 245/70R19.5 No Bid

14a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
Conti HS3, Ply 16, Tread 

18

Firestone Transforce 
AT2,(004197)Ply 14, 

Tread 18 No Bid

Continental HS3 
Hybrid, Ply 14, Tread 

16/32
StarLux, Ply 14, 

Tread 19/32
Firestone FS561, Ply 

14, Tread 19/32
Goodyear G 647, Ply 14, 

Tread 16/32
Goodyear G 647, Ply 14, 

Tread 16/32

Firestone FS561 
(248477), Ply 14, 

Tread 18

14b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) $281.00 $322.98 No Bid $260.00 $170.00 $300.00 $256.00 $276.00 $308.55 
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

14c Total Amount $2,810.00 $3,229.80 No Bid $2,600.00 $1,700.00 $3,000.00 $2,560.00 $2,260.00 $3,085.50 

15 255/70R22.5 No Bid No Bid

15a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
Conti HSR2SA, 16 Ply, Tread 

19

Firestone 
FS560,(192982)Ply 16, 

Tread 18 No Bid No Bid
StarLux, Ply 16, 

Tread 21/32
Bridgestone R250, Ply 

14, Tread 23/32
Endurance RSA, Ply 16, 

Tread 20/32
Endurance RSA, Ply 16, Tread 

18/32

Firestone 
FS560,(192982)Ply 16, 

Tread 18

15b
Price Per Unit

(80 Units) $299.00 $345.83 No Bid No Bid $190.00 $340.00 $286.00 $324.00 $313.97 

15c Total Amount $23,920.00 $27,666.40 No Bid No Bid $15,200.00 $27,200.00 $22,880.00 $25,920.00 $25,117.60 

16 11R22.5 No Bid No Bid

16a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth Conti HSR2, 16 Ply, Tread 23

Firestone 
FS561A,(012710)Ply 16, 

Tread 21 No Bid No Bid
StarLux, Ply 16, 

Tread 29/32
Firestone FS560, Ply 

16, Tread 23/32
Endurance RSA, Ply 16, 

Tread 20/32
Endurance RSA, Ply 16, Tread 

22/32
YOK 108R (10832), 

Ply 16, Tread 22

16b
Price Per Unit
(300 Units) $347.00 $363.19 No Bid No Bid $260.00 $335.00 $351.00 $397.00 $335.00 

16c Total Amount $104,100.00 $108,957.00 No Bid No Bid $78,000.00 $100,500.00 $105,300.00 $119,100.00 $100,500.00 

17 12R22.5 No Bid No Bid

17a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth Conti HSR2, 16 Ply, Tread 23

Firestone 
FS561A,(012715)Ply 16, 

Tread 21 No Bid No Bid
Otani, Ply 16, Tread 

29/32

Firestone FD663, Ply 
16, Tread 30/32 Endurance RSA, Ply 16, 

Tread 20/32
Endurance RSA, Ply 16, Tread 

22/32

Firestone 
FS561A,(012715)Ply 

16, Tread 21

17b
Price Per Unit
(1000 Units) $390.00 $406.85 No Bid No Bid $310.00 $371.00 $427.00 $459.00 $395.00 

17c Total Amount $390,000.00 $406,850.00 No Bid No Bid $310,000.00 $371,000.00 $427,000.00 $459,000.00 $395,000.00 

18 12R24.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth Conti HSC, 16 Ply, Tread 23

Firestone 
T819,(157368)Ply 16, 

Tread 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone T819,Ply 16, 

Tread 32/32
Goodyear G751, Ply 16, 

Tread 21/32 No Bid No Bid

18b
Price Per Unit
(250 Units) $614.71 $393.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $384.00 $610.00 No Bid No Bid

18c Total Amount $153,677.50 $98,437.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $96,000.00 $152,500.00 No Bid No Bid

19 315/80R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

19a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth Conti HSR2, 20 Ply, Tread 19

Firestone FS860, 
#244465, Ply 20, Tread 

24 No Bid No Bid
Arisun, Ply 20, 
Tread 32/32

Firestone T819,Ply 20, 
Tread 32/32

Goodyear G289, Ply 
L20, Tread 26/32

GY WHA,Load J,  Ply 20, 
Tread 23/32

Firestone FS860, 
#244465, Ply 20, 

Tread 24

19b
Price Per Unit
(500 Units) $494.24 $452.00 No Bid No Bid $340.00 $400.00 $450.00 $595.00 $462.00 

19c Total Amount $247,120.00 $226,000.00 No Bid No Bid $170,000.00 $200,000.00 $225,000.00 $297,500.00 $231,000.00 

20 425/65R22.5 No Bid No Bid

20a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth Conti HR2, 20 Ply, Tread 21

Firestone FS818, 
#241235, Ply 20, Tread 

23 No Bid No Bid
Arisun, Ply 20, 
Tread 32/32

Firestone FS818,Ply 20, 
Tread 32/32

Goodyear G296, Ply 
L20, Tread 26/32

Goodyear G296, Ply L20, 
Tread 23/32

Firestone FS818, 
#241235, Ply 20, 

Tread 23

20b
Price Per Unit
(400 Units) $614.47 $510.80 No Bid No Bid $460.00 $511.00 $680.00 $725.00 $520.80 

20c Total Amount $245,788.00 $204,320.00 No Bid No Bid $184,000.00 $204,400.00 $272,000.00 $290,000.00 $208,320.00 

21 385/65R22.5 No Bid No Bid

21a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth Conti HTR2, 20 Ply, Tread 21

Firestone FS818, 
#247780, Ply 20, Tread 

23 No Bid No Bid
Arisun, Ply 20, 
Tread 32/32

Firestone FS818,Ply 18, 
Tread 32/32

Goodyear Amormax 
MSA, Ply 18, Tread 

26/32

Goodyear Amormax MSA, 
Ply 20, Tread 23/32

Firestone FS818, 
#247780, Ply 20, 

Tread 23

21b
Price Per Unit
(600 Units) $543.21 $563.30 No Bid No Bid $400.00 $563.00 $625.00 $663.00 $573.30 

21c Total Amount $325,926.00 $337,980.00 No Bid No Bid $240,000.00 $337,800.00 $375,000.00 $397,800.00 $343,980.00 

22 18x9.50-8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

22a

Brand Name & Tire
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth No Bid

Carlisle Turf Saver, 
CA5110841, Ply 2, 

Tread 22 No Bid
Hercules Turs Trac, Ply 

4 Carlisle Rib, Ply 4 Carlisle Turf, Ply 4 No Bid No Bid

Carlisle Turf Saver, 
CA5110841, Ply 2, 

Tread 7

22b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) No Bid $45.47 No Bid $40.00 $65.00 $52.00 No Bid No Bid $45.04 

22c Total Amount No Bid $454.70 No Bid $400.00 $650.00 $520.00 No Bid No Bid $450.40 

23 11Lx16 No Bid No Bid

23a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

Harvest King F3, F(12) 
Load Range, 10 Ply, 16 

Tread

Ascenso BHB 313, 
3002020013, Ply 10, 

Tread 16 No Bid
Galaxy F3, Load F, 

Ply 12

Hercules F3, Load 
E, Ply 12, Tread 

23/32
Carlisle F3, Load E, 

Ply 10 No Bid
Maxamms900, Load 12F, 

Ply 12, Tread 18/32
AGSTAR, Load E, Ply 

10, Tread 12

23b
Price Per Unit

(50 Units) $142.28 $139.47 No Bid $150.00 $180.00 $188.00 No Bid $163.57 $113.00 
23c Total Amount $7,114.00 $6,973.50 No Bid $7,500.00 $9,000.00 $9,400.00 No Bid $8,178.50 $5,650.00 
24 12x16.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

24a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
BH Skid Power, F 12, 10, 

Ply, 22 Tread

Ascenso SSB 330, 
300204004, Ply 12, 

Tread 25 No Bid
Samson, Load F, Ply 

12 No Bid
Carlisle R4, Load E, 

Ply 10 No Bid
Maxamms906, Load 12, 

Ply 10, Tread 28/32
WESTLAKE, Load E, 

Ply 10, Tread 26

24b
Price Per Unit
(100 Units) $152.00 $175.47 No Bid $156.00 No Bid $210.00 No Bid $208.81 $148.66 

24c Total Amount $15,200.00 $17,747.00 No Bid $15,600.00 No Bid $21,000.00 No Bid $20,881.00 $14,866.00 
25 14x17.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

25a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-16 
and Tread Depth

Power King, 14 Ply, 23 
Tread

GAL111278, Galaxy 
XD2010, Ply 14, Tread 

24 No Bid
Galaxy, Load G, Ply 

14 No Bid
Samson, Load F, Ply 

14 No Bid
Maxamms906, Load H, Ply 

16, Tread 28/32
DEESTONE, Load H, 

Ply 16, Tread 33

25b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units) $298.13 $272.47 No Bid $280.00 No Bid $420.00 No Bid $343.79 $242.00 
25c Total Amount $8,943.90 $8,174.10 No Bid $8,400.00 No Bid $12,600.00 No Bid $10,313.70 $7,260.00 
26 14.5-75-16.1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-14 
and Tread Depth

No Bid MAX60802, Maxam 
MS900, Ply 10, Tread 

22 No Bid
Hercules F3, Load F, 

Ply 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maxamms900, Load E, Ply 

10
DEESTONE, Load E, 

Ply 10

26b
Price Per Unit

(30 Units) No Bid $299.47 No Bid $325.00 
No Bid

No Bid No Bid $316.91 $345.70 
26c Total Amount No Bid $8,984.10 No Bid $9,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,507.30 $10,371.00 
27 17.5x25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-16 & 

Tread Depth

No Bid
MAX342684, Maxam 

MS330, Ply 20 No Bid
Galaxy, Load H, Ply 

16
Maxam, Load F, Ply 

12
FST Versabuilt AT, Ply 

12 No Bid No Bid
Maxam M3, Load F, Ply 

12

27b
Price Per Unit         

(5 Units) No Bid $845.47 No Bid $560.00 $600.00 $490.00 No Bid No Bid $576.00 
27c Total Amount No Bid $4,227.35 No Bid $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $2,450.00 No Bid No Bid $2,880.00 
28 19.5Lx24 No Bid No Bid

28a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
Harvest King R4, F Load 

Range, 37 Ply
MAX60302, Maxam 

MS904, Ply 12 No Bid K-9, Load F, Ply 12
Maxam, Load F, Ply 

12
FST Alltrac, Load E, Ply 

10 No Bid
Maxamms904, Load F, Ply 

12
GLXY EZRDR, Load F, 

Ply 12

28b
Price Per Unit

(14 Units) $507.92 $419.47 No Bid $360.00 $500.00 $690.00 No Bid $548.97 
$498.47 

28c Total Amount $7,110.88 $5,872.58 No Bid $5,040.00 $7,000.00 $9,660.00 No Bid $7,685.58 

$6,978.58 

29 20.5Rx25 No Bid No Bid

29a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply & 

Tread Depth

Double Coins , 20 Load 
range

MAX342685, Maxam 
MS330

No Bid Maxxam
Galaxy, Load 2, Ply 

2
FST Versabuilt AT, Ply 

20 No Bid

Maxamms300, Load 20, 
Ply 20 FST Versabuilt,Load MS, 

Ply 20
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

29b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) $1,250.09 $1,295.47 No Bid $1,380.00 $1,295.00 $690.00 No Bid $1,415.37 $1,036.00 

29c Total Amount $12,500.90 $12,954.70 No Bid $13,800.00 $12,950.00 $6,900.00 No Bid $14,153.70 $10,360.00 
30 21L-24 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply & 

Tread Depth No Bid

GAL200442, Galay EZ 
Rider, Load F, Ply 12, 

Tread 35 No Bid
Galaxy, Load F, Ply 12, 

Tread 24
Hercules, Load F, 
Ply 12, Tread R4 Firestone  Alltrac, Ply 16 No Bid

Maxamms904, Load G, Ply 
16, Tread R4

BKT, Load G, Ply 16, 
Tread R4

30b
Price Per Unit

(20 Units) No Bid $591.47 No Bid $580.00 $720.00 $850.00 No Bid $646.80 
$1,002.00 

30c Total Amount No Bid $11,829.40 No Bid $11,600.00 $14,400.00 $17,000.00 No Bid $12,936.00 20,040.00
31 23.5Rx25 No Bid No Bid

31a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply & 

Tread Depth

Double Coins , 20 Load 
range MAX342686, Maxam 

MS330 No Bid Maxam
Galaxy, Load 2, Ply 

2
FST Versabuilt AT, Ply 

20 No Bid
Maxamms300 Double Coin 

REM, Load 20, Ply 20
Maxam LM, Load MS, 

Ply 20

31b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) $1,601.80 $1,776.47 No Bid $1,650.00 $1,700.00 $1,000.00 No Bid $1,729.42 

$1,890.00 

31c Total Amount $32,036.00 $35,529.40 No Bid $33,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid $34,588.40 

$37,800.00 

32 29.5R25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

32a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply- & 

Tread Depth No Bid
MAX342688, Maxam 

MS330 No Bid Maxam No Bid FST Versabuilt AT No Bid
Maxamms300, Load 28, 

Ply 28
WESTLAKE, Load MS, 

Ply 20

32b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) No Bid $3,419.47 No Bid $3,000.00 No Bid $1,800.00 No Bid $3,349.19 $3,180.00 

32c Total Amount No Bid $34,194.70 No Bid $30,000.00 No Bid $18,000.00 No Bid $33,491.90 $31,800.00 
33 18.7.00-8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply- & 

Tread Depth No Bid
T80487008, OTR 

Grassmaster, Load 8, Ply 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
YARD MASTER, Load B, 

Ply 4

33b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) No Bid $67.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$98.00 

33c Total Amount No Bid $1,349.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1,960.00 

34 23x10.50-12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply- & Tread 
Depth No Bid

WD1044, Hi Run Turf 
Master, Ply 4 No Bid

Galaxy, Load C, Ply 6, 
Tread 12

Carlisle Turf Trac, 
Load B, Ply 4

Carlisle Turf Master, Ply 
4 No Bid No Bid

DEESTONE D405, 
Load C, Ply 6, Tread 

10

34b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) No Bid $67.47 No Bid $66.35 $85.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid $72.00 
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

34c Total Amount No Bid $3,373.50 No Bid $3,317.50 $4,250.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid

$3,600.00 

35 24x12.00-12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35a

Brand Name & Tire
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply  & Tread 
Depth No Bid

WD1112, Hi Run Turf 
Master, Ply 4 No Bid

Galaxy, Load B, Ply 4, 
Tread 12

Carlisle Turf Trac, 
Load C, Ply 6 Carlisle Turf Trac, Ply 4 No Bid No Bid

DEESTONE, Load C, 
Ply 6, Tread 10

35b
Price Per Unit

(50 Units) No Bid $84.47 No Bid $75.00 $170.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid
$76.00 

35c Total Amount No Bid $4,223.50 No Bid $3,750.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid $3,800.00 
36 1400x24 No Bid No Bid No Bid

36a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply  & 

Tread Depth No Bid

MAX60713, Maxam 
MS915, Load 11, Tread 

34 No Bid Galaxy 31/32
Samson, Load F, Ply 

12 Firestone Versabuilt AT No Bid
Maxamms905, Load H, Tread 

38/32

DEESTONE G2/L2, 
Load G2, Ply16, 

Tread 34

36b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) No Bid $571.47 No Bid $600.00 $420.00 $245.00 No Bid $463.87 
$425.00 

36c Total Amount No Bid $5,714.70 No Bid $6,000.00 $4,200.00 $2,450.00 No Bid $4,638.70 $4,250.00 
37 215/75R17.5 No Bid

37a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply  & 

Tread Depth
Conti HTZ2, H Load Range, 

16 Tread
GL1173591175, Zenna AP 

250, Load H, Tread 16 No Bid
Arisun, Load H, Tread 

16/32
Ironman, Load H, 

Ply 16
Bridgestone R238,Load 
H Ply 16, Tread 21/32

Goodyear G114, Load H, 
Ply 16, Tread 17/32 Arroya, Load H, Tread 17

(248511) FST FS561, 
Load H, Ply 16, Tread 

16

37b
Price Per Unit
(500 Units) $222.00 $133.47 No Bid $130.00 $130.00 $310.00 $240.00 $160.64 

$271.67 

37c Total Amount $111,000.00 $66,735.00 No Bid $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $155,000.00 $120,000.00 $80,320.00 $135,835.00 
38 ST175/80R13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply 12 & Tread 
E-3/L-3 No Bid

GL1943001831, Gladiator 
QR-25 Trailer, Tread 7 No Bid

Arisun, Load C, Tread 
10/32 No Bid

Americus, Load C, Ply 6, 
Tread 10/32 No Bid No Bid

NRM14, National 
RDMX, Load C, Ply 6, 

Tread 10

38b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) No Bid $57.47 No Bid $41.00 No Bid $40.00 No Bid No Bid
$59.00 

38c Total Amount No Bid $1,149.40 No Bid $820.00 No Bid $800.00 No Bid No Bid $1,180.00 
39 ST215/75R14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply & Tread R-4 No Bid
GL1943002141, Gladiator 

QR-25 Trailer, Tread 7 No Bid
Towstar, Load D, Tread 

10/32 No Bid
HiRun, Load C, Ply 6, 

Tread 10/32

Goodyear Endurance, 
Load E, Ply 10PR, Tread 

12/32 No Bid

6H04571, CARLISLE 
TL HD, Load D, Ply 8, 

Tread 9

39b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) No Bid $69.47 No Bid $51.00 No Bid $74.00 $86.00 No Bid
$85.00 

39c Total Amount No Bid $694.70 No Bid $510.00 No Bid $740.00 $8,600.00 No Bid $850.00 
40 ST225/75R15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

40a

Brand Name & Tire
Name OPL#-Load 

Range, Ply 20 & Tread 
E-3

Zeemax, E (10) Load Range, 
10 Tread Depth

GL1943002253, Gladiator 
QR-25 Trailer, Tread 8 No Bid

Arisun, Load E, Tread 
10/32 No Bid

HiRun, Load D, Ply 8, 
Tread 10/32

Goodyear Endurance, 
Load E, Ply 10PR, Tread 

12/32 No Bid
013275, FZ TRAILER, 
Load D, Ply 8, Tread 9

40b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) $77.00 $84.47 No Bid $61.00 No Bid $77.00 $101.00 No Bid
$74.00 

40c Total Amount $770.00 $844.70 No Bid $610.00 No Bid $770.00 $1,010.00 No Bid $740.00 
41 ST235/80R16 No Bid No Bid No Bid

41a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply 16 & 

Tread Depth
Power King, E10 Load Range, 

10 Ply, 10 Tread

GL1943002864, Gladiator 
QR-25 Trailer, Load F, Ply 

12, Tread 8 No Bid
Towstar, Load F,Ply 12, 

Tread 12/32 No Bid
Hercules, Load E, Ply 10, 

Tread 10/32

Goodyear Endurance, 
Load E, Ply 10PR, Tread 

12/32 No Bid

NRM25 NTL RDMX, 
Load F, Ply 12, Tread 

10

41b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) $112.00 $98.47 No Bid $90.00 No Bid $112.00 $122.00 No Bid
$109.79 
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

41c Total Amount $1,120.00 $984.70 No Bid $900.00 No Bid $1,120.00 $1,220.00 No Bid $1,097.90 
42 ST235/85R16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42a

Brand Name & Tire
Name OPL#-Load 

Range, Ply 20 & Tread 
E-3 No Bid

GL1943003865, Gladiator 
QR-25 Trailer, Load G, Ply 

14, Tread 8 No Bid
Trailer Master, Load E, 
Ply 10, Tread 12/32 No Bid

HiRun, Load D, Ply 6, 
Tread 10/32

Goodyear Endurance, 
Load E, Ply 10PR, Tread 

12/32 No Bid

WD1233, HIRUN HWY, 
Load E, Ply 10, Tread 

11

42b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) No Bid $122.47 No Bid $80.00 No Bid $100.00 $130.00 No Bid
$95.00 

42c Total Amount No Bid $1,224.70 No Bid $800.00 No Bid $1,000.00 $1,300.00 No Bid $950.00 
43 11R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43a

Goodyr Multi Pos Hwy
Duracil/Equal OPL#, 
Load Range, Ply & 

Tread Depth Conti HSRZ 16 Ply, 23 Tread 
248817, Bridgestone 

R268, Ply 16, Tread 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone FS560, Ply 16, 

Tread 23/32
Goodyear, Ply 16, Tread 

21/32
751 MSA, Ply 16, Tread 

24/32

No Bid

43b
Price Per Unit
(100 Units) $347.00 $371.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $335.00 $351.00 $644.00 

No Bid

43c Total Amount $34,700.00 $37,110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33,500.00 $351,000.00 $64,400.00 No Bid
44 11R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

44a

Goodyr or Equal OPL#-
Load Range-Ply & 

Tread Conti HSRZ 16 Ply, 23 Tread 

211206, Firestone 
FD663, Ply 16, Tread 

26 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone FS560, Ply 16, 

Tread 23/32
Goodyear, Ply 16, Tread 

21/32
Endurance RSA, Ply 16, Tread 

22/32
YK 108R, Ply 16, 

Tread 22

44b
Price Per Unit
(300 Units) $347.00 $355.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $335.00 $351.00 $397.00 

$335.00 

44c Total Amount $104,100.00 $106,695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $100,500.00 $105,300.00 $119,280.00 $100,500.00 
45 11R24.5 No Bid No Bid

45a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 
Range-Ply & Tread Conti HSRZ316 Ply, 23 Tread 

293733, Firestone 
FD663, Ply 16, Tread 

26 No Bid No Bid
Road Lux, Ply 16, 

Tread 29/32
Firestone FS560, Ply 16, 

Tread 23/32
Goodyear Endurance, 
Ply 16, Tread 21/32

Endurance RSA, Ply 16, Tread 
22/32

YK 108R, Ply 16, 
Tread 22

45b
Price Per Unit

(50 Units) $390.00 $375.95 No Bid No Bid $280.00 $355.00 $511.00 $569.00 
$399.13 

45c Total Amount $19,500.00 $18,797.50 No Bid No Bid $14,000.00 $17,750.00 $25,550.00 $28,450.00 $19,956.50 
46 12R.22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

46a

Goodyr or Equal OPL#-
Load Range-Ply & 

Tread Conti HSRZ316 Ply, 23 Tread 
000278, Bridgestone 

R268, Ply 16, Tread 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone FD663, Ply 16, 

Tread 32/32
Goodyear Endurance, 
Ply 16, Tread 21/32

Endurance RSA, Ply 16, Tread 
22/32

FST FS561, Ply 16, 
Tread 21

46b
Price Per Unit
(500 Units) $390.00 $427.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $371.00 $427.00 $459.00 

$395.00 

46c Total Amount $195,000.00 $213,675.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $185,500.00 $213,500.00 $229,500.00 $197,500.00 
47 12R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47a

Firestone T-831 or 
Equal-Load Range-Ply 

& Tread No Bid
157531, Firestone T-
831, Ply 16, Tread 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

FS T-831, Ply 16, Tread 
32/32

Goodyear G622, Ply 16, 
Tread 32/32 No Bid

FS T-831 or Equal, Ply 
16, Tread 31

47b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) No Bid $383.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $385.00 $571.00 No Bid

$592.29 

47c Total Amount No Bid $38,325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38,500.00 $57,100.00 No Bid $59,229.00 
48 P265/70R17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-10 & Tread
General HTS, Load 4, Ply 4, 

Tread ll

005374, FS Destination 
LE3, Load SL, Ply SL, 

Tread 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid FS Destination AT, Ply 4
Firestone Destination 

LE3,Load P, Ply 4 No Bid

Firestone Destination 
LE3,Load S, Ply 4, 

Tread 12

48b
Price Per Unit
(150 Units) $4,139.00 $142.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.00 $129.00 No Bid $123.88 

48c Total Amount $20,850.00 $21,373.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19,200.00 $19,350.00 No Bid $18,582.00 

49 LT245/75R17 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

49a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-20 & Tread
General Grabber HD, Ply 10, 

Tread 14
000184 FS Transforce 
AT2, Ply 10, Tread 17 No Bid

General Grabber ATX, 
10 Ply, 14/32 No Bid

FS Destination XT, Ply 
10, Tread 14/32

Goodyear Duratrac or 
Equal, Ply 10 PR, Tread 

17/32 No Bid
FST DEST MT2, Ply 

10, Tread 19

49b
Price Per Unit

(50 Units) $161.01 $150.13 No Bid $190.00 No Bid $162.00 $158.00 No Bid
$171.52 

49c Total Amount $8,050.50 $7,506.50 No Bid $9,500.00 No Bid $8,100.00 $7,900.00 No Bid $8,576.00 
50 LT285/75R16 No Bid No Bid No Bid

50a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-16 & Tread
Grabber ALTX, Ply 10, Tread 

16
009608 FS Destination XT, 

Ply 10, Tread 16 No Bid
General Grabber ATX, 

10 Ply, 14/32 No Bid
FS Destination XT, Ply 

10, Tread 14/32

Goodyear Duratrac or 
Equal, Ply 10 PR, Tread 

17/32 No Bid
FST DEST MT2, Ply 

10, Tread 20

50b
Price Per Unit

(60 Units) $202.00 $196.65 11799 $200.00 No Bid $170.00 $208.00 No Bid
$192.77 

50c Total Amount $12,120.00 $11,799.00 No Bid $12,000.00 No Bid $10,200.00 $12,480.00 No Bid $11,566.20 
51 225/70R19.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

51a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-6 & Tread Conti HSR5, Ply 14, Tread 16
248426, FS561, Ply 14, 

Tread 21 No Bid
Continental HS3, Ply 

14, Tread 16/32 No Bid No Bid
Goodyear G647, Ply 14, 

Tread 21/32
Goodyear G647, Ply 14, 

Tread 16/32
YOK 124R, Ply 14, Tread 

17

51b
Price Per Unit
(150 Units) $275.25 $297.59 No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid $246.00 $274.00 

$281.19 

51c Total Amount $41,287.50 $44,638.50 No Bid $37,500.00 No Bid No Bid $36,900.00 $41,100.00 $42,178.50 
52 275/70R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

52a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-8 & Tread Conti HSR2, Ply 18, Tread 16
012716, FS561A, Ply 14, 

Tread 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Firestone FS561, Ply 18, 

Tread 21/32

Goodyear Endurance 
RSA, Ply 14, Tread 

21/32
Goodyear Endurance RSA, 

Load H, Ply 16, Tread 19/32
HSR 2 SA, Ply 18, 

Tread 18

52b
Price Per Unit

(20 Units) $398.25 $401.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $365.00 $458.00 $484.00 
$399.76 

52c Total Amount $7,965.00 $8,030.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,300.00 $9,160.00 $9,680.00 $7,995.20 
53 295/80R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

53a

Brand Name & Tire
Name OPL#, Load 

Range, Ply 8& Tread 
Depth No Bid

000282 Bridgestone R268, 
Load H, Ply 16, Tread 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

53b
Price Per Unit

(25 Units) No Bid $554.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid

53c Total Amount No Bid $13,859.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54 305/70R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

54a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 
Range-Ply & Tread

Conti Urban HD, Load L, Ply 
20, Tread 23

0540860000, Conti Urban, 
Load L, Ply 20, Tread 23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Goodyear Urban, Load L, 
Ply 20, Tread 21/32

Goodyear Urban MCS, Load L, 
Ply 18, Tread 24/32 No Bid

54b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) $475.00 $511.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $655.00 $695.00 
No Bid

54c Total Amount $4,750.00 $5,110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,550.00 $6,950.00 No Bid
55 315/80R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

55a

Goodyear Multi  Hwy 
Duraseal or Equal, 

Load Range H, Ply & 
Tread Depth Conti HSR2, Ply 20, Tread 19

244465 FS860, Ply 20, 
Tread 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid

FS T-819, Ply 20, Tread 
32/32

Goodyear G289, Ply 
L20, Tread 26/32

Goodyear WHA, Load L, Ply 
20, Tread 24/32

FST 860, Ply 20, 
Tread 20

55b
Price Per Unit
(500 Units) $494.24 $511.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $400.00 $450.00 $595.00 

$462.00 

55c Total Amount $247,120.00 $5,110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $200,000.00 $225,000.00 $297,500.00 $231,000.00 
56 385/65R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

56a

Goodyear or Equal, 
Load Range H, Ply & 

Tread Depth Conti HSR2,  Tread 19 247780 FS818,  Tread 26 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FS818,  Ply 20, Tread 

32/32
Goodyear Amor Max, Ply 
L, Ply 20, Tread 26/32

Goodyear Armor Max 
MSA,Load J, Ply 20, Tread 

23/32
FST 818, Ply 20, 

Tread 23

56b
Price Per Unit
(1000 Units) $543.21 $563.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $570.00 $625.00 $663.00 $573.30 

56c Total Amount $543,210.00 $563,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $570,000.00 $625,000.00 $666,000.00 $573,300.00 
57 425/65R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

57a

Goodyear or Equal, 
Load Range H, Ply & 

Tread Depth Conti HSR2,  Tread 21 241235 FS818,  Tread 23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FS818,  Ply 20, Tread 

32/32
Goodyear Amor Max, Ply 
L, Ply 20, Tread 26/32 GY , Tread 23/32 

FST 818, Ply 20, 
Tread 23

57b
Price Per Unit
(600 Units) $614.47 $510.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $515.00 $680.00 $725.00 $520.80 

57c Total Amount $368,682.00 $306,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $309,000.00 $408,000.00 $435,000.00 $312,480.00 
58 P265/65R18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

58a

Firestone T-831 or 
Equal, Load Range H, 

Ply & Tread Depth General HTS,  Ply 4, Tread ll
014393 FS Desination LE3, 

Ply SL, Tread 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FS LE3, Ply 4, Tread 

14/32
Workhorse HT, Ply 4, 

Tread 12/32 No Bid
 FS Desination LE3, Ply 

4, Tread 10

58b
Price Per Unit

(20 Units) $150.00 $152.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.00 $125.00 No Bid $133.56 
58c Total Amount $3,000.00 $3,050.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,560.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $2,671.20 
59 P265/70R16 No Bid No Bid No Bid

59a

Firestone or 
Bridgestone only, Load 

Range, Ply & Tread 
Depth General HTS60, Ply 4, Tread ll

005354 FS Desination LE3, 
Ply SL, Tread 10 No Bid

Grabber HT, Ply 4, 
Tread 12/32 No Bid

FS LE3, Ply 4, Tread 
14/32

GY Territory AT, Ply 4, 
Tread 14/32 No Bid

 FS Desination LE3, Ply 
4, Tread 10

59b
Price Per Unit

(20 Units) $132.00 $127.68 No Bid $130.00 No Bid $115.00 $106.00 No Bid $123.88 

59c Total Amount $2,640.00 $2,553.60 No Bid $2,600.00 No Bid $2,300.00 $2,120.00 No Bid $2,477.60 

60 P255/70R17 No Bid No Bid No Bid

60a

Firestone or 
Bridgestone only, Load 
Range E., Ply & Tread 

Depth General HTS,  Ply 4, Tread ll
005371 FS Desination LE3, 

Ply SL, Tread 10 No Bid
Grabber HTS, Ply 4, 

Tread 12/32 No Bid
Firestone ATZ, Ply 4, 

Tread 14/32
GY Territory AT, Ply 4, 

Tread 14/32 No Bid
 FS Desination LE3, Ply 

4, Tread 10

60b
Price Per Unit

(20 Units) $172.00 $147.22 No Bid $165.00 No Bid $132.00 $115.00 No Bid $122.63 

60c Total Amount $3,440.00 $2,944.40 No Bid $3,300.00 No Bid $2,640.00 $2,300.00 No Bid $2,452.60 

61 P195/65R15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

61a

Goodyear Duratrac or 
Eq., Load Range E, Ply 

& Tread Depth 
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

11
011603 Bridgestone 

Ecopia, Ply SL, Tread 11 No Bid
General RT45, Ply 4, 

Tread 10/32 No Bid
FS AS, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
Goodyear,Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 No Bid
FST All SEASON, Ply 4, 

Tread 9

61b
Price Per Unit

(10 Units) $79.00 $110.83 No Bid $74.00 No Bid $72.00 $58.00 No Bid $62.35 

61c Total Amount $790.00 $1,108.30 No Bid $740.00 No Bid $720.00 $580.00 No Bid $623.50 

62 LT245/75R17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

62a

Goodyear Duratrac or 
Eq., Load Range E, Ply 

& Tread Depth 
General Gabber HD, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

013889 Firestone 
Transforce HT3, Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid No Bid No Bid
 Firestone Transforce 

HT3, Ply 4, Tread 14/32 No Bid No Bid N, Ply E, Tread 13

62b
Price Per Unit

(50 Units) $161.00 $147.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $133.19 

62c Total Amount $8,050.50 $7,376.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,650.00 No Bid No Bid $6,659.50 

63 P225/60VR16-RSA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

63a

Goodyr Gen or Eq., 
Load Range G, Ply & 

Tread Depth No Bid
15576440000, Ply SL, 

Tread 11 No Bid No Bid
BFG,Ply 4, Tread 

16/32 No Bid
Goodyear, Load W, Ply 

4, Tread 12/32 No Bid ALTIMAX

63b
Price Per Unit
(200 Units) No Bid $86.74 No Bid No Bid $121.00 No Bid $81.00 No Bid $93.00 

63c Total Amount No Bid $17,348.00 No Bid No Bid $24,200.00 No Bid $16,200.00 No Bid $18,600 

64 P235/55R17 RSA No Bid No Bid

64a

 Goodyr/ Gen or 
Equal,Load Range, Ply 

& Tread Depth 
General Gmax Justice, Ply SL, 

Tread 10
15553940000, Ply SL, 

Tread 10 No Bid
General, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
BFG,Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 Ply 4, 10/32
Goodyear, Load W,Ply 4, 

Tread 12/32 No Bid G-MAX

64b
Price Per Unit
(100 Units) $118.00 $119.74 No Bid $107.00 $130.00 $102.00 $93.00 No Bid $110.00 

64c Total Amount $11,800.00 $11,974.00 No Bid $10,700.00 $13,000.00 $10,200.00 $9,300.00 No Bid $11,000.00 

65 P265/60R17 RSA No Bid No Bid

65a

Goodyr/Gen or Eq., 
Load Range G, Ply & 

Tread Depth General Gmax Justice #15553960000' No Bid General BFG, Ply 4 Ply 4, 10/32
Goodyear, Ply 4, Tread 

12/32 No Bid G-MAX

65b
Price Per Unit
(2000 Units) $121.43 $127.83 No Bid $114.50 $157.00 $114.00 $102.00 No Bid $133.00 

65c Total Amount $242,860.00 $255,660.00 No Bid $229,000.00 $314,000.00 $228,000.00 $204,000.00 No Bid $266,000.00 

66 P235/50r18 No Bid No Bid

66a

Goodyear/Gen or Eq., 
Load Range J/L, Ply & 

Tread Depth 
General Gmax Justice, Ply SL, 

Tread 10
#15553930000, Ply XL, 

Tread 10 No Bid
General, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
BFG,Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 Ply 4, 10/32
Goodyear, Load W, Ply 

4, Tread 12/32 No Bid G-MAX

66b
Price Per Unit
(500 Units) $142.06 $150.06 No Bid $136.50 $148.00 $126.00 $124.00 No Bid $142.00 

66c Total Amount $71,030.00 $75,030.00 No Bid $68,250.00 $74,000.00 $63,000.00 $62,000.00 No Bid $71,000.00 

67 P225/60r18 No Bid No Bid

67a

Goodyear Gen or Eq., 
Load Range J/L, Ply & 

Tread Depth  Ply SL, Tread 10
#15553920000, Ply SL, 

Tread 10 No Bid
General, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
BFG,Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 Ply 4, 10/32
Goodyear, Load W.Ply 4, 

Tread 12/32 No Bid G-MAX

67b
Price Per Unit
(200 Units) $112.71 $117.91 No Bid $107.00 $135.00 $110.00 $103.00 No Bid $116.00 

67c Total Amount $22,542.00 $23,582.00 No Bid $21,400.00 $27,000.00 $22,000.00 $20,600.00 No Bid $23,200.00 

68 P275/55r20 No Bid No Bid

68a

Goodyear Gen or Eq., 
Load Range L, Ply & 

Tread Depth  Ply SL, Tread 10
#1555390810000, Ply SL, 

Tread 11 No Bid
General, Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
BFG,Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 Ply 4, 10/32
Goodyear, Load V, Ply 4, 

Tread 12/32 No Bid G-MAX

68b
Price Per Unit
(2000 Units) $140.24 $150.06 No Bid $136.50 $177.00 $129.00 $124.00 No Bid $135.39 

68c Total Amount $280,480.00 $300,120.00 No Bid $273,000.00 $354,000.00 $258,000.00 $248,000.00 No Bid $270,780.00 

69 11R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

69a.
26/32 mud/Snow 

(Tread & Unit Price) 26 Tread, $151.96
BDM-666645 Tread 26 

$140.00 26/32 Tread, $177.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 26/32 Tread, $168.85 Tread 26/32, $138.76 Tread 26, $117.90

69b.

Deepest Tread
offered-mud/Snow 

(Unit Price) Tread 26  $140.00 Tread 26/32  $177.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid 32/32 Tread, $217.72 Tread 26/32, $138.76 No Bid
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ITB Number: 2025-013
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: April 28, 2025
Cost Opening:  May 5, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

69c. Section with Cap $25.00 $15.00 

R-120-$21.00, R-122-
$23.00, R-130-$29.00, 
R-135-$38.00R-R-140-

$40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $156.76 No Bid

69d. Spot w/Cap $8.00 $5.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $146.76 $0.00 

70 12R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

70a. 
26/32 mud/Snow 

(Tread & Unit Price) 26 Tread, $157.00
BDM-666653 Tread 26 

$155.00 Tread 26  $182.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid Tread 26/32  $181.56  Tread 26/32  $150.78  Tread 26, $129.08

70b. 

Deepest Tread 
offered-mud/Snow 

(Unit Price) Tread 26 $155.00 Tread 26/32  $182.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid Tread 32/32  $235.13  Tread 26/32  $150.78  No Bid

70c. Section w/Cap $25.00 $15.00 

R-120-$21.00, R-122-
$23.00, R-130-$29.00, 
R-135-$38.00R-R-140-

$40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $168.78 $12.00 

70d. Spot w/Cap $8.00 $5.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $158.78 $0.00 

71 315/80R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

71a.
26/32 mud/Snow 

(Tread & Unit Price) Tread 26, $177.00
BDM-667064 Tread 26 

$198.00 Tread 26/32  $201.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Tread 26/32  $191.31  Tread 26/32 $151.15 Tread 26, $164.90

71b. Section w/Cap $25.00 $15.00 

R-120-$21.00, R-122-
$23.00, R-130-$29.00, 
R-135-$38.00R-R-140-

$40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $169.15 $12.00 

71c. Spot w/Cap $8.00 $5.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $159.15 $0.00 

72 385/65R22.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72a.

21/32 mud and 
snow (Tread & Unit 

price) No Bid
BRM3 012206, Tread 26  

$225.00 Tread 21/32, $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Tread 22/32  $235.46  Tread 21/32, $229.85 Tread 22, $221.85

72b. Section w/Cap No Bid $15.00 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $247.85 $12.00 

72c. Spot w/Cap No Bid $5.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $237.85 $0.00 
Bidding on: Name

or System Conti CLC (COLD) Bandag Retreads
Marangoni Unitread & 

Ringtread No Bid No Bid No Bid Goodyear Retread Oliver No Bid
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Number of bids Responsive: 6
Separate Sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: 
(Waived)

Witness:_________________

Agent:___________________ 11
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