ITB No. |2025-123 PURCHASING AND Bid Opening: 11/06/2026
Right of Way Mowin, j
ITB Nam | o O ey & BID TABULATION FERFECEN 2/4/2022
and Maintenance Svcs Opening
(Annual Contract with 2
. Agent: Briana Triplett,
Options to Renew)
\%
ASAP LAND(?;S:’]]}E; i«:gAGEMENT FACILITY MAINGTlEgGI;ICE & SERVICE PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 WK Cyel
— . Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If] Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If 08 (r::win & Y€l Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If
g Miles) (inFeet) | (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required herbiciﬁe) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required
1
Rockbridge Road, includes:
islands and medians, cement medians.
(N. Clarendon Ave. to Hwy 124) 12.01 5-10' $5,824.85 N/A $5,235.00 N/A $5,404.50 N/A $4,500.00 N/A $3,933.00 N/A $51,943.25 N/A $5,280.00 N/A
2 Booker Avenue
(Kelly St. to Dead End) 0.04 5'-10 $19.40 N/A $20.00 N/A $18.00 N/A $20.00 N/A $38.00 N/A $173.00 N/A $110.00 N/A
3
Kelly Street
(N. Clarendon Ave. to Reed St.) 0.17 5'-10 $82.45 N/A $75.00 N/A $76.50 N/A $60.00 N/A $70.00 N/A $735.25 N/A $110.00 N/A
4
Proctor Avenue
(Kelly St. to Dead End) 0.48 5'-10 $232.80 N/A $210.00 N/A $216.00 N/A $180.00 N/A $160.00 N/A $2,076.00 N/A $220.00 N/A
5
Rowland Road
(Rockbridge Rd. to S. Indian Creek Dr.) 2.03 5'-10 $974.40 $10.10 $885.00 $1,000.00 $913.50 $1,116.50 $720.00 $100.00 $603.00 $78.00 $8,779.75 $2,000.00 $890.00 $250.00
6 Allgood Circle
(Rockbridge Rd. to Dead End.) 2 5'-10 $970.00 N/A $872.00 N/A $900.00 N/A $740.00 N/A $602.00 N/A $8,650.00 N/A $880.00 N/A
7 |Allgood Road
(Rockbridge Rd. to Redan Rd.) 1.9 510 $970.00 $10.00 $829.00 $900.00 $855.00 $1,045.00 $730.00 $90.00 $573.00 $73.00 $8,217.50 $1,900.00 $880.00 $250.00
8 Elam Road
(Rowland Rd. to S. Hairston Rd.) 0.9 5-10' $436.50 N/A $393.00 N/A $405.00 N/A $350.00 N/A $1,676.00 N/A $3,892.50 N/A $440.00 N/A
®  |Ellis Road
(Rowland Rd. to Redan Rd.) 0.64 5'-10 $305.40 $5.00 $280.00 $300.00 $288.00 $352.00 $240.00 $75.00 $207.00 $25.00 $2,768.00 $640.00 $350.00 $200.00
10 |Sheppard Road
(Rockbridge Rd. to the Stn. Mtn. City Limit) 1 5-10' $485.00 N/A $435.96 N/A $450.00 N/A $360.00 N/A $312.00 N/A $4,325.00 N/A $440.00 N/A
11 Hambrick Road, includes:
islands and medians
(See Note 5) (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to
Rockbridge) 3.82 5'-10" $1,833.60 NO BID $1,665.36 $1,781.68 $1,719.00 $2,101.00 $1,390.00 $175.00 $1,159.00 $147.00 $16,521.50 $3,820.00 $1,670.00 $250.00
12
Rays Road
(E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Rockbridge Rd.) 4.52 5-10' $2,168.60 $22.60 $1,970.53 $2,108.17 $2,034.00 $2,486.00 $1,620.00 $250.00 $1,404.00 $174.00 $19,549.00 $4,520.00 $1,980.00 $325.00
13 Alford Road
(Stephenson Rd. to S. Deshon Rd.) 1.63 10-15' $790.55 N/A $710.64 N/A $733.50 N/A $580.00 N/A $600.00 N/A $7,049.75 N/A $735.00 N/A
14 Stephenson Road
(See Note 5)(Rockbridge Rd. to Rock Mtn.
Rd.) 9.44 10'-15' $4,578.40 N/A $4,115.46 N/A $4,248.00 N/A $3,470.00 N/A $3,738.00 N/A $40,828.00 N/A $4,200.00 N/A
15
S. Deshon Road (See Note 5)
(Stephenson Rd. to Wellborn Rd.) 6.4 10-15' $3,104.00 N/A $2,790.14 N/A $2,880.00 N/A $2,380.00 N/A $2,362.00 N/A $27,680.00 N/A $2,860.00 N/A
16
N. Deshon Road
(Rockbridge Rd. to the County Line) 1.5 10-15' $727.50 N/A $653.94 N/A $675.00 N/A $540.00 N/A $554.00 N/A $6,487.50 N/A $660.00 N/A
17 [Bermuda Road
(N. Deshon Rd. to the County Line) 3.38 5'-10 $1,639.30 N/A $1,473.54 N/A $1,521.00 N/A $1,230.00 N/A $1,050.00 N/A $14,618.52 N/A $1,500.00 N/A
18 |Plcasant Hill Road
(Hwy 124 to the County Line) 5.7 10'-20' $2,376.00 $28.50 $2,484.97 NO BID $2,565.00 $3,135.00 $2,000.00 $275.00 $2,240.00 $219.00 $24,652.00 $5,700.00 $2,630.00 $150.00
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Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cyel
S ot ez Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If] Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If os (I::win & Y€ Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If
g Miles) (in Feet) (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required herhici(gie) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required
19  |Rogers Lake Road
(See Note 5) (1270 Rogers Lake Rd. to S.
Deshon Rd.) 2.3 5'-10' $1,115.50 N/A $1,002.70 N/A $1,035.00 N/A $830.00 N/A $734.00 N/A $9,947.05 N/A $930.00 N/A
20 |Asbury Drive
(Stephenson to Hwy 124) 1.44 5-10' $698.40 N/A $627.78 N/A $648.00 N/A $520.00 N/A $450.00 N/A $6,228.00 N/A $770.00 N/A
2 Union Grove Road
(Pleasant Hill Rd. to DeKalb County Line
and Hwy 124 to Rockdale County Line) 6.0 10'-20" $2,910.00 N/A $2,615.76 N/A $2,700.00 N/A $2,180.00 N/A $2,322.00 N/A $25,950.00 N/A $2,640.00 N/A
» Norris Lake Road
(Gwinnett County Line to Gwinnett County
Line) 1.3 5'-10" $630.50 N/A $566.74 N/A $585.00 N/A $460.00 N/A $408.00 N/A $5,622.44 N/A $550.00 N/A
23 Norris Lake Drive
i (Norris Lake Rd. to Pleasant Hill Rd.) 0.74 5'-10" $358.90 N/A $322.61 N/A $333.00 N/A $260.00 N/A $240.00 N/A $3,200.23 N/A $330.00 N/A
24 |Smith James Road
(Pleasant Hill Rd. to Norris Lake Dr.) 0.5 5-10' $242.50 N/A $217.98 N/A $225.00 N/A $180.00 N/A $160.00 N/A $2,162.54 N/A $220.00 N/A
Giles Road
25 1.34 5'-10'
(Wellborn Rd. to Phillips Rd.)
$649.90 N/A $584.18 N/A $603.00 N/A $480.00 N/A $420.00 N/A $5,795.56 N/A $770.00 N/A
26
S. Stone Mtn. Lithonia Road
(Rockbridge Rd. to City Limit) 12.7 10'-20" $6,096.00 $63.50 $5,536.69 $5,923.40 $5,715.00 $6,985.00 $4,650.00 $600.00 $4,999.00 $489.00 $54,927.24 $12,700.00 $5,610.00 $750.00
27
N. Stone Mtn. Lithonia Road
(Rockbridge Rd. to Cross Railroad) 6.3 10'-20" $3,055.50 N/A $2,746.54 N/A $2,835.00 N/A $2,200.00 N/A $2,436.00 N/A $27,247.44 N/A $2,750.00 N/A
8 King Road
(Walker Rd. to Panola Rd.) 1.57 10'-20" $761.45 N/A $684.45 N/A $706.50 N/A $560.00 N/A $616.00 N/A $6,790.25 N/A $670.00 N/A
29 Sheppard Place
(Redan Rd. to Dead End) 0.45 10'-20' $218.25 N/A $196.18 N/A $202.50 N/A $150.00 N/A $180.00 N/A $1,946.33 N/A $330.00 N/A
30 Redan Road
(Covington Hwy to S. Stn Mtn Lithonia Rd.) 6.13 10'-20" $2,942.40 $30.65 $2,672.43 $2,859.09 $2,758.50 $3,371.50 $2,200.00 $200.00 $2,415.00 $255.00 $25,960.55 $6,130.00 $2,750.00 $350.00
31
Glenwood Rd./Glenwood Ave.
(Covington Hwy and Wilkinson Dr./I-20) 12.4 5'-10" $6,014.00 N/A $5,405.90 N/A $5,580.00 N/A $4,500.00 N/A $3,924.00 N/A $52,514.11 N/A $5,500.00 N/A
TOTAL (GROUP I: #1-31) $53,212.05|$170.35 $48,279.48 $14,872.34 $49,828.50 $20,592.00 $40,280.00 $1,765.00 $40,585.00 $1,460.00 $477,238.26 $37,410.00 $49,655.00 $2,525.00
|Sub Total Sub Total JSub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total SubTotal Sub Total  Sub Total Sub Total  Sub Total
ASAP LANDSCAPE MANAGEMENT |FACILITY MAINTENANCE & SERVICEY]
GROUP LLC GROUP PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
GROUP II
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g Length (in Width (in (mowing & herbicide) Needed Only | (mowing & herbicide) ¥ .. g . .g Only (mowing & herbicide) Only (mowing & herbicide) Only & herbicide) sing ¥ (mowing & herbicide) sing Y
Miles) Feet) herbicide) herbicide)
32 McDaniel Street
(Conyers St. to Dead End) 0.54 10'-20" $261.90|N/A $235.41|N/A $243.00|N/A $180.00|N/A $277.50|N/A $2,335.50|N/A $230.00|N/A
33 Conyers Street
(Turner Hill Rd. to Rock Chapel Rd.) 0.86 10'-20" $417.10|N/A $374.92|N/A $387.00|N/A $280.00|N/A $427.50|N/A $3,719.50|N/A $350.00 |N/A
34 Rhodes Street
(Conyer Rd. to Dead End) 0.11 5'-10' $53.35|N/A $47.95|N/A $49.50{N/A $40.00|N/A $65.00|N/A $475.75|N/A $110.00{N/A
35
Silver Hill Road
(Hugh Howell Rd. to E. Ponce de Leon Ave) 2.77 10'-20" $1,343.45|N/A $1,207.60|N/A $1,246.50|N/A $950.00 |N/A $1,360.00|N/A $11,980.25|N/A $1,210.00|N/A
36 Lilburn S. Mtn Road
(Silver Hill Rd. to Gwinnett County Line) 34 10'-20" $1,649.00|N/A $1,482.26|N/A $1,530.00|N/A $1,160.00|N/A $1,690.00|N/A $14,705.00 |N/A $1,520.00|N/A
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Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cycl
— i i Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If| Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If o8 (l::win & Yl Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If
g Miles) (in Feet) (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required herhici(gie) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required
37
Mountain View Connector
(Mtn. View Dr. to W. Mtn. St.) 0.42 10'-20" $203.70{N/A $183.10{N/A $189.00|N/A $130.00{N/A $222.50{N/A $1,816.05|N/A $220.00|N/A
38 Central Drive
(Cimmarron Dr. to Goldsmith) 2.59 5'-10' $1,243.20 $12.90 $1,129.13 $1,208.00 $1,165.50 $1,424.50 $880.00 $30.00 $1,062.50 $125.00 $11,201,750.00 $2,590.00 $1,320.00 $250.00
39 Brer Rabbit Road
(See Note 5) (Stonegate Ind. Blvd. to
Hambrick Rd.) 1.46 5-10' $708.10|N/A $636.50|N/A $657.00|N/A $480.00|N/A $107.50|N/A $6,314.24|N/A $660.00 |N/A
40 Kensington Road
(Redan Rd. to Memorial Dr.) 52 10'-20" $2,496.00 $26.00 $2,266.99 $2,425.33 $2,340.00 $2,860.00 $1,780.00 NO BID $2,066.00 $200.00 $22,490.00 $5,200.00 $2,220.00 $425.00
41 Porter Road
(Kensington Rd. to Covington Hwy) 1.34 5'-10' $649.90|N/A $584.18|N/A $603.00 |N/A $440.00|N/A $2,266.00|N/A $5,795.35|N/A $590.00|N/A
42 |Durham Parkway
(Kensington Rd. to S. Indian Creek Dr.) 0.64 10'-20" $310.40|N/A $279.01|N/A $288.00|N/A $200.00|N/A $325.00|N/A $2,768.00 |IN/A $320.00|N/A
43 George Luther Drive
(Memorial Dr. to Durham Park Dr.) 1 10'-30" $480.00 NO BID $435.96 $466.41 $450.00 $550.00 $320.00 $30.00 $481.25 $47.50 $4,325.00 $1,000.00 $440.00 $185.00
44
Memorial College Avenue
(Memorial Ave. to Durham Park Ave.) 0.92 10'-20" $446.20|N/A $401.08|N/A $424.00|N/A $300.00|N/A $457.50|N/A $3,979.00 |N/A $420.00|N/A
45 Norman Road
(Rays Rd. to Church St.) 0.65 5'-10' $315.25|N/A $283.37|N/A $292.50|N/A $220.00{N/A $214.00{N/A $2,811.25|N/A $300.00 |N/A
46
North Indian Creek Drive
(Montreal Rd. to Memorial Dr.) 1.7 5'-10' $824.50{N/A $741.13[N/A $765.00 |N/A $580.00 |N/A $530.00{N/A $7,352.33|N/A $770.00 N/A
47  |Snapfinger Road
(Austin Dr. to Columbia to Snapfinger
Wood Dr.) 3.22 10'-20" $1,561.70 $16.10 $1,403.79 $1,501.84 $1,449.00 $1,771.00 $1,100.00 $30.00 $1,224.00 $124.00 $13,926.05 $3,220.00 $1,430.00 $350.00
48 [Amsler Road
(Flakes Mill Rd. to Scarborough Rd.) 1.45 5'-10" $703.25|N/A $632.14|N/A $652.50|N/A $500.00 |N/A $458.00|N/A $6,271.25|N/A $660.00 |N/A
49 Shadow Rock Drive
(S. Stn. Mtn. Lithonia Rd. to S. Stn. Mtn.
Lithonia Rd.) 3.37 5'-10' $1,634.45|N/A $1,469.18|N/A $1,516.50|N/A $1,160.00|N/A $1,088.00|N/A $14,575.25|N/A $1,490.00|N/A
50 Stewart Mill Road
(Rockbridge Rd. to Bermuda Rd.) 0.75 10'-30" $363.75|N/A $326.97|N/A $337.50|N/A $250.00 |N/A $288.00|N/A $3,243.75|N/A $330.00|N/A
51 Swift Street
(Covington Hwy. to Max Cleland Blvd.) 1.14 5'-10" $552.90|N/A $496.99 |N/A $513.00|N/A $380.00|N/A $350.00|N/A $4,930.50|N/A $550.00 |N/A
52 |Railroad Avenue
(Brockett Rd. to Lynburn Dr.) 1.36 10'-20" $659.60 |N/A $592.90{N/A $612.00|N/A $460.00 [N/A $524.00|N/A $5,882.00|N/A $600.00 [N/A
53
Briarcliff Road (See Note 5)
(Henderson Mill Rd. to N. Druid Hill Rd.) 8.54 5-10' $4,141.90|N/A $3,723.09|N/A $3,843.00|N/A $2,900.00|N/A $2,862.00|N/A $36,935.05|N/A $3,860.00|N/A
54 |Briarcliff Way
(Briarcliff Rd. to Henderson Mill Rd.) 0.31 5'-10' $150.35|N/A $135.14|N/A $139.50|N/A $100.00 |N/A $102.00{N/A $1,340.75|N/A $160.00 |N/A
55 Biltmore Drive
(Clifton Rd. to Lavista Rd.) 1.4 5-10' $679.00|N/A $610.34|N/A $630.00|N/A $480.00|N/A $434.00|N/A $6,055.00 |N/A $660.00 |N/A
s Mercer University Drive
(Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Henderson Mill
Rd.) 1.45 10'-20" $703.25|N/A $632.14|N/A $652.50|N/A $480.00|N/A $546.00|N/A $6,271.25|N/A $660.00 |N/A
57 Old Stn. Mtn. Rd.
(Lilburn-Stn. Mtn. Rd. to Gwinnett County
Line) 24 10'-20" $1,164.00|N/A $1,046.30|N/A $1,080.00 |N/A $800.00|N/A $902.00|N/A $10,380.00 |N/A $1,100.00|N/A




ASAP LANDSCAPE MANAGEMENT

FACILITY MAINTENANCE & SERVICEY

GROUP LLC GROUP PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cycl
— i i Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If| Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If o8 (l::;win & Yl Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If
g Miles) (in Feet) (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required herhici(gie) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required
58 |S. Hairston Rd.
(Wesley Chapel Rd. to Rockbridge Rd.) 16.8 10'-20" $8,064.00 $84.00 $7,324.12 $7,835.68 $7,560.00 $9,240.00 $5,800.00 $30.00 $6,289.00 $646.00 $72,660.18 $16,800.00 $7,370.00 $750.00
59
N. Hairston Rd.
(Rockbridge Rd. to E. Ponce de Leon Ave.) 8.1 10'-20" $3,888.00 $40.50 $3,531.27 $3,777.92 $3,645.00 $4,455.00 $2,300.00 $30.00 $3,188.00 $312.00 $35,032.50 $8,100.00 $3,530.00 $425.00
TOTAL (GROUP II: #32-59) $ 35,668.20 $179.50 $32,212.96 $17,215.18 $ 33,260.50 $20,300.50 $24,650.00 $150.00 $29,807.25 $1,454.50 $11,510,120.75 $36,910.00 $33,080.00 $2,385.00
Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total
LY L ASAP LANDSCAPE MANAGEMENT |FACILITY MAINTENANCE & SERVICE
GROUP 111 Service Area| Service Area A GROUP L:C GROUP PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle
) . Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Edging As Needed . Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing . Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle .
Item # M Locati
em Il e Miles) (inFeet) | (mowing & herbicide) | Needed Only | (mowing & herbicide) Only (}'l‘e“r’;vi'c';ﬁef‘ Only (mowing & herbicide) Only (mowing & herbicide) Only & herbicide) RERTE AORC Oy ||| (o 6 et || o SORee Oty
60 Marjan Drive
(Presidential Pkwy to Dead End) 0.31 5'-10' $150.35|N/A $135.14|N/A $139.50|N/A $100.00|N/A S121.12|N/A $1,340.00 |N/A $180.00|N/A
61 |Northlake Parkway
(Henderson Mill Rd. to Lawrenceville Hwy.) 2.64 10'-20 $1,267.20 $13.20 $1,150.93 $1,231.32 $1,188.00 $1,452.00 $980.00 $200.00 $1,145.15 $119.94 $11,418.00 $2,640.00 $1,180.00 $230.00
62 |Northcrest Road
(Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Oakcliff Rd.) 1.21 5'-10" $580.80 $10.00 $527.51 $564.35 $544.50 $665.50 $430.00 $100.00 $450.07 $54.62 $5,233.25 $1,210.00 $550.00 $200.00
63 Pleasantdale Road
(Tucker Norcross Rd. to I-85) 5.61 10'-20' $2,692.80 $28.05 $2,445.73 $2,616.56 $2,524.50 $3,085.50 $2,000.00 $200.00 $2,008.30 $205.20 $24,263.25 $5,610.00 $2,480.00 $250.00
o4 Presidential Parkway
(Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Buckeye Rd.) 2.16 10'-20" $1,047.60|N/A $941.67|N/A $972.00|N/A $760.00 |N/A $767.60|N/A $9,342.00|N/A $990.00 |N/A
65 Pangborn Road
(Lavista Rd. to Frazier Rd.) 2.55 5'-10" $1,236.75|N/A $1,111.69|N/A $1,147.50|N/A $900.00 |N/A $746.70|N/A $11,028.75|N/A $1,100.00|N/A
Montreal Road
66 (See Note 5) (N. Indian Creek Dr. to
Lawrenceville Hwy. to Lavista Rd.) 6.16 10'-20" $2,956.80 $30.80 $2,685.51 $2,873.08 $2,772.00 $3,388.00 $2,200.00 $200.00 $2,195.45 $237.00 $26,642.00 $6,160.00 $2,750.00 $250.00
67 Montreal Circle
(Montreal Rd. to Montreal Rd.) 0.63 10'-20" $305.55|N/A $274.65|N/A $283.50|N/A $200.00 |N/A $294.50|N/A $2,724.75|N/A $275.00|N/A
68 Montreal Court
(Montreal Cir. To Dead End) 0.3 5'-10' $145.50{N/A $130.78 |N/A $135.00|N/A $100.00|N/A $114.00{N/A $1,297.05|N/A $110.00{N/A
69
North Druid Hills Road.
Note: The parameter of North Druid Hills is
from Valley Brook to I-85 bridge ONLY.
(See Note 5) (Lawrenceville Hwy to
Briarcliff Rd.) 7.47 5'-10' $3,585.60 $37.35 $3,256.62 $3,484.08 $3,361.50 $4,108.50 $2,700.00 $200.00 $2,361.70 $273.60 $32,307.75 $7,470.00 $3,300.00 $350.00
70 Valley Brook Road, includes:
islands and medians
(E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville
Hwy) 2.9 5'-10' $1,392.00 $14.50 $1,264.28 $1,352.58 $1,305.00 $1,595.00 $1,040.00 $200.00 $1,064.00 $133.00 $12,542.50 $2,900.00 $1,320.00 $285.00
71 DeKalb Ind. Way
(Lawrenceville Hwy to N. Arcadia) 2.31 5-10' $1,108.80 $11.55 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,039.50 $1,270.50 $820.00 $200.00 $839.56 $105.69 $9,990.75 $2,310.00 $1,040.00 $285.00
7 Winn Way
(DeKalb Ind. Blvd. to N. Arcadia Ave) 0.71 5'-10' $339.35 $10.00 $465.00 $360.00 $319.50 $390.50 $250.00 $200.00 $260.07 $32.06 $3,070.75 $710.00 $330.00 $185.00
North Arcadia Ave.: County
owned plot is located at the corner of
73 Springdale St. and N. Arcadia Ave.
contractor can mow further into this lot to
ensure it is kept in good order.
(DeKalb Ind. Way to Sam Crossing) 0.5 5-10' $237.50 $5.00 $465.00 $240.00 $225.00 $275.00 $170.00 $100.00 $200.64 $22.61 $2,162.05 $500.00 $220.00 $185.00




ASAP LANDSCAPE MANAGEMENT

FACILITY MAINTENANCE & SERVICEY

GROUP LLC GROUP PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cycl
— i i Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If| Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If o8 (l::win & Yl Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If
g Miles) (in Feet) (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required herhici(gie) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required
- Buckeye Road
(Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Presidential
Pkwy) 0.23 5'-10" $111.55|N/A $350.00|N/A $103.50|N/A $80.00|N/A $87.88|N/A $994.75|N/A $110.00{N/A
75 Chamblee-Tucker Road, includes: islands
and medians. Note: Contractor shall pay
extra attention to shrubbery in the islands
and medians.
(I-85 to Lavista Rd.) 11.1 10'-20' $5,328.00 $55.50 $4,839.15 $5,177.15 $4,995.00 $6,105.00 $4,060.00 $200.00 $3,953.90 $405.65 $48,007.50 $11,100.00 $4,850.00 $425.00
76 |Cooledge Road
(E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville
Hwy) 1.84 5'-10 $892.40|N/A $802.16|N/A $828.00|N/A $640.00 |N/A $674.50|N/A $7,958.00|N/A $790.00 |N/A
7 Brockett Road
(E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Hwy 78) 3.32 5'-10 $1,610.20|N/A $1,447.38|N/A $1,494.00|N/A $1,200.00 |N/A $712.50|N/A $14,359.00 |IN/A $1,470.00|N/A
78 Bancroft Circle
(Fellowship Rd. to Railroad Ave) 0.32 510 $155.20|N/A $139.50|N/A $144.00|N/A $100.00 |N/A $123.50|N/A $1,384.00|N/A $175.00|N/A
79
Fellowship Road
(Lavista Rd. to Lawrenceville Rd.) 2 5-10' $960.00 $10.00 $871.92 $932.82 $900.00 $1,100.00 $720.00 $100.00 $732.69 $91.44 $8,650.00 $2,000.00 $880.00 $225.00
30 McLendon Drive
(E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville
Hwy) 1.4 5'-10 $679.00|N/A $610.34|N/A $630.00 |N/A $500.00 |N/A $513.00|N/A $6,055.00 |N/A $660.00 |N/A
81 Juliette Road - Include Medians
(E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Dead End) 4.5 10'-20' $2,182.50|N/A $1,961.82|N/A $2,025.00 |N/A $1,600.00 |N/A $1,605.50|N/A $19,462.50 IN/A $1,980.00|N/A
82 East Ponce de Leon Avenue
(Sam Crossing to N. Hairston Rd.) 7.1 10'-30' $3,408.00|NO BID $3,095.31 $3,311.51 $3,195.00 $3,905.00 $2,600.00 $200.00 $2,833.85 $259.35 $30,707.25|NO BID $3,100.00 $425.00
Idlewood Road
83 (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville
Hwy) 4.31 5'-10' $2,090.35|N/A $1,878.98|N/A $1,939.50|N/A $1,540.00|N/A $788.50|N/A $18,640.75 N/A $1,920.00|N/A
84
Sarr Parkway (See Note 5)
(Idlewood Rd. to Mtn. Ind. Blvd) 1.62 10'-20' $785.70|N/A $706.25|N/A $729.00|N/A $580.00|N/A $722.00|N/A $7,006.05 |N/A $710.00|N/A
85 |Roadhaven Drive
(E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Greer Cir.) 1.34 5'-10 $649.90 |N/A $610.98|N/A $603.00 |N/A $480.00 |N/A $491.63 |N/A $5,795.50|N/A $600.00 |N/A
86 Belvedere Lane
(Columbia Dr. to Rupert Rd.) 0.77 5-10' $373.42|N/A $335.68|N/A $346.50|N/A $275.00|N/A $280.25|N/A $3,330.25|N/A $340.00|N/A
g7  |Bouldercrest Road
(See Note 5) (Atl. City Limit to Henry
County Line) 8.04 10'-20' $3,859.20 $40.20 $3,505.11 $3,749.93 $3,618.00 $4,422.00 $2,900.00 $200.00 $3,749.65 $293.55 $34,773.00 $8,040.00 $3,540.00 $425.00
88
Glenwood Rd./Glenwood Ave.
(Covington Hwy and Wilkinson Dr./I-20) 12.4 10'-20' $5,952.00 $62.00 $5,405.90 $5,783.48 $5,580.00 $6,820.00 $4,500.00 $200.00 $4,365.03 $488.05 $53,630.00 $12,400.00 $5,500.00 $425.00
TOTAL (GROUP I1I: #60-88) $ 46,084.02 $328.15 $42,414.99 $32,876.86 $ 43,087.50 $ 38,582.50 $ 34,425.00 $2,500.00 $34,203.24 $2,721.76 $414,116.40 $63,050.00 $42,450.00 $4,145.00
Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total $ Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total
ASAP LANDSESEI; r:gAGEMENT FACILITY MAINgEg;‘Jl:CE & SERVICE PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
GROUP IV
Proximity Proximity Cost Per 6 Wk Cyel
ftem # T Service Area Ser\{ice A.rea Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Edging As Needed o8 (l::win & yele Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Edeing As Needed Onl Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edeing As Needed Onl
g '-eh';l';’l“‘ )('“ W'Fd"‘t)('" (mowing & herbicide) | Needed Only | (mowing & herbicide) Only herhici‘gie) Only (mowing & herbicide) Only (mowing & herbicide) Only & herbicide) ging Y| (mowing & herbicide) ging 2/
iles eel
89 Cedar Grove Road
(Bouldercrest Rd. to Moreland Ave) 2 10'-20' $960.00 $10.00 $871.92 $932.82 $900.00 $1,100.00 $650.00 $100.00 $938.75 $96.25 $8,650.00 $2,000.00 $880.00 $225.00




ASAP LANDSCAPE MANAGEMENT

FACILITY MAINTENANCE & SERVICEY

PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC

REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS

RUSSELL LANDSCAPE

UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC

WORLDSCAPES LLC

GROUP LLC GROUP
Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cycl
S ot ez Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If] Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If os (I::win & Y€ Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If
g Miles) (in Feet) (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required herhici(gie) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required
90 Constitution Road
(See Note 5) (Bouldercrest Rd. to Bailey
St.) 3.35 10'-20" $1,624.75|N/A $1,460.46 |N/A $1,507.50|N/A $1,100.00|N/A $1,378.00|N/A $14,488.75|N/A $1,480.00|N/A
91 Fayetteville Road
(See Note 5) (Bouldercrest Rd. to Glenwood
Rd. to Moreland Ave) 3.7 10'-20" $1,776.00 $18.50 $1,613.05 $1,725.71 $1,665.00 $2,035.00 $1,200.00 $270.00 $1,372.00 $142.00 $16,002.05 $3,700.00 $1,650.00 $300.00
92 Key Road (See Note 5)
(Bouldercrest Rd. to Fayetteville Rd.) 1.79 5'-10" $868.15|N/A $780.36 |N/A $805.50|N/A $580.00 |N/A $1,085.00|N/A $7,741.75|N/A $770.00 |N/A
93 East Conley Road
(Cedar Grove Rd. to County Line) 1.45 10'-20" $703.25|N/A $632.14|N/A $652.50|N/A $450.00|N/A $680.00[N/A $6,271.25|N/A $660.00 |N/A
94 Conley Road
(Moreland Ave. to County Line) 1.51 10'-20" $732.35|N/A $658.29|N/A $679.50|N/A $500.00|N/A $710.00|N/A $6,530.75|N/A $670.00|N/A
95 Moore Road
(Bouldercrest Rd. to Cedar Grove Rd.) 1.76 10'-20" $853.60|N/A $767.28 |N/A $792.00|N/A $580.00 |N/A $827.50|N/A $7,612.00|N/A $770.00 |N/A
96 |Henrico Road
(Moore Rd. to Moreland Ave) 3.7 10'-20" $1,794.50|N/A $1,613.05|N/A $1,665.00|N/A $1,200.00|N/A $1,390.00|N/A $16,002.50 |N/A $1,650.00|N/A
97 West Side Place
(Henrico Rd. to Dead End) 0.15 5'-10' $72.75|N/A $65.39|N/A $67.50|N/A $50.00|N/A $60.00|N/A $648.75|N/A $110.00|N/A
98 Koppers Road
(Henrico Rd. to Dead End) 0.29 5-10' $140.65|N/A $126.42|N/A $130.50|N/A $100.00[N/A $117.50|N/A $1,254.25|N/A $150.00|N/A
99 Oakvale Road
(River Rd. to Panthersville Rd.) 1.4 10'-20 $672.00 $10.00 $610.34 $652.97 $630.00 $770.00 $40.00 $40.00 $525.00 $54.00 $6,055.00 $1,400.00 $660.00 $225.00
100  |Panthersville Road
(See Note 5) (Flat Shoal Pkwy to
Bouldercrest Rd.) 3.73 10'-20" $1,790.40 $18.65 $1,626.13 $1,739.70 $1,678.50 $2,051.50 $120.00 $270.00 $1,738.00 $144.00 $16,132.00 $3,730.00 $1,650.00 $300.00
101
River Road (See Note 5)
(Bouldercrest Rd. to Hwy 155) 10.78 10'-30" $5,174.40 $53.90 $4,699.64 $5,027.89 $4,851.00 $5,929.00 $3,600.00 $1,000.00 $5,655.00 $415.00 $46,623.50 $10,780.00 $4,730.00 $425.00
102 Linecrest Road
(Bouldercrest Rd. to River Rd.) 3.62 10'-20" $1,737.60 $18.10 $1,578.17 $1,688.40 $1,629.00 $1,991.00 $1,200.00 $320.00 $1,358.00 $139.00 $15,656.50 $3,620.00 $1,600.00 $300.00
103 |Ward Lake Road
(Bouldercrest Rd. to Linecrest Rd.) 1.83 10'-20" $887.55|N/A $797.80|N/A $823.50|N/A $250.00 |N/A $860.00 |N/A $7,914.75|N/A $820.00|N/A
104 [Waldrop Road
(River Rd. to Flat Shoal Pkwy) 1.33 10'-20" $645.05|N/A $579.82|N/A $598.50|N/A $420.00[N/A $500.00 |N/A $5,752.25|N/A $560.00 |N/A
105
Lombard Road
(Panola Rd. to River Rd.) 2.9 10'-20" $1,406.50|N/A $1,264.28|N/A $1,305.00|N/A $920.00|N/A $1,092.00|N/A $12,542.05|N/A $1,320.00|N/A
106 IMosley Road
(Old River Rd. to Dead End) 0.26 5'-10" $126.10|N/A $113.34|N/A $117.00|N/A $80.00|N/A $84.00|N/A $1,124.05|N/A $120.00|N/A
TOTAL (GROUP 1V: #89-106) $ 21,965.60 $129.15 $19,857.88 $11,767.49 $20,497.50 $13,876.50 $ 13,040.00 $2000.00 $20,370.75 $990.25 $197,002.15 $25,230.00 $20,250.00 $1,775.00
Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total
\'%
GROUP V ASAP LANDnggE}; 1]\:[: CN AGEMENT |FACILITY MAINglEgGI;ICE & SERVICE PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle
: : Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Edging As Needed . Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Edging As Needed Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing . Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle
tem# | Mowing Location i in F (mowing & herbicide) Needed Only | (mowing & herbicide) Onl (oinsis: Onl (mowing & herbicide) Onl (mowing & herbicide) Onl & herbicide) 126 AN Oy ||| e @ e
iles) (in Feet) 2 y g y herbicide) Y 2 Y 4 Yy J Edging As Needed
Only
107 Weelaunee Road
(River Rd. to Dead End back to Flakes Mill
Rd.) 1.6 10'-20" $776.00|N/A $697.53|N/A $720.00|N/A $500.00|N/A $731.99|N/A $6,920.00|N/A $670.00|N/A




ASAP LANDSCAPE MANAGEMENT

FACILITY MAINTENANCE & SERVICEY

GROUP LLC GROUP PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
Proximity Proximity
Service Area | Service Area Cost Per 6 Wk Cyel
S ot ez Length (in Width Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If] Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle | Cost of Edging If os (I::win & Y€ Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing Cost of Edging If Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle Cost of Edging If
g Miles) (in Feet) (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required herhici(gie) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required & herbicide) Required (mowing & herbicide) Required
108 |Line Street
(Glenwood Rd. to Memorial Dr.) 0.97 10'-20" $470.45|N/A $422.88|N/A $436.50|N/A $340.00|N/A $322.74|N/A $4,195.25|N/A $440.00|N/A
109 [White Oak Drive
(Capistrana Pl. to Candler Rd.) 1.84 5-10' $892.40|N/A $802.16|N/A $828.00|N/A $600.00 |N/A $552.15|N/A $7,958.00|N/A $800.00|N/A
110 |Midway Road
(Covington Hwy to Memorial Dr. and
Columbia Dr. to S. Candler St..) 5.8 10'-20" $2,784.00 $29.00 $2,528.56 $2,705.17 $2,610.00 $3,190.00 $2,000.00 $30.00 $1,485.33 $216.77 $25,085.00 $5,800.00 $2,570.00 $425.00
i Mercer Road
(Covington Hwy to Malibu Dr.) 0.98 5-10' $475.30|N/A $427.24|N/A $441.00|N/A $320.00|N/A $369.40|N/A $4,238.55|N/A $440.00|N/A
112
Ripplewater Drive
(See Note 5) (Skyhaven Rd. to Eastland Rd.) 0.53 5'-10' $257.05|N/A $231.05|N/A $238.50|N/A $160.00 |N/A $199.28 [N/A $2,292.25|N/A $230.00|N/A
113 |Thompson Mill Road
(Snapfinger Rd. to 4645 Thompson Mill
Rd.) 3.69 5'-10' $1,771.20 $18.45 $1,608.69 $1,721.05 $1,660.50 $2,029.50 $1,140.00 $30.00 $1,104.30 $138.04 $15,959.25 $3,690.00 $1,650.00 $300.00
TOTAL (GROUP V: #107-113) $ 7,426.40 $47.45 $6,718.11 $4,426.22 $6,934.50 $5,219.50 $5,060.00 $60.00 $4,765.19 $354.81 $66,648.30 $9,490.00 $6,800.00 $725.00
Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total Sub Total
GRAND TOTAL (GROUP I -V) $164,356.27 $ 854.60 149,483.42 $81,158.09 153,608.50 $98,571.00 $117,455.00 $6,475.00 $129,731.43 $6,981.32 $12,665,125.86 $172,090.00 $152,235.00 $11,555.00
Optional Locations ASAP LANDglgngl; il:CIVAGEMENT FACILITY MAIN(”}FEE/[&JI;ICE & SERVICE PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC REIMAGE GENERAL CONTRACTORS RUSSELL LANDSCAPE UNIVERSAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES LLC WORLDSCAPES LLC
Item #
m Cost per Mile to Service Mowing on Other
County Right-of-Way Locations
1 Mile 5'-10' $800.00 $435.96 $450.00 $440.00 $550.00 $5,526.00 $400.00
s Cost per Mile to Service Edging on Other
County Right-of-Way Locations
1 Mile 5'-10' $1,200.00 $466.41 $550.00 $100.00 $120.00 $2,000.00 $175.00
116 Cost per Mile to Apply Herbicide on Other
County Right-of-Way Locations
1 Mile 5'-10' $975.00 $180.00 $137.00 $180.00 $120.00 $1,500.00 $130.00
117 |Cost per Mile for One Time Clean-up and
Edging (See Note 4) .
1 Mile 5'-10' $750.00 $350.00 $550.00 $230.00 $815.00 $4,000.00 $550.00




