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County of Fairfax, Virginia 

 

 
AMENDMENT NO. 2 

2021 December 11 05:35:14 PST 

 

CONTRACT TITLE: Safety Shoes 
 

CONTRACTOR 
Saf-Gard Safety Shoe Co 
2701 Patterson Street 
Greensboro, NC 27407 

 
 

SUPPLIER CODE 
1000012216 

 
 

CONTRACT NO. 
4400008194 

 

By mutual agreement, Contract 4400008194 ls renewed for one (1) year at existing prices, terms 
and conditions effective February 1, 2022, through January 31, 2023. This is the second and final 
renewal option available. 

 

Please provide a current Certificate of Insurance (COi) in accordance with the CONTRACT 
INSURANCE PROVISIONS paragraph of this contract within ten (10) days after receipt of this 
executed amendment. 

 

ACCEPTANCE: 
 
 

BY:  VP  
(Signatu;e) (Title) 

 
 
 

Kenneth Harbaugh 
(Printed) 

 
  11/30/21  

(Date) 
 
 

 
For Cathy A. Muse, CPPO 

Director/County Purchasing Agent 
 
 

DISTRIBUTION: 
Dept. of Finance - Accounts Payable/e 
Park Authority - Christina Hokenson/a 
Park Authority - Tonya Mills/e 
FRO - Jason Stanley/e 
Contractor: idvorak@safqard.com 

 
 

Contract Specialist - Tamir Enkhjargal/e 
Assistant Contract Specialist- Team 2 

 
 
 
 
 

Department orProcurement & Material Management 
12000 Government Center Parkway, Suite 427 

Fairfax, VA 22035-0013 
Website: www.fairfaxcounty.gov/procurement 

Phone (703) 324-3201, TIY: 71 l, Fax: (703) 324-3228 

mailto:idvorak@safqard.com
http://www.fairfaxcounty.gov/procurement


Award recommendation for IFB2000002431 
 
 
 
 

Red Wing Brands Lehigh ValleySafety Shoes Saf-Gard Safety Shoe 
25% vendor's retail price 

Part I 18% vendor's retail price shhet 10% vendor's retail price sheet sheet 
 

Red 
Wing 
Price 

 
 

% 

RedWing 
Price 
after 

 
Lehigh 
Price 

 
 

% 

Lehigh 
Price 
after 

 
Saf- 

Gard's 

Sat-Gard 
Price 
after 

Part II List Discount Discount List Discount Discount Price List % Discount Discount 
2   No Bid $154.95 10% $139.46 $186.00 25% $139.50 
3   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid 
4   No Bid $144.95 10% $130.46 $172.00 25% $129.00 
5 $198.35 18% $168.09   No Bid   No Bid 
6 No Bid.  $184.95 10% $166.46 $230.00 25% $172.50 
7 No Bid $129.95 10% $116.96 $120.00 25% $90.00 
8 No Bid $154.95 10% $139.46   No Bid 
9 No Bid $189.95 10% $170.96   No Bid 

10 No Bid $219.95 10% $197.96 $258.00 25% $193.50 
11 No Bid $89.95 10% $80.96   No Bid 
12 No Bid   No Bid $160.00 25% $120.00 
13 

Part Ill 
No Bid   No Bid   No Bid 

14 Offerred 3 styles Offerred 245 styles Offerred 44 styles 
15 0% accessories discount 0% accesssories discount 25% accessories discount 
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