ITB Number: 2025-056
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening Date: July 14, 2025
Cost Opening Date: July 18, 2025

Dilmar Oil The McPherson Companies, Safety Kleen Lubrication Engineers
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Auto Lube Group Boswell Oil Rush Truck Centers WW Williams Co. Systems Inc.
Fluid Transmission Valvoline $32.36/gal.
1 55 gallon drums $6.45 per gal. $8.05 per gal. $886.60 per gal. $10.86 per gal. CAT $18.18/gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fluid Transmission 1
2 Quart $2.11 per qgt. $2.77 per qgt. $5.36 per qgt. $14.61 per qt. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fluid Transmission
Synthetic Valvoline $38.00/gal.
3 (5 gallon) $10.23 per gal. $22.79 per gal. No Bid $11.21 per gal. CAT $19.00/gal. No Bid No Bid $14.05 per qt.
Fluid Transmission
Synthetic
4 (1 gallon) $8.35 per gal. $16.53 per gal. No Bid No Bid $55.00 per gal. No Bid No Bid $14.05 per qgt.
Valvoline
$9.17 per gal (Boswell| $16.20/gal.(CNG
Qil, Motor, 15W-40 0il) $10.67 per gal Compatible)
with CJ4 (55 gallon (CHV Ursa Super Plus | $18.18/gal.(Diesel
5 drums) $7.82 per gal. $8.82 per gal. $13.71 per gal. EC) Only) No Bid $8.91 per gal. $16.83 per gal.
Oil, Motor, 15W-40 $8.52 per gal (Boswell
with CJ4 (Bulk 0il) $10.02 (CHV Ursa
6 Delivery) 6.85 per gal. $8.02 per gal. $10.98 per gal. Super Plus EC) No Bid No Bid $7.90 per gal. $16.15 per gal.
Qil, Motor, 15W-40
ith CJ4, (1 gall
7 wi + (1 gallon) $10.09 per gal. $12.30 per gal. $12.57 per gal. $14.81 per gal. $34.00 per gal. No Bid $10.25 per gal. $5.28 per gt.
Oil, Motor, 5W-30, $13.36 per gal (Nal
. Puresyn) $13.37 (CHV
8 Synth(eéLﬁkeexos, $7.55 per gal. $8.65 per gal. $8.71 per gal. HAV PRODS SYN) No Bid No Bid $8.25 per gal. $39.75 per gal.
Qil, Motor, 5W-30,
Synthetic D M
9 yn ?1|c0te)xos, $2.79 per quart $2.91 per qt. $4.14 per qt. No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.10 per qt. $14.05 per qgt.
Qil, Lubricant, Multi-
Purpose Gear, SAE
75W-90, GL-5/MT-
10 1, 120 Ib. drums $2.18 per Ib. $24.93 per gal. $3.47 per Ib. $3.90 per Ib. $6.66 per Ib. No Bid Unreadable $12.33 per Ib.

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 2025-056
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening Date: July 14, 2025
Cost Opening Date: July 18, 2025

Dilmar Oil The McPherson Companies, Safety Kleen Lubrication Engineers
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Auto Lube Group Boswell Oil Rush Truck Centers WW Williams Co. Systems Inc.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, EP-2,
11 400 Ib. drums $1.79 per Ib. $3.23 per Ib. $2.16 per Ib. $3.17 per Ib. $5.25 per Ib. No Bid $4.13 per Ib. $8.24 per Ib.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, EP-2,
12 120 Ib. drums $2.19 per Ib. $2.72 per Ib. $2.62 per Ib. $3.29 per Ib. $6.66 per Ib. No Bid $4.21 per Ib. $8.46 per Ib.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, MP-2,
13 400 Ib. drums $2.77 per Ib. $4.87 per Ib. $2.54 per Ib. $3.17 per Ib. No Bid No Bid $4.13 per Ib. $7.64 per |b.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, MP-2,
14 120 Ib. drums No Bid $4.95 per Ib. $3.28 per Ib. $3.29 per Ib. No Bid No Bid $4.21 per Ib. $7.83 per Ib.
$6.30 per gal.(NAL
Puramax TO-
Oil Transmission, 4)$12.79 per
SAE 10W CF, gal.(CHV DELO
15 5 gallon drums $8.00 per gal. $8.72 per gal. $14.30 per gal. ToroForce) No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.02 per gal.
$7.55 per gal.(NAL
Fluid, Universal PURAMAX AGR.HYD
Tractor, 5 gallon Fluid/$10.37(CHV
16 drums $7.41 per gal. $8.30 per gal. No Bid Tractor Fluid)l No Bid No Bid $7.80 per gal. $44.74 per gal.
Fluid, Hydraulic,
ISO 68AW, Low
Temp., 5 gallon
17 pails $6.70 per gal. $7.10 per gal. No Bid $11.63 per gal. $18.00 per gal. No Bid No Bid $40.46 per gal.
Fluid, Hydraulic,
ISO 46AW, High
18 Temp., (Bulk) $3.63 per gal. $6.25 per gal. $11.00 per gal. $11.83 per gal. No Bid No Bid $6.00 per gal. $36.99 per gal.
Fluid, Hydraulic,
ISO 46AW, High
Temp., 55 gallon
19 drums $5.49 per gal. $7.10 per gal. $11.70 per gal. $12.49 per gal. $21.81 per gal. No Bid $7.18 per gal. $32.95 per gal.
Gear Oil, HD
80W90, (120 Ib.
20 drums) $1.65 per Ib. $2.32 per Ib. No Bid $1.92 per Ib. $2.91 per Ib. No Bid $260.00/16 gal. keg $8.38 per Ib.

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 2025-056 q Bid Opening Date: July 14, 2025
ITB NAME: Lubricants Cost Opening Date: July 18, 2025
Tammy Shew

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting
Bid Tabulation

Dilmar Oil The McPherson Companies, Safety Kleen Lubrication Engineers
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Auto Lube Group Boswell Oil Rush Truck Centers WW Williams Co. Systems Inc.

Grease, special with
selected mineral oil,
12% modified
bentonite thickener
and extreme
pressure additives,
dropping pt. to 500
21 Fl, 35 Ib. pails No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Qil, Light, 55 gallon
drums, LE
Ind./Turbine Qil,
Must be LE 4932
22 Only No Bid $7.39 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.38 per gal.

Qil, BB, 55 gallon
drums, LE Ind.
Turbine Oil 6406,
23 Must be LE Only No Bid $10.96 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.82 per gal.

Oil, Cylinder (Multi-
purpose)
55 gallon drums,
Must be LE 1605 oil
24 Only No Bid $25.48 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.50 per gal.

Grease, cartridges,
(40 per case) with
Aluminum Complex
Thickener. ISO VG
220, Viscosity @ 40
degrees C210 &
@100 degrees

25 C17.5 $204.19 per case $350.55 per case No Bid No Bid $5.00 per Case No Bid No Bid $467.48 per case

Vanguard Synthetic
Lubricant for Air
Compressors &

Vacuum Pumps, 2

26 Gallon $42.87 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




ITB Number: 2025-056
ITB NAME: Lubricants

Bid Opening Date: July 14, 2025
Cost Opening Date: July 18, 2025
Tammy Shew

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Dilmar Oil

The McPherson Companies,
Inc.

Auto Lube Group

Boswell Oil

Rush Truck Centers

WW Williams Co.

Safety Kleen
Systems

Lubrication Engineers
Inc.

27

Grease, cartridges,
(40 per case) With
Lithium Complex
Thickener

$23.60 per case

No Bid

No Bid

$3.17 per case

$5.00 per Case

No Bid

No Bid

$454.06 per case

28

Grease, gear
compound, EP 320,
55 gallon drums,
high temp., Multi-
purpose

$14.24 per gal.

$1.58 per Ib.

No Bid

$2.66 per gal.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$60.50 per gal.

29

Qil, gear Lube, 55
gallon drums, Must
be Lubrication
Engineers (LE oil)
1608

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$60.50 per gal.

30

QOil, Hydraulic, ISO
46, 55 gallon
drums, high temp,
multi-purpose, Must
be LE Oil 4933 only.

No Bid

$17.15 per gal.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$29.38 per gal.

31

Qil, SAE 30, non-
detergent, 55 gallon
drums

$6.45 per gal.

$23.39 per gal.

$10.91 per gal.

$14.22 per gal.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$40.81 per gal.

32

Qil, Engine, 55
gallon drums,SAE
15W-40

$7.82 per gal.

$8.82 per gal.

$12.36 per gal.

$9.17 per
gal.(Boswell)/$10.67
per gal.(CHV Ursa
Super Plus EC)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$19.80 per gal.

33

Lubricant, gear (ISO
VG 460)

$16.47 per gal.

$11.04 per gal.

No Bid

$33.59 per gal.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$60.50 per gal.

34

Lubricant, Air
Compressor, 55
gallon drums (ISO
VG 68/SAE 20)

No Bid

No Bid

$14.20 per gal.

$25.44 per gal.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$50.07 per gal.
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DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting
Bid Tabulation

Dilmar Oil The McPherson Companies, Safety Kleen Lubrication Engineers
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Auto Lube Group Boswell Oil Rush Truck Centers WW Williams Co. Systems Inc.

Lubricant, Multi-
Purpose Gear QOil,
55 gallon drums

(Must be LE 1604
35 Only) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.50 per gal.

Lubricant, Air
Compressor, 5-
gallon drums, S

Rotary Compressor
36 Oil SAE 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.14 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Qil, Special Turbine,
Inhibited, (in 55
gallon);
Industrial/Turbine
Oil ISO VG 150/SAE

30 (Must be LE Oil
37 6403 Only) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.82 per gal.

Oil, Light Spindle, 5
gallon buckets, ISO-
38 32, SAE 10 $15.81 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.64 per gal.

Qil, Special Turbine,
(55 gallon drums);
Industrial/Turbine

Oil ISO VG 150/SAE

30 (Must be
Lubrication

Engineers (LE Oil
39 6404 only) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.82 per gal.

Qil, Turbine,
Inhibited, Food
Grade, Anti foaming
( 5 gallon buckets)

Industrial/Turbine
40 Oil ISO VG 220 $13.67 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.64 per gal.




ITB Number: 2025-056 q Bid Opening Date: July 14, 2025
ITB NAME: Lubricants Cost Opening Date: July 18, 2025
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DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting
Bid Tabulation

Dilmar Oil The McPherson Companies, Safety Kleen Lubrication Engineers
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Auto Lube Group Boswell Oil Rush Truck Centers WW Williams Co. Systems Inc.

$9.17 per

Oil, Engine, Diesel, gal.(Boswell)/$10.67
55 gallon drums, per gal.(CHV URSA

41 15W-40 $7.82 per gal. No Bid $12.37 per gal. SUPER PLUS EC) No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.80 per gal.

Lube, Special Gear
Compound for Cotta
Gearbox, (5 Gallon
Buckets), Anti
foaming SAE 85W-
42 140 $14.94 per gal. $2.15 per Ib. No Bid $30.20 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.62 per gal.

Qil, Turbine,
Inhibited, Food
Grade, Anti foaming
( 5 gallon buckets)
Industrial/Turbine
43 Oil ISO VG 150 $24.58 per gal. $48.95 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.64 per gal.

Oil, gear & bearing,
5 gallon buckets,
Mobil SHC 626
44 (Food Grade) $35.55 per gal. $46.70 per gal. No Bid $25.58 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $83.31 per gal.

Chevron NLGEWAR
Compound 220
Food Grade 5 gallon
45 Buckets $31.30 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.50 per gal.
OIl, cCompressor,
46 (5 gallon buckets) $40.49 per gal. No Bid No Bid $25.58 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.69 per gal.

Qil, Lubricant, SAE
15W-40, 100% CNG
47 & LNG Engine Oil $11.88 per gal. $9.56 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.75 per gal. $31.65 per gal.

Oil,hydraulic, (55
gallon drums), Must
be Lubrication
Engineers LE 680
48 Only No Bid No Bid $14.33 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.86 per gal.




ITB Number: 2025-056
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening Date: July 14, 2025
Cost Opening Date: July 18, 2025
Tammy Shew

Dilmar Oil The McPherson Companies, Safety Kleen Lubrication Engineers
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Auto Lube Group Boswell Oil Rush Truck Centers WW Williams Co. Systems Inc.
Glycerin,
Ind.grade,5
gal.cans for Lime
49 Slurry Pumps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oil, Medium, 55
gallon drums,Must
be Lubrication
Engineers
Industrial/Turbine
50 Oil (LE 4934 Only). No Bid $11.39 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.38 per gal.
Qil, Heavy, 55
gallon drums, Must
51 be LE Oil 6405 Only. No Bid $7.97 per gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.82 per gal.
$2.64 per
Diesel Exhaust Fluid gal.(Bulk)$3.42 per
(delivery Bulk, $2.08/gal.(Bulk),$2.83(Drum) gal.(Drum)$3.96 per
52 drums, gallons) $1.63 per gal. $3.50(Case) No Bid gal(Case) $2.55 per gal.(Drum) No Bid $2.35 per gal No Bid
$7.88/gal(Boswell)
Oil, OW-20, Full $13.37/gal.(CHV HAV
53 Synthetic $7.43 per gal. $8.20 per gal. $7.60 per gal. PRODS SYN) No Bid No Bid $7.50 per gal. $39.75 per gal.
0il,SAE 5W30,Full 69.50/ aIBE’DSﬂ'W 73/g8
Synthetic (delivery I.(IBqug)Ci—IV HAV PR‘ODSg-
gallon drums & $8.20 per gal.(Bulk) $14.22(Drum)$13.57(Bulk
54 bulk) $7.25 per gal. $9.00 per gal. (Drum) $7.60 per gal. ) No Bid No Bid $7.50 per gal. $39.74 per gal.
Fluid Synthetic
Automatic
Transmission, TES
295/TES 468,Must
be authorized by
55 Allison Transmission $27.62 per gal. $45.30 per gal. No Bid $25.46 per gal. No Bid $28.28 per gal. $35.50 per gal. No Bid
Number of bids Responsive: 8 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

LSBE Participation Benchmark (Waived)

witness, L_deres W

Agent:

/@hw;% NY I
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