ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ip. Bolt
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Adams Equip AgPro Allan Vigil Ford | Altec Ing. | ‘‘antaGlass | Barber Auto oon
No. Co. Inc. Heroes Air, Inc. Motorsports
. . .. . . p
1 |Hourly labor rate for Service Repairs as per minimum specifications. $155.00 $159.00 $175.00 $149;11:)0bi12$165 $75.00 $130.00 $125.00
2 |Hourly labor rate for Transmission Repairs as per minimum specifications NA $159.00 $175.00 N/A N/A $130.00 $75.00
3 |Hourly labor rate for radiator Repair as per minimum specifications N/A $159.00 N/A N/A N/A $130.00 $56.00
; 214> shop / 5165 |
4 |Overtime hourly labor rate. $155.00 N/A N/A 5143 ;::)‘Lil/e 5165 $125.00 $130.00 $125.00
5 |Weekend hourly labor rate. $155.00 $165.00 N/A N/A $125.00 $130.00 $125.00
6 | After hours hourly labor rate $155.00 $165.00 N/A N/A $123.00 $130.00 $125.00
7  |State the rate for extended warranty coverage for overhauls and/or major repairs. See Paragraph.VII, as per minimum specifications. $0.00 N/A N/A N/A $75.00 NA $125.00
8 |State the rate for hauling or towing of equipment, as per minimum specifications. $0.00 14.50/mile N/A N/A N/A N/A $145.00
9 |State percentage markup cost for additional parts, supplies purchased, overhead and profit not listed in the bid. (See Note 1) $0.00 N/A 25% N/A 47% MSRP% 30%
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS N/A
10 |Domestic and Foreign Windshields Percentage off Nags Pricing N/A N/A N/A N/A 65% N/A 30%
11 |Domestic and Foreign Curved Tempered Percentage off Nags Pricing N/A N/A N/A N/A 65% N/A 30%
12 |Labor Rate (Rate to include Removal & Replacement Charges) Flat Rate NA N/A N/A N/A $75.00' $130/hour $125.00
13 |Installation Kits Flat Rate N/A N/A N/A N/A $45.00' N/A $30.00
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS/COLLISION REPAIR N/A N/A
14 |Dealer Moldings (if necessary) Net Price (based on jobber listing) N/A N/A NA N/A $50.00 NA $175.00
15 |Laminated glass (1/4 inch glass) Price per square foot N/A N/A NA N/A $18.24 NA $100.00
16 |Mechanical repair Labor rate per hour N/A N/A NA N/A N/A $130.00 $95.00
17  |Body/structural repair Labor rate per hour N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $58.00
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ITB No.: 2025-011 Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25 Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION gy, Agent: Tammy Shew

DeKalb County

Clark
. . Carolina . Maintenance & Cummins Inc.
IL?)M COMMUODITIES and SERVICES I\E:cpl:it::i Silt())] Environmental C(];Ce ];liisel Supplies Inc DBA Cougﬁzﬁ Auto ?l"f‘aflzl;cll;f‘ dba Cummins
’ P Systems, Inc. P Clark Truck P ’ Sales & Svc.
Repair
1 Hourly labor rate for Service Repairs as per minimum specifications. $100.00 $159.00 $125.00 $174.50 $195.00 $165.00 $210.00
2 |Hourly labor rate for Transmission Repairs as per minimum specifications NA N/A $125.00 $174.50 $195.00 $165.00 N/A
3 |Hourly labor rate for radiator Repair as per minimum specifications N/A N/A $125.00 $174.50 N/A $165.00 N/A
4 [Overtime hourly labor rate. $150.00 $159.00 $125.00 $174.50 $195.00 $165.00 $225.00
5 |Weekend hourly labor rate. $150.00 N/A $125.00 $174.50 $195.00 $165.00 $225.00
6 | After hours hourly labor rate $150.00 $159.00 $125.00 $174.50 N/A $165.00 $225.00
Estended
7 |State the rate for extended warranty coverage for overhauls and/or major repairs. See Paragraph.VII, as per minimum specifications. N/A N/A $125.00 $174.50 N/A $165.00 a\%ﬂ
2125.00 2174.50 D
request
8 [State the rate for hauling or towing of equipment, as per minimum specifications. $100.00 N/A $125.00 15% over cost $125.00 N/A $750 per tow
0,
9 |[State percentage markup cost for additional parts, supplies purchased, overhead and profit not listed in the bid. (See Note 1) 15% 15% 0% 10% off list 25% 40% %
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS
10 |Domestic and Foreign Windshields Percentage off Nags Pricing NA N/A N/A 10% N/A N/A N/A
11 |Domestic and Foreign Curved Tempered Percentage off Nags Pricing N/A N/A N/A 10% N/A N/A N/A
12 |Labor Rate (Rate to include Removal & Replacement Charges) Flat Rate NA N/A N/A N/A $55.00 N/A N/A
13 |Installation Kits Flat Rate N/A N/A N/A N/A $55.00 N/A N/A
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS/COLLISION REPAIR
14 |Dealer Moldings (if necessary) Net Price (based on jobber listing) N/A N/A N/A NA 25% NA NA
15 |Laminated glass (1/4 inch glass) Price per square foot NA N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A
16 |[Mechanical repair Labor rate per hour NA $159.00 125 $174.50 $195.00 $165.00 N/A
17 |Body/structural repair Labor rate per hour N/A $159.00 N/A $174.50 $55.00 $95.00 N/A
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM . Emission & Cooling Fabco Farmers Auto . GA Truck & Hardy Chevrolet
COMMUODITIES and SERVICES
No. an Dobbs Equip Solutions Fabrication, Inc. Glass Fairway Fleet | 1 iler LLC | Buick GMC, Inc.
1 |Hourly labor rate for Service Repairs as per minimum specifications. $$11891 SSEZI d/ N/A $190.00 $140.00 $135.00 $125.00 $165.00
2 |Hourly labor rate for Transmission Repairs as per minimum specifications $$11891 SSEZld/ N/A N/A N/A $135.00 $125.00 $165.00
3 |Hourly labor rate for radiator Repair as per minimum specifications $$11891 SSEZld/ N/A N/A N/A $135.00 $95.00 $165.00
. . p
4 |Overtime hourly labor rate. $2;21 9570 ff :'l‘:i L N/A $285.00 $210.00 $135.00 $200.00 N/A
»=/1.50 shop /.
5 |Weekend hourly labor rate. $2;21 9570 ff:'l‘:i : N/A $285.00 $280.00 $135.00 $250.00 N/A
»=/1.50 shop /.
6 |After hours hourly labor rate $2;219570;;‘; L N/A $285.00 $280.00 $135.00 $150.00 N/A
7 |State the rate for extended warranty coverage for overhauls and/or major repairs. See Paragraph.VII, as per minimum specifications. $181.00 N/A N/A N/A $135.00 $125.00 $165.00
. . . - . . $600.00
8 |State the rate for hauling or towing of equipment, as per minimum specifications. minimum N/A N/A N/A $135.00 Sublet tows $400.00
9 |State percentage markup cost for additional parts, supplies purchased, overhead and profit not listed in the bid. (See Note 1) 35% N/A 25% 30% 10% 30% 100%
COMMUODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS N/A
10 |Domestic and Foreign Windshields Percentage off Nags Pricing N/A N/A N/A 10% 10% 25% N/A
11 |Domestic and Foreign Curved Tempered Percentage off Nags Pricing N/A N/A N/A 0% 10% 25% N/A
12 |Labor Rate (Rate to include Removal & Replacement Charges) Flat Rate N/A N/A N/A 140/hr $135.00 Sublet $165.00
13 |Installation Kits Flat Rate N/A N/A NA $80.00 $135.00 Sublet $165.00
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS/COLLISION REPAIR Sublet
14 |Dealer Moldings (if necessary) Net Price (based on jobber listing) N/A N/A N/A $9.00ft N/A Sublet N/A
15 |Laminated glass (1/4 inch glass) Price per square foot N/A N/A N/A $36.00 N/A Sublet N/A
16 |[Mechanical repair Labor rate per hour N/A N/A N/A N/A $135.00 $150.00 $145.99
17 |Body/structural repair Labor rate per hour N/A N/A $190.00 N/A $135.00 $105.00 $60.00
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

. . . Marion Ford MHC Kenworth .
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Interstate Truck | Jim Ellis = yp ypoopsppe | Kendrick Tractordba | dba Georgia | hhatown Glass
No. Equip. Inc. Chevrolet Radiator dba Glass Inc.
Lashley Kubota Kenworth
1 |Hourly labor rate for Service Repairs as per minimum specifications. $165.00 $175.00 $140/hr $55.00 $169.00 $160.00 N/A
2 |Hourly labor rate for Transmission Repairs as per minimum specifications N/A $175.00 $140/hr $55.00 NA $160.00 NA
3 |Hourly labor rate for radiator Repair as per minimum specifications N/A $175.00 $140/hr $55.00 N/A $160.00 N/A
4 |Overtime hourly labor rate. $275.00 $175.00 160/hr $110.00 $193.50 $160.00 N/A
5 |Weekend hourly labor rate. N/A $175.00 $180/hr $110.00 $193.50 $160.00 N/A
6 | After hours hourly labor rate N/A $175.00 $160/hr $85.00 $193.50 $160.00 N/A
7 |State the rate for extended warranty coverage for overhauls and/or major repairs. See Paragraph.VII, as per minimum specifications. N/A $175.00 $140/hr N/A N/A N/A N/A
8 |State the rate for hauling or towing of equipment, as per minimum specifications. N/A $175.00 N/A N/A $249.00 N/A N/A
9 |State percentage markup cost for additional parts, supplies purchased, overhead and profit not listed in the bid. (See Note 1) 35% Cost+15% Varies 2% 66% 20% N/A
COMMUODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS
10 |Domestic and Foreign Windshields Percentage off Nags Pricing N/A Cost +15% NA N/A NA N/A 30%
11 |Domestic and Foreign Curved Tempered Percentage off Nags Pricing N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 30%
12 |Labor Rate (Rate to include Removal & Replacement Charges) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $18.00
13 |Installation Kits N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS/COLLISION REPAIR N/A N/A
14 |Dealer Moldings (if necessary) Net Price (based on jobber listing) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
15 |Laminated glass (1/4 inch glass) Price per square foot N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
16 |[Mechanical repair Labor rate per hour $165.00 $175.00 NA $55/hr NA $160.00 N/A
17 |Body/structural repair Labor rate per hour $165.00 $175.00 N/A N/A N/A $110.00 N/A

Page: 4 of 30




ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

. Reliable . . Springs & . .
- &
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Peterbilt of Transmission Rush Truck Ctr. Sims Radiator Suspension, Stivers Bro.t hers | Ten-8 Fire
No. Atlanta . Sve., Inc. Automotive Safety LLC
Service, Inc. Inc.
$135, 8120
1 |Hourly labor rate for Service Repairs as per minimum specifications. $200.00 N/A (embedded $125.00 $145.00 189.95 $195.00
technicians)

2 |Hourly labor rate for Transmission Repairs as per minimum specifications $200.00 $230/ hr $135.00 N/A NA 189.95 N/A

3 |Hourly labor rate for radiator Repair as per minimum specifications N/A N/A $135.00 $125.00 N/A 189.95 $195.00

4 |Overtime hourly labor rate. $120.00 $345/ hr $135.00 $187.50 $200.00 189.95 N/A

5 |Weekend hourly labor rate. $200.00 $345 / hr $135.00 $250.00 $200.00 189.95 $260.00

6 | After hours hourly labor rate $200.00 $345 / hr $135.00 $250.00 $200.00 189.95 $260.00

7 |State the rate for extended warranty coverage for overhauls and/or major repairs. See Paragraph.VII, as per minimum specifications. $200.00 not offered N/A N/A N/A 189.95 N/A

8 |State the rate for hauling or towing of equipment, as per minimum specifications. N/A as charged N/A N/A $250.00 NA N/A

.. . . . . . *59 i 0 —0
9 |State percentage markup cost for additional parts, supplies purchased, overhead and profit not listed in the bid. (See Note 1) 20% list less 5% £5% shop supplics. . lies 35% 15% off list 10% 1o A’ oll QEM
and misc. list price
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS

10 |Domestic and Foreign Windshields Percentage off Nags Pricing 20% N/A N/A N/A N/A NA N/A

11 |Domestic and Foreign Curved Tempered Percentage off Nags Pricing 20% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

12 |Labor Rate (Rate to include Removal & Replacement Charges) Flat Rate $375.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Sublet

13 |Installation Kits Flat Rate $375.00 NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Sublet

COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS/COLLISION REPAIR

14 |Dealer Moldings (if necessary) Net Price (based on jobber listing) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Sublet

15 |Laminated glass (1/4 inch glass) Price per square foot N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Sublet

16 |[Mechanical repair Labor rate per hour $200.00 N/A $135.00 N/A $145.00 NA $195.00

17 |Body/structural repair Labor rate per hour $150.00 N/A $105.00 N/A $145.00 N/A $195.00
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

West GA - . _—
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Wespro JCB Tl.'actor & Hydraulic & Lift Williams Fire| The W.W. Williams
No. Equipment Co. Apparatus Co. LLC
Truck
1  |Hourly labor rate for Service Repairs as per minimum specifications. $175.00 21;118959/;;;?:1 d- $75.00 $165.00 $189.00
2 |Hourly labor rate for Transmission Repairs as per minimum specifications $175.00 %‘f N/A $165.00 $189.00
3 |Hourly labor rate for radiator Repair as per minimum specifications $175.00 %};s{l‘:;%- N/A $165.00 $189.00
4 |Overtime hourly labor rate. $260.00 $$2245(:1//l;1rrstl'::1 : N/A $165.00 $252.00
»510/hr shop /.
5 |Weekend hourly labor rate. $350.00 $§;2()4:?l:rsil“:zl d/ N/A $165.00 $252.00
6 | After hours hourly labor rate $260.00 21;2245(:/;;;?:1 d- N/A $165.00 $252.00
. . . . . . ici
7 |State the rate for extended warranty coverage for overhauls and/or major repairs. See Paragraph.VII, as per minimum specifications. $500.00 N/A N/A $165.00 —g—y—zriz:n S:: :nnl\:;lc
& changes annually
$406/Refuse &
8 [State the rate for hauling or towing of equipment, as per minimum specifications. $450.00 N/A N/A $1800 flat rate | tandem.$656/Fire &
g g ot equip p P
Yac
9 |State percentage markup cost for additional parts, supplies purchased, overhead and profit not listed in the bid. (See Note 1) 15% 10% 20% 10% 10% off mfg. list
COMMUODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS
10 |Domestic and Foreign Windshields Percentage off Nags Pricing 10% N/A N/A 0% N/A
11 |Domestic and Foreign Curved Tempered Percentage off Nags Pricing 10% N/A N/A 0% N/A
12 |Labor Rate (Rate to include Removal & Replacement Charges) Flat Rate $550.00 N/A N/A $165.00 NA
p g $330.00
13 |Installation Kits Flat Rate $550.00 N/A N/A $165.00 N/A
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR PLEXIGLASS, MIRRORS AND REPAIR SERVICE FOR GLASS/COLLISION REPAIR $165.00 N/A
14 |Dealer Moldings (if necessary) Net Price (based on jobber listing) $500.00 N/A N/A $165.00 N/A
15 |Laminated glass (1/4 inch glass) Price per square foot 8.50 N/A N/A N/A N/A
16 |[Mechanical repair Labor rate per hour $175.00 N/A NA $165.00 N/A
17 |Body/structural repair Labor rate per hour $175.00 N/A N/A $165.00 N/A
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ITB No.: 2025-011 Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25 Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION R, Agent: Tammy Shew

o

DeKalb County

ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Adams Equip. AgPro Allan Vigil Ford | Altec Ing. | ‘‘antaGlass | Barber Auto Bolton
No. Co. Inc. Heroes Air, Inc. Motorsports
18 |Frame repair Labor rate per hour N/A N/A N/A N/A NA N/A $58.00
19 |Paint Labor rate per hour N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $45.00
20 |Parts cost Increase over cost N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 30%
0,
21 |Parts discount Specify N/A NA N/A N/A NA N/A 10/;:%
. . $12.00 (paint
22 |Miscellaneous charges Specify NA N/A NA NA NA NA supplies)
23 $110.00 (Class 7
Other services Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A & 8 trucks paint
24
& body labor)
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL & INDUSTRIAL CLEANING N/A
25 |Cleaning of sand/grit/collection tanks Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
26 |Cleaning of oil water separator Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
27 |Cleaning of storm water interceptor Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
28 |Disposal of gray water sludge Rate per gallon N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
29 |Equipment fees Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
30 [Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
31 Specify NA N/A NA NA NA NA N/A
Other services
QOil Change Services for OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT per OEM standards N/A
LANDFILL COMPACTOR N/A
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
32 |CATERPILLAR 836
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

——

0

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

Clark
. . Carolina . Maintenance & Cummins Inc.
IL?)M COMMUODITIES and SERVICES l\f:cpl:itii (Sjilt())] Environmental C(];Ce ];liisel Supplies Inc DBA Cougﬁf’i Auto ?l“?‘afll;l;cll:lf‘ dba Cummins
) P Systems, Inc. P Clark Truck P ’ Sales & Sve.
Repair
18 |Frame repair Labor rate per hour NA $159.00 N/A $174.50 $75.00 N/A N/A
19 |Paint Labor rate per hour N/A N/A N/A $174.50 $55.00 $95.00 N/A
20 |Parts cost Increase over cost N/A 15% N/A 10% off list 25% 40% N/A
21 |Parts discount Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A cost +25% N/A N/A
$100.00 5% of labor
22 |Miscellaneous charges Specify (machining/wel| charges up to N/A N/A N/A 8% labor N/A
ding) $50
23 . . $100.00
24 Other services Specify fabrication N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL & INDUSTRIAL CLEANING
25 [Cleaning of sand/grit/collection tanks Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
26 |Cleaning of oil water separator Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
27 |Cleaning of storm water interceptor Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
28 |Disposal of gray water sludge Rate per gallon N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
29 |Equipment fees Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
30 |Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
31 Specify NA N/A NA NA N/A NA NA
Other services
Oil Change Services for OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT per OEM standards N/A
LANDFILL COMPACTOR N/A
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
32 |CATERPILLAR 836
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

——

0

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM . Emission & Cooling Fabco Farmers Auto . GA Truck & Hardy Chevrolet
COMMODITIES and SERVICES
No. an Dobbs Equip Solutions Fabrication, Inc. Glass Fairway Fleet Trailer LLC Buick GMC, Inc.
18 |Frame repair Labor rate per hour N/A N/A $190.00 N/A $135.00 $195.00 $95.00
19 |Paint Labor rate per hour N/A N/A N/A N/A $135.00 $105.00 $60.00
20 |Parts cost Increase over cost N/A N/A 25% N/A 10% 30% 35%
. . Varies according to
21 |Parts discount Specify N/A Part 0% N/A N/A 25% 5%
Paint
22 |Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $25.00 Supplies/$50.00
Body/$20.00
23 . .
4 Other services Specify N/A N/A NA NA N/A $7.50 NA
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL & INDUSTRIAL CLEANING
25 |Cleaning of sand/grit/collection tanks Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $50.00 N/A
26 |Cleaning of oil water separator Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
27 |Cleaning of storm water interceptor Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
28 |Disposal of gray water sludge Rate per gallon N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
29 |Equipment fees Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
30 [Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
$300.00 Level 2(Thermal/Air
Blasting Cleaning) $400.00 Level
31 Specify N/A 3.(Liquid Cleaning) $550.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Level 4 Chemical Cleaning) &
$100.00, (Bung/Fitting Repair)
Other services
Oil Change Services for OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT per OEM standards N/A
LANDFILL COMPACTOR N/A
500 HOUR N/A 300 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A 400 NA NA NA N/A NA
32 |CATERPILLAR 836
1500 HOUR N/A 350 N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A 100 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

-y

0

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

. . . Marion Ford MHC Kenworth .
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Interstate Truck | JimEllis = pp ypors e | Kendrick Tractordba | dba Georgia | hhatown Glass
No. Equip. Inc. Chevrolet Radiator dba Glass Inc.
Lashley Kubota Kenworth
18 |Frame repair Labor rate per hour $165.00 $175.00 N/A N/A N/A $110.00 N/A
19 |Paint Labor rate per hour $165.00 $175.00 N/A N/A N/A $110.00 N/A
20 |Parts cost Increase over cost 100% 15% N/A 5% N/A 20% N/A
21 |Parts discount Specify 20% N/A N/A 12% N/A N/A N/A
22 |Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
23 . .
24 Other services Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL & INDUSTRIAL CLEANING
25 [Cleaning of sand/grit/collection tanks Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A $75 hr flat rate N/A N/A N/A
26 |Cleaning of oil water separator Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A NA NA $65 hr flat rate N/A N/A N/A
27 |Cleaning of storm water interceptor Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
28 |Disposal of gray water sludge Rate per gallon N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
29 |Equipment fees Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
30 [Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
31 Specify NA NA NA NA NA N/A NA
Other services
Oil Change Services for OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT per OEM standards NA
LANDFILL COMPACTOR
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
32 |CATERPILLAR 836
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.: 2025-011 Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25 Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION R, Agent: Tammy Shew

0

DeKalb County

. Reliable . . Springs & . .
ITEM COMMUODITIES and SERVICES Peterbilt of Transmission Rush Truck Ctr. Sims Radiator Suspension, Stivers Bro.t hers | Ten-8 Fire &
No. Atlanta . Sve., Inc. Automotive Safety LLC
Service, Inc. Inc.
18 |Frame repair Labor rate per hour $200.00 N/A $215.00 N/A $200.00 NA Sublet
19 |Paint Labor rate per hour $150.00 N/A $105.00 N/A N/A N/A $195.00
o, o,
20 |Parts cost Increase over cost 20% (off List) N/A 15%eover cost (Part N/A 15% off List N/A M
Buyout), — list price
21 [|Parts discount Specify 20% (off List) N/A National fleet N/A 15% N/A N/A
8% of Labor
. . Sho 2% (shop P —
$150.00 N/A ies) N/A ies) N/A (Shop Supply
22 |Miscellaneous charges Specify $150.00 N/A supplies)$15.00 N/A suplies N/A Sho feiu 1
$145.00
driveline
23 . . i (driveline
Other services Specify N/A N/A m N/A rep/flywheel/wel N/A N/A
24 materials)$61.90 -
ding/press
work)
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL & INDUSTRIAL CLEANING
25 |Cleaning of sand/grit/collection tanks Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A $145.00 N/A N/A
26 |Cleaning of oil water separator Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
27 |Cleaning of storm water interceptor Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
28 |Disposal of gray water sludge Rate per gallon N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
29 |[Equipment fees Specify N/A NA NA NA NA NA NA
30 [Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
31 Specify NA N/A NA NA NA NA N/A
Other services
Oil Change Services for OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT per OEM standards NA
LANDFILL COMPACTOR
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
32 |CATERPILLAR 836
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.: 2025-011 Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25 Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION R, Agent: Tammy Shew

o

DeKalb County

West GA - . _—
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Wespro JCB Tl.'actor & Hydraulic & Lift Williams Fire| The W.W. Williams
No. Equipment Co. Apparatus Co. LLC
Truck
18 |Frame repair Labor rate per hour $175.00 N/A NA $165.00 N/A
19 |Paint Labor rate per hour $175.00 N/A N/A $165.00 N/A
20 |Parts cost Increase over cost 15% N/A N/A 20% N/A
21 [|Parts discount Specify 10% N/A N/A 0% N/A
22 |Miscellaneous charges Specify $250.00 N/A N/A 5% of invoice N/A
23 . .
24 Other services Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR ENVIRONMENTAL & INDUSTRIAL CLEANING
25 [Cleaning of sand/grit/collection tanks Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
26 |Cleaning of oil water separator Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
27 |Cleaning of storm water interceptor Rate (specify gallon, ton or flat) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
28 |Disposal of gray water sludge Rate per gallon N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
29 |Equipment fees Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
30 [Miscellaneous charges Specify N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
31 Specify NA N/A NA N/A NA
Other services
Oil Change Services for OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT per OEM standards N/A
LANDFILL COMPACTOR

500 HOUR $1.540.00 $2.724.00 N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR $5,130.00 $3,387.00 N/A N/A N/A
32 |CATERPILLAR 836

1500 HOUR $1.540.00 $2,724.00 N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR $5,130.00 $5.,655.00 N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Adams Equip. AgPro Allan Vigil Ford | Altec Ing. | ‘‘antaGlass | Barber Auto Bolton
No. Co. Inc. Heroes Air, Inc. Motorsports
LANDFILL TIPPER N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
33 |COLUMBIA HORIZONTAL
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
ARTICULATED DUMP N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
34 |CATERPILLAR 745
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
WHEEL LOADER N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
35 |KOMATSU, WA470
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
500 HOUR NA $1,275.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR NA $1,275.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
36 |JOHN DEERE 644
1500 HOUR N/A $1,275.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR NA $1,275.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

Clark
Carolina Maintenance & Cummins Inc.
ITEM Capital Cit i
No COMMODITIES and SERVICES M:cpl:i::e S;uf Environmental C(];Ce ];liisel Supplies Inc DBA Cougﬁzﬁ Auto ?l"f‘aflzl;cll;f‘ dba Cummins
’ P Systems, Inc. P Clark Truck P ’ Sales & Svc.
Repair
LANDFILL TIPPER N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
33 |COLUMBIA HORIZONTAL
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
ARTICULATED DUMP N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
34 |CATERPILLAR 745
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
WHEEL LOADER N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
35 |KOMATSU, WA470
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
36 |JOHN DEERE 644
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM . Emission & Cooling Fabco Farmers Auto GA Truck & Hardy Chevrolet
COMMODITIES and SERVICES i
No. Dobbs Equip Solutions Fabrication, Inc. Glass Fairway Fleet | 4 iler LLC | Buick GMC, Inc.
LANDFILL TIPPER N/A
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
33 |[COLUMBIA HORIZONTAL
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
ARTICULATED DUMP N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
34 [CATERPILLAR 745
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
WHEEL LOADER N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
35 |KOMATSU, WA470
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR $1,586.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR $2,719.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
36 [JOHN DEERE 644
1500 HOUR $1,586.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $4,605.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

Marion Ford MHC Kenworth
ITEM i i i i
COMMODITIES and SERVICES lnterst‘flte Truck Jim Ellis JR Motors LLC Ken(.irlck Tractor dba dba Georgia Midtown Glass
No. Equip. Inc. Chevrolet Radiator dba Glass Inc.
Lashley Kubota Kenworth
LANDFILL TIPPER N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
33 |COLUMBIA HORIZONTAL
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
ARTICULATED DUMP N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
34 |CATERPILLAR 745
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
WHEEL LOADER N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
35 |KOMATSU, WA470
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
36 |JOHN DEERE 644
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

. Reliable . . Springs & . .
ITEM Peterbilt of -
COMMODITIES and SERVICES eterbilt o Transmission Rush Truck Ctr. Sims Radiator Suspension, Stivers Bro.thers Ten-8 Fire &
No. Atlanta . Sve., Inc. Automotive Safety LLC
Service, Inc. Inc.
LANDFILL TIPPER
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
33 |COLUMBIA HORIZONTAL
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
ARTICULATED DUMP
500 HOUR N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
34 |CATERPILLAR 745
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
WHEEL LOADER
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
35 |KOMATSU, WA470
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
36 |JOHN DEERE 644
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

West GA S . S
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Wespro JCB Tl.'actor & Hydraulic & Lift Williams Fire| The W.W. Williams
No. Equipment Co. Apparatus Co. LLC
Truck
LANDFILL TIPPER
500 HOUR $2.200.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR $3.850.00 N/A NA N/A N/A
33 |COLUMBIA HORIZONTAL
1500 HOUR $2.200.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $3,850.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
ARTICULATED DUMP
500 HOUR $1,840.00 $2.800.00 N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR $3.130.00 $4.527.00 N/A N/A N/A
34 |CATERPILLAR 745
1500 HOUR $1,840.00 $2,800.00 N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $3.130.00 $6.864.00 N/A N/A N/A
WHEEL LOADER
500 HOUR $1.640.00 $2.707.00 N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR $4,750.00 $3,345.00 N/A N/A N/A
35 |KOMATSU, WA470
1500 HOUR $1.640.00 $2.707.00 N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $4,750.00 $5,518.00 N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR $1.565.00 $2.633.00 N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR $2,775.00 $3.168.00 N/A N/A N/A
36 |JOHN DEERE 644
1500 HOUR $1.565.00 $2.633.00 N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $2,775.00 $5,544.00 N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Adams Equip. AgPro Allan Vigil Ford | Altec Ing. | ‘‘antaGlass | Barber Auto Bolton
No. Co. Inc. Heroes Air, Inc. Motorsports
TUB GRINDER N/A

500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
37 |VERMEER

1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

EXCAVATOR N/A N/A

500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
38 |KOMATSU, PC490

1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NA

1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
39 |VOLVO EC350

1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NA

2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA

1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
40 |VOLVO EWI180

1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA

2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA

1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
41 |JCBJC260

1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA

2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

DOZER N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
CATERPILLAR D6 1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

42

1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA

2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

Clark
Carolina Maintenance & Cummins Inc.
ITEM Capital Cit i
No COMMODITIES and SERVICES M:cpl:i::e S;uf Environmental C(];Ce ];liisel Supplies Inc DBA Cougﬁzﬁ Auto ?l"f‘aflzl;cll;f‘ dba Cummins
’ P Systems, Inc. P Clark Truck P ’ Sales & Svc.
Repair
TUB GRINDER
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
37 |VERMEER
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
EXCAVATOR
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
38 |KOMATSU, PC490
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
39 |VOLVO EC350
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
40 |VOLVO EWI180
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
41 |JCBJC260
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
DOZER
500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A N/A N/A N/A
CATERPILLAR D6 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
42
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A NA NA N/A NA N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM . Emission & Cooling Fabco Farmers Auto GA Truck & Hardy Chevrolet
COMMODITIES and SERVICES i
No. Dobbs Equip Solutions Fabrication, Inc. Glass Fairway Fleet | 4 iler LLC | Buick GMC, Inc.
TUB GRINDER
500 HOUR N/A NA NA NA NA N/A N/A
1000 HOUR NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
37 |VERMEER
1500 HOUR N/A NA NA NA NA N/A N/A
2000 HOUR NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
EXCAVATOR
500 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
38 |KOMATSU, PC490
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
39 |[VOLVO EC350
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
40 |VOLVO EW180
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
41 |ICBJC260
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
DOZER
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
CATERPILLAR D6 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
42
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

Marion Ford MHC Kenworth
ITEM i i i i
COMMODITIES and SERVICES lnterst‘flte Truck Jim Ellis JR Motors LLC Ken(.irlck Tractor dba dba Georgia Midtown Glass
No. Equip. Inc. Chevrolet Radiator dba Glass Inc.
Lashley Kubota Kenworth
TUB GRINDER N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
37 |VERMEER
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
EXCAVATOR N/A
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
38 |KOMATSU, PC490
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
39 |VOLVO EC350
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
500 HOUR NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
40 |VOLVO EWI180
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
500 HOUR NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
41 |JCBJC260
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
DOZER N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
CATERPILLAR D6 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
42
1500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
2000 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

. Reliable . . Springs & . .
ITEM Peterbilt of -
COMMODITIES and SERVICES eterbilt o Transmission Rush Truck Ctr. Sims Radiator Suspension, Stivers Bro.thers Ten-8 Fire &
No. Atlanta . Sve., Inc. Automotive Safety LLC
Service, Inc. Inc.
TUB GRINDER
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
37 |VERMEER
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
EXCAVATOR
500 HOUR N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
38 |KOMATSU, PC490
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
39 |VOLVO EC350
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
500 HOUR N/A N/A NA N/A N/A NA N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
40 |VOLVO EWI180
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
41 |JCBJC260
1500 HOUR NA NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
DOZER
500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
CATERPILLAR D6 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
42
1500 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
2000 HOUR N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
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ITB No.:

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

2025-011

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

West GA S . S
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Wespro JCB Tl.'actor & Hydraulic & Lift Williams Fire| The W.W. Williams
No. Equipment Co. Apparatus Co. LLC
Truck
TUB GRINDER

500 HOUR $3.115.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR $4,655.00 N/A NA N/A N/A
37 |VERMEER

1500 HOUR $3.115.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR $4,655.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

EXCAVATOR

500 HOUR $2.150.00 $2,645.00 N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR $3.875.00 $3.353.00 N/A N/A N/A
38 |KOMATSU, PC490

1500 HOUR $2,150.00 $2,645.00 N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR $3.875.00 $5.086.00 N/A N/A N/A

500 HOUR $1,950.00 $2,554.00 N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR $3.125.00 $3.560.00 N/A N/A N/A
39 |VOLVO EC350

1500 HOUR $1,950.00 $2,554.00 N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR $3.125.00 $5.157.00 N/A N/A N/A

500 HOUR $1,580.00 $2,106.00 N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR $2.850.00 $2.593.00 N/A N/A N/A
40 |VOLVO EWI180

1500 HOUR $1,580.00 $2,106.00 N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR $2.850.00 $3.506.00 N/A N/A N/A

500 HOUR $1,400.00 $2,592.00 N/A N/A N/A

1000 HOUR $2.750.00 $3.194.00 N/A N/A N/A
41 |JCBJC260

1500 HOUR $1,480.00 $2,592.00 N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR $2.750.00 $4.280.00 N/A N/A N/A

DOZER
500 HOUR $2.950.00 $2.499.00 N/A N/A N/A
CATERPILLAR D6 1000 HOUR $3,650.00 $3,610.00 N/A N/A N/A

42

1500 HOUR $2,950.00 $2,499.00 N/A N/A N/A

2000 HOUR $3.650.00 $4.135.00 N/A N/A N/A
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Adams Equip. AgPro Allan Vigil Ford | Altec Ing. | ‘‘antaGlass | Barber Auto Bolton
No. Co. Inc. Heroes Air, Inc. Motorsports
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
43 |CATERPILLAR D8
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
JOHN DEERE 1050 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
44
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
45 |[JOHN DEERE 850
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
46 |Travel Charge, round trip. $110.00 $14.50/mile N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
47 |Other charges or services (Specify) $0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
48 |Other charges or services (Specify) $0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Carrier,
49  |Price sheet name/# (Brand/manufacturer) Yac-Con/Sewer, John Deere Ford Motor Co. Altec Ind. N/A Bergstrom- N/A
Equp. Co. — Kysor,
Trans/Air
. . L] .E i .
50 |Column in price sheet Py Des,m:l tion & Cost Column $3.00 N/A DeKalb Price N/A
Pricing —
. 15% off selling o
51 |Discount from column N/A rice plus 15% None N/A None N/A
. . . OEM
52 |For new replacement radiators, bidder state Radiator Manufacturer/Brand Name N/A John Deere Ford Motor Co. N/A N/A ey N/A
— — I Mfg/MSRP —
Number of Bids Responsive: 40 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: (Waived)
Note: N/A=No Bid (Vendor chose not to bid on that item)
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

Clark
. . Carolina . Maintenance & Cummins Inc.
IL?)M COMMUODITIES and SERVICES I\E:cpl:it::i Silt())] Environmental C(];Ce ];liisel Supplies Inc DBA Coug:(s:fl Auto ?l"f‘afll;l;cll:lf‘ dba Cummins
’ P Systems, Inc. P Clark Truck P ’ Sales & Svc.
Repair
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
43 |CATERPILLAR D8
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
JOHN DEERE 1050 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
44
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
45 |JOHN DEERE 850
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
46 |Travel Charge, round trip. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $135.00 N/A
47 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $7Z‘2:.) eaivcvl;u & N/A
48 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
49  |Price sheet name/# (Brand/manufacturer) N/A N/A Mitchell Napa Ford/Mopar OEM N/A Cummins
50 [Column in price sheet N/A N/A N/A Napa MSRP N/A N/A G
51 |Discount from column N/A N/A N/A 10% plus 15% N/A M
. . . According to
52 |For new replacement radiators, bidder state Radiator Manufacturer/Brand Name N/A N/A - N/A Ford/Mopar N/A N/A
- — make of vehicle I - -
Number of Bids Responsive: 40 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: (Waived)

Note: N/A=No Bid (Vendor chose not to bid on that item)
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

-y

()

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

ITEM . Emission & Cooling Fabco Farmers Auto . GA Truck & Hardy Chevrolet
COMMODITIES and SERVICES
No. an Dobbs Equip Solutions Fabrication, Inc. Glass Fairway Fleet | 4 iler LLC | Buick GMC, Inc.
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
43 |CATERPILLAR D8
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR $1,812.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
JOHN DEERE 1050 1000 HOUR $2.847.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A NA
44
1500 HOUR $1,812.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $7.861.00 N/A NA NA N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR $1.366.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR $2.238.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
45 |JOHN DEERE 850
1500 HOUR $1.366.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $2.588.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NA
46 |Travel Charge, round trip. $527.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
47 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
48 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
49  |Price sheet name/# (Brand/manufacturer) John Deere N/A Attac.hm—mtﬂls N/A N/A . Pl..l?e based 01.1 Lanbe prov.lded
— Price sheet individual repairs after repairs
50 [Column in price sheet N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
51 |Discount from column N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
52 |For new replacement radiators, bidder state Radiator Manufacturer/Brand Name John Deere N/A N/A NA NA N/A GM DE
Number of Bids Responsive: 40 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: (Waived)

Note: N/A=No Bid (Vendor chose not to bid on that item)
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ITB No.: 2025-011 Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25 Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION Agent: Tammy Shew

DeKalb County

. . . Marion Ford MHC Kenworth .
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Interstate Truck | JimEllis = pp ypors e | Kendrick Tractordba | dba Georgia | hhatown Glass
No. Equip. Inc. Chevrolet Radiator dba Glass Inc.
Lashley Kubota Kenworth
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
43 |CATERPILLAR D8
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
JOHN DEERE 1050 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
44
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA NA NA N/A NA N/A NA
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
45 |JOHN DEERE 850
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
46 |Travel Charge, round trip. N/A N/A $50.00 $0.00 $199.00 N/A N/A
47 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A $75.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
48 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
General Radiators & Fuel
49  |Price sheet name/# (Brand/manufacturer) See attached sheet [Motors/Jim Ellis N/A T Tanks Lashley Kubota N/A N/A
Chevrolet E—
50 [Column in price sheet N/A N/A N/A N/A List Price N/A N/A
o, 1 0, " 1
51 |Discount from column N/A Cost+15% 10% discount off 15% w N/A N/A
EE— Parts — Price
Paccar Parts/Road
52 |For new replacement radiators, bidder state Radiator Manufacturer/Brand Name N/A General Motors N/A N/A NA Force/1-800 N/A
Radiator
Number of Bids Responsive: 40 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: (Waived)
Note: N/A=No Bid (Vendor chose not to bid on that item)
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ITB No.:

2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew

. Reliable . . Springs & . .
ITEM COMMUODITIES and SERVICES Peterbilt of Transmission Rush Truck Ctr. Sims Radiator Suspension, Stivers Bro.t hers | Ten-8 Fire &
No. Atlanta . Sve., Inc. Automotive Safety LLC
Service, Inc. Inc.
500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
43 |CATERPILLAR D8
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR NA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA N/A NA NA NA NA N/A
JOHN DEERE 1050 1000 HOUR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA
44
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR NA N/A NA NA NA NA N/A
1000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
45 |JOHN DEERE 850
1500 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
46 |Travel Charge, round trip. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
47 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
48 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
49  |Price sheet name/# (Brand/manufacturer) Peterbilt online Allison Navistar Price sheet 1 N/A N/A Ten-8 Fire &
Leterbilt online Allison davistar irice sheet 1 A A Safety LLC
$195/hr (in
50 [Column in price sheet Your Price List N'tl fleet Jobber N/A N/A shop), $225/hr
(mobile sve)
51 |Discount from column Sell Price 5% N'tl fleet 10% N/A N/A N/A
CSF.Cryomax,Ge
52 |For new replacement radiators, bidder state Radiator Manufacturer/Brand Name Paccar/Peterbilt N/A Int'l or Northern | nera, Thermal NA NA OEM
Solutions
Number of Bids Responsive: 40 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: (Waived)
Note: N/A=No Bid (Vendor chose not to bid on that item)
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ITB No.: 2025-011

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING BID TABULATION

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: 4/21/25

West GA - . S
ITEM COMMODITIES and SERVICES Wespro JCB Tl.‘actor & Hydraulic & Lift Williams Fire| The W.W. Williams
No. Equipment Co. Apparatus Co. LLC
Truck
500 HOUR $5,350.00 $2.,809.00 N/A NA N/A
1000 HOUR $7.600.00 $4.215.00 N/A N/A N/A
43 [CATERPILLAR D8
1500 HOUR $5,350.00 $2,809.00 N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $7.600.00 $4,931.00 N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR $3.300.00 $1,736.00 NA N/A NA
4 [PoHN DEERE 1050 1000 HOUR $5.750.00 $2.169.00 N/A N/A N/A
1500 HOUR $3,300.00 $1,736.00 N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $5.750.00 $2.336.00 N/A N/A N/A
500 HOUR $2.700.00 $1,736.00 NA N/A NA
1000 HOUR $4,050.00 $2.169.00 N/A N/A N/A
45 [JOHN DEERE 850
1500 HOUR $2,700.00 $1,736.00 N/A N/A N/A
2000 HOUR $4,050.00 $2.336.00 N/A N/A N/A
46 |Travel Charge, round trip. $200.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
. . (shop
47 |Other charges or services (Specify) $153uma:;e:h0 N/A N/A N/A N/A
48 |Other charges or services (Specify) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
. Pricing
. p .
49  |Price sheet name/# (Brand/manufacturer) N/A Available upon N/A depends on Allison
request .
repair
. . i E .
50 [Column in price sheet N/A Available upon N/A N/A List
request
51 |Discount from column N/A N/A N/A N/A 10%
52 |For new replacement radiators, bidder state Radiator Manufacturer/Brand Name JCB Komatsu N/A O,E M & Active Radlat(?r &
— Vehicle Type Spectra Premium
Number of Bids Responsive: 40 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: (Waived)

Note: N/A=No Bid (Vendor chose not to bid on that item)

—

Agent Signature;%j’m

Witness Signature:
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Cost Opening Date: 5/6/25

Agent: Tammy Shew



	Sheet2



