Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S
Agent: Tammy Shew

ITB No.: 2025-112
Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road

-

Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to Renew)

Q

DeKalb County

Ag-Pro

Allan Vigil Ford Lincoln

Atlanta Safety Brake Service

Auto Zone Parts, Inc.

Bolton Motorsports, LLC.

A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS

John Deere, Bushhog, American Honda (OPE), Stihl, Tiger

MGM-50% off List, Stemco 50% off List, BCA Bearings-
Jobber, Nt'l Seals-Jobber, Gunite 50% off List + 10% off final
total, Webb-50% off list + 10% off final total, Meritor-50 % off]

Chevrolet 5%, Ford 5%, Kenworth 10%,

Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered) Movwers Ford OEM Parts & Supplies list, Euclid-50% off list, Abex 685 4707 shoe-$34.00 ea., Abex No Bid Peterbilt 10%, Kia 5%, GMC 5%, Cummins
685 4715 shoe-$39.00 ea., Abex 685 4709 shoe-$36.00 5%, BM Headlights 20%, LKQ 10%
ea.,Gunite 3687x drum $245.00 ea., Webb 66864B drum-
$170.00 ea., Webb 66661B drum-$440.00 ea.
MGM-50% off List, Stemco 50% off List, BCA Bearings-
Jobber, Nt'l Seals-Jobber, Gunite 50% off List + 10% off final
total, Webb-50% off list + 10% off final total, Meritor-50 % off] Chevrolet 5%, Ford 5%, Kenworth 10%,
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus) 15% off Sellng Price 10 % over dealer cost at time of purchase list, Euclid-50% off list, Abex 685 4707 shoe-$34.00 ea., Abex No Bid Peterbilt 10%, Kia 5%, GMC 5%, Cummins
685 4715 shoe-$39.00 ea., Abex 685 4709 shoe-$36.00 5%, BM Headlights 20%, LKQ 10%
ea.,Gunite 3687x drum $245.00 ea., Webb 66864B drum-
$170.00 ea., Webb 66661B drum-$440.00 ea.
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries
ll:e;n Item Description Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price
1 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . . . . . ProPower Ultra $146.99 " "
Capacity Rating: 115
2 Batter)f with BiCl Group: 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve B B . . . . Duralast $171.26
Capacity Rating: 250 * *
3 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . . . . . Duralast $198.78 . .
Capacity Rating: 320
4 Batter)f with BiCl Group: 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Reserve . . . . . . ProPower Ultra $164.99 " .
Capacity Rating: 115
5 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve N N " " . . ProPower Plus $148.31 . .
Capacity Rating: 100
6  |Battery AGM with BCI Group: 65, CA775, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1000 * * * * * * ProPower AGM $201.99 * *
7 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve * * . . . " ProPower Plus $185.39 N N
Capacity Rating: 130
3 Batter)f with l:s’Cl Group: 51R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 500, Reserve . . . . . . ProPower Ultra $169.99 . .
Capacity Rating: 75
9 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve w w * * « « Duralast $279.17 . .
Capacity Rating: 435
10 Batterr\f with BfCI Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . . . . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 200
1 Batter)f with l:s’Cl Group: 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . . . . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 200
12 Batter}.' with BfCI Group: 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve N N . . . . ProPower Ultra $166.99 . .
Capacity Rating: 120




IITB No.: 2025-112

Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

Renew)

-

Q

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S
Agent: Tammy Shew

Buddy OP Il LLC. dba Buddy Chevrolet

Courtesy Automative Group

Cummins Inc.

Emission & Cooling Systems

Fleetpride

Georgia Auto Refinishing

A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS

General Motors Parts & General Motors Engines &

All aftertreatment part pricing is listed on

OTR Battery/Continental (USA Made), OTR Products,
Haldex, Phillips Industries, Dana/Spicer, Eaton Fuller,
Power Products, Truck-Lite, Automann, Breeze, Cole

Basecoat & Single Stage Paint (Mipa), Primer 2K or
Laquer (Mipa, U-POL, 5 Star), Body Filler (Evercoat,
USC, 3M, U-POL, etc.), Putty (Mipa, Evercoat, U-POL,
etc.), Seam Sealer (HUD, Transtar, SEM), 2 Part
Adhesives (3M, Proform,Pliogrip, SEM,etc.),Aerosol
Cans (3M, Evercoat, SEM, Transtar, etc.),Clear Coat
(Mipa, Montana, Matrix, Refinish Solutions,

Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered) Transmissions OEM Ford & Mopar Parts No Bid attached price schedule in bid. Hersee, Dayco, Buyers Products, CRC, Dorman, Jost, etc.),Compounds, Polish & Wax (3M,Presta),Masking
Chelsea, GlobeTech, Webb, Conment, National, NTN, Paper (Kardol Quality Products),Plastic Sheeting
SKF (Sunmight, 5-Star, Finish Pro),Paint Prep Cups (3M,
Sunmight, DeVilbiss),Mixing Cups (E-Z Mix),Mixing
Sticks & Paint Strainers, Sandpaper (3M,Indasa,
Fandeli,Sunmight,Mirka),Masking Tape (3M,Q1
Premium Masking Solutions)
General Motors Parts-List minus 30% excluding
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus) engmes & 1ransm1551(_)n§ Dealer Cost plus 20% No Bid aries by numb_er (see price sheet for See quote #800182.73 for actual price a nd hSF price See See Attached Price Sheet in bid as of 9/26/25
General Motors Engines & Transmissions-Cost plus| discount) www.fleetpride.com for comparison pricing
15%
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries
l;f(:n Item Description Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price | Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price | Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price
! gZZZZn?Zhafanl C;"]Uj”p-' 24 Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve AcDelco $135.00 * * Cummins Inc. C24LTV $108.22 * = OTR/Continental #OTRGF34 $99.79 = B
2 f«iﬁiﬁﬁﬁfg (;r;(;tp: 4DLI, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve No Bid N/A N . c4p $212.14 . . OTR/Continental #OTRF4DLT $199.50 . .
3 gzzzgnvjllghafncg[ C_T;’ZU(;J i 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A * * No Bid N/A = * OTR/Continental #0TR-F4D $189.00 * =
4 g‘;zzzt;gfg G;f;p ¢ 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 673, Reserve AcDelco $135.00 . . No Bid N/A . . OTR/Continental OTRG-F2F4 $140.99 . .
3 gZZZZUWZ}anZ’ C%Zl pi 7860, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A * * No Bid N/A - - OTR/Continental #OTRS-F78 No Bid . *
6 |Battery AGM with BCI Group: 65, CA775, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1000 AcDelco $210.00 * * No Bid N/A = * OTR/Continental #65-AGM $184.39 = =
7 ‘gZZZZUWZhafnZI C?;; . 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A * * No Bid N/A . N OTR/Continental #OTRS-F27 $99.30 . .
8 gZZZ?;Uv;l};hafrg G7’50 up 1R Cold Cranking Ranking: 300, Reserve AcDelco $120.00 * * No Bid N/A = = OTR/Continental #51RCP $92.50 * *
9 ‘g‘{‘;;gnwzha 5an1- Cj;'j"j”” ¢ 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A . N Cummins, C8DXH $264.67 . - OTR/Continental #OTR-FSDX $312.50 . .
10 Battery_’ with ECI Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A w « N/A N/A . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 200
Battery with BCI Group: 31E, ing Ranking: 1300, Rese: . . .

1 CZZ;Z;”}QZ tirfg‘ C;’(;’(;‘p 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A . . No Bid N/A . . No Bid N/A . X
12 gZZZZ;ZanCg{ G]’;{;‘P-’ 5 Cold Cranking Ranking: 830, Reserve AcDelco $145.00 = * No Bid N/A * = OTR/Contintenal #OTRG-F65 $114.90 = =
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Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S
Agent: Tammy Shew

-

Q

IITB No.: 2025-112
Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road

Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

Renew)

DeKalb County

Georgia Kenworth (MHC)

Interstate Batteries

Interstate Truck

Williams Fire Apparatus

Jasper Engines & Transmissions

Jim Ellis Chevrolet

A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS

Lighting/Peterson, Whelen Amber, Truck
Lite,Maxxima,Truck Accessories/Hardware,
Velvac/Buyers Prod, Goodall,Cranes/ Liftmoore,
Palfinger, Nt'l, Northshore,IMT,
Rotobec,Hitches/Wallace Forge, Air
Compressors/Vanair,Boss, Ingersol &

Sutphen Corp. OEM Parts & Pieces, Whelen Engineering
Parts & Pieces, TFT Parts for Repair, Alcron Brass Parts &

General Motor Parts

Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered) Tri Batteries & Cummins Parts No Bid Champion,DumpBodies & Hoists/Warren, Galion, Pieces, Bostrom Seating, Elkhart Brass Jasper
Rugby, Service Bodies/MCB,
IMT, Liftgates/Thieman, Waltco, Tommy Gate, Maxon,
Snow/Ice Control-Warren & Coastal Metal, (Fab
Salts/Sand Spreader), Wausau (Snow Plows)
Spreaders/Warren (Fertilizer Spreaders)

Jasper Part #s (25% Off List Price: 397810
5.3/325 CHEV, 399410 4.3/262 V6 CHEV,

513510 5.7/345 V8 CHRY, 5502340 6T70 2013-

20, 5503390 6L80 4.3 RWD, 5503400 6L.80 5.3

Tri Batteries 45% Discount, Cummins Parts No Bid Price Lists Unavailable 15% 3 % off List (see attached parts lists in bid) 24(;)1V 5[,) 3?2%%%%%%%?5%,5 ’sgggizé()ﬁilgﬁ()zgﬁ Cost + 15%

State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)

30% Discount

20, 5579540 6L.80 2014-18, 5579560 6180 2014-
20), (15% Off List-Jasper 5109790 1000PK 2011-
15), (20% Off List-Light Duty Transmissions, Gas
Engines & Differentials), (25% Off List-Fuel & Air
Components), (10% Off List-Diesel Engines)

B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES No Bid Batteries . . No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries
No Bid Batteries
ll:e;n Item Description Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price

1 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTP-24 $107.96 . . * * . . . .
Capacity Rating: 115

2 Batter,\f with j.BCI Group: 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 830, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries 4DLT-VHD $141.56 * = * * = = = =
Capacity Rating: 250

3 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries 4D-XHD $147.16 . . * . . . .
Capacity Rating: 320 *

4 Batter,\f with j.BCI Group: 24F. Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTP-24F $107.96 = * * * - = - *
Capacity Rating: 115

5 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MT-78 $107.96 . . . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 100

6  |Battery AGM with BCI Group: 65, CA775, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1000 No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTX-65 $178.36 * = * * = = * =

7 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MT-27 $107.96 . . N . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 130

3 Batter)f with l:s’Cl Group: 51R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 500, Reserve No Bid NA Interstate Batteries MT-SIR $91.96 . . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 75 *

9 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries SD-MHD $156.84 . * . . . ) .
Capacity Rating: 435 = *

10 Batter,\{ with Bicl Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries 31P-XHD $118.36 . . " . . . .
Capacity Rating: 200 *

1 Batterjf with lj?CI Group: 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries 31-XHD $118.36 . . N . = . N
Capacity Rating: 200 *

12 Batter,\i with j_BCI Group: 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 830, Reserve Midwest Battery/Tri $79.99 Interstate Batteries MTP-65HD $102.08 * = * * * * =
Capacity Rating: 120 *
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IITB No.: 2025-112

Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to
Renew)

-

Q

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S
Agent: Tammy Shew

Knox Fleet Services, LLC. Lashley Kubota Napa Auto Parts Peterbilt of Atlanta Refuse & Mixer Support, LLC. Reliable Transmission Service, Inc.

A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS

Batteries 52%,Alternators/Starters 53%,Batteries
56%,Bearings,Ball & Roller 55%,Belts & Hoses
48%,Brakes 56%,Electrical & Ignition 52%,Emission,
Sensors & Exhaust 54%,Engine & Drive Train
52%,Filters, Oil,Gas,Air & Transmission 72%,Auto
Repair Shop Supplies 46%,General Auto Parts
50%, Wipers/Washers 59%,Suspension, Shocks,Strust &
Steering 52%,0ils,Chemicals,Fluids & Lubricants 52%

Refuse & Mixer Support, LLC. does not supply
parts currently for DeKalb County. Service labor
rate is $150.00

ASV , Kubota, Land Pride, Toro Siteworks,
DuroForce Rubber Tracks (10%)

Remanufactured Allison Transmissions, Allison &
Telma OEM Parts

Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered) N/A See Attached Price Sheet in bid

Allison & Telma OEM Parts: List less 5%
Remanufactured Allison Transmissions: Model Nos:
1000/2000 Series-$4,360.50 (Core Deposit-
$2000.00), 3000 Series- $6,207.30 (Core Deposit-

Batteries 52%,Alternators/Starters 53%,Batteries

For all items not listed in the attached price list 56%,Bearings,Ball & Roller 55%,Belts & Hoses

Labor Rate: $150/hr. for: Repairs &

State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)

Maintenance, Paint & Body work, Sandblast &

or from alternative manufacturers, pricing will
be calculated as follows:

48%,Brakes 56%,Electrical & Ignition 52%,Emission,

Sensors & Exhaust 54%,Engine & Drive Train

(DeKalb County Discount shown on Price Sheet)

$3000.00), 3000R Series- $6,669.00 (Core Deposit

Service Labor Rate $150.00/hr.

$4,000.00), 4000 Series- $9,644.40 (Core Deposit-

List Price less a discount of 10%-DeKalb
County Purchase Price, Lashley Kubota
Purchase Price divided by .60= List Price

Prep, Fabrication & Welding
Material Cost (as needed)

52%,Filters, Oil,Gas,Air & Transmission 72%,Auto
Repair Shop Supplies 46%,General Auto Parts
50%,Wipers/Washers 59%,Suspension,Shocks,Strust &
Steering 52%,0ils,Chemicals,Fluids & Lubricants 52%

$5000.00), 4000R Series, $10,208.70 (Core Deposit
$7000.00), (Core Returns are eligible if returned
within 30 days) Allison Transmission labor rate:

$230/hr., Electronic Diagnostics: $230 for 1st hr. &

$230/hour thereafter, Service Calls: $3.50/mile each

way
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries
ll:e;n Item Description Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price | Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price | Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price

1 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7524 $114.76 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 115

2 Batter'\f with Bicl Group: 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7251 $163.66 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 250

3 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7266 $191.00 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 320

4 Batter'\f with Bicl Group: 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7524F $114.75 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 115

5 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7578 $114.75 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 100

6 |Battery AGM with BCI Group: 65, CA775, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1000 = * - = East Penn Legend Premium 9865 $184.00 * = = = = *

7 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7527 $114.76 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 130

3 Batter)f with l:s’Cl Group: 51R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 500, Reserve . . . . East Penn Leger = Premium 7551R $114.76 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 75

9 Battery with BCI Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve East Penn Legend Premium $225.44 )
Capacity Rating: 435 = - - 7271FT ’ - * * * -

10 Batter,\{ with Bicl Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7234 $148.46 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 200
Batte; ith BCI : 31E, ing Ranking: 1300, Reserve

1 attu)f with .C Group: 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7235 $148.46 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 200

12 Batterr\f with BfCI Group: 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve . . . . East Penn Legend Premium 7565 $120.94 . . . . . .
Capacity Rating: 120
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IITB No.: 2025-112
Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

g Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
‘ Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S

Agent: Tammy Shew

Renew
) DeKalb County
Rush Truck Center Sims Radiator Service, Inc. Ten-8 Fire & Safety, LLC. Tidewater Fleet Supply dba TNT Auto Parts Truck Pro LLC. Weaver Distributors
A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS
BW Bendix-57% off list, DC Dayco-20% off TP Retail, DX Dexter-50% off TP
Retail, EU Euclid-57% off TP List, GR Grote-25% off Grote Sheet, MD
Haldex-50% off TP List, NA National Seals-67% off TP List, RO Meritor-
55% off TP List,SP-Parker Chelsa-51% off TP List, ST Stemco-54% off TP
. . g . Baldwin Filters-66% off Jobber, Donaldson List, TK Trucklite-71% off TP List, TI Nt'l Bearings-68% off TP List, WE
l‘:zzz:i;i\lh‘;ii“gé:“;;“&iRITC"“};Sdgg{’;g“;n(:l);/g;’viti‘r)’ Filters-50% off Jobber, Bendix- 50% off List, | Webb Drum-59% off TP List, WW Anco-73% off TP List, RC Raybesto-43%
Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered) Intl Bendix I;jternational Isuzu I\;[edc:) Inc.. PAI I’nd Rie Tou ’h Please see attached price sheet with bid N/A Haldex-50% off List, Anco/Trico-68% off List,] off TP List, QC-Quality Chain-41% off TP Retail, CO Commet-57% off TP ACDelco & Motorcraft Batteries
HVA,C Rush Pren;ilim P;)wer Produc;;s Stemc;), Inf s MEI Air Source-55% off List, Grote Lighting- | List, HT Horton-55% off TP List, MM MGM Brake Chambers-57% off TP
’ ’ : 60% off List List, BP Buyers Products-58% off TP List, IU Deflecto-55% off TP List, BH
Armanda-68% off TP List, VH Donovan-62% off TP List, OW-Kost- 57% off
TP List, TN Tectrah-65% off TP List, YC-Security Chain-59% off TP List, GP
Grote-57% off TP List, RQ-Dorman-55% off TP List, MY Mystic-57% off TP
List, DB-East Penn-56% off TP List
BW Bendix-57% off list, DC Dayco-20% off TP Retail, DX Dexter-50% off TP
Retail, EU Euclid-57% off TP List, GR Grote-25% off Grote Sheet, MD
Haldex-50% off TP List, NA National Seals-67% off TP List, RO Meritor-
OEM Vendors -Cost + Margin % on the following: 55% off TP List,SP-Parker Chelsa-51% off TP List, ST Stemco-54% off TP
Accuride Wheel End-17%, Cummins (Recon)-8%, Caterpillar (On Baldwin Filters-66% off Jobber, Donaldson List, TK Trucklite-71% off TP List, TI Nt'l Bearings-68% off TP List, WE
Hwy.)-10%, Roadwarrior-17%, Hino Diesel Trucks, Inc.-19%, Int'l Filters-50% off Jobber, Bendix- 50% off List, | Webb Drum-59% off TP List, WW Anco-73% off TP List, RC Raybesto-43%
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus) Delco-14%, Int'l Meritor-13%, Int'l Bendix-15%, International- No Bid OEM pricelist is not available Haldex-50% off List, Anco/Trico-68% off List,| off TP List, QC-Quality Chain-41% off TP Retail, CO Commet-57% off TP List - 34%
22%, Isuzu-20%, Medco Inc.-22%, PAI Ind.-15%, Rig Tough MEI Air Source-55% off List, Grote Lighting- | List, HT Horton-55% off TP List, MM MGM Brake Chambers-57% off TP
HVAC-17%, Rush Premium Power Products-20%, Stemco Inc.- 60% off List List, BP Buyers Products-58% off TP List, IU Deflecto-55% off TP List, BH
17% (Extensive notes & price sheet in bid) Armanda-68% off TP List, VH Donovan-62% off TP List, OW-Kost- 57% off
TP List, TN Tectrah-65% off TP List, YC-Security Chain-59% off TP List, GP]
Grote-57% off TP List, RQ-Dorman-55% off TP List, MY Mystic-57% off TP
List, DB-East Penn-56% off TP List
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries
l;e(:n Item Description Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price
. o . o i Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 724mFE:188 (CCA K
| [Battery with BCI Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve 725-RC120), See Clarifications & Notes in | 11074 (Core: . . . East Pen-Deka $94.99 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB725-24) $92.05 ACDelco part#24GHR $103.00
Capacity Rating: 115 ; $23.94)
. . . Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 94DLT:188 (CCA
Batt ith BCI G : 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Re: 188.27 (Core:
o |Panerywith BELGTOUp » Lola Lranking fanting: SoU, Reserve 850-RC240), See Clarifications & Notes in | (Core . . . East Pen-Deka $136.89 | East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB850-4DLT) $179.15 ACDelco part#4DLTG $175.97
Capacity Rating: 250 ; $47.88)
p S . T e Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 8A4D:188 (CCA X
3 Battu’}( with ‘?Cl Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve 1110-RC380), See Clarifications & Notes in $351.70 (Core: = * & East Pen-Deka $157.49 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB1050-4D) $178.31 ACDelco part#4DGA $192.14
Capacity Rating: 320 bid $71.82)
. . . Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 724FMF:188 (CCA
Batt ith BCI G : 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Res 116.74 (Core:
g4 |ponery it SEEGroup: S4E, Cold Cranking fanfing: 072, Reserve 725-RC120), See Clarifications & Notes in | (Core . - . East Pen-Deka $90.59 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB725-24F) $92.05 ACDelco part#24RPG $109.60
Capacity Rating: 115 bid $23.94)
p S » T T, Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 778 MF:188 (CCA X
5 Battu’}( with ‘?Cl Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve 801-RC115), See Clarifications & Notes in $121.21 (Core: = = * East Pen-Deka $91.09 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB690-78) $93.18 ACDelco part#78G $108.49
Capacity Rating: 100 bid $23.94)
6 |Battery AGM with BCI Group: 65, CA775, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1000 No Bid N/A * * + East Pen-Deka $149.09 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB9A65) $185.23 ACDelco part#65GA $108.29
p S » T oo, | Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 627MF:188 (CCA X
7 Battu’}. with ‘?CI Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve 710-RC120), See Clarifications & Notes in $120.17 (Core: = = = East Pen-Deka $91.39 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB840-27) $112.26 ACDelco part#27GA $110.92
Capacity Rating: 130 bid $23.94)
" o . . e Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep S51IMF:I88 (CCA X
g |Battery with BCI Group: 3IR, Cold Cranking Ranking: 500, Reserve 450-RC70), See Clarifications & Notesin | 2/ (Core: - = - East Pen-Deka $76.29 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DBS00-51R) $104.80 ACDelco part#51RG $96.29
Capacity Rating: 75 bid $23.94)
. S . T e Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 8A4D:188 (CCA X
o |Battery with BCI Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve 1450-RC480), See Clarifications & Notesin| 0-0- + (Core: . N N East Pen-Deka $205.79 | East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB1425-8DFT) $231.45 ACDelco part#8DGA $261.29
Capacity Rating: 435 bid $95.76)
Batt ith BCI G : 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Res
1o | Cattery with BELGrotp  Cold Lranking Ranfing: 15U, feserve No Bid N/A . . . East Pen-Deka $114.99 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB1000-31) $127.39 ACDelco part#31CO00HRT $136.79
Capacity Rating: 200
Battery with BCI Group: 31E, ranking Ranking: 1300, Rese .
1 |Battery with BCI Group: 3IE, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve No Bid N/A . . . East Pen-Deka $114.99 | East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB1000-31CP) $127.39 ACDelco part#31C1000HRA |  $135.41
Capacity Rating: 200
. . . Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 665MF:188 (CCA
Batt ith BCI G : 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Res 142.11 (Core:
1o |Parery with BELGroup: 65, Lold Cranking fanking: 650, Reserve 850-RC150), See Clarifications & Notes in | (Core * . . East Pen-Deka $99.89 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB850-65) $103.50 ACDelco part#65GHR $118.85
Capacity Rating: 120 bid $23.94)
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ITB No.: 2025-112

Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to
Renew)

-

Q

DeKalb County

West Chatham Warning Devices

W.W. Williams Co. LLC.

Yancey Brothers Caterpillar

A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS

Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)

Whelen-47% off list, Whelen price list
PL25.0WL/ Setina-20% off list, 7-1-25 Retail/
Go Rhino, 25% off list, Go Rhino 25% off list,
MSRP 9-15-25/Havis-30% off list, MSRP 9-1-
25a, Progard-25% off list, July 2025, / Tuffy-
15% off list, MSRP 7-16-25/ Gamber-20% off
list,7/1/25 MSRP/ Federal Signal-30% off list,

9/1/25/Truckvault 10% off list, Retail Pricing 9-
1-25/ Westin 15% off list, 9-24-25 List Price,
Labor $100/hr. at any of the 5 locations.

Allison Genuine Parts, Mfg. Price List-15%,
TranSynd Fluids, Mfg. Price List-10%, Silverback

Brakes-Mfg. Price List-25%, Detroit Diesel Genuine

Parts-Mfg. Price List-17%, Meritor Axle Systems,
Mfg. Price List-10%, Service Repairs-$189/hr.,
Overtime Service-$252/hr., After Hours Service-
$252/hr.

Caterpillar Parts: HD Undercarriage- 25%, GD
Undercarriage-30%, Ground engaging tools-
30%, Filters-35%, HD UC when GD is available
15%

State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)

Whelen-47% off list, Whelen price list

PL25.0WL/ Setina-20% off list, 7-1-25 Retail/
Go Rhino, 25% off list, Go Rhino 25% off list,
MSRP 9-15-25/Havis-30% off list, MSRP 9-1-
25a, Progard-25% off list, July 2025, / Tuffy-

15% off list, MSRP 7-16-25/ Gamber-20% off
list,7/1/25 MSRP/ Federal Signal-30% off list,
9/1/25/Truckvault 10% off list, Retail Pricing 9-

Allison Genuine Parts, Mfg. Price List-15%,
TranSynd Fluids, Mfg. Price List-10%, Silverback

Brakes-Mfg. Price List-25%, Detroit Diesel Genuine

Parts-Mfg. Price List-17%, Meritor Axle Systems,
Mfg. Price List-10%, Service Repairs-$189/hr.,
Overtime Service-$252/hr., After Hours Service-

Caterpillar Parts: HD Undercarriage- 25%, GD
Undercarriage-30%, Ground engaging tools-
30%, Filters-35%, HD UC when GD is available|
15%

Service Rates: Field Service $223.86, Shop
Service $185.00, Spec Shop $208.00, Hyd/Weld
Shop/PM $165.00, Paint $139.00, Undercarriage

1-25/ Westin 15% off list, 9-24-25 List Price, $252/hr. $149.00, Atl Machine/Boring Shop $208.00
Labor $100/hr. at any of the 5 locations.
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES No Bid Batteries No Bid Batteries
ll:e;n Item Description Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price | Manufacturer & Brand Name Unit Price Manufacturer & Brand Name | Unit Price

1 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . East Penn D624MFE $86.72 . .
Capacity Rating: 115

2 Batter)f with BfCI Group: 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve . . East Penn DY4DLTE $144.39 . .
Capacity Rating: 250

3 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . East Penn D04DE $164.39 . .
Capacity Rating: 320

4 Batter)f with BfCI Group: 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Reserve . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 115

5 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 100

6 |Battery AGM with BCI Group: 65, CA775, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1000 * * East Penn D9A65E $151.73 * =

7 Baltl:‘}'jf with l:&‘CI Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 130

3 Batterjf with §C1 Group: 51R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 500, Reserve . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 75

9 Batter}l’ with l:s’Cl Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . East Penn D90SDFTE $207.77 . .
Capacity Rating: 435

10 Bm‘tery: with Bicl Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . No Bid N/A . .
Capacity Rating: 200

1 Batterjf with ?CI Group: 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve . . East Penn DD1131MFE $92.73 . .
Capacity Rating: 200

12 Batter_\f with BfCI Group: 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve . . East Penn DIAGSE $151.73 . .
Capacity Rating: 120

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 2025

Agent: Tammy Shew
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IITB No.: 2025-112

Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

Renew)

-

Q

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S
Agent: Tammy Shew

Ag-Pro Allan Vigil Ford Lincoln Atlanta Safety Brake Service Auto Zone Parts, Inc. Bolton Motorsports, LLC.
A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS
Batte; ith BCI : GT9-R, ing Ranking: 235, Resel
13 attu)f with .C Group: GT9-R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve . . . Duralast Gold Powersport $108.99 .
Capacity Rating: 37 *
14 Bm‘tery: with BiCI Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve - . - Duralast $100.97 - .
Capacity Rating: 55
15 Batterjf with lj?CI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . . Duralast $134.63 . .
Capacity Rating: 180
16 Battery with Gr_oup # 31T Part # N993ITYEL. CCA 900, CA 1125, . . . Duralast $153.46 . -
Reserve Capacity Rating: 155
17 Batterjf with ?CI Group: 58r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve . . . ProPower Plus $124.62 . .
Capacity Rating: 80
18 Bm‘tery: with BiCI Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . . ProPower Ultra $144.99 . .
Capacity Rating: 90
19 Baltl:‘}'jf AGM.wzth BCI Group: H3, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve . . . ProPower AGM $201.99 . .
Capacity Rating: 60
20 |Battery with BCI Group: BXT99, Cold Cranking Ranking: 470 x = * ProPower Plus $163.99 s =
21 Batter)f with Bicl Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve - . - ProPower Plus $159.64 + &
Capacity Rating: 140
2 Batter){ with Bicl Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve . . . ProPower Ultra $166.99 . .
Capacity Rating: 165
23 Batter,\{ with Bicl Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve . . . ProPower Plus $150.37 . .
Capacity Rating: 90 *
24 Battlery with Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity . . . ProPower Plus $130.80 . .
Rating: 100 *
25 Battlery with Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity . . . ProPower Ultra $176.99 . .
Rating: 95 *
2% Battlery with Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve Capacity . . . ProPower Ultra $160.99 . .
Rating: 110
27 Battlery with Group 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity . - . ProPower Plus $123.59 - -
Rating: 122
28 Battery AGM w:ilh BC.I Qroup.‘ 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, . . . ProPower AGM $219.99 . .
Reserve Capacity Rating: 140 N
29 Batterr\f AGM_wtth BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve . . - ProPower AGM $195.99 N .
Capacity Rating: 95
30 Batt.ery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity . . - ProPower AGM $280.27 . .
Rating: None at this time.
Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880
31 # * * Clarios-Optima $355.73 * =
Number of Bids Responsive: 32
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE (Waived)
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Price Schedule attached seperately
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Note: * Denotes No bid+N/A (Vendor chose not to bid on item)

Agent Signature: /Wq 5

L acndhy (o
Witness Signature;
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IITB No.: 2025-112 =
Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road ‘ ‘ ’
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

Renew) DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S

Agent: Tammy Shew

Buddy OP Il LLC. dba Buddy Chevrolet Courtesy Automative Group Cummins Inc. Emission & Cooling Systems Fleetpride Georgia Auto Refinishing
A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS

3 |Battery with BCI Group: GT9-R. Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve No Bid N/A . . No Bid N/A . OTR/Continental #UIR-HD $46.95 .
Capacity Rating: 37

14 Battery_’ with ECI Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve No Bid N/A . . No Bid N/A . OTR/Continental #51RCS $94.29 .
Capacity Rating: 55

15 |Battery with BCI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A N . No Bid N/A s OTR/Continental 30H-HD $167.50 .
Capacity Rating: 180 =

16 |Battery with Group i 31T: Part # N993ITYEL. CCA 900, CA 1125, No Bid N/A - - Cummins, C31SXHD $135.22 - OTR/Continental #OPTD31TYT $369.10 *
Reserve Capacity Rating: 155

17 Batter){ with B.’CI Group: 58r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve No Bid N/A . - No Bid N/A - OTR/Continental #58RCS $94.29 .
Capacity Rating: 80

18 Batter}_f with ECI Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A . . No Bid N/A . OTR/Continental #75CP $104.89 .
Capacity Rating: 90

19 Batter')f AGM.wzth BCI Group: H3, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve No Bid N/A . . No Bid N/A . No Bid NA .
Capacity Rating: 60

20 |Battery with BCI Group: BXT99, Cold Cranking Ranking: 470 No Bid N/A * * No Bid N/A = No Bid N/A *

21 Batter)f with IIECI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve No Bid N/A - - No Bid N/A ) OTR/Continental #0TRGFHS $137.50 .
Capacity Rating: 140 -

5y |Battery with BCI Group: BXTS3, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve No Bid N/A - * No Bid N/A - OTR/Continental #OTRG-F65 $114.90 -
Capacity Rating: 165

23 Batter)f with IIECI Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve No Bid N/A . - No Bid N/A . OTR/Continental #56CS $94.99 .
Capacity Rating: 90 -

24 Batzjer'y with Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity No Bid N/A . . No Bid N/A . OTR/Continental #GM 59CS $117.60 .
Rating: 100

% ﬁzzzg ”;;h Group: 96R. Cold Cranking Ranking: 390, Reserve Capacity No Bid N/A = * No Bid N/A % OTR/Continental #96RCS $117.56 =

2% Bat{ery with Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve Capacity No Bid N/A . ) No Bid N/A . No Bid N/A .
Rating: 110 *

27 2:5;2 “11;}; Group 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity No Bid NA & & C34-HC Cummins $120.54 . OTR/Continental #OTRG-F34 $98.69 -
Battery AGM with BCI G : 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850,

2g [Catery wieh 56 roup 06 Lraniing Raniing: No Bid NA N . No Bid N/A . OTR/Continental OTRPAGMHS $215.50 .
Reserve Capacity Rating: 140

29 [Battery AGM with BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 833, Reserve No Bid NA = * No Bid N/A * OTR/Continental L3/H6/48-AGM $186.39 x
Capacity Rating: 95

30 Banjery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity No Bid NA . - No Bid N/A . OTR/Continental $298.70 .
Rating: None at this time.
Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880 ) i

31 No Bid N/A = * No Bid N/A = No Bid N/A *
Number of Bids Responsive: 32
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE (Waived)

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Price Schedule attached seperately
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Note: * Denotes No bid+N/A (Vendor chose not to bid on item)

Agent Signature:

Witness Signature:
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IITB No.: 2025-112

Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

Renew)

T

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S

Agent: Tammy Shew

Georgia Kenworth (MHC) Interstate Batteries Interstate Truck Williams Fire Apparatus Jasper Engines & Transmissions Jim Ellis Chevrolet
A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS
Batte ith BCI : GT9-R, ing Ranking: 235, Resel

13 |Battery with BCI Group: GT9-R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries FATTX9 $59.95 ] . = = &
Capacity Rating: 37 *

14 Bm‘tery: with Bicl Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries SP22NF $89.95 s * % “
Capacity Rating: 55
Battery with BCI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . . .

N/A - A .

15 Capacity Rating: 180 No Bid / Interstate Batteries 29H-VHD $96.76 = * = = =

16 |Battery with Group #3IT: Part # N993ITYEL. CCA 900, CA 1125, Midwest Battery/Tri $79.99 Interstate Batteries 31-MHD $95.42 ) . * = *
Reserve Capacity Rating: 155 =
B ith BCI : - ing Ranking: Rese .

17 atterjf with .C Group: 38r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MT-58R $91.96 . * = - :
Capacity Rating: 80 =

18 Bm‘tery: with Bicl Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MT-75 $91.96 . N & & .
Capacity Rating: 90 * =
Battery AGM with BCI Group: H3, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve . .

1 N/A - 149, .

9 | Capacity Rating: 60 No Bid / MTX-H3 $149.95 = « = & =
20 |Battery with BCI Group: BXT99, Cold Cranking Ranking: 470 No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTP-96R $106.36 = * L - =
g1 [Battery with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTP-49/H8 |  $128.76 % . * . .

Capacity Rating: 140 -

2 Battery: with Bicf Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTP-65HD $102.08 = . = - +*
Capacity Rating: 165
Battery with BCI Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve A ) ) )

23 Capacity Rating: 90 No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MT-56 $91.96 - . = = 5

24 Battlery with Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MT-59 $91.96 - . - + :
Rating: 100 =
B i : 96R, ing Ranking: , Rese; i .

o5 |Battery with Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 390, Reserve Capacity No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTP-96R $106.36 = . . :
Rating: 95 = =
B i : ing Ranking: Reserve ity . .

26 RZng ”]’;Z Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 833, Reserve Capacity Midwest Battery/Tri $79.99 Interstate Batteries MTP-48/H6 $122.26 * . = = *

27 Battlery with Group 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MT-34 $85.06 i . X = =
Rating: 122
Battery AGM with BCI Gi : 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, . .

gg [Sattery Auiwith B4 Lroup v Lraniing faniang No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTX-49/HS $195.96 . . * % =
Reserve Capacity Rating: 140 =

29 Batterr\f AGM_wtth BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve No Bid N/A Interstate Batteries MTX-48/H6 $152.96 = * = . =
Capacity Rating: 95
Battery AGM with BCI Gi : 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Res C ity .

30 [amery ot Wil B rotps 34 :  deserve Hapacty Midwest Battery/Tri $159.99 Interstate Batteries 31-AGM7 $271.00 ; * . i .
Rating: None at this time. x x =
Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880 . .

31 No Bid N/A OPTIMA SC31DS $253.40 = * = = *
Number of Bids Responsive: 32
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE (Waived)

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Price Schedule attached seperately

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Note: * Denotes No bid+N/A (Vendor chose not to bid on item)

Agent Signature:

Witness Signature;


Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp

Lauren Cush
Stamp


IITB No.: 2025-112

Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

Renew)

-

Q

DeKalb County

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S

Knox Fleet Services, LLC. Lashley Kubota Napa Auto Parts Peterbilt of Atlanta Refuse & Mixer Support, LLC. Reliable Transmission Service, Inc.
A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS
13 Batterjf with lj?CI Group: GT9-R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve - . East Penn Legend Premium 8224 $41.77 ) ) =
Capacity Rating: 37 = = =
14 Bm‘tery: with Bicl Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve = = Fast Penn Legend Premium 6526R $82.48 + - -
Capacity Rating: 55
Batte; ith BCI : 30H, ing Ranking: Reserve . 3 . .
15 attu)f with .C Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve . = East Penn Legend Premium 7218 $128.39 e = - =
Capacity Rating: 180 =
16 Battery with Group # 31T: Part # N9931TYEL. CCA 900, CA 1125, ) . East Penn Legend Premium $311.78 & . .
Reserve Capacity Rating: 155 = = N9931TYEL ’ = = =
Battery with BCI Group: 58r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve . . .
1 . . .
7 Capacity Rating: 80 = e East Penn Legend Premium 7558R $114.75 = = = =
Battery with BCI G : 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Re:
1g | Cattery with 2 roup » Cold Lranking Ranfing » freserve & = East Penn Legend Premium 7575 $114.76 = = = =
Capacity Rating: 90
19 Batter)f AGM.Wlth BCI Group: H3, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve . = East Penn Legend Premium 98153R $175.29 = & = -
Capacity Rating: 60 =
20 |Battery with BCI Group: BXT99, Cold Cranking Ranking: 470 * * East Penn Legend Premium 7599R $136.56 = = = =
Battery with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve . . . .
21 Capacity Rating: 140 x e East Penn Legend Premium 7549 $116.88 = = & *
Battery with BCI Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve ) . . . .
22 Capacity Rating: 165 = ' East Penn Legend Premium 7565 $120.94 = = - =
23 Batter,\{ with Bicl Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve & = East Penn Legend Premium 7556 $114.76 + = = =
Capacity Rating: 90
Battery with Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity .
24 . . . . .
Rating: 100 & & East Penn Legend Premium 7559 $114.76 * * = =
B i : 96R, ing Ranking: 590, Rese i . . .
25 attlery with Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity = - East Penn Legend Premium 7596R $116.88 * = . *
Rating: 95 =
B i : ing Ranking: Reserve ity . .
2% attlery with Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve Capacity = . East Penn Legend Premium 7548 $116.88 * = *
Rating: 110 =
27 Battlery with Group 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity “ - East Penn Legend Premium 7534 $114.75 % & =
Rating: 122
28 Battery AGM with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, . East P L d Premium 9849 . . & .
Reserve Capacity Rating: 140 = = ast Fenn Legend Fremium $183.99 E = E
29 Batterr\f AGM_wtth BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve 5 = East Penn Legend Premium 9848 $183.99 & = N
Capacity Rating: 95
30 Batt.ery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity = : East Penn Legend Premium 9837 $297.35 * = +*
Rating: None at this time. =
Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880 . . East Penn Legend Premium . ;
31 = = $315.47 = = = =
N99DH7YEL
Number of Bids Responsive: 32
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE (Waived)
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Price Schedule attached seperately
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Note: * Denotes No bid+N/A (Vendor chose not to bid on item)

Agent Signature:

Witness Signature;: / 73 W

10

Agent: Tammy Shew
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IITB No.: 2025-112
Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

|

Q

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S
Agent: Tammy Shew

Renew!
) DeKalb County
Rush Truck Center Sims Radiator Service, Inc. Ten-8 Fire & Safety, LLC. Tidewater Fleet Supply dba TNT Auto Parts Truck Pro LLC. Weaver Distributors
A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS
Battery with BCI Group: GT9-R, ing Ranking: 235, Reserve . . .

3 |Battery with BCI Group: GT9-R. Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve No Bid N/A . . * East Pen-Deka $63.92 No Bid N/A ACDelco part#U1RG250 $46.86
Capacity Rating: 37 = =

14 Zézzzgtrg f’g G;j"“p : 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 430, Reserve No Bid N/A e * = East Pen-Deka $73.16 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB522FMF) $73.59 ACDelco part#26RS $75.94
Battery with BCI Group: 30H, -anking Ranking: 700, Reserve .

15 C‘;Z;’cyl;”l};ha tincg Cj’;(;"’ 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve No Bid N/A = * = East Pen-Deka $103.48 No Bid N/A ACDelco part#31G750T $120.19

16 i:ﬁ’;’v}evg}') z:_?)”_"]’ejt; 1g T Z"j” #N9GIITYEL. CCA 900, CA 1125, No Bid N/A = = * No Bid N/A East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB1000-31CP) $127.39 ACDelco part#31G950T $132.65
Battery with BCI ing Ranking: 580, Reserve .

17 C‘;Z;Z;’Zha tirfg‘ C;’(;’ up: 38r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve No Bid N/A + = & East Pen-Deka $77.69 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB580-58R) $70.96 ACDelco part#58RG $89.50
Battery with BCI Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 775MF:188, See $110.09 (Core: . ;

18 Capacity Rating: 90 Clarifications & Notes in bid $23.94) = = = East Pen-Deka $77.69 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB690-75) $77.96 ACDelco part#75VPG $117.99

19 ‘gZZZ’L’l ;gﬁg{h f()c’ Group: H3, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve No Bid N/A * = * East Pen-Deka $152.85 No Bid N/A Motorcraft part4BAGMH3 $106.85

20 |Battery with BCI Group: BXT99, Cold Cranking Ranking: 470 No Bid N/A - = L East Pen-Deka $90.39 No Bid N/A ACDelco part#99RG $89.50

. . . Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 649MF:188 (CCA
Battery with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Res 166.47 (Core: .

g | Catery with BLEGroup : Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve | g4y p185), See Clarifications & Notes in | (Core = = = East Pen-Deka $117.39 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB900-49) $160.97 ACDelco part#49PS $134.69
Capacity Rating: 140 bid $23.94)

2 IEZZZZ yﬁ;‘z’; f’g 61’6”5“” : BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 830, Reserve No Bid N/A = = * East Pen-Deka $99.89 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB850-65) $103.50 ACDelco part#65GHR $118.85

23 ZZZZ yﬁ;‘z’; fn(; G;{;’“” 36, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve No Bid N/A * - = No Bid N/A No Bid N/A ACDelco part#56S $101.72

p . o L e e Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 659MF:188 (CCA X
24 2:5;2 w;g{') Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 390, Reserve Capacity 590-RC100), See Clarifications & Notes in $122.23349(4C)0re. - & = East Pen-Deka $90.79 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB590-59) $93.80 ACDelco part#59PS $100.36
' bid :
. . . . Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 696RMF:188 (CCA
Battery wi - 96R R + 590, Reserve ) . : .
25 RZZ;Z ”91;}' Group: 96K, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity " ccy o cg0) See Clarifications & Notesin | | 12;;;;‘“ % - + East Pen-Deka $89.19 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB600-96R) $98.31 ACDelco part#96RSA $85.43
' bid :
. . . . Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 748MF:188 (CCA
Battery wi - 48, s Ranking: 835, Rese : . : .
26 RZZZ? ”;7(') Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 833, Reserve Capacity | 135 p130). See Clarifications & Notes in $14§2135;g°re . * * East Pen-Deka $105.49 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB730-48) $147.73 ACDelco part#48GHRA $130.73
: bid :
" . N e e Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 634MF:188 (CCA .
27 2:5;2 “11;}; Group 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity 690-RC110), See Clarifications & Notes in $10;é3389(g°re' = = = East Pen-Deka $91.59 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB800-34) $91.96 ACDelco part#34G $116.62
' bid :
. . . Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 649MF:188 (CCA
Battery AGM with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, ) : .
28 [ wieh 56 Group 06 Lraniing Raniing: 900-RC185), See Clarifications & Notes in | 0047 (Core = x = East Pen-Deka $177.99 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB9A49) $207.11 ACDelco part#49SAGM $184.80
eserve Capacity Rating: 140 bid $23.94)
Battery AGM with BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Re: .

29 CZpZ’Cy”y le_;: P roup: 40, Lold Lraniing famiing: 635, feserve No Bid N/A = = = East Pen-Deka $152.89 East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DBIA4S) $177.38 ACDelco part#48AGM $192.79
Battery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity |Fleetrite-East Penn-Fep 9F31:188 (CCA 925 $297.36 (Core: .

30 . - 238.69 249.89 225.33
Rating: None at this time. RC190), See Clarifications & Notes in bid $35.91) * ] - East Pen-Deka $! East Penn/Deka/TruckPro Branded (DB9F31) S ACDelco part#31AGMT $
Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880

31 No Bid N/A = = = East Pen-Deka $156.69 No Bid N/A No Bid N/A
Number of Bids Responsive: 32
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE (Waived)

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Price Schedule attached seperately

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Note: * Denotes No bid+N/A (Vendor chose not to bid on item)

Agent Signature; /MM bm

L awndly (reak
Witness Signature:

1"
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IITB No.: 2025-112

Parts & Service for Vehicles and Off-Road
Equipment (Annual with 2 Options to

Renew)

|

Q

DeKalb County

West Chatham Warning Devices

W.W. Williams Co. LLC.

Yancey Brothers Caterpillar

A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS

13 Batterjf with lj?CI Group: GT9-R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve = ) No Bid N/A i
Capacity Rating: 37 =

14 Bm‘tery: with Bicl Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve = . No Bid N/A =
Capacity Rating: 55 =
Battery with BCI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve .

15 Capacity Rating: 180 = = No Bid N/A =
Battery with Group # 31T: Part # N9931TYEL. CCA 900, CA 1125, . )

16 Reserve Capacity Rating: 155 = = No Bid N/A =
Battery with BCI Group: 58r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve . .

1

7 Capacity Rating: 80 = = No Bid N/A =

18 Battery: with Bicl Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve = = No Bid N/A -
Capacity Rating: 90

19 Baltl:‘}'jf AGM.wzth BCI Group: H3, Cold Cranking Ranking: 380, Reserve +* . No Bid N/A +*
Capacity Rating: 60

20 |Battery with BCI Group: BXT99, Cold Cranking Ranking: 470 = * No Bid N/A =

a1 Batter,\{ with BfCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve i i No Bid N/A &
Capacity Rating: 140

2 Bm‘tery: with Bicf Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve - = No Bid N/A =
Capacity Rating: 165

23 Batter,\{ with BfCI Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve + " No Bid N/A =
Capacity Rating: 90
Battery with Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity .

24 Rating: 100 e * No Bid N/A &
B i : 96R, ing Ranking: 590, R i -

25 RZZT,? Vl;l;h Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity '.!r & No Bid N/A =

2% 23;:,613 W}I;Z Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve Capacity - = No Bid N/A «

27 Battlery with Group 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity X = No Bid N/A i
Rating: 122 =

28 Battery AGM w.ith BC.I Qroup,‘ 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, = = No Bid N/A e
Reserve Capacity Rating: 140

29 Batter_\f AGM_wtth BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 835, Reserve - = No Bid N/A N
Capacity Rating: 95

30 ﬁz;fi;y ;4\/273;{ Z;tttl;liljiigmup: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity - = East Penn DDOF31E $209.05 *
Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880 ;

31 = = No Bid N/A =
Number of Bids Responsive: 32

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE (Waived)

Price Schedule attached seperately

Note:* Denotes No bid+N/A (Vendor chose not to bid on item)

Agent Signature:

Witness Signature;: // W

12

Bid Opening Date: September 29, 2025
Cost Opening Date: October 6, 202S
Agent: Tammy Shew
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