

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING  
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire
1	Road Service for Fire Rescue (normal business hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$65.00	No Bid	\$94.50	N/A
2	Road Service for Fire Rescue (after business hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$90.00	No Bid	\$115.00	N/A
3	Additional charge per tire for more than 1 tire replacement (same location)	N/C	No Bid	\$35.00	N/A
4	Road Service for Heavy Truck, Trailer, Light Truck & Passenger Vehicles (normal bus. Hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$70.00	No Bid	\$88.50	N/A
5	Road Service for Heavy Truck, Trailer, Light Truck & Passenger Vehicles (after bus. Hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$70.00	No Bid	\$110.00	N/A
6	State if Additional charge for more than 1 tire replaced at same location	\$20.00	No Bid	\$30.00	N/A
7	Flat Repair Charge (includes demounting & mounting)	\$25.00	No Bid	\$30.00	N/A
8	Valve Stem, Replacement Cost	\$2.25	No Bid	\$3.50	N/A
9	Road Service for Off Hwy/ Construction Equipment (Normal bus. Hours) Trip Charge	\$65.00	No Bid	\$85.00	\$100.00 per hour
10	Road Service for Off Hwy/ Construction Equipment (after bus. Hours)	\$90.00	No Bid	\$100.00	\$100.00 per hour
11	Flat Repair Charge (includes demounting & mounting)	Deleted per Addendum No. 1	Deleted per Addendum No. 1	Deleted per Addendum No. 1	Deleted per Addendum No. 1
12	Tube Replacement	\$5.00	No Bid	\$90.00	Depend on size of tube
13	Tube Patch Repair	\$8.00	No Bid	\$29.00	\$45.00

Witness Signature: \_\_\_\_\_

Agent Signature: \_\_\_\_\_

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING  
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire
32b.	Tread Depth	22	No Bid	16/32	15/32
32c.	Unit Price	\$244.07	No Bid	\$283.75	\$294.83
32d.	Total Amount	\$2,440.70	No Bid	\$2,837.50	\$2,948.30
33a.	7.5 x 16, 6-ply (Quantity-16)-Brand	Galaxy Earthpro	No Bid	Galaxy F2	BKT
33b.	Tread Depth	26	No Bid	28/32'	16/32'
33c.	Unit Price	\$188.09	No Bid	\$201.82	\$202.73
33d.	Total Amount	\$3,009.44	No Bid	\$3,229.12	\$3,243.68
34a.	11L x 16, 8-ply (Quantity 12)-Brand	Gladiator F-3	No Bid	Harvest King	Maxam 12 ply
34b.	Tread Depth	11	No Bid	18/32'	17/32'
34c.	Unit Price	\$273.10	No Bid	\$268.62	\$316.38
34d.	Total Amount	\$3,277.20	No Bid	\$3,223.44	\$3,796.56
35a.	14x17.5, 14-ply (Quantity-6)-Brand	Maxam MS907	No Bid	Power King	Maxam MS 916
35b.	Tread Depth	46	No Bid	26/32'	25/32'
35c.	Unit Price	\$763.68	No Bid	\$526.08	\$548.03
35d.	Total Amount	\$4,582.08	No Bid	\$3,156.48	\$3,288.18
36a.	28Lx26, 20-ply (Quantity-10)-Brand	Primex Logmonster	No Bid	Primex Monster	Maxam MS 931
36b.	Tread Depth	69	No Bid	69/32'	64/32'
36c.	Unit Price	\$3,716.32	No Bid	\$3,791.26	\$3,756.57
36d.	Total Amount	\$37,167.20	No Bid	\$37,912.60	\$37,565.70
37a.	16.9 x 30, 6-ply (Quantity- 16)-Brand	Galaxy Earthpro	No Bid	Galaxy Earthpro	Galaxy 6-ply
37b.	Tread Depth	48	No Bid	48/32'	34/32'
37c.	Unit Price	\$1,242.91	No Bid	\$1,447.46	\$1,380.63
37d.	Total Amount	\$19,886.56	No Bid	\$23,159.36	\$22,090.08
38a.	17.5 x 25L5, 20-ply (Quantity-4)-Brand	#V031164	No Bid	Maxam MS501	MS 501 2 Star & Maxam Radial
38b.	Tread Depth	65	No Bid	83/32'	83/32'
38c.	Unit Price	\$2,248.19	No Bid	\$2,358.14	\$2,298.30
38d.	Total Amount	\$8,992.76	No Bid	\$9,432.56	\$9,193.20
39a.	1400 x 24, 16-ply (Quantity 6)-Brand	Galaxy MPC	No Bid	Galaxy L2	MS905 Maxam

Witness Signature: \_\_\_\_\_

Agent Signature: \_\_\_\_\_

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING  
 BID TABULATION

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire
39b.	Tread Depth	31	No Bid	30/32'	32/32'
39c.	Unit Price	\$1,020.49	No Bid	\$998.45	\$1,090.52
39d.	Total Amount	\$6,122.94	No Bid	\$5,990.70	\$6,543.12
40a.	23.5r x 25 E-3/L-3, 20-ply (Quantity-8)-Brand	Maxam MS300/#Max031204	No Bid	Galaxy LHD500	MS301E3-2 Star/Maxam Radial
40b.	Tread Depth	48	No Bid	100/32'	41/32'
40c.	Unit Price	\$3,042.76	No Bid	\$4,258.89	\$3,214.66
40d.	Total Amount	\$24,342.08	No Bid	\$24,071.12	\$25,717.28
41	Charge for removal & installation of Foam Filled Tires on Vehicles, rim size 20 inches & Smaller	\$45.00	No Bid	\$35.00	\$50.00
42	Charge for removal & installation of Foam Filled Tires on Vehicles, rim size greater than 20 inches	\$55.00	No Bid	\$45.00	\$75.00
43	Charge for removal & installation of Foam Filled Tires on Vehicles, Tire sizes 23.5-25, 26.5-25, 28L x 26 & 1400 x 24	\$75.00	No Bid	\$75.00	\$75.00
44	Charge for removing Foam Filled Tires from rims 20 inches & smaller	\$10.00	No Bid	\$10.00	\$25.00
45	Charge for removing Foam Filled Tires from rims 20 inches & greater	\$20.00	No Bid	\$20.00	\$45.00
46	Charge for removing Foam Filled Tire sizes 23.5-25, 28L x 26 & 1400 x 24 from rim	\$20.00	No Bid	\$60.00	\$45.00
47	Charge for Tire Service & Road Service Calls Round Trip	\$75.00	No Bid	\$70.00	\$75.00
48	Tire Service: State if additional for more than one tire at same location	No Charge	No Bid	N/C	N/C
49	Charge for Repair work not specifically covered elsewhere in the bid	\$75.00 per hour	No Bid	\$70.00 per hour	\$100.00 per hour
50	Articulated Loaders (John Deere 6441.K) (Quantity 16)			No Bid	24" Tire Width
50a.	Unit Price	\$5,522.34	\$8,125.00	No Bid	\$8,250.00

Witness Signature: \_\_\_\_\_

Agent Signature: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire
50b.	Total Amount	\$88,357.44	\$130,000	No Bid	\$132,000.00
51	Skid Steer Loaders (Size 12X16.5) (Quantity 16)			No Bid	
51a	Unit Price	\$580.82	\$450.00	No Bid	\$665.48
51b	Total Amount	\$9,293.12	\$7,200.00	No Bid	\$10,647.68
52	Trip Charge for site inspection	No Charge	No Bid	\$70.00	\$100.00 per hour
53	Service Charge for rotation of Solid Rubber Tires on Loader	\$70.00 per hour	No Bid	\$75.00	\$100.00 per hour
54	Hourly charge for minor repair work associated with tire removal & installation	\$70.00 per hour	No Bid	\$75.00	\$100.00 per hour
55	Hourly charge for Repair work not specifically covered elsewhere in this invitation	\$70.00 per hour	No Bid	\$75.00 per hour	\$100.00 per hour
LSBE Participation/GFE (Yes/No)		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Vendor Attended Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No)		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Vendor Submitted Cost in Separate Sealed Envelope (Yes/No)		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Vendor Included Cost in Other Areas Outside of Separate Sealed Envelope (Yes/No)		No	No	No	No
<b>Recommend Award to the Lowest, Responsive and Responsible Bidders. The Goodyear Tire &amp; Rubber Co. C/O Goodyear Commercial Tire &amp; Service Centers were deemed Non-Responsive because they did not submit their price schedule in a separate sealed envelope.</b>					

Recommended Vendors:

Southern Tire Mart, LLC  
 529 Industrial Park Rd.  
 Columbia, MS 39429

Atlanta Commercial Tire  
 6590-A Button Gwinnett Dr.  
 Doraville, GA 30340

Setco, Inc.  
 PO Box 809  
 Idabel, OK 74745

Action Tire  
 410 Lees Mill Rd.  
 Forest Park, GA 30297

Witness Signature:   
 Agent Signature: 