ITB No: 22-101537

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

ITB NAME: Uniforms for Fire Rescue Services

Bid Due Date: September 21, 2022
Price Schedule Opening: October 7, 2022
Agent: Toneya B. Dawson

C Safeguard Printing & Promotional NAFECO
ompany Products, Inc
ITEM DESCRIPTION Total Price Total Price
—— e ——
Line Items 1-31 Flying Cross Brand Products No Bid Q $2,663,425.0D
Line Items 32-46 Gildan Brand Products Q24,239.00 $25,993.00
Line Items 47-63 Champion/ Russell/ Fruit Of The Loom $65,741.00 $43,277.40
Line Items 64-75 Cornerstone $36,234.90 $26,168.70
Line Items 76-96 Proper / Tru-Spec/Vertex $175,114.00 g $128,974.00
Line Items 97-121 Flying Cross Brand Products No Bid ($265,56®
Line Items 122-134 Samuel / Sam / Garrison No Bid C $84,490.0D
Line Items 135-181 Gerber / Haix / Thorogood No Bid $4,040,855.
. No Bid $2,650.00
182 Department Sleeve Patch, no substitutes
No Bid $1,495.00
183 Dress Coat Emblem/Patch, no substitutes
Left Chest Badge patch, Firefighter, all embroidered no No Bid $1,320.00
184 substitutes
Left Chest Badge patch, Fire Chief, all embroidered no
185 substitutes No Bid $19.80
Left Chest Badge patch, Deputy Chief, all embroidered
tituts .
186 no substitutes No Bid $33.00
187 Left Chest Badge patch, Assistant Chief, all
broidered bstitut .
embroidered no substitutes No Bid $33.00
188 Left Chest Badge patch, Battalion Chief, all
broidered bstitut .
embroidered no substitutes No Bid $66.00
189 Left Chest Badge patch, Fire Captain, all embroidered No Bid $660.00
no substitutes
Left Chest Badge patch, Rescue Captain, all
190 embroidered no substitutes No Bid $66.00




DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

ITB No: 22-101537 BID TABULATION Bid Due Date: September 21, 2022
ITB NAME: Uniforms for Fire Rescue Services Price Schedule Opening: October 7, 2022
Agent: Toneya B. Dawson
Safeguard Printing & Promotional NAFECO
Company Products, Inc
ITEM DESCRIPTION Total Price Total Price

Left Chest Badge patch, Driver Operator, all
embroidered no substitutes

191 No Bid $660.00

192 Name Strip Patch. Nomex background, navy or light

blue with Gold embroidery, no substitutes .
No Bid $4,750.00

Name Strip Patch. Nylon background, navy with Gold

193 embroidery, no substitutes No Bid $2,375.00

Name Strip Patch — 2 lines. Nylon background,
194 navy with Gold embroidery, 2 lines, no substitutes No Bid $2,375.00

195 Fire Driver Steamer Collar Insignia Patch, No Bid $325.00
Color: Navy, no substitutes

Collar Insignia Patch, Private (Firefighter) in gold
embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no

196 substitutes No Bid $650.00

197 Collar Insignia Patch, Corporal (Senior Firefighter) in

old embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no .
fubstitutes. ’ ¢ vore No Bid $650.00

198 Collar Insignia Patch, Sargent (Master Firefighter) in

gold embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no .
substitutes No Bid $650.00

Collar Insignia Patch, 2 Parallel Bars in gold
199 embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no No Bid
substitute

Collar Insignia Patch, 2 Parallel Bugles in gold
200 embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no No Bid $130.00
substitutes

201 Collar Insignia Patch, 2 Crossed Bugles in gold

embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no .
substitutes. No Bid $65.00

Collar Insignia Patch, 3 Crossed Bugles in gold
embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no

202 .
0 substitutes

No Bid

IR




ITB No: 22-101537

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

ITB NAME: Uniforms for Fire Rescue Services

BID TABULATION

Bid Due Date: September 21, 2022
Price Schedule Opening: October 7, 2022
Agent: Toneya B. Dawson

C Safeguard Printing & Promotional NAFECO
ompany Products, Inc
ITEM DESCRIPTION Total Price Total Price
Collar Insignia Patch, 4 Crossed Bugles in gold No Bid $16.25
embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no
203 substitutes
204 Collar Insignia Patch, 5 Crossed Bugles in gold
embroidery. Background: navy or light blue, no .
substitutes No Bid
205 Maltese Cross for Dress Coat Emblem, One No Bid $16.25
Cross, no substitutes
206 Maltese Cross for Dress Coat Emblem, Two No Bid $22.50
Crosses, no substitute
207 Maltese Cross for Dress Coat Emblem, Three No Bid $32.50
Crosses, no substitutes
208 Maltese Cross for Dress Coat Emblem, Four No Bid $43.75
Crosses, no substitutes.
209 Maltese Cross for Dress Coat Emblem, Five No Bid $56.25
Crosses, no substitutes
Left Chest Badge patch, PARAMEDIC, EMS
210 Division, Caduceus Center Emblem all embroidered no No Bid $480.00
substitutes
211 Paramedic Caduceus Collar Insignia Patch, No Bid $130.0
Color: Navy, no substitutes.
212 Company 1 Station Patch No Bid < $230.00 >
213 Company 2 Station Patch No Bid $319.00
214 Company 3 Station Patch No Bid $277.00
215 Company 4 Station Patch No Bid C § 277.00)
216 Company 5 Station Patch No Bid 319.00
217 Company 6 Station Patch No Bid $277.00
218 Company 7 Station Patch No Bid C $277.00>
219 Company 8 Station Patch No Bid C $31 9.00)
220 Company 9 Station Patch No Bid C $329.0D
221 Company 10 Station Patch No Bid $319.00
222 Company 11 Station Patch No Bid $277.00
223 Company 12 Station Patch No Bid C $319.00 )
224 Company 13 Station Patch No Bid C $277.00 )
225 Company 14 Station Patch No Bid < 827700 T >
226 Company 15 Station Patch No Bid C §277.00 )
227 Company 16 Station Patch No Bid < $31 9.00)
228 Company 17 Station Patch No Bid ( $319.00 )




ITB No: 22-101537
ITB NAME: Uniforms for Fire Rescue Services

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

Bid Due Date: September 21, 2022
Price Schedule Opening: October 7, 2022
Agent: Toneya B. Dawson

Safeguard Printing & Promotional NAFECO
Company Products, Inc
ITEM DESCRIPTION Total Price Total Price
229 Company 18 Station Patch No Bid ( $277.00 >
230 Company 19 Station Patch No Bid << $357.00 %
231 Company 20 Station Patch No Bid $273.00
232 Company 21 Station Patch No Bid ( $357.00 )
233 Company 22 Station Patch No Bid ( $357.00 )
234 Company 23 Station Patch No Bid $277.00
235 Company 24 Station Patch No Bid
236 Company 25 Station Patch No Bid $277.00
237 Company 26 Station Patch No Bid E $319.00 %
238 Company 27 Station Patch No Bid $357.00
239 Company 28 Station Patch No Bid < $357.00 >
240 Battalion | Patch No Bid < $121.50
241 Battalion 2 Patch No Bid < 8121500 >
242 Battalion 3 Patch No Bid < SI12150 >
243 Battalion 4 Patch No Bid < SIS0 >
244 Battalion 5 Patch No Bid < $12150 >
245 Battalion 6 Patch No Bid < SI2050 >
246 Car 7 Patch No Bid < 817100 >
247 Training Division Patch No Bid $319.00
248 Support / Fiscal Services Patch No Bid i $179.50 ;




ITB No: 22-101537

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

ITB NAME: Uniforms for Fire Rescue Services

Bid Due Date: September 21, 2022
Price Schedule Opening: October 7, 2022
Agent: Toneya B. Dawson

Safeguard Printing & Promotional

NAFECO

Products, Inc

Company Products, Inc
ITEM DESCRIPTION Total Price Total Price
Items listed in the annual catalog for the following brands will be available for purchase on this contract at % below retail cost.
RedKap % Below Reatil No Bid 20%
Sandmar % Below Reatil No Bid 20%
Flying Cross % Below Reatil No Bid 20%
5.11 % Below Reatil No Bid 20%
KC Caps % Below Reatil No Bid 20%
Alphabroder % Below Reatil No Bid 20%
Propper % Below Reatil No Bid 20%
TOTAL: $301,328.90 $7,308,259.65
Number of Bids Received: 6
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE Yes Yes
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No) Yes Yes
Company: Safeguard Printing & Promotional NAFECO

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Total Price

Total Price

Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)

Yes

Yes

NOTES - DETAIL JUSTIFICATION

Notes: The following Bidde

rs were deem non-responsive:

Recommend award to the lowest, responsive, and responsible biddders:
Safeguard Printing & Promotional Products, Inc., 715 Park North Blvd., Ste. 120, Clarkston, GA 30021, was awarded lines 32-46.
NAFECO, 715 Park North Blvd., Clarkston, GA 30021, was awarded lines 1-31, 47-52, 55-149, 151-159, 165-176, 179-248.

No bids were received for lines 53-54, 150, 160-164, 177-178 these items will be purchased via open market.

Galls, LLC, failure to complete Attachment C, LSBE Subcontractor Reference and Release Form, failure to complete the Subcontractor Affidavit,
Attachment F, and failure to obtain LSBE Sub-contractor’s signature on Attachment G, Exhibit B.
Central Alabama Training Solutions, failure to meet the County’s LSBE Participation benchmark or demonstrate a “good faith effort".

Bennett Fire Products Company, Inc., failure to meet the County’s LSBE Participation benchmark or demonstrate a “good faith effort”.
Municipal Emergency Services, Inc., failure to exclude price in the submitted bid, as per the solicitation requirements.

Witness Signature: Zeuigue Me(rear
Agent Signature:

72»;%4/ B. Dacwasn






