
ITB No. 22-101511 DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING Bid Opening: May 26, 2022 @ 3:00 PM via ZOOM
ITB Name: Ammunition BID TABULATION Price Schedule Opening: Monday June 13th, 2022 11:00 AM via ZOOM

Agent: Toneya Dawson

ITEM DESCRIPTION
Estimated #                    

of Units
Unit of 

Measure
No 
Bid Unit Price  Total Price

No 
Bid Unit Price  Total Price

No 
Bid Unit Price Total Price

No 
Bid Unit Price  Total Price

1

Speer Gold Dot, Part# 53966, Grain: 
230. Caliber: 45, Case of 500. No 
substitutes. 45 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                23 cases 495.00$     11,385.00$       No Bid -$                  

2

Winchester Ranger T Series, Part# 
RA40T, Grain: 180. Caliber: 40 
Smith & Wesson or acceptable 
equal. Case of 500. No substitutes. 50 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   198.00$      9,900.00$       No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

3

Atlanta Arms, Full Metal Jacket and 
training reload, Part# AAAL40180, 
Grain: 180. Caliber: .40. Case of 
1000. No substitutes. 213 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   291.00$      61,983.00$     No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

4
Atlanta Arms, Caliber: 38, Grain: 
148. Case of 1000. No substitutes. 10 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   376.00$      3,760.00$       No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

5
Atlanta Arms, Grain: .115, Caliber: 
9mm. Case of 1000. No substitutes. 10 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   245.00$      2,450.00$       No Bid -$                 350.00$         3,500.00$          

6

Atlanta Arms, Grain: 230. Caliber: 
45. ACP. Case of 1000. No 
substitutes. 150 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   327.00$      49,050.00$     No Bid -$                 380.00$         57,000.00$        

7

Winchester Ranger T Series, Part 
#RA45T, Grain: 230. Caliber: 45 
Auto. Case 500 No Substitutes 10 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   222.50$      2,225.00$       No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

8

Winchester Ranger T Series 147 
grain 9mm Part number RA9T. Case 
of 500. No substitutes. 150 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   177.50$      26,625.00$     No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

9

Atlanta Arms, Full Metal Jacket and 
training reload, Part# AAAL40165, 
Grain: 165. Caliber: .40, Case of 
1000. No substitutes. 15 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   277.00$      4,155.00$       No Bid -$                 370.00$         5,550.00$          

10

Atlanta Arms, Total Copper Jacket, 
Part# I380, Grain: 95 TJC. Caliber: 
380. Case of 1000. No substitutes. 2 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   248.00$      496.00$          No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

11

Atlanta Arms, Part# AAAL40F. 
Caliber: .40 lead free frangible 
training rounds or acceptable equal. 
Case of 1000. No substitutes. 10 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   599.00$      5,990.00$       No Bid -$                 570.00$         5,700.00$          

12

Atlanta Arms, 147 grain TCJ 9mm 
practice rounds. Case of 1000. No 
substitutes. 500 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   285.00$      142,500.00$   No Bid -$                 350.00$         175,000.00$      
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13

Atlanta Arms, Grain: 145. Caliber: 
.45 or acceptable equal. Case of 
500. No substitutes 10 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   372.50$      3,725.00$       No Bid -$  No Bid -$  

14

Hornady .223 caliber 62 grain 
Barrier TAP part # HOR83285 case 
of 200 No substitutes 7 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  200 rd 158.00$     1,108.00$         No Bid -$  

15

Hornady .40 caliber 175 grain 
Critical Duty part # HOR91375 case 
of 500 No substitutes 7 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  500 rd 263.00$     1,841.00$         No Bid -$  

16

Remington 12 gauge reduced recoil 
00 buckshot, Part# RR12BK800, 
Case of 250. No substitutes. 250 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   155.00$      38,750.00$     250 rd 195.00$     48,750.00$       -$  

17

Federal 12 gauge standard recoil, 00 
buckshot, 9 pellets or acceptable 
equal. Case of 250. Manufacturer 
Name & Item No. 50 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   155.00$      7,750.00$       195.00$     9,750.00$         -$  

18

Federal American Eagle Full Metal 
Jacket, Part# FEDXM193F or Part# 
AE223 or AE223BK, Grain: 55. 
Caliber: 5.56 mm or .223 mm, 
practice rounds. Case of 500. No 
Substitutes. 424 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   427.00$      181,048.00$   259.00$     109,816.00$     -$  

19

Federal American Eagle FMJ Part# 
AE223 Grain: 55 Caliber: 5.56 or 
.223 Case: 500 No Substitutes 75 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   427.00$      32,025.00$     259.00$     19,425.00$       -$  

20

Federal Tactical Rifle Urban 
Ballistic Tips, Part# T223F, Grain: 
55. Caliber: 5.56 mm, duty rounds.
Case of 500. No substitutes. 100 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  359.00$     35,900.00$       -$  

21

Hornady TAP, Part# HOR83276, 
Grain: 55. Caliber: 5.56 mm, duty l. 
Case of 200. No substitutes. 16 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  158.00$     2,528.00$         -$  

22

Hornady TAP Barrier, Caliber: .223, 
Grain weight: 62, Part# 83285. No 
substitutes. 10 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  158.00$     1,580.00$         -$  

23

Federal Gold Metal Boat Tail 
Hollow Point, Part# GM 308M, 
match grade, Grain: 168. Caliber: 
.308. Case of 500. No substitutes. 25 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  489.00$     12,225.00$       -$  

24

Ruag Swiss P Styx Action HPBT. 
Grain : 69, Caliber: .223 Case: 1000 
No Substitutes 5 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  865.00$     4,325.00$         -$  
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25

Ruag Swiss P Target HPBT. Grain: 
168, Caliber .308, Case: 200. No 
Substitutes 2 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                535.00$     1,070.00$         -$                  

26

Ruag Swiss P Styx Action HPBT. 
Grain: 167, Caliber: .308, Case: 200 
No Substitutes 2 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                445.00$     890.00$            -$                  

27

CTG Swiss P Tactical. Grain: 164, 
Caliber: .308, Case: 200. No 
Substitutes 2 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                835.00$     1,670.00$         -$                  

28

Swiss P Tactical FNBT. Grain: 250, 
Caliber: .338, Case: 200 No 
Substitutes 2 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                755.00$     1,510.00$         -$                  

29

Swiss P Armor Piercing. Grain: 260, 
Caliber: .338, Case: 200 No 
Substitutes 2 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                1,195.00$  2,390.00$         -$                  

30

Swiss P Target HPBT. Grain: 250, 
Caliber: .338, Case: 200 No 
Substitutes 5 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                755.00$     3,775.00$         -$                  

31

Federal Gold Metal Boat Tail 
Hollow Point, Part# GM 3006M, 
match grade, Grain: 168. Caliber: 
.3006 or acceptable equal. Case of 
200. Manufacturer Name & Item 
No. 10 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   240.00$      2,400.00$       269.00$     2,690.00$         -$                  

32

Federal Tactical Load, Part# 
LE223T1, Grain: 55 or acceptable 
equal. Case of 500. Manufacturer 
Name & Item No. 6 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   995.00$      5,970.00$       249.00$     1,494.00$         -$                  

33

Atlanta Arms, lead free frangible 
training rounds, Part# AAA223F, 
Grain: .45. Caliber: .223 or 
acceptable equal. Case of 1000. 
Manufacturer Name & Item No. 5 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   790.00$      3,950.00$       No Bid -$                 700.00$         3,500.00$          

34

12 Gauge No. 7.5 Birdshot, target 
load or acceptable equal. Case of 
250. Manufacturer Name & Item 
No. 50 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                95.00$      4,750.00$         No Bid -$                  

35

12 Gauge, 2 ¾ Popper Rounds 
(Blanks) or acceptable equal. Case 
of 250 Manufacturer Name & Item 
No. 70 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

36

Speer Force on Force marker 
Training ammunition. Caliber: 
9mm. Case of 500. No substitutes. 300 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                299.00$     89,700.00$       No Bid -$                  
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37

Speer Force maker Training 
ammunition, Caliber: 5.56/223. Case 
of 500. No substitutes. 150 Case

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                339.00$     50,850.00$       No Bid -$                  

38

Combined Tactical Systems CTS, 
Part# 2581 Super-Sock 12 gauge. 5 
rounds per box and yearly 
certification. No substitutes. 30 Box  $       6.86  $       205.80 

 No 
Bid -$                31.50$      945.00$            No Bid -$                  

39
Combined Tactical Systems CTS 
Part # 9230, Sting Ball 10 Box  $     35.94  $       359.40 

 No 
Bid -$                38.85$      388.50$            No Bid -$                  

40
Combined Tactical Systems CTS 
Part # 7290, Flash Bang 50 Box  $     48.80  $    2,440.00 

 No 
Bid -$                52.80$      2,640.00$         No Bid -$                  

41
Combined Tactical Systems CTS 
Part # 9590, Sting Ball 10 Box  $     51.34  $       513.40 

 No 
Bid -$                57.75$      577.50$            No Bid -$                  

42

Pepper Ball Inert Training Round, 
Part# PC3- P375. 375 rounds per jar. 
No substitutes. 8 Box

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                No Bid -$                 No Bid -$                  

43

Pepper Ball PAVA Hot Pepper 
Round, Part# PP-R10X. 375 rounds 
per jar. No substitutes 4 Jars

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

44

Defense Technology Spede Heat 37 
mm Short Range, Part# 2003. SAF-
Smoke. No substitutes. 50 Jars

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

45

Defense Technology Spede Heat 
37mm Long Range, Part# 1183. SAF-
Smoke. No substitutes. 100 Rounds

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

46

Defense Technology Spede Heat 
37mm Long Range CS, Part# 
1182C. No substitutes. 50 Rounds

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

47

Defense Technology Spede Heat CS 
37mm Short Range, Part# 2002CS. 
No substitutes. 50 Rounds

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

48

Defense Technology 37mm 
Multiple Foam Baton, Part# 1178. 
No substitutes. 50 Rounds

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

49
Defense Technology SAF-Smoke 
Grenade, Part# 1063. No substitutes. 10 Rounds

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

50
CS Tri Chamber Flameless, Part# 
1032 25 Rounds

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

51
OC Tri Chamber Flameless, Part# 
1030 25 Rounds

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                -$                 No Bid -$                  

52

Hornady 12 GA Shotgun Tap Light 
Magnum 00 Buck, Part# 86276, 20 
boxes per case. No substitutes. 6 Cases

No 
Bid  $           -    $               -   

 No 
Bid -$                144.00$     864.00$            No Bid -$                  
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53

Hornady 9mm 135 GR + P Flex 
Lock Critical Duty Item #90226 No 
Substitutes. 16 Cases

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  263.00$     4,208.00$         No Bid -$  

54

Speer Lawman 9mm 115gr Training 
Ammunition Item#53650 *Any 
9mm 115gr, 125gr, 147gr training 
ammunition may be substituted for 
the above-mentioned training ammo 120 Cases

No 
Bid  $           -    $ -   

 No 
Bid -$  252.00$     30,240.00$       350.00$         42,000.00$        

4
N/A N/A N/A N/A
N/A N/A N/A N/A
YES YES YES YES

Witness Signature:

Agent Sig

Number of Bids Received:  

Recommend award to the lowest, responsive and responsible bidders: 
Dana Safety Supply, 4729 Nelson Brogdon Blvd, Ste. C Sugar Hill GA, 30518  was awarded lines 38-41. 
Precision Delta, 205 Floyce Street, Ruleville, MS 38771  was awarded lines 2-10, 12, 16-17, 31. 
Gulf States Distributors Inc., 600 E. Shirley Lane, Montgomery, AL 36117 was awarded lines 1, 14, 15, 18-30, 32, 34 36, 37, 52-54.
Specialty Cartridge Inc., 7129 Wheat Street, NE Covington, GA, 30014 was awarded lines 5, 6, 9, 11, 12, 33, 54.
 LSBE Participation was waived.

NOTES -  DETAIL JUSTIFICATION

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE 
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No) 
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)

Those line items that were not bid on will be purchased through open market.

Jennifer Schofield
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