

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart LLC.	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire Co.	NexTire Commercial Inc.
1	Road Service for Fire Rescue (normal business hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$115.00	N/A	\$125.00	N/A	\$155.00
2	Road Service for Fire Rescue (after business hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$125.00	N/A	\$160.00	N/A	\$215.00
3	Additional charge per tire for more than 1 tire replacement (same location)	\$30.00	N/A	\$40.00	N/A	\$40.00
4	Road Service for Heavy Truck, Trailer, Light Truck & Passenger Vehicles (normal bus. Hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$115.00	N/A	\$115.00	N/A	\$155.00
5	Road Service for Heavy Truck, Trailer, Light Truck & Passenger Vehicles (after bus. Hours) Trip charge + 1 Tire Replacement	\$125.00	N/A	\$188.00	N/A	\$215.00
6	State if Additional charge for more than 1 tire replaced at same location	\$30.00	N/A	\$40.00	N/A	\$40.00
7	Flat Repair Charge (includes demounting & mounting)	\$38.00	N/A	\$45.00	N/A	\$45.00
8	Valve Stem, Replacement Cost	\$4.00	N/A	\$5.00	N/A	\$10.99
9	Road Service for Off Hwy/ Construction Equipment (Normal bus. Hours) Trip Charge	\$185.00	N/A	\$125.00	\$120.00 per hour	\$135.00 per hour
10	Road Service for Off Hwy/ Construction Equipment (after bus. Hours) Trip Charge	\$225.00	N/A	\$150.00	\$120.00 per hour	\$215.00 per hour
11	Flat Repair Charge (includes demounting & mounting)	\$165.00	N/A	\$110.00	N/A	Up to \$300.00
12	Tube Replacement	\$125.00	N/A	\$90.00	N/A	Up to \$300.00
13	Tube Patch Repair	\$45.00	N/A	\$49.00	\$45.00	Up to \$300.00
14	Valve Stems, large Bore	\$24.00	N/A	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$20.99
15	O'Ring Seals	\$28.00	N/A	\$25.00	\$17.50	\$35.00

Witness Signature: *Tynia Anu Umoru*

Agent Signature: *Tammy Shew*

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart LLC.	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire Co.	NexTire Commercial Inc.
16	Tire Replacement for In-Shop Repair of Light Trucks & Passenger Vehicles (Including mount & balance)	\$25.00	N/A	\$22.50	N/A	\$25.00
17	Flat Repair, In-Shop Repair of Light Trucks & Passenger Vehicles (Including mount & balance)	\$25.00	N/A	\$28.00	N/A	\$35.00
18	Tire Disposal Fee	\$6.00	N/A	\$5.00	N/A	\$4.50-150.00
19	Cost per hour for repair work not covered elsewhere in the bid	\$115.00	N/A	\$75.00	\$120.00	\$155.00
20	Hourly Rate for site inspections (normal bus. Hours)	\$40.00	N/A	\$75.00	\$120.00	\$135.00
21	Hourly Rate for site inspections (after bus. Hours)	\$70.00	N/A	\$75.00	\$120.00	\$225.00
22	Air Pressure Adjustment Charge per tire	\$6.00	N/A	\$7.00	\$120.00 per hour	\$10.00
23	Tire Replacement-Pre-mounted wheel (Heavy truck & Trailer)	\$20.00	N/A	\$17.50	N/A	\$25.00
24	Tire Replacement, includes mount, dismount & installation	\$30.00	N/A	\$40.00	N/A	\$45.00
25	Valve Stem, Replacement Cost	\$4.00	N/A	\$5.00	N/A	\$10.99
26	Flow through valve stem cap	\$1.50	N/A	\$1.00	N/A	\$10.99
27	Wheel Refurbishing, inspection, cleaning & recoating	\$28.00	N/A	\$20.00	N/A	\$65.00
28	Storage fee, for Bulk wheel assemblies for use with tire replacement	No Charge	N/A	NC	N/A	\$10.00 each monthly
29	Wheel Pickup & Delivery fee	No Charge	N/A	NC	N/A	\$50.00
30	Distance added Charge per mile for Items 1,2,4,5 & 24 /distance limit	\$0 per mile	N/A	\$1.00 per mile	N/A	\$1.35 per mile

Witness Signature: Tynia Anu Amorru

Agent Signature: Tammy Shew

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart LLC.	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire Co.	NexTire Commercial Inc.
31a.	11Lx15, 14-ply (Quantity-10)-Brand	(12 ply) 339482 Firestone Farm Imp	N/A	Harvest King	Goodyear	No Bid
31b.	Tread Depth	8	N/A	16'	16/32'	No Bid
31c.	Unit Price	\$528.55	N/A	\$405.00	\$414.98	No Bid
31d.	Total Amount	\$5,285.50	N/A	\$4,050.00	\$4,149.80	No Bid
32a.	11L x 16, 8-ply (Quantity 12)-Brand	(12 ply) 378355 Firestone Reg. Ind.	N/A	Harvest King	Titan/Goodyear	No Bid
32b.	Tread Depth	14	N/A	18'	16/32'	No Bid
32c.	Unit Price	\$517.72	N/A	\$455.00	\$439.07	No Bid
32d.	Total Amount	\$6,212.64	N/A	\$5,460.00	\$5,268.84	No Bid
33a.	14 x 17.5, 14-ply (Quantity 6)-Brand	510039 Carlisle Trac Chief	N/A	Galaxy	Titan	No Bid
33b.	Tread Depth	25	N/A	26'	19/32'	No Bid
33c.	Unit Price	\$965.00	N/A	\$765.00	\$559.03	No Bid
33d.	Total Amount	\$5,790.00	N/A	\$4,590.00	\$3,354.18	No Bid
34a.	28Lx26, 20-ply (Quantity-10)-Brand	PR464518 Primex Logmonster	N/A	Prinx	Maxam	No Bid
34b.	Tread Depth	69	N/A	69'	16/32'	No Bid
34c.	Unit Price	\$6,561.00	N/A	\$5,266.00	\$4,047.00	No Bid
34d.	Total Amount	\$65,610.00	N/A	\$52,660.00	\$40,470.00	No Bid
35a.	16.9 x 30, 6-ply (Quantity-16)-Brand	008563 Firestone SAT II 23	N/A	Galaxy	Galaxy	No Bid
35b.	Tread Depth	47	N/A	48'	43/32'	No Bid
35c.	Unit Price	\$2,454.52	N/A	\$1,832.00	\$1,027.61	No Bid
35d.	Total Amount	\$39,272.32	N/A	\$29,312.00	\$16,441.76	No Bid
36a.	17.5 x 25L5, 20-ply (Quantity-4)-Brand	423165 Bridgestone VSDL D2A L5	N/A	Advance L5	E-3 Constellation	No Bid
36b.	Tread Depth	86	N/A	83'	33/32'	No Bid
36c.	Unit Price	\$4,731.87	N/A	\$3,112.00	\$1,114.67	No Bid
36d.	Total Amount	\$18,927.48	N/A	\$12,448.00	\$4,458.68	No Bid
37a.	1400 x 24, 16-ply (Quantity 6)-Brand	425384 Firestone SGG RBT6	N/A	Galaxy	Camso	No Bid
37b.	Tread Depth	31	N/A	30'	31/32'	No Bid

Witness Signature: Tynia Inu Amorru
 Agent Signature: Tammy Shew

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart LLC.	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire Co.	NexTire Commercial Inc.
37c.	Unit Price	\$1,996.48	N/A	\$1,491.00	996.36	No Bid
37d.	Total Amount	\$11,978.88	N/A	\$8,946.00	\$5,978.16	No Bid
38a.	23.5 x 25 L5, 20-ply (Quantity-8)-Brand	005501 Firestone Versabuilt AP	N/A	Advance L5	E-3 Constellation	No Bid
38b.	Tread Depth	45	N/A	63'	45/32'	No Bid
38c.	Unit Price	\$5,478.26	N/A	\$4,746.00	\$2,235.05	No Bid
38d.	Total Amount	\$43,826.08	N/A	\$37,968.00	\$17,880.40	No Bid
39	Charge for removal & installation of Foam Filled Tires on Vehicles, rim size 20 inches & Smaller	\$45.00	N/A	\$35.00	N/A	No Bid
40	Charge for removal & installation of Foam Filled Tires on Vehicles, rim size greater than 20 inches	\$55.00	N/A	\$60.00	N/A	No Bid
41	Charge for removal & installation of Foam Filled Tires on Vehicles, Tire sizes 23.5-25, 26.5-25, 28L x 26 & 1400 x 24	\$85.00	N/A	\$100.00	\$120.00 per hour	No Bid
42	Charge for removing Foam Filled Tires from rims 20 inches & smaller	\$30.00	N/A	\$25.00	\$45.00 each	No Bid
43	Charge for removing Foam Filled Tires from rims 20 inches & greater	\$40.00	N/A	\$35.00	\$60.00 each	No Bid
44	Charge for removing Foam Filled Tire sizes 23.5-25, 26.5-25, 28L x 26 & 1400 x 24	\$80.00	N/A	\$100.00	\$60.00 each	No Bid
45	Charge for Tire Service & Road Service Calls Round Trip	\$185.00	N/A	\$125.00	\$120.00 per hour	No Bid
46	Tire Service: State if additional for more than one tire at same location	No Charge	N/A	\$100.00	N/C	No Bid
47	Charge for Repair work not specifically covered elsewhere in the bid	\$125.00 per hour	N/A	\$150.00 per hour	\$120.00 per hour	No Bid
48	Articulated Loaders (John Deere 644J.K) (Quantity 16)	Unit price-\$16,341.76 Total Amount-\$261,468.16	Unit price-\$11,366.00 Total Amount-\$181,856.00	No Bid	Unit price-\$8208.27 Total Amount-\$131,332.32	No Bid
49	Skid Steer Loaders (Size 12X16.5) (Quantity 16)	Unit price-\$955.64 Total Amount-\$15,290.24	Unit price-\$605.17 Total Amount-\$9682.72	No Bid	Unit price-\$659.06 Total Amount-\$10,544.96	No Bid

Witness Signature: Tynia Inu Umoru
 Agent Signature: Tammy Shew

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Southern Tire Mart LLC.	Setco Inc.	Atlanta Commercial Tire	Action Tire Co.	NexTire Commercial Inc.
50	Articulated Loaders (Komatsu) (WA470) (Quantity 16)	Unit price-\$16,341.76 Total Amount-\$261,468.16	Unit price-\$8,353.29 Total Amount-\$133,652.64	No Bid	Unit price-\$8,208.27 Total Amount-\$131,332.32	No Bid
51	Trip Charge for site inspections with no follow-up maintenance.	\$60.00	N/A	\$125.00	\$120.00 per hour	No Bid
52	Service charge for rotation of Solid Rubber Tires on loader.	\$85.00	\$800.00	\$100.00	\$120.00 per hour	No Bid
53	Bidder state hourly charge for minor repair work associated with tire removal & installation.	\$125.00	N/A	\$100.00	\$120.00 per hour	No Bid
54	Bidder state hourly charge for repair work not specifically covered elsewhere in the bid.	\$125.00	N/A	\$125.00	\$120.00 per hour	No Bid
Number of bids received: 5						
<p>*Note: Item Nos: 48, 49 & 50 for Setco , Item No. 34. for Action Tire Co., Item No. 49. for Southern Tire Mart and Item Nos: 31, 32, 33, 35 & 36 for Atlanta Commercial Tire were incorrectly tabulated. The following is the correct total amount for each item.(This was calculated through multiplying the usage amount (16) with the unit price submitted.) Total prices changed from: Item No. 48: <u>\$45,464.00 to \$181,856.00</u> Item No. 49: <u>\$2420.68 to \$9,682.72 (Setco)</u> Item No. 49: <u>\$10,544.96 to \$15,290.24 (Southern Tire Mart)</u> Item No. 50: <u>\$33,413.16 to \$133,652.64</u> Item No. 34: <u>\$40,475.50 to \$40,470.00</u> Item No. 31: <u>\$4455.00 to \$4050.00</u> Item No. 32: <u>\$5874.00 to \$5460.00</u> Item No. 33: <u>\$5232.00 to \$4590.00</u> Item No. 35: <u>\$30,923.00 to \$29,312.00</u> Item No. 36: <u>\$15,023.00 to \$12,448.00</u></p>						

Recommended Vendors:

Southern Tire Mart, LLC.
529 Industrial Park Rd.
Columbia, MS 39429

NexTire Commercial, Inc.
3589 Memorial Dr., Ste. B
Decatur, GA 30032

Setco, Inc.
PO Box 809
Idabel, OK 74745

Action Tire
410 Lees Mill Rd.
Forrest Park, GA 30297

Atlanta Commercial Tire
6590-A Button Gwinnett Dr.
Doraville, GA 30340

Witness Signature:

Tynia Anu Amorru

Agent Signature:

Tammy Shew