[

DeKalb County

ITB No. 24-101685
ITB Name: Small Diameter Sewer Cleaning (Three (3) Year

Bid Opening: January 17, 2025

BID TABULATION ice S ing:
Multiyear Contract) Price Schedule Opening: February 13, 2025
Agent: Tiffany Reid - -
A International Design Services (IDS Metals & Materials Engineers. .
Atakapa Services, LLC Graham & Associates, Inc. | 5 '8 ices( %/ ! 8! ¥ Performance Contracting, Inc. Southeast Pipe Survey, Inc. The Renee Group, Inc.
— R Global, Inc. __— LLC - o =
ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE| UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE| UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED PRICE| UNIT PRICE |EXTENDED PRICE| UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE |EXTENDED PRICE]
Division 2 - Site Work
Traffic Control
01015-01 WorkZoneSiagmgand'l‘ramcConlrol: FC17- 15 EA
Urban Collector Street (per link)
$ 2,500.00| § 37.500.00 $ 500.00 7.500.00] § 500.00f $ 7,500.00] $ 7,250.00 | § 108,750.00 | § 1,054.00 | § 15,810.00 | $ 37.875.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 52,500.00
01015-02 WorkZm’eSiagmg‘and'l'ramcCo!llrol: FC16- 30 EA
Urban Minor Arterial Street (per link)
$ 3,000.00] $ 90,000.00| $ 875.00 26,250.00] $ 750.00f $ 22,500.00f $ 8.000.00 | § 240.000.00 | $ 1.054.00 | § 31.620.00 | § 2,525.00 75.750.00 | $ 3.750.00 | $ 112,500.00
01015-03 WorkZm!eSfagmganfi'l‘ramcConlr'ol: FC 14- 15 EA
Urban Principal Arterial Street (per link)
$ 3,000.00] § 45,000.00] § 875.00 13,125.00) § 1,000.00) § 15,000.00] § 12,875.00 | § 193,125.00 | § 1,054.00 | § 15,810.00 | $ 3.845.00 57,675.00 | § 6,000.00 | § 90,000.00
Locate and Expose Manhole
01545-1  |Steel Traffic Plate Installation 200 EA
$ 835.00[ $ 167,000.00] $ 1,000.00 200,000.00] $ 2,000.00] $ 400,000.00f $ 100.00 | $ 20.000.00 No Bid NoBid| $ 1,201.00 240.200.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 180,000.00
01545-2  |Steel Traffic Plate Maint 200 Week
o] Trafhic Plate Manenance “C ls 196000 s 392,000.00f s 120.00 24,000.00] s 300.00] § 60.000.00] § 300.00 | § 60.000.00 No Bid NoBid| § 361.00 72.200.00 | § 225.00 | s 45.000.00
02607#-1 |Locate and Expose Buried Manhole, Street 200 EA . .
$ 2,225.00| § 445,000.00] $ 625.00 125,000.00] $ 600.00f $ 120,000.00f $ 950.00 | § 190,000.00 No Bid NoBid| § 661.00 132,200.00 | $ 1,560.00 | § 312,000.00
02607#-2 |Locate and Expose Buried Manhole, Non-Street 200 EA . .
$ 1,670.00| § 334,000.00] $ 1,027.00 205,400.00] $ 700.00{ $ 140,000.00] § 1,800.00 | § 360,000.00 No Bid NoBﬂS 1,081.00 216,200.00 | $ 725.00 | § 145,000.00
Sanitary Sewer Cleaning
Cleaning & CCTV Cleaning
02956#-1 |Verification < 8” Diameter Pipe, Inside the Right 3,680,000 LF
of Way/Highway $ 2.85] § 10,488.000.00] $ 5.01 18,436,800.00] $ 445) § 16,376,000.00| $ 6.00 | $ 22,080,000.00 | $ 459 18§ 16,891,200.00 | § 4.10 15,088,000.00 | $ 4208 15,456,000.00
Cleaning & CCTYV Cleaning Verification > 8” -
02956#-2 |18” Diameter Pipe, Inside the Right of 280,000 LF
Way/Highway
$ 425 § 1,190,000.00 $ 5.01 1,402,800.00] $ 495| § 1,386,000.00] $ 6258 1,750.000.00 | $ 544 | $ 1.523.200.00 | $ 4.35 1.218.000.00 | $ 4358 1,218.000.00
Cleaning & CCTV Cleaning Verification > 18” <
02956#-3 |24” Diameter Pipe, Inside the Right of 40,000 LF
Way/Highway
$ 4.50] § 180.,000.00] $ 3.58 143.200.00] $ 499 § 199,600.00] $ 650 | § 260,000.00 | $ 643 | $ 257,200.00 | § 6.65 266,000.00 | $ 480 |8 192,000.00
Cleaning & CCTV Cleaning Verification <8”
02956#-4 i Pipe, Outside the Right of 3,680,000 LF
Way/Highway
$ 3751 § 13,800,000.00] $ 6.31 23,220,800.00] $ 495| § 18,216,000.00] $ 940 | § 34.592.000.00 | $ 53418 19.651.200.00 | § 5.65 20.792.000.00 | $ 470 | 8 17,296.000.00
Cleaning & CCTV Cleaning Verification > 8” -
02956#-5 |18"Diameter Pipe, Outside the Right of 280,000 LF
Way/Highway
$ 425 § 1,190,000.00f $ 6.31 1,766.800.00] $ 6.95| $ 1,946,000.00f $ 1025 | § 2,870,000.00 | $ 6.51 |8 1,822,800.00 | $ 6.15 1,722,000.00 | $ 73918 2,069,200.00
Cleaning & CCTYV Cleaning Verification > 18” <
02956#-6 |24” Diameter Pipe, Outside the Right of 40,000 LF
Way/Highway
$ 4.60| $ 184,000.00] $ 5.73 229,200.00] $ 6.95] $ 278,000.00] $ 2150 | $ 860.000.00 | $ 747 (8% 298.800.00 | $ 7.45 298.000.00 | $ 7828 312,800.00
02956#-7 |Manhole Cleaning, Additional Depth 7,000 VF
$ 1.00] $ 7,000.00] $ 10.00 70,000.00 $ 50.00) § 350,000.00] $ 50.00 | $ 350,000.00 | $ 2137 | § 149.590.00 | § 107.50 752,500.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 630,000.00
02956#-8 | Remove Protruding Connection 200 EA B 150.00 $ 30,000.00f $ 500.00 100,000.00f $ 600.00] S 120,000.00| $ 750.00 | $ 150,000.00 | $ 328.94 | § 65,788.00 | S 428.50 85,700.00 | $ 475.00 | S 95,000.00
As Needed Basis
Emergency Flow Bypass Pumping (As Needed Basis)
Bypass Pumping < 12” Diameter Pipe with Flow
01520-1 > 25% and < 50% 10,000 LF
$ 2500 $ 25,000.00 $ 12.00 120,000.00] $ 12.00) § 120,000.00] $ 55.00 | $ 550,000.00 | $ 2.66 | $ 26.600.00 | § 33.50 335.000.00 | $ 15.60 | § 156,000.00
015202 l:);[il]:jsPumpmg,Sll Diameter Pipe with Flow 5,000 LF
~ ° $ 3.50] $ 17,500.00 $ 15.00 75,000.00 $ 15.00) § 75,000.00f $ 55.00 | $ 275.000.00 | $ 272 (8 13.600.00 | $ 33.50 167.500.00 | § 2250 | § 112,500.00
01520-3  |Bypass Pumping, > 12 Diameter Pipe 8,000 LF
$ 5.00[ $ 40,000.00] $ 25.00 200,000.00] $ 25.00] § 200,000.00] $ 105.00 | $ 840.000.00 | $ 358§ 28.640.00 | § 130.00 1.040.000.00 | $ 1925 |8 154,000.00
015204 | Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Operation 320 HR
$ 500.00{ $ 160,000.00f $ 585.00 187,200.00] § 450.00) § 144,000.00] § 850.00 | § 272,000.00 | § 8116 | § 2597120 § 500.00 160,000.00 | $ 22500 | $ 72,000.00
Access Road and Easement Cleaning
02110-1 12’ Wide Construction Access 5,000 LF
Road, Install & Remove
$ 50.00) § 250,000.00] $ 128.78 643,900.00] $ 686.00[ $ 3.430,000.00f $ 330.00 | § 1,650,000.00 No Bid NoBid | § 271.00 1.355.000.00 | $ 9250 | § 462,500.00
021102 | Easement Clearing Light 10,000 v $ 17.00] § 170,000.00] $ 18.15 181,500.00]_$ 1065] § 106.500.00] § 3000 | 300.000.00 No Bid NoBid | § 27.00 270.000.00 | § 5208 52.000.00
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DeKalb County

NOTES - DETAIL JUSTIFICATON

Recommended Awardees:

‘Atakapa Services, LLC, 10542 S Glen PI, Baton Rouge, LA 70810

International Design Services (IDS) Global, Inc., 3849 Oakview Dr, Powder Springs, GA 30127
The Renee Group, Inc., 305 Selig Dr SW, Atlanta, GA, 30336

1. For the 'Subtotal', Graham & Associates entered $48,544,745.00 on their bid. The amount reflected on the bid tabulation in red represents the correct subtotal amount.
2. For the Total', Graham & Associates entered $51,942,887.20 on their bid. The amount reflected on the bid tabulation in red represents the correct total amount.

3. For the 'Subtotal', The Renee Group entered $39,498,500.00 on their bid. The amount reflected on the bid tabulation in red represents the correct subtotal amount.

4. For the 'Total', The Renee Group entered $40,090,977.50 on their bid. The amount reflected on the bid tabulation in red represents the correct total amount.

Only responsive bids are tabulated.

ddend

Pateco Services, LLC was deemed non-responsive for failure to sign and return No. 7 of the solicitation, in
Vacutek Integrated Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to meet the LSBE benchmark and demonstrate Good Faith Efforts.

to the Instruction No. 4 of the addendum.

021103 |Easement Clearing Medium 10,000 sY
s 1850 s 185.000.00] s 2.60] s 226,000.00] s 1600 s 160.000.00] s 4200 420,000.00 No Bid NoBid | § 4850 | 5 48500000 | s 1400 | s 140.000.00
021104 |Easement Clearing Heavy 2,000 Cali
Asoment Tearing Temy s 63.00 s 126,000.00] s 163.00] s 326,000.00] s 100.00] s 200,000.00] s 48000 | 5 960.000.00 No Bid NoBid | § 30100 |5 60200000 | 109.00 | s 218.000.00
02542-01 |[Silt Fence — Type C, Single Row 12,000 LF
w N s 13.00] s 156,000.00] s 1219] s 14628000 s 8.00] § 96.000.00] s 8.00 | s 96.000.00 No Bid NoBid | § 600 | s 72.000.00 | § 7.50 | s 90.000.00
02542-02 |Silt Fence —Type C, Double Row 24,000 LF $ 1500 § 360,000.00f s 19.50] s 468,000.00f s 16.00] s 384,000.00f s 10.00 | § 240,000.00 No Bid NoBid | § 1250 | $ 300,000.00 | 5 13758 330,000.00
Subtotal s 30,069,000.00 | 5 48,544,755.00 5 44,552,100.00 69,686,875.00 | $ 40,817,82920 s 45,840,800.00 | s 39,993,000.00
Allowance
01020-1 Allowance (shall not exceed 10% of the Subtotal 1 LS
amount) $ 207476100 §  2,074761.00] § 3398132.05| §  3398,132.05| § 445521000 S 445521000] 5 6.968.687.50 | 5 6.968.687.50 | 5 407.54600 |5 40754600 | 5 10000000 | S 100.000.00 [ s 592.477.50 | 5 592.477.50
Total $ 32,143,761.00] § 51,942,887.15] § 49,007,310.00| § 76,655,562.50 | 8 4122537520 | $ 45,940,800.00 | $ 40,585,477.50
LSBE Participation WGFE LSBE - 30% LSBE DeKalb - 5% LSBE MSA - 20% LSBE - 20% LSBE - 20% LSBE - 20% LSBE - 20%
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No) - Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Number of Bids Received: 9
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