



ITB No. ITB 22-101512 DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
 ITB Name: Steel Bottoms & Tops Lids BID TABULATION
 (Annual Contract with 2 Options to Renew)

Bid Opening: June 9, 2022
 Price Schedule Opening: July 8, 2022
 Agent: L. Deneen Walters

Company				CAR Industries of Georgia II LLC			WASTEQUIP LLC		
ITEM	COMMODITIES OR SERVICES	Estimated number of units	Unit	Brand	Unit Price (Capped Railings)	Unit Price (Uncapped Railings)	Brand	Unit Price (Capped Railings)	Unit Price (Uncapped Railings)
A. STEEL BOTTOMS									
1	3 YARDS - 72"W x 42"L (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	50	EA	PRT	N/A	365.33	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$304.00
2	4 YARDS - 72"W x 54"L (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	35	EA	PRT	N/A	374.48	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$357.00
3	4 YARDS - 72"W x 57"L (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	25	EA	PRT	N/A	389.85	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$370.00
4	6 YARDS - 72"W x 66"L (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	80	EA	PRT	N/A	426	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$411.00
5	6 YARDS - 72"W x 68"L (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	70	EA	PRT	N/A	522.17	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$420.00
6	6 YARDS - 72"W x 72"L (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	40	EA	PRT	N/A	466.77	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$438.00
7	8 YARDS - 72"W x 54"L-SLANT (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	90	EA	PRT	N/A	455.63	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$375.00
8	8 YARDS - 72"W x 82"L (RAILINGS FRONT TO BACK)	65	EA	PRT	N/A	572.56	WASTEQUIP	No Bid	\$446.00
B. TOP LIDS									
9	36"W x 48"L	1000	EA	PRT	N/A	35.06	PRT	\$23.00	\$23.00
10	36"W x 58"L	500	EA	PRT	N/A	36.93	PRT	\$24.00	\$24.00
C. PARTS									
11	IP ROD75.5 – ½" Dia.	500	EA	PRT	N/A	12.5	PRT	\$8.00	\$8.00
12	¼ Hinge Ear Dual 9/16 Holes	1000	EA	PRT	N/A	1.75	PRT	\$1.00	\$1.00
Number of Bids Received: 2									
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE				N/A					
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)				YES					
Two (2) bids were received. Recommend award to the responsible and responsive bidder: Wastequip Manufacturing Company, LLC P.O. Box 603008, Charlotte, NC 28260-3008									

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature: