

ITB No. 21-101427

ITB Name: Liquid Oxygen, Ferric Chloride and Various Other Chemicals (Three (3) Year Multiyear Contract)

BID TABULATION Bid & Price Opening:
January 25, 2022 Agent:
Angel Frazier

Item No.	Item Description	Estimated Number of Units	Unit	Brenntag South Mid-South, Inc.		Airgas USA, LLC		PVS Technologies, Inc.		Univar Solutions USA, Inc.		Speciality Chemical Company LLC	
				Unit Price	Total Amount	Unit Price	Total Amount	Unit Price	Total Amount	Unit Price	Total Amount	Unit Price	Total Amount
1	Ferric chloride, 30 to 45 percent Ferric (iron) content. Specific gravity of 1.2 to 1.5. Delivery method bulk liquid tanker 4,000 to 4,500 gallon shipment. Bidding On: (Manufacturer's Name and Model Number)	12,000	Dry Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$805.00	\$9,660,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Liquid Oxygen refrigerated (Hospital Grade,) delivered in bulk tanks 4,500-500 gallons Contractor shall provide means of transferring liquid to plant storage tank; per specifications. Bidding On: (Manufacturer's Name and Model Number)	540,000	GAL	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.3924	\$211,896.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Chlorine Gas, 1-ton containers, to be delivered in varying quantities of two (2) or more but probably not more than ten (10) at any time per specification. Bidding On: (Manufacturer's Name and Model Number)	360	TON	\$1,679.00	\$604,440.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Caustic Soda, drive, pellet form (100%)(NaOH) to be delivered on pallets in approx. 50-pound waterproof paper bags; per Specifications. Bidding On: (Manufacturer's Name and Model Number)	5,400	LB	\$1.35	\$7,290.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.6900	\$9,126.00

			Brenntag South Mid-South, Inc.		Airgas USA, LLC		PVS Technologies, Inc.		Univar Solutions USA, Inc.		Speciality Chemical Company LLC		
5	Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda), 50% Gradedeliver in bulk tank trucks of 3000-5000-gallon capacity, Contractor to transfer material to storage tanks, cleanup after delivery is the responsibility of the contractor, per specifications. Bidding On: (Manufacturer's Name and Model Number)	1,200	TON	\$888.00	\$1,065,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$393.00*WTON \$786.00* DST	\$471,600.00 \$943,200.00	\$906.89	\$1,088,268.00
6	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% grade, delivered in bulk tank trucks of 4,500-5,000-gallon capacity, per specifications. Bidding On: (Manufacturer's Name and Model Number)	420,000	GAL	\$1.663	\$698,460.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.859	\$780,738.00
7	Sodium Bicarbonate, NaHCO3, Technical Grade, free flowing, delivered on pallet in approx. 50 pounds new weight paper bags; per enclosed Specifications. Bidding On: (Manufacturer's Name and Model Number)	6,000	LB	\$0.325	\$1,950.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.3350	\$8,010.00
TOTAL:				\$2,377,740.00		\$211,896.00		\$9,660,000.00		\$471,600.00		\$1,886,142.00	
Number of Bids Received:		5											
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE		Waived											
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No)		Waived											
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)		Waived											

NOTES - DETAIL JUSTIFICATION

Speciality Chemical and Brenntag were deemed non-responsive for failure to sign the Bid Acknowledgement Form

Witness 
Signature: Shameka Weaver (Feb 3, 2022 09:22 EST)

Agent **Angel Frazier** Digitally signed by Angel Frazier
Signature: Date: 2022.02.02 17:13:56 -0500

Crystal Creekmore Digitally signed by Crystal Creekmore
Date: 2022.02.02 14:34:24 -0500