ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Th¢McPherson Companiygs,
Inc.

Cadence Petroleum

Taylor Enterprises
Inc.

ubrication Engineer

ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc.
———— T0.
Fluid Transmission gal./$343.75 per
1 55 gallon drums $8.38 per gal. $7.79 per gal. $7.54 per gal. drum $35.71 per gal.
Fluid Transmission 1 $2.48 per qt./ $4.40 per qt./$52.80
2 Quart $3.15 per qgt. $9.93 per gal. $2.68 per qgt. per case $10.94 per qt.
Fluid Transmission
Synthetic $12.00 per gal./
3 (5 gallon) $11.94 per gal. $23.13 per gal. $9.24 per gal. $60.00 per pail $37.81 per gal.
Fluid Transmission
Synthetic $15.00 per gal./$45.00
4 (1 gallon) $14.42 per gal. $14.31 per gal. $4.54 per gal. per (3 per case) $37.81 per gal.
Oil, Motor, 15W-40
with CJ4 (55 gallon $8.70 per gal./$478.50
5 drums) $8.76 per gal. $9.87 per gal. $8..98 per gal. per drum $15.42 per gal.
Oil, Motor, 15W-40
with CJ4 (Bulk
6 Delivery) 8.95 per gal. $8.47 per gal. $8.50 per gal. $8.15 per gal./Bulk $14.79 per gal.
Qil, Motor, 15W-40 $11.95 1./$35.85
ith CJ4, (1 gall -2> per gal. :
7 with €34, (1 gallon) $13.30 per gal. $11.07 per gal. $13.55 per gal. (3 per case) $16.96 per gal.
Qil, Motor, 5W-30,
Synthetic D
8 Y e $11.89 per gal. $9.81 per gal. $9.60 per gal. $9.29 per gal. N/A
Qil, Motor, 5W-30, $3.85 t./ $23.10
Synthetic Dexos, M -8 per qt. :
9 yn ?IICOte;XOS $4.02 per quart $3.15 per qt. (6 per case) $10.96 per qt.
Oil, Lubricant, Multi-
Purpose Gear, SAE
75W-90, GL-5/MT- $2.09 per Ib./$250.80
10 1, 120 Ib. drums $2.02 per Ib. $18.86 per gal. $2.43 per Ib. per keg $11.97 per Ib.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, EP-2, $1.97 per |b./$788.00
400 Ib. drums $2.29 per Ib. $2.57 per Ib. $2.14 per Ib. per drum $8.20 per Ib.

Witness Signature:

L alon Waltrre

Agent Signatur::/’_@hu/};% S&W’

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Th¢McPherson Companiygs,
Inc.

Cadence Petroleum

Taylor Enterprises
Inc.

ubrication Engineer

ITEM DESCRIPTION \ Inc.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, EP-2, $2.57 per |b./$308.40
12 120 Ib. drums $2.53 per Ib. $2.72 per Ib. $2.42 per Ib. per keg $8.41 per Ib.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, MP-2, $3.89 per Ib./$1556.00
13 400 Ib. drums $2.59 per Ib. $3.94 per Ib. per drum $6.09 per Ib.
Grease, Chassis
Lubrication, MP-2, $3.99 per |b./$478.80
14 120 Ib. drums $3.52 per Ib. $4.02 per Ib. per keg $6.30 per Ib.
Oil Transmission,
SAE 10W CF, $12.00 per
15 5 gallon drums $12.71 per gal. $6.01 per Ib $7.88 per gal. gal./$60.00 per pail $37.96 per Ib.
Fluid, Universal
Tractor, 5 gallon $7.75 per gal./$38.75
16 drums $8.86 per gal. 7.45 per gal. $7.04 per gal. per pail $34.84 per Ib.
Fluid, Hydraulic,
ISO 68AW, Low
Temp., 5 gallon $12.99 per gal./$64.95
17 drums $18.48 per gal. $8.23 per gal. $6.89 per gal. per pail $24.45 per |b.
Fluid, Hydraulic,
ISO 46AW, High
18 Temp., (Bulk) $7.49 per gal. $6.98 per gal. $5.74 per gal. $5.70 per gal./bulk $29.47 per Ib.
Fluid, Hydraulic,
ISO 46AW, High
Temp., 55 gallon $6.25 per gal./$343.75
19 drums $8.17 per gal. $7.58 per gal. $5.99 per gal. per drum $30.84 per Ib.
Gear Oil, HD
80W90, (120 Ib. $1.59 per |b./$636.00
20 drums) $1.59 per Ib. $1.55 per Ib. $1.97 per Ib. per drum $6.70 per Ib.

Lablon Wallera

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature: %% SW

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Th@s, m @ ubrication Engineer
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Cadence Petroleum Inc. \ Inc.
Grease, special with
selected mineral oil,
12% modified
bentonite thickener
and extreme
pressure additives,
dropping pt. to 500
21 Fl, 35 Ib. pails No Bid No Bid $167.00 per pail $277.00 per pail
Qil, Light, 55 gallon
drums, LE
Ind./Turbine Qil,
Must be LE 4932 $6.20 per gal./$341.00
22 Only No Bid $9.48 per gal. per drum $22.88 per gal.
Qil, Light, 55 gallon
drums, LE Ind. $12.19 per
Turbine Oil, Must be gal./$670.45 per
23 LE 6406 Only No Bid $9,88 per gal. drum $31.78 per gal.
Oil, Cylinder (Multi-
purpose)
55 gallon drums, $10.85 per
Must be LE 1605 oil gal./$596.75 per
24 Only No Bid $22.79 per gal. drum $48.41 per gal.
Grease, cartridges,
(40 per case) with
Aluminum Complex
Thickener. ISO VG
220, Viscosity @ 40
degrees C210 &
@100 degrees $29.95 per case/10
25 C17.5 No Bid No Bid per case/.14 kg $374.11 per case

L 2lon Welare

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature: W/&'/ SW

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Th¢McPherson Companiygs,
Inc.

Cadence Petroleum

Taylor Enterprises
Inc.

ubrication Engineer

ITEM DESCRIPTION \ Inc.
Vanguard Synthetic
Lubricant for Air
Compressors &
Vacuum Pumps, 2 $57.80 per
26 Gallon No Bid No Bid gal./$289.00 per pail N/A
Grease, cartridges,
(40 per case) With
Lithium Complex
27 Thickener No Bid No Bid $29.95 per case $363.37 per case
Grease, gear
compound, EP 320,
55 gallon drums, $11.55 per
high temp., Multi- gal./$635.25 per
28 purpose No Bid $1.72 per Ib. drum $48.41 per gal.
Oil, gear Lube, 55
gallon drums, Must
be Lubrication $14.25 per
Engineers (LE oil) gal./$783.75 per
29 1608 No Bid No Bid drum $48.41 per gal.
Oil, Hydraulic, ISO
46, 55 gallon
drums, high temp,
multi-purpose, Must $6.25 per gal./$343.75
30 be LE Oil 4933 only. No Bid $24.87 per gal. $5.99 per gal. per drum $22.88 per gal.
Qil, SAE 30, non-
detergent, 55 gallon $7.99 per gal./$439.45
31 drums No Bid $19.99 per gal. per drum $31.78 per gal.
Oil, Engine, 55
gallon drums,SAE $8.70 per gal./$478.50
32 15W-40 $8.76 per gallon $9.27 per gal. per drum $15.42 per gal.
$35.99 per
Lubricant, gear (ISO gal./$1979.45 per
33 VG 460) No Bid $1.57 per gal. drum $47.10 per gal.

Witness Signature: w}@ W@éﬁ@b&

Agent Signature:

J

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021
Tammy Shew




ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Th¢McPherson Companiygs,
Inc.

Cadence Petroleum

Taylor Enterprises
Inc.

ubrication Engineer

\ Inc.

34

Lubricant, Air
Compressor, 55
gallon drums (ISO
VG 68/SAE 20)

No Bid

No Bid

$11.75 per
gal./$646.25 per drum

$38.99 per gal.

35

Lubricant, Multi-
Purpose Gear Qil,
55 gallon drums
(Must be LE 1604
Only)

No Bid

No Bid

$9.98 per gal./drum

$48.41 per gal.

36

Lubricant, Air
Compressor, 5-
gallon drums, S

Rotary Compressor
Oil SAE 15

No Bid

No Bid

$31.95 per
gal./$159.75 per pail

N/A

37

Qil, Special Turbine,
Inhibited, (in 55
gallon);
Industrial/Turbine
Oil ISO VG 150/SAE
30 (Must be LE Oil
6403 Only)

No Bid

No Bid

$11.50 per
gal./$632.50 per drum

$33.21 per gal.

38

Oil, Light Spindle, 5
gallon buckets, ISO-
32, SAE 10

No Bid

No Bid

$25..70 per
gal./$128.50 per pail

$24.45 per gal.

39

Qil, Special Turbine,
(55 gallon drums);
Industrial/Turbine
Oil ISO VG 150/SAE

30 (Must be
Lubrication
Engineers (LE Oil
6404 only)

No Bid

No Bid

$11.50 per gal./

$632.50 per drum

$33.21 per gal.

L alon Welare

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature: 7%/&/ SW

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Th@s, m @ ubrication Engineer
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Cadence Petroleum Inc. \ Inc.
Qil, Turbine,
Inhibited, Food
Grade, Anti foaming
( 5 gallon buckets)
Industrial/Turbine $53.80 per
40 Oil ISO VG 220 No Bid No Bid gal./$269.00 per pail $58.10 per gal.
Oil, Engine, Diesel,
55 gallon drums, $8.70 per gal./$478.50
41 15W-40 $8.76 per gallon No Bid per drum $16.96 per gal.
Lube, Special Gear
Compound for Cotta
Gearbox, (5 Gallon
Buckets), Anti
foaming SAE 85W- $11.25 per gal./$56.25
42 140 No Bid $1.52 per Ib. per pail $47.71 per gal.
Qil, Turbine,
Inhibited, Food
Grade, Anti foaming
( 5 gallon buckets)
Industrial/Turbine $43.80 per
43 0il ISO VG 150 No Bid $45.25 per gal. gal./$219.00 per pail $33.21 per gal.
Oil, gear & bearing,
5 gallon buckets, $35,.20 per
44 Mobil SHC 626 No Bid $42.03 per gal. gal./$176.00 per pail $64.88 per gal.
Chevron NLGEWAR
Compound 220
Food Grade 5 gallon $53.80 per
45 Buckets No Bid No Bid gal./$269.00 per pail $58.10 per gal.
Oil, Compressor, $31.95 per
46 (5 gallon buckets) No Bid No Bid gal./$159.75 per pail $40.26 per gal.
Glycerin, Industrial
grade (1 gallon
cans) No Bid No Bid N/A

Witness Signature:

L alon (/(/ﬁ,ﬁﬁ?/w/

Agent Signature: % 5’&0{)‘

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb County

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

Th@s, m @ ubrication Engineer
ITEM DESCRIPTION Inc. Cadence Petroleum Inc. \ Inc.
Qil, Lubricant, SAE
15W-40, 100% CNG
& LNG OQil, in
accordance with API
CK-4 Licensed and
48 Cummins approved. $13.79 per gallon $18.42 per gal. $12.69 per gal. $9.50 per gal. $29.87 per gal.
Qil, Hydraulic, 55
gallon drums, Must
be Lubrication
Engineers 680 Oil $14.25 per
49 Only. No Bid No Bid gal./$783.75 per drum $47.10 per gal.
Glycerin, Industrial
grade (5 gallon
cans)for Lime Slurry
Pumps. Pump
Solution Group: $24.50 per
50 Neptune No Bid No Bid gal./$122.50 per pail N/A
Qil, Medium, 55
gallon drums,Must
be Lubrication
Engineers
Industrial/Turbine $6.25 per gal./$343.75
51 Oil (LE 4934 Only). No Bid $8.63 per gal. per drum $22.88 per gal.
Oil, Heavy, 55
gallon drums, Must $11.50 per
52 be LE Oil 6405 Only. No Bid $9.48 per gal. gal./$632.50 per drum $31.79 per gal.
Oil, Engine, 55
gallon drums, Must $26.87 per
53 be LE Oil 8420 Only. No Bid No Bid gal./$134.37 per pail N/A
DIESEl CXNause rara
(DEF), EDEF B,
(delivery Bulk, $1.98 bulk, $2.66 per gal.
54 drums, gallons) $2.01 per gal. drum $1.95 per gal. $1.69 per gal./bulk N/A
On, OW-20, run
Synthetic $9.49 per gal. $10.61 per gal. $11.97 per gal. $8.15 per gal./bulk $37.12 per gal.

55
Witness Signature: MW W

Agent Signature: % SW

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021
Tammy Shew




ITB Number: 21-101442
ITB NAME: Lubricants

DeKalb Cou

(-

nty

Department of Purchasing Contracting

Bid Tabulation

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Th¢McPherson Companiygs,
Inc.

Cadence Petroleum

Taylor Enterprises
Inc.

ubrication Engineer

\ Inc.

56

Ull, SAC DW5U,run
Synthetic (delivery
gallon drums &
bulk)

$11.89 per gal.

$11.21 per gal.

$9.37 per gal.

$8.15 per gal./bulk

$37.12 per gal.

57

Fluid, Synthetic
Automatic
Transmission, TES
295/TES 468
(delivery gallons)
Must be authorized
by Allison
Transmission

$26.85 per gal.

$41.79 per gal.

$25.78 per gal.

$31.95 per gal./bulk

N/A

Recommended Vendors:

Dilmar Oil
1951 W. Darlington St.
Florence, SC 28501

The McPherson Co., Inc.
5051 Cardinal St.
Trussville, AL 35173-1871

Cadence Petroleum
701 Mcdowell Rd.
Asheboro, NC 27205

Taylor Enterprises, Inc.
120 Hollow Tree Ln., SW
Atlanta, GA 30318

Lubrication Engineers, Inc.
1919 E. Tulsa
Wichita, KS 67216

Witness Signature: w}b Wm

Agent Signature: W SW

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2021
Tammy Shew



