ITB Number: #25-100072
ITB NAME: Tire Services

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Southern Tire Mart LLC.

Atlanta
Commercial Tire

Action Tire Co.

Dixon Mobile Services

Road Service for Fire Rescue
(normal business hours)Trip
charge + 1 Tire Replacement

v

$110.00

e

No Bid

N—_

$125.00

N

No Bid

$510.00

Road Service for Fire
Rescue (after business
hours)Trip charge + 1 Tire
Replacement

$120.00

No Bid

$175.00

No Bid

$560.00

Additional charge per tire
for more than 1 tire
replacement (same

location)

$30.00

No Bid

$48.00

No Bid

$160.00

Road Service for Heavy
Truck, Trailer, Light Truck
& Passenger Vehicles
(normal bus. Hours)Trip
charge + 1 Tire
Replacement

$110.00

No Bid

$125.00

No Bid

$510.00

Road Service for Heavy
Truck, Trailer, Light Truck
& Passenger Vehicles
(after bus. Hours)Trip
charge + 1 Tire
Replacement

$120.00

No Bid

$185.00

No Bid

$560.00

State if Additional charge
for more than 1 tire
replaced at same location

$30.00

No Bid

$48.00

No Bid

$160.00

Flat Repair Charge
(includes demounting &
mounting)

$38.00

No Bid

$48.00

No Bid

$160.00

Valve Stem, Replacement
Cost

$4.00

No Bid

$5.00

No Bid

$10.00

Road Service for Off Hwy/

Construction Equipment

(Normal bus. Hours) Trip
Charge

$135.00

No Bid

$125.00

$125.00

$620.00

10

Road Service for Off Hwy/
Construction Equipment
(after bus. Hours) Trip
Charge

$175.00

No Bid

$150.00

$125.00

$700.00

11

Flat Repair Charge
(includes demounting &
mounting)

$135.00

No Bid

$110.00

No Bid

$260.00

12

Tube Replacement

$105.00

No Bid

$90.00

No Bid

$200.00

13

Tube Patch Repair

$45.00

No bid

$60.00

$50.00

$55.00

14

Valve Stems, large Bore

$24.00

No Bid

$30.00

$32.50

$25.00

15

O'Ring Seals

$28.00

No Bid

$25.50

$18.00

$5.00

Bid Opening Date: March 20, 2025
Cost Opening: April 1, 2025
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: #25-100072
ITB NAME: Tire Services

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Southern Tire Mart LLC.

Atlanta
Commercial Tire

Action Tire Co.

Dixon Mobile Services

16

Tire Replacement for In-
Shop Repair of Light
Trucks & Passenger

Vehicles (Including mount
& balance)

$25.00

No Bid

$22.50

No Bid

$290.00

17

Flat Repair, In-Shop
Repair of Light Trucks &
Passenger Vehicles
(Including mount &
balance)

$25.00

No Bid

$32.50

No Bid

$170.00

18

Tire Disposal Fee

$6.00

No Bid

$5.00

No Bid

$25.00

19

Cost per hour for repair
work not covered
elsewhere in the bid

$110.00

No Bid

$85.00

$125.00

$265.00

20

Hourly Rate for site
inspections (normal bus.
Hours

$40.00

No Bid

$75.00

$125.00

$130.00

21

Hourly Rate for site
inspections (after bus.
Hours

$70.00

No Bid

$85.00

$125.00

$130.00

22

AT Pressure Adjustment
Charge per tire

$6.00

No Bid

$12.50

$125.00

$35.00

23

Tire Replacement-Pre-
mounted wheel (Heavy
truck & Trailer)

$20.00

No Bid

$37.50

No Bid

$570.00

24

Tire Replacement, includes
mount, dismount &
installation

$30.00

No Bid

$48.50

No Bid

$360.00

25

Valve Stem, Replacement
Cost

$4.00

No Bid

$5.00

No Bid

$35.00

26

Flow through valve stem
cap

$1.50

No Bid

$1.00

No Bid

$5.00

27

Wheel Refurbishing,
inspection, cleaning &
recoating

$28.00

No Bid

$40.00

No Bid

$1,500.00

28

Wheel Pickup & Delivery
fee

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$225.00

29

Distance added Charge per
mile for Items 1,2,4,5 & 24
/distance limit

$0.00

No Bid

$1.00

No Bid

$5.00

Bid Opening Date: March 20, 2025
Cost Opening: April 1, 2025
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: #25-100072
ITB NAME: Tire Services

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

Southern Tire Mart LLC.

Atlanta
Commercial Tire

Action Tire Co.

ITEM DESCRIPTION Dixon Mobile Services
11Lx15, 14-ply (12 ply) Galaxy Rib Implement
30a. (Quantity-10)-Brand No Bid Loadmaxx R3 ATF 12 ply Harvest King Rib
30b. Tread Depth 10 No Bid 16' 18 22/32
30c. Unit Price $582.00 No Bid $509.00 $393.25 $281.00
30d. Total Amount $5,820.00 No Bid $5,090.00 $3,932.50 $1,570.00
11L x 16, 8-ply (Quantity
31a. 12)-Brand {12 ply) Galaxy Workstar No Bid Agstar 4105 i-1 Rib Galaxy Harvest King Rib
31b. Tread Depth 15 No Bid 18' 9 11/32'
31c. Unit Price $652.00 No Bid $431.00 $367.20 $245.00
31d. Total Amount $7,824.00 No Bid $5,172.00 $4,406.40 $2,940.00
14 x 17.5, 14-ply
! Galaxy Beefy Bab
32a. (Quantity 6)-Brand alaxy Beety Baby No Bid MaxduraPRSKST ATF Power King Rim-Guard
32b. Tread Depth 27 No Bid 26' 23' 20/32
32c. Unit Price $794.00 No Bid $802.00 $660.02 $740.00
32d. Total Amount $4,764.00 No Bid $4,812.00 $3,960.12 $4,440.00
17.5 x 25L5, 20-ply
33a. (Quantity-4)-Brand Maxam MS502 No Bid Maxxam MS501 No Bid Power King
33b. Tread Depth 91 No Bid 83' No Bid 30/32
33c. Unit Price $2,973.00 No Bid $3,671.00 No Bid $1,197.00
33d. Total Amount $11,892.00 No Bid $14,684.00 No Bid $4,788.00
TZ00 x 24, 16-ply
34a. (Quantity 6)-Brand Maxam MS915 No Bid Maxdura 2350 G2 Ascenso Camco TLH
34b. Tread Depth 34 No Bid 30' 33 30/32
34c. Unit Price $1,777.00 No Bid $1,951.00 $1,449.55 $1,265.00
34d. Total Amount $10,662.00 No Bid $11,706.00 $8,697.30 $7,590.00
23.5 x 25 L5, 20-ply
35a. (Quantity-8)-Brand 23.5R25 E3-L3 Maxam MS301 No Bid Galaxy LHD500 No Bid Firestone
35b. Tread Depth 48 No Bid 63" No Bid 40/32
35c. Unit Price $4,456.00 No Bid $5,955.00 No Bid $5,561.00
35d. Total Amount $35,648.00 No Bid $47,640.00 No Bid $44,488.00
Charge for removal &
installation of Foam Filled
Tires on Vehicles, rim size
36 20 inches & Smaller $45.00 No Bid $45.00 No Bid $650.00

Bid Opening Date: March 20, 2025

Cost Opening: April 1, 2025
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: #25-100072
ITB NAME: Tire Services

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

Southern Tire Mart LLC.

Atlanta
Commercial Tire

Action Tire Co.

ITEM DESCRIPTION Dixon Mobile Services
Charge for removal &
installation of Foam Filled
Tires on Vehicles, rim size
37 greater than 20 inches $55.00 No Bid $85.00 No Bid $1,125.00
Charge for removal &
installation of Foam Filled
Tires on Vehicles, Tire
sizes 23.5-25, 26.5-25,
38 28L x 26 & 1400 x 24 $85.00 No Bid $130.00 $125.00 $4,500.00
Charge for removing Foam
Filled Tires from rims 20
39 inches & smaller $30.00 No Bid $45.00 $65.00 $2,650.00
Charge for removing Foam
Filled Tires from rims 20
40 inches & greater $40.00 No Bid $65.00 $85.00 $3,780.00
Charge for removing Foam
Filled Tire sizes 23.5-25,
26.5-25,28L x 26 & 1400 x
a1 24 $80.00 No Bid $100.00 $85.00 $4,200.00
Charge for Tire Service &
Road Service Calls Round
42 Trip $185.00 No Bid $125.00 $125.00 $360.00
Tire Service: State if
additional for more than
43 one tire at same location $0.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid $335.00
Charge for Repair work not
specifically covered
44 elsewhere in the bid $120.00 No Bid $150.00 $125.00 $130.00
Articulated Loaders Unit price-$9,225.00
(John Deere 644].K) Unit price-$14,068.00 Total Amount-
45 (Quantity 16) Total Amount-$225,088.00 $147,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Skid Steer Loaders Unit price-$725.00 Unit price-$585.00
(Size 12X16.5) Unit price-$1,278.64 Total Amount- Total Amount-
46 (Quantity 16) Total Amount-$20,448.00 $11,600.00 No Bid $9360.00 No Bid
Unit price-
Articulated Loaders Unit price-$9,225.00 $9482.24
(Komatsu) (WA470) Unit price-$14,068.00 Total Amount- Total Amount-
47 (Quantity 16) Total Amount-$225,088.00 $147,600.00 No Bid $151,715.84 No Bid
Trip Charge for site
inspections with no follow-
48 up maintenance. $60.00 $0.00 $125.00 $125.00 $560.00
Service charge for rotation
of Solid Rubber Tires on
49 loader. $85.00 $800.00 $100.00 $125.00 $2,670.00
Bidder state hourly charge
for minor repair work
associated with tire
50 removal & installation. $125.00 $200.00 $100.00 $125.00 $130.00

Bid Opening Date: March 20, 2025
Cost Opening: April 1, 2025
Tammy Shew



ITB Number: #25-100072
ITB NAME: Tire Services

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

Atlanta
ITEM DESCRIPTION Southern Tire Mart LLC. @ ® @ Dixon Mobile Services
Bidder state hourly charge
for repair work not
specifically covered
51 elsewhere in the bid. $125.00 No Bid $125.00 $125.00 $265.00
Number of bids Responsive: 5
LSBE Benchmark GFE GFE GFE GFE GFE
Separate Sealed Price Schedule Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Attended Mandatory LSBE Meeting Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Recommended Vendors:
Southern Tire Mart, LLC. Action Tire

529 Industrial Park Rd.
Columbia, SC 39429

Setco, Inc.
PO Box 809

Idabel, OK 74745

Atlanta Commercial Tire
6590-A Button Gwinnett Dr.
Doraville, GA 30340

410 Lees Mill Rd.
Forest Park, GA 30297

L anen (Creak

Witness Signature

Agent Signature

Tammy Shecw
J

Bid Opening Date: March 20, 2025
Cost Opening: April 1, 2025
Tammy Shew
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