





A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS			IEH Auto Parts LLC. dba Auto Plus Auto Parts							Auto Zone Parts							Barber Auto Air							Irish Plus LLC dba Batteries Plus							
Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)			Motorcraft, Motormite, National Seals, Permatex, Power Brake Exchange, Prestone, Proline Products, Pro Select by Wai Global, Quick Steer Chassis, Radiator Specialty, Sealed Power, Spectra Fuel Tanks, Standard Engine mgmt., Standard Wire, Techsmart, Tru-Flate, Valvoline, Velvac, Wagner Friction, Lighting, OEX Pads, Quick Stop & drums & rotors, Walker Exhaust, WD-40, Webb Wheel Wilmar Tool, Wilson Electrical, Wix Filters, Dorman,Ecco,Edelmann,Euclid,Fel-Pro,Forney,4 Seasons,Gates, Grote, Ideal Clamps,Monroe,Moog, & Motorad (Please see bid for entire list of products)							See Attached in bid							Carrier-CD, Trans/Air-CD, Kysor-CD							East Penn/Duracell/Magna Power/Crown Batt./Optima							
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)			List less 45%-80% depending on product (please see bid)							0%							No Discount							10%-60% (Please see bid)							
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES																															
Item No.	Item Description	Estimated No. of Units	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	
1	Battery with BCI Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity Rating: 115	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast JCI	24DLG	24'	700'	130'	\$145.39	\$8,723.40							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	24'	725'	120 min.	\$82.90	\$4,974.00	
2	Battery with BCI Group: 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Reserve Capacity Rating: 115	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast JCI	24FDLG	24'	700'	130'	\$145.39	\$581.56							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	24F	650'	115 min.	\$73.50	\$294.00	
3	Battery with BCI Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast JCI	78DLG	78'	800'	110'	\$145.39	\$4,361.70							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	78'	690'	110 min.	\$82.30	\$2,469.00	
4	Battery with BCI Group: 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 820, Reserve Capacity Rating: 250	15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	4D	4D	825'	235'	\$158.99	\$2,384.85							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	4DLT	850'	240' min.	\$134.50	\$2,017.50	
5	Battery with BCI Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 320	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	4DH-1000	4D	1000'	295'	\$158.99	\$4,769.70							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	4D	1050'	290'	\$148.50	\$4,455.00	
6	Battery with BCI Group: 51, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve Capacity Rating: 75	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	51DLG	51'	500'	85'	\$145.39	\$1,453.90							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	51'	450'	70 min.	\$61.30	\$613.00	
7	Battery with BCI Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 650, Reserve Capacity Rating: 130	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	27DLG	27'	810'	140'	\$145.39	\$290.78							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	27'	710'	120 min.	\$88.50	\$177.00	
8	Battery with BCI Group: 27F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 710, Reserve Capacity Rating: 120	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	27FDLG	27F	710'	165'	\$145.39	\$5,815.60							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	27F	710'	120'	\$88.50	\$3,540.00	
9	Battery with BCI Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 435	850	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	8D-1400	8D	1400'	450'	\$203.99	\$173,391.50							\$0.00		East Penn Duracell	8D	1425'	440 min.	\$174.95	\$148,707.50	
10	Battery with BCI Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 200	1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A						#VALUE!							#####	BNC Crown Battery	31D	1000'	190 min.	\$128.00	\$128,000.00		
11	Battery with BCI Group: 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 200	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A						#VALUE!							#####	BNC Crown Battery	31D	1000'	190 min.	\$128.00	\$1,280.00		
12	Battery with BCI Group: 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 120	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	65DLG	65'	850'	150'	\$145.39	\$1,453.90	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	65'	850'	150 min.	\$91.00	\$910.00
13	Battery with BCI Group: GT9-R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve Capacity Rating: 37	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A						#VALUE!	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	UI	300'	35 min.	\$41.30	\$495.60	









A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS										McNeilus Truck & Mfg.						MHC Kenworth						Mobile Hydraulics of GA, Inc.						Napa Auto Parts					
Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)										McNeilus Truck & Mfg.						Exide 925cca Batteries						Gates & Intertraco-Key Drive Price Sheet, 30% off reg. Pre-(Hose & Fittings), Brennan Inc.-Adapters, 30% off reg.prc., Midland Mfg.-30% off Regular Price						Please see attached sheet in bid.					
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)										Please see attached list of parts with pricing in bid.						45% discount						30% off reg. price/Pre 1 (Key Drive Price Sheet)											
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES																																	
Item No.	Item Description	Estimated No. of Units	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount			
1	Battery with BCI Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity Rating: 115	60							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7524	10.75x9"	24'	700'	115'	\$86.39	\$5,183.40			
2	Battery with BCI Group: 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Reserve Capacity Rating: 115	4							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7524F	10.75x9"	24F	675'	115'	\$86.39	\$345.56			
3	Battery with BCI Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	30							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7578	10.75x7.25 in.	78(60)	630'	100'	\$86.39	\$2,591.70			
4	Battery with BCI Group: 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 820, Reserve Capacity Rating: 250	15							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7251	20 x 8.125 in.	4DLT	820'	250'	\$104.21	\$1,563.15			
5	Battery with BCI Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 320	30							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7266	20.5 x 9.875 in	40'	1300'	320'	\$162.05	\$4,861.50			
6	Battery with BCI Group: 51, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve Capacity Rating: 75	10							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 6551	9.375 x 8.75 in.	51'	450'	75'	\$68.76	\$687.60			
7	Battery with BCI Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 650, Reserve Capacity Rating: 130	2							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 8270	12.5 x 9.375 in.	27 COM	650'	175'	\$89.09	\$178.18			
8	Battery with BCI Group: 27F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 710, Reserve Capacity Rating: 120	40							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7527F	12.375 x 9 in.	27F	710'	120'	\$86.39	\$3,455.60			
9	Battery with BCI Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 435	850							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7271FT	20.75 x 10 in.	8D	1425'	440'	\$208.58	\$177,293.00			
10	Battery with BCI Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 200	1000							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7234	13 x 9.5 in.	31D	1300'	200'	\$95.03	\$95,030.00			
11	Battery with BCI Group: 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 200	10							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7235	13 x 9.5 in.	31E	1300'	200'	\$95.03	\$950.30			
12	Battery with BCI Group: 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 120	10							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7565	12 x 7.625 in.	65'	850'	150'	\$86.39	\$863.90			
13	Battery with BCI Group: GT9-R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve Capacity Rating: 37	12							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 8224	7.75 x 7.25 in.	GT9-R	235'	37'	\$29.15	\$349.80			





A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS			Rubberedge LLC.							Sims Radiator							Springs & Suspension							Rush Truck Centers						
Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)			911R-72-Rubberedge-\$1126.68 ea. , 1x4 1/2 TBA T Bold Assembly \$11.10 ea.							Price Sheet 1(See Attached) 10%-MD/HD Truck & Bus (Northern, One Stop Cooling, Thermal Solution), Price Sheet 2(See Attached)-Industrial/Specialty, Price Sheet 3 (See Attached)- AG/Off Highway pricing							See Thumb drive marked "Price Sheets". We sell many parts to list.							Cummins (CE)-10%, Cummins (CX)-8%, Int'l (IH)-25%, CAT (CT)-10%, DCL(Roadwarrior)-15%, Fleetguard (153)-Rebate, Stemco (STM)-30%, Isuzu (IZ)-20%, Wheels (Gunitel/Accuride)-15%, Int'l (151)Delco-20%, Bendix (IBW)-18%, Mobil-15%, Northern Radiator-30%, PAI-20%, Rig Tough A/C R51(MEI)-30%, RPP (Diesel Forward)-30%						
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)			Above pricing includes 7 1/2% quantity discount & includes free freight to your location. Two or more sets have to be ordered at one time for above pricing to be in effect. * 1 set equals 2 rubber edges.							10%							0%							See % on above products.						
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES																														
Item No.	Item Description	Estimated No. of Units	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount
1	Battery with BCI Group: 24, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity Rating: 115	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Fleetrite	31'	700'	190'	\$113.99	\$6,839.40
2	Battery with BCI Group: 24F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 675, Reserve Capacity Rating: 115	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Fleetrite	31'	660'	160'	\$80.99	\$323.96
3	Battery with BCI Group: 78-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Exide	78'	630'	100'	\$98.77	\$2,963.10
4	Battery with BCI Group: 4DLT, Cold Cranking Ranking: 820, Reserve Capacity Rating: 250	15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Fleetrite	4D	1000'	295'	\$151.61	\$2,274.15
5	Battery with BCI Group: 4D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 320	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Fleetrite	8D	1400'	450'	\$220.00	\$6,600.00
6	Battery with BCI Group: 51, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve Capacity Rating: 75	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						#VALUE!
7	Battery with BCI Group: 27COM, Cold Cranking Ranking: 650, Reserve Capacity Rating: 130	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						#VALUE!
8	Battery with BCI Group: 27F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 710, Reserve Capacity Rating: 120	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						#VALUE!
9	Battery with BCI Group: 8D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 435	850	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Fleetrite	8D	1400'	450'	\$220.00	\$187,000.00
10	Battery with BCI Group: 31D, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 200	1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						#VALUE!
11	Battery with BCI Group: 31E, Cold Cranking Ranking: 1300, Reserve Capacity Rating: 200	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						#VALUE!
12	Battery with BCI Group: 65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 120	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Fleetrite	65'	850'	150'	\$115.66	\$1,156.60
13	Battery with BCI Group: GT9-R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 235, Reserve Capacity Rating: 37	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						#VALUE!











A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS			IEH Auto Parts LLC. dba Auto Plus Auto Parts							Auto Zone Parts							Barber Auto Air							Irish Plus LLC dba Batteries Plus						
Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)			Motorcraft, Motormite, National Seals, Permatex, Power Brake Exchange, Prestone, Proline Products, Pro Select by Wai Global, Quick Steer Chassis, Radiator Specialty, Sealed Power, Spectra Fuel Tanks, Standard Engine mgmt., Standard Wire, Techsmart, Tru-Flate, Valvoline, Velvac, Wagner Friction, Lighting, OEX Pads, Quick Stop & drums & rotors, Walker Exhaust, WD-40, Webb Wheel Wilmar Tool, Wilson Electrical, Wix Filters, Dorman,Ecco,Edelmann,Euclid,Fel-Pro,Forney,4 Seasons,Gates, Grote, Ideal Clamps,Monroe,Moog, & Motorad (Please see bid for entire list of products)							See Attached in bid							Carrier-CD, Trans/Air-CD, Kysor-CD							East Penn/Duracell/Magna Power/Crown Batt./Optima						
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)			List less 45%-80% depending on product (please see bid)							0%							No Discount							10%-60% (Please see bid)						
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES																														
Item No.	Item Description	Estimated No. of Units	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount
14	Battery with BCI Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve Capacity Rating: 55	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	22FC	22f	450'	77'	\$133.99	\$269.98	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn BNC Magna Power	22F	425'	65 min.	\$65.50	\$131.00
15	Battery with BCI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity Rating: 180	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A						#VALUE!	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	30H	650'	150 min.	\$87.30	\$5,238.00
16	Battery with Group # 31T: Part # N9931TYEL, CCA 900, CA 1125, Reserve Capacity Rating: 155	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		D31T	31T	900'	155'	\$379.99	\$75,988.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	Duracell	31AGM	925'	190 min.	\$247.30	\$49,460.00
17	Battery with BCI Group: 58R-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 80	25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	58RDL	58R	730'	80'	\$120.69	\$3,017.25	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	58R	580'	85 min.	\$68.00	\$1,700.00
18	Battery with BCI Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	75DL	75'	630'	95'	\$120.69	\$12,069.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	75'	650'	90 min.	\$68.50	\$6,850.00
19	Battery with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	H8-DLG	49'	850'	155'	\$155.89	\$1,558.90	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	49'	900'	185 min.	\$122.50	\$1,225.00
20	Battery with BCI Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 165	600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	65DLG	65'	850'	150'	\$145.39	\$87,234.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	65'	850'	150 min.	\$91.00	\$54,600.00
21	Battery with BCI Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	56DL	56'	590'	95'	\$120.69	\$6,034.50	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	55'	540'	75 min.	\$75.80	\$3,790.00
22	Battery with BCI Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	59DL	59'	590'	100'	\$120.69	\$3,620.70	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	59'	590'	100'	\$89.90	\$2,697.00
23	Battery with BCI Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	96RDLG	96R	590'	95'	\$145.39	\$4,361.70	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	96R	600'	90 min.	\$92.30	\$2,769.00
24	Battery with Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 690, Reserve Capacity Rating: 110	400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	H6-DLG	48'	730'	115'	\$155.89	\$62,356.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	48'	680'	120 min.	\$97.50	\$39,000.00
25	Battery with Group: 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	34DLG	34'	800'	105'	\$145.39	\$14,539.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	East Penn Duracell	34'	690'	110 min.	\$78.00	\$7,800.00
26	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	H8-AGM	H8	1000'	170'	\$180.59	\$90,295.00	N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	East Penn Duracell	49'	900'	185 min.	\$121.50	\$60,750.00
27	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 770, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Duralast	H6-AGM	H6	760'	120'	\$180.59	\$90,295.00	N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	East Penn Duracell	48'	730'	120'	\$105.40	\$52,700.00
28	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity Rating: None at this time.	70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Odyssey	31-925S	31'	925'	N/A	\$321.99	\$22,539.30	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	Duracell	31AGM	925'	190 min.	\$247.30	\$17,311.00
29	Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880	70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Optima	DH7	DH7	880'		\$349.99	\$24,499.30	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	Optima	DH7	880'	155 min.	\$331.50	\$23,205.00









A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS			Jerry Pate Turf & Irrigation, Inc.							Jim Ellis Chevrolet							Lashley Kubota							McGee Co.						
<i>Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)</i>			Toro OEM Parts -MSRP-DeKalb Price on thumb drive/Toro Performance Parts OEM-Everyday low price							General Motor Parts							Lashley Kubota							Request online shipping & pricing at <a href="https://shop.mcgeecompany.com">https://shop.mcgeecompany.com</a>						
<i>State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)</i>			Toro has a price increase every Nov. 1st which will also be implemented to DeKalb. In the event that Toro initiates any price increases other than the annual price increase, we will inform DeKalb of that change and submit a new price list at that time.							Cost + 15%							10% on the following: Kubota, Land Pride, Bush Hog,ASV,DuroForce Rubber Tracks,Toro,Echo,Alamo,Kohler,Kawasaki,Briggs & Stratton,Perkins & New Holland							0%						
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES																														
Item No.	Item Description	Estimated No. of Units	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount
14	Battery with BCI Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve Capacity Rating: 55	2							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!							#VALUE!
15	Battery with BCI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity Rating: 180	60							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
16	Battery with Group # 31T: Part # N9931TYEL, CCA 900, CA 1125, Reserve Capacity Rating: 155	200							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
17	Battery with BCI Group: 58r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 80	25							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
18	Battery with BCI Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	100							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
19	Battery with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	10							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
20	Battery with BCI Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 165	600							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
21	Battery with BCI Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	50							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
22	Battery with BCI Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	30							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
23	Battery with BCI Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	30							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
24	Battery with Group:48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 690, Reserve Capacity Rating: 110	400							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
25	Battery with Group: 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	100							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
26	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	500							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
27	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 770, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	500							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
28	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity Rating: None at this time.	70							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	
29	Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880	70							#VALUE!							#####							#VALUE!						#VALUE!	

A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS										McNeilus Truck & Mfg.						MHC Kenworth						Mobile Hydraulics of GA, Inc.						Napa Auto Parts					
Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)										McNeilus Truck & Mfg.						Exide 925cca Batteries						Gates & Intertraco-Key Drive Price Sheet, 30% off reg. Pre-(Hose & Fittings), Brennan Inc.-Adapters, 30% off reg.prc., Midland Mfg.-30% off Regular Price						Please see attached sheet in bid.					
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)										Please see attached list of parts with pricing in bid.						45% discount						30% off reg. price/Pre 1 (Key Drive Price Sheet)											
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES																																	
Item No.	Item Description	Estimated No. of Units	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount			
14	Battery with BCI Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve Capacity Rating: 55	2							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 6526R	8.75 x 8 in.	22F	450'	55'	\$70.19	\$140.38			
15	Battery with BCI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity Rating: 180	60							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7218	13 x 9.5 in.	30H	700'	180'	\$101.15	\$6,069.00			
16	Battery with Group # 31T: Part # N9931TYEL, CCA 900, CA 1125, Reserve Capacity Rating: 155	200							#VALUE!	Exide Batteries	Group 31	925cca	180'	\$75.00	\$15,000.00								\$0.00	East Penn Legend N9931TYEL	12.8125 x 9.375 in.	31T	900'	155'	\$295.09	\$59,018.00			
17	Battery with BCI Group: 58R-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 80	25							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7558R	10 x 6.875 in.	58R60	580'	85'	\$86.39	\$2,159.75			
18	Battery with BCI Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	100							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7575	9.75 x 7.25 in.	75 (60)	650'	90'	\$86.39	\$8,630.90			
19	Battery with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	10							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7549	13.9375 x 7.5 in.	49(40)	900'	185'	\$86.39	\$863.90			
20	Battery with BCI Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 165	600							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7565	12 x 7.625 in.	BXT65	850'	165'	\$86.39	\$863.90			
21	Battery with BCI Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	50							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7556	8.75 x 8.5 in.	56'	580'	90'	\$86.39	\$863.90			
22	Battery with BCI Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	30							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7559	9.5 x 7.5 in.	59'	590'	100'	\$86.39	\$2,591.70			
23	Battery with BCI Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	30							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7596R	9.5625 x 6.875 in..	96R	600'	95'	\$101.51	\$3,045.30			
24	Battery with Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 690, Reserve Capacity Rating: 110	400							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7548	11 x 7.5 in.	48'	690'	120'	\$87.47	\$34,988.00			
25	Battery with Group: 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	100							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 7534	10.75 x 8 in.	34'	690'	110'	\$86.39	\$8,639.00			
26	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	500							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 9849	13.9375 x 7.5 in.	49(940)	850'	170'	\$159.25	\$79,625.00			
27	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 770, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	500							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 9848	7.5 x 6.875 in.	48'	770'	120'	\$116.63	\$58,315.00			
28	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity Rating: None at this time.	70							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 9835	13 x 9.5 in.	31'	925'	190'	\$186.44	\$13,078.80			
29	Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880	70							#VALUE!							#VALUE!							#VALUE!	East Penn Legend 9894R	12.4375 x 7.5 in.	DH7	880'	140'	\$144.60	\$10,122.00			











A. COMMODITIES AND SERVICES FOR ALL PARTS		West ChathamWarning Devices Inc.								The WW Williams Co. LLC								Yancey Brothers, Co.							
Type of Price List (Manufacturer/Brand of Product Offered)		Whelen-47% off list, Whelen price list PL22.1WL/ Setina-20% off list, Setina 22 price list/ Go Rhino, 25% off list, Go Rhino list updated 2112/ Havis-30% off list (except ballistic armour & apple products), Havis MSRP 3/2/22 VII/ Progard-25% off list, progard 2022 price guide/ Tuffy-15% off list, Tuffy list price effective 33122/ Gamber-20% off list, Gamber 2022 price list/ Federal-30% off list, 2022 Police price book/ Labor \$75/hr. at any of the 5 locations.								Meritor truck parts, Allison Trans., Active Radiator,heat exchange pts,Spectra Prem.Radiator, RedDot Air heavy duty A/C parts, Denso Electrics, Bendix Air prod., Easton Powertrain prod., Yanmar Engine parts, Daimler Mascot Pwrtrain & Weller differential & steering gear, Gates belts Leece Neville Rotating Electric, Dorman HD \Solutions, Bostrom & N'l Seating, All makes aftermarket heavy duty on and off hwy. truck & equip. parts															
State Discount % Under List Price (Cost Plus)		0%								10%								0%							
B. COMMODITIES OR SERVICES FOR BATTERIES																									
Item No.	Item Description	Estimated No. of Units	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount	Manufacturer & Brand Name	Battery Size	BCI	Cold Cranking Ranking	Reserve Capacity Ranking	Unit Price	Total Amount		
14	Battery with BCI Group: 22F, Cold Cranking Ranking: 450, Reserve Capacity Rating: 55	2	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
15	Battery with BCI Group: 30H, Cold Cranking Ranking: 700, Reserve Capacity Rating: 180	60	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Caterpillar	31/30H	3T-5760	750'	165'	\$178.85	\$10,731.00		
16	Battery with Group # 31T: Part # N9931TYEL, CCA 900, CA 1125, Reserve Capacity Rating: 155	200	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
17	Battery with BCI Group: 58r-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 80	25	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
18	Battery with BCI Group: 75-60, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	100	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
19	Battery with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	10	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
20	Battery with BCI Group: BXT65, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 165	600	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
21	Battery with BCI Group: 56, Cold Cranking Ranking: 580, Reserve Capacity Rating: 90	50	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
22	Battery with BCI Group: 59, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	30	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
23	Battery with BCI Group: 96R, Cold Cranking Ranking: 590, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	30	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
24	Battery with Group:48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 690, Reserve Capacity Rating: 110	400	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
25	Battery with Group: 34, Cold Cranking Ranking: 630, Reserve Capacity Rating: 100	100	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
26	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 49-940, Cold Cranking Ranking: 850, Reserve Capacity Rating: 140	500	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
27	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 48, Cold Cranking Ranking: 770, Reserve Capacity Rating: 95	500	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
28	Battery AGM with BCI Group: 31, CA 1000, CCA 880, Reserve Capacity Rating: None at this time.	70	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		
29	Battery Optima with BCI Group: DH7, CA 1000, CA1000, CCA 880	70	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							#VALUE!		

Agent Tammy Shew Witness Tynia Anu Umoru

\* All Vendors recommended for award