ITB No. 17-100840
ITB Name: Meter Boxes and Lids

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

Bid Opening: September 27, 2017

Price Schedule Opening: October 10, 2017

Agent: DeValory Donahue

Company Delta Municipal Supply Fortiline Waterworks FM Shelton
Estimated # | Unit of
ITEM DESCRIPTION of Units Measure Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Box, meter, cast iron, to include lid,
1 size 207 x 10” x 167, 1,500 Each $ 59.15( $ 88,725.00 | $ 83.88 | $125,820.00 | $ 6496 | $ 97,440.00
Lid, only, meter box, cast iron, size
2 [20-inchx 10”x 167, 2,000 Each $ 1751 $ 35,020.00| $ 1943 | $ 38,860.00 | $ 1960 [ $ 39,200.00
Box, meter, cast iron, to include lid,
3 |227x16”x16”, 200 Each $ 88.89| $ 17,778.00 | $ 97.77 [ $ 19,554.00 | $ 98.56 | $ 19,712.00
Lid, only, meter box, cast iron, 22” x
4 16” x 167, to fit Item No. 3 200 Each $ 36.01| $ 7,202.00| $ 3999 |$ 7,998.00 (% 3096 | $ 7,992.00
Box, meter, oval, polymer, to
include polymer lid, size 12” x 19” x
5 187, 5000 Each $ 92.741 $ 463,700.00 | $ 97.42 | $ 487,100.00 No Bid
Lid, meter box, polymer only, size
6 197 x 10”7 x 2”, to fit tem No 5 & 7, 2500 Each $ 4851 $ 121,275.00 | $ 52.59 | $ 131,475.00 | No Bid No Bid
Box, meter, oval, polymer, size 12”
x 197 x 18 100 Each | $ 39.28( $ 3,928.00 | $ 43.10 | $ 44,310.00 | No Bid No Bid
Security Brass Lock Extra Long. 200 Each | $ 10.35( $ 2,070.00 | $ 11.28 | $ 2,256.00 | No Bid No Bid
9 |Brass Key for Standard DFW Lock. 200 Each $ 890 $ 1,780.00| $ 952 |%$ 1,904.00 | No Bid No Bid
10 |Screw Driver for 2 }2” Security Bolt. 200 Each $ 13.78] $ 2,756.00 | $ 15.08 | $ 3.016.00 | No Bid No Bid
11 |2 %” Security Bolt. 200 Each $ 225 $ 450.00 | $ 246 | $ 492.00 | No Bid No Bid
TOTAL S 744,684.00) $ 862,785.00 $ 164,344.00
Number of Bids Received: 4 o
Number of Solicitation Notifications Sent: 7
Number of Bids Received on Previous Solicitation: 4
Addendum 1
LSBE 20% Good Faith Effort 100%
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes

Recommend Award to :
Delta Municipal Supply Company, 408 Jesse Cronic Road, Braselton, GA 30517

NOTES - DETAIL JUSTIFICATION

Core and Main (4th bidder) was deemed non-responsive for qualifying their bid by taking exception to several County terms and conditions.

Witness Signature: D&lialory Donatiue

Agent Signature: Aykeen Brictsl

Purchasing Director Signature:

BOC Award Approval Date:




