
ITB No: 20-101218
ITB Name: LAW ENFORCEMENT ACCESSORIES

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING: 02/13/2020
PRICE OPENING: 02/24/2020

TECHNICIAN: LOLA AWONUSI 

ITEM 
No. Commodities/Services

Estimated 
Quantities Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1
Blackinton Badge, Part# B550; numbered, pin and 
latch on back, Color: Rhodium finish, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on 21

20 $49.59 $991.80 $41.26 $825.20 $51.25 $1,025.00

2

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B550, with two scrolls, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, 
no substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
21.

20 $72.77 $1,455.40 $60.58 $1,211.60 $75.50 $1,510.00

3

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B550, with two scrolls, Color: Rhodium 
Finish, no substitutes, see minimum specifications 
on page 21.

20 $49.59 $991.80 $43.74 $874.80 $51.25 $1,025.00

4

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, with scroll to read: Police, Color: 
Rhodium finish, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 22.

20 $40.79 $815.80 $34.26 $685.20 $42.50 $850.00

5

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, scroll to read: Sergeant, Color: Hi-
Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications on 
page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

6

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, scroll to read: Lieutenant; Color: 
Hi-Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications 
on page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

7

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750; scroll to read: Captain, Color:  Hi-
Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications on 
page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

8

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, scroll to read: Major, Color:  Hi-
Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications on 
page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

Company: Dana Safety SupplyGT Distributors Inc. Galls LLC
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9

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, scroll to read: Assistant Chief, 
Color: Hi-Glo, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

10

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, scroll to read: Chief; Color: Hi-
Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications on 
page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

11

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, Scroll to read: Honor Guard, 
Color: Hi-Glo, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 22. 

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

12

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B750, Scroll to read: Chaplain, Color:  
Hi-Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications 
on page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

13

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B957, with four scrolls, scroll to read: 
Detective, Color: Hi Glo finish, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications page 22. 

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

14

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B957, with four scrolls, scroll to read: 
Sergeant, Color: Hi Glo finish, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

15

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B957, with four scrolls, scroll to read: 
Lieutenant, Color: Hi Glo finish, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00
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16
Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B957; with four scrolls, scroll to read: 
Captain, Color: Hi Glo finish, no substitutes, 

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

17

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B957, with four scrolls, scroll to read: Major, 
Color: Hi Glo finish, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

18

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B957; with four scrolls, scroll to read:  
Assistant Chief, Color: Hi Glo finish, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

19

Blackinton Badge with DeKalb County Police Seal, 
Part# B957, with four scrolls, scroll to read: Chief, 
Color: Hi Glo finish, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 22. 

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

20

Blackinton Cap Badge with DeKalb County Police 
Seal, Part# B957, Scroll to read: Chaplain; Color: 
Hi-Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications 
on page 22.

20 $63.09 $1,261.80 $49.43 $988.60 $65.50 $1,310.00

21 Memorial Ribbons, (Black w/ Blue Line),no 
substitutes see minimum specifications on page 22. 20 $3.44 $68.80 $ No Bid $ No bid $0.75 $15.00

22
Blackinton Insignia Collar, Part# A10544, Cutout 
Brass, Size: 5/16", Color: Gold, no substitutes see 
minimum specifications on page 22.

20 $9.80 $196.00 $8.66 $173.20 $9.40 $188.00
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23
Blackinton Insignia Collar, Part# A10544, Cutout 
Brass, Size: 5/16", Color: Silver, no substitutes see 
minimum specifications on page 22.

50 $9.80 $490.00 $8.66 $433.00 $9.40 $470.00

24
Blackinton Insignia Collar for Marshal’s Office, 
Part#A10544, Cutout Brass, Size: 5/16", Color: 
Gold, no substitutes.

50 $9.80 $490.00 $8.66 $433.00 $9.40 $470.00

25

Blackinton Medal of Honor Part# A4558, DeKalb 
Top Bar Part# A8392, Police Seal Part# C7315, 
Color: Red, White & Blue, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 23.

50 $60.92 $3,046.00 $54.89 $2,744.50 $49.75 $2,487.50

26

Blackinton Exceptional Merit Part# A6777, Medal 
Part# A1786, Top Bar Part# A478, DeKalb Police 
Seal Part# C7315, Color: Enamel Bar, Blue and 
White, no substitutes, see minimum specifications 
on page 23.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $70.36 $3,518.00 $80.50 $4,025.00

27

Blackinton Meritorious Service Part# A6777, 
Bronze Medal Part# A1786, Top Bar Part# A478, 
DeKalb Police Seal Part# C7315, Color: Enamel 
Bar, Green and White, no substitutes, see minimum  
specifications on page 24.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $70.36 $3,518.00 $80.50 $4,025.00

28

Blackinton Insignia for Chief, Part# J105, Four 
Star, Size: Small, Color: Hi-Glo finish, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
25.

50 $16.26 $813.00 $15.82 $791.00 $17.25 $862.50

29

Blackinton Insignia for Chief, Part# J105, Four 
Star, Size: Large, Color: Hi-Glo finish, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
25.

25 $16.26 $406.50 $15.82 $395.50 $18.25 $456.25
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30

Blackinton Insignia for Assistant Chief, Part# J101, 
Two Star, Size: Small, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
25.

25 $9.74 $243.50 $9.64 $241.00 $10.50 $262.50

31

Blackinton Insignia for Colonel, Part# J67, Two 
Star, Size: Large, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
25.

25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $4.85 $121.25

32

Blackinton Insignia for Major, Part# J66, Clover, 
Size: Large, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 25.

25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $4.85 $121.25

33
Blackinton Insignia for Major, Part# J65, Clover, 
Size: Small, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 25.

25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $4.85 $121.25

34 Blackinton Insignia for Captain, Part# J64,  Double 
Bars, Size: Large, Color: Hi-Glo finish,  25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $4.85 $121.25

35

Blackinton Insignia for Captain, Part# J63, Double 
Bars, Size: Small, Color: Hi-Glo finish, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
26.

25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $4.85 $121.25

36
Blackinton Insignia for Lieutenant, Part# J62, Bar, 
Size: Large, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 26.

25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $4.85 $121.25

37
Blackinton Insignia for Lieutenant; Part# J61, Bar, 
Size: Small, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 26.

25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $4.85 $121.25
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38
Blackinton or Premier Insignia for Sergeant, Part# 
7-419, Color: Hi-Glo Finish, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 26.

25 $4.52 $106.25 $4.46 $111.50 $ No bid $ No bid

39

Blackinton or Premier Insignia Master Officer, Hi-
Glo finish military style silver cross pistols, Part# I-
5078S, no substitutes, see minimum specifications 
on page 26.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

40

Blackinton 1 Cross Life Saving, Part# A8074A, has 
three sections: two outside sections: red, center 
section: white with red crosses, no substitutes see 
minimum specifications on page 27.

10 $12.03 $120.30 $11.04 $111.50 $11.90 $119.00

41

Blackinton 2 Crosses Life Saving, Part# A8074A, 
has three sections: two outside sections: red, center 
section: white with red crosses, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 27.

10 $12.03 $120.30 $11.04 $110.40 $11.90 $119.00

42

Blackinton 3 Crosses Life Saving; Part# A8074B, 
has three sections: two outside sections: red, center 
section: white with red crosses, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 27.

10 $12.03 $120.30 $11.04 $110.40 $11.90 $119.00

43
Blackinton Merit of Honor, Part# A6230B,Colors: 
Gold Trim, Red, Ivory & Blue, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 28.

20 $11.15 $223.00 $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

44

Blackinton "Certificate of merit", Part# A8105, 
Color: Gold Trim, Navy-Red-Ivory-Red-Navy, no 
substitutes, see minimum specifications on page 
28.

10 $11.15 $111.50 $11.04 $110.40 $11.90 $119.00
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45
Blackinton Meritorious Service, Part# A6777, 
Color: Gold Trim, Green and White, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 28.

20 $11.15 $223.00 $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

46
Blackinton Exceptional Merit; Part# A6777, Color: 
Gold Trim, Blue and White, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 28. 

20 $11.15 $223.00 $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

47

Blackinton Field Training Officer, Part# A8107, 
Color: Silver Trim Bars and Lettering, Green 
background with White Center, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 29.

20 $11.15 $223.00 $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

48

Blackinton Driving Pin, Part# A8106, Color: Gold 
Trim and White Number: White, Green, White, 
Green, White, no substitutes see minimum 
specifications on page 29.

10 $11.15 $111.50 $11.04 $110.40 $11.90 $119.00

49

Blackinton Shooting Pin, Part# A8167, with 1 Star, 
Size: 88-92, Color: Gold Trim and Star with Green 
Background, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 29.

20 $11.15 $223.00 $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

50

Blackinton Shooting Pin, Part# A8167A, with 2 
Stars, Size: 93-99, Color: Gold Trim and Star with 
Green Background, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 29.

20 $ No bid $ No bid $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

51

Blackinton Shooting Pin, Part# A8167B, with 3 
Stars, Size: 100, Color: Gold Trim and Star with 
Green Background, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 29.

20 $ No bid $ No bid $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

52

Blackinton Post Intermediate Certification; Part# 
A346, with 1 Star, Color: Silver Trim and Silver 
Star Background, Blue Enamel Seal, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 30.

25 $12.03 $300.75 $11.04 $276.00 $11.90 $297.50



ITB No: 20-101218
ITB Name: LAW ENFORCEMENT ACCESSORIES

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING: 02/13/2020
PRICE OPENING: 02/24/2020

TECHNICIAN: LOLA AWONUSI 

ITEM 
No. Commodities/Services

Estimated 
Quantities Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

Company: Dana Safety SupplyGT Distributors Inc. Galls LLC

53

Blackinton Post Advance Certification, Part# 
A346B, with 2 Stars, Color: Silver Trim and Silver 
Star Background, Blue Enamel Seal, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 30. 

20 $12.03 $240.60 $11.04 $220.80 $11.90 $238.00

54

Blackinton Post Supervisory Certification, Part# 
A346C with 3 Stars, Color: Silver Trim and Silver 
Star Background, Blue Enamel Seal, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 30.

10 $12.03 $120.30 $11.04 $110.40 $11.90 $119.00

55

Blackinton Post Management Certification, Part# 
A346D, with 4 Stars, Color: Silver Trim and Silver 
Star Background, Blue Enamel Seal, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 30.

10 $12.03 $120.30 $11.04 $110.40 $11.90 $119.00

56

Blackinton Post Executive Certification, Part# 
A346E, with 5 Stars, Color: Silver Trim and Silver 
Star Background, Blue Enamel Seal, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 30.

10 $12.03 $120.30 $11.04 $110.40 $11.90 $119.00

57

Blackinton Badge for Marshal’s Office, Part# 448, 
Color: Hi-Glo with blue block letters, Reading: 
Marshal, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 31.

50 $69.54 $3,477.00 $55.12 $2,756.00 $62.25 $3,112.50

58

Blackinton Badge for Marshal’s Office, Part# 448, 
Color: Hi-Glo with blue block letters, Reading: 
Chief Deputy Marshal, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 31.

50 $69.54 $3,477.00 $55.12 $2,756.00 $62.25 $3,112.50

59

Blackinton Badge for Marshal’s Office, Part# 448, 
Color: Hi-Glo with blue block letters, Reading: 
Major, no substitutes, see minimum specifications 
on page 31.

25 $69.54 $1,738.50 $55.12 $1,378.00 $62.25 $1,556.25
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60

Blackinton Badge for Marshal’s Office, Part# 448, 
Color: Hi-Glo with blue block letters, Reading:  
Lieutenant, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 31.

25 $69.54 $1,738.50 $55.12 $1,378.00 $62.25 $1,556.25

61

Blackinton Badge for Marshal’s Office, Part# 448, 
Color: Hi-Glo with blue block letters, Reading:  
Deputy Marshal, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 31.

25 $69.54 $1,738.50 $55.12 $1,378.00 $62.25 $1,556.25

62 Blue Gun Glock 17 firearm simulator. No 
substitutes. 20 $38.25 $765.00 $42.61 $852.20 $43.75 $875.00

63 Bianchi Belt Liner, Part# 7205, nylon, Velcro, 
Sizes: XS through XL, or acceptable equal. 25 $18.29 $457.25 $ No Bid $ No bid $21.75 $543.75

64
Bianchi Double Magazine Pouch, Part # 
7302H/7302HS, AccuMold, Color: Black. No 
substitute.

25 $21.34 $533.50 $ No Bid $ No bid $25.25 $631.25

65
Blackhawk Rapid Adjust 2 Point Rifle Sling Nylon 
Black 70GS18BK. No substitutes. 50 $ No bid $ No bid $33.95 $1,697.00 $22.25 $1,112.50

66
DDSP (Doubled-Sided Protectant) 
Armbands/Wristbands w/Hardware, 10” in length. 
No substitutes.

20 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

67 Dutyman Silent Key Holder, Part# 4241N, Nylon, 
adjustable loop, Color: Black, no substitutes. 200 $11.02 $2,204.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $8.50 $1,700.00

68 Dutyman Mace Holder, Part# 736, Nylon, Size: 3 
oz. canister, Color: Black, no substitutes. 200 $10.23 $2,046.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $11.75 $2,350.00

69

Don Hume Garrison Belt, Part# B111BW, with 
chrome or brass hardware, Sizes 28 – 44, or 
acceptable equal.

100 $19.66 $1,966.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $21.00 $2,100.00

70
Don Hume Garrison Belt, Part# B111BW, with 
chrome or brass hardware, Sizes 46 – 48, or 
acceptable equal.

100 $21.63 $2,163.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $23.00 $2,300.00
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71
Don Hume Garrison Belt, Part# B111BW, with 
chrome or brass hardware, Sizes 50 – 52, or 
acceptable equal.

100 $21.63 $2,163.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $23.00 $2,300.00

72
Don Hume Garrison Belt, Part# B111BW, with 
chrome or brass hardware, Sizes 54 – 56, or 
acceptable equal.

100 $23.59 $2,359.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $23.00 $2,300.00

73

Don Hume Garrison Belt, Part# B111BW, with 
chrome or brass hardware, Sizes 58– 60 or 
acceptable equal.

100 $23.59 $2,359.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $25.00 $2,500.00

74
Don Hume Garrison Belt, Part# B111BW, with 
chrome or brass hardware, Sizes 62 – 64 or 
acceptable equal.

100 $23.59 $2,359.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $25.00 $2,500.00

75 First Defense, Spray, Oleoresin Capsicum Aerosol, 
Part# MK-3, Size 1.47 oz., or acceptable equal. 100 $9.88 $988.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $10.75 $1,075.00

76

Intapol Helmet #SD777 with snap on smoked visor, 
quick release chin strap and added padding and 
cushion, with zip-in ear warmer. Color: Black with 
Silver top. No substitutes.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $200.00 $5,000.00

77
Button Hook Chain, Color:  Gold, or acceptable 
equal. 50 $ No bid $ No bid $2.83 $141.50 $2.75 $137.50

78
Premiere Insignia for Chief, Part# P2470, Wreath, 
Color: Hi Glo, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662.50

79
Premiere Insignia for Assistant Chief, Part# P2472, 
Wreath, Color: Hi Glo, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662.50

80
Premiere Insignia for Major, Part# P2476, Wreath, 
Color: Hi Glo, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662.50

81

Premiere Insignia for Captain, Part# P2475, 
Wreath, Color: Hi-Glo, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662.50
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82
Premiere Insignia for Lieutenant, Part# P2474, 
Wreath, Color: High Glo Gold Plate, no substitutes, 
see minimum specifications on page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662.50

83
Premiere Insignia for Sergeant, Wreath, Color: Hi 
Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications on 
page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662.50

84
Premiere Insignia for Chaplain, Wreath, Color: Hi 
Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications on 
page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662..50

85

Premiere Insignia for Director, Wreath, Color: Hi 
Glo, no substitutes, see minimum specifications on 
page 31.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.13 $606.50 $13.25 $662.50

86 Peerless Handcuff, Part# 801B, Hinged Model, 
Color: Chrome finish, no substitutes. 25 $ No Bid $ No bid $33.07 $826.75 $31.00 $775.00

87 Peerless Handcuff, Part# 801C, Hinged models 
with 2 keys. Color: Nickel finish, no substitutes. 50 $28.13 $1,406.50 $33.07 $1,653.50 $31.00 $1,550.00

88
Sabre Red O.C. Pepper Spray DPS 2.5 oz. cone, 
Part# 520020-C, 10 percent in canister, no 
substitutes.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $10.16 $508.00 $10.50 $525.00

89

Safariland Baton Holder, Part# 67, basket weave, 
Color: Chrome with brass hardware and black 
snaps, or acceptable equal.

50 $7.21 $360.50 $ No Bid $ No bid $8.50 $425.00

90
Safariland Radio Carrying Case with Swivel, Part# 
762-5-4, basket weave, Color: Black, or acceptable 
equal.

100 $31.32 $3,132.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $37.00 $3,700.00

91 Safariland Case for latex gloves, Part# SAF33-4V, 
Basket Weave, Color: Black, or acceptable equal. 100 $12.98 $1,289.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $23.50 $2,350.00
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92
Safariland Reversible Belt, Part# 99, basket weave, 
Velcro lined, no buckle, 1-3/4” wide, Size: X-
small, X-large, Color: Black,  no substitutes.

100 $24.67 $2,467.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $29.00 $2,900.00

93

Safariland Reversible Belt, Part# 99, basket weave, 
Velcro lined, no buckle, 1-3/4” wide, Size: 2X-
large, 3X-large, Color: Black,  no substitutes.

100 $30.21 $3,021.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $29.00 $2,900.00

94
Safariland Heavy Duty Key Holder, Part# 168-4, 
basket weave, Color: Black with brass or chrome 
snaps, or acceptable equal.

100 $10.81 $1,081.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $12.75 $1,275.00

95

Safariland Double Magazine Pouch, Part# 77-83-
4V, basket weave, with a velcro fastener and auto 
clip, Color: Black Finish, for Glock Model No. 19 
Semi-Auto Pistol, or acceptable equal.

50 $26.05 $1,302.50 $ No Bid $ No bid $20.00 $1,000.00

96
Safariland Belt Keeper, Part# 65-4-4PBL, 
Basketweave, Color: Black, Size: 2-1/4”, no 
substitute.

100 $8.87 $887.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $17.00 $1,700.00

97
Safariland Key Holder, Part# SAF170-4, basket 
weave, Color: Black, no substitutes. 100 $16.35 $1,635.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $19.00 $1,900.00

98
Safariland Handcuff Case, Part# SAF90-4B, basket 
weave with brass snap, Color: Black, no 
substitutes.

100 $23.84 $2,384.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $23.25 $2,325.00

99 Safariland Pager/Glove Holder, Part# 768-2-4PBL, 
basket weave, Color: Black, no substitutes. 100 $19.96 $1,996.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

100 Safariland Double Magazine Holder, Part# 77-83-
4HS, basket weave, Color: Black, no substitutes. 100 $26.05 $2,605.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $30.25 $3,025.00

101

Safariland Level II Retention Duty Holster, Part# 
6280, Color: Black, tactical, Mid-Ride, or 
acceptable equal. 

100 $84.76 $8,476.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $143.00 $14,300.00
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102
Safariland ALS Level III Duty Holster, Part# 6360 
with light Color: Black, tactical, Mid-Ride. No 
substitutes.

1000 $102.75 $102,750.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $162.00 $162,000.00

103 Safariland Holster SAF-6360-832-411 – Level III 
Retention RH w/TLR 100 $102.75 $10,275.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $129.00 $12,900.00

104 Safariland Holster SAF-6360-832-412 - Level III 
Retention LH w/TLR 100 $102.75 $10,275.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $129.00 $12,900.00

105
Safariland Holster SAF-6360-83-411 – ALS 
Holster RH STX Finish 100 $93.60 $9,360.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $118.00 $11,800.00

106 Safariland Holster SAF-6360-83-412 – ALS 
Holster LH STX Finish 100 $93.60 $9,360.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $118.00 $11,800.00

107
Samuel Broom Metal Clip-on Ties, Part# 90057, 
100% polyester woven, Color: black, Size: 14”, no 
substitutes.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $3.75 $187.50

108
Samuel Broom Metal Clip-on Ties, Part# 90016, 
100% polyester woven, Color: black, Size: 18”, no 
substitutes. 

100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $3.75 $375.00

109

Samuel Broom Metal Clip-on Ties, Part# 90049, 
100% polyester woven, Color: black, Size: 20”, no 
substitutes.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $3.85 $192.50

110
Samuel Broom Metal Clip-on Ties, Part# 90063, 
100% polyester woven, Color: black, Size: 22”, no 
substitutes.

25 $  No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $3.95 $98.75

111 Sentry Security Tuff Ties Restraints, no substitutes 30 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $1.50 $45.00

112

Strong Holster Company Badge Holder, Part# 
71200-0002 3, Leather, snap closure, 3” oval shape 
clip-on. Color: Black, Size: 2 ¼” x 3 1/8”, or 
acceptable equal.

30 $3.99 $119.70 $8.16 $244.80 $4.85 $145.50
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113

Strong Badge Case, Part# 86400-019, with Double 
ID, Side Open, with “DeKalb County” over badge 
area and “Police Department” under badge area in 
gold lettering, no substitutes. 

30 $19.68 $590.40 $25.82 $774.60 $26.16 $784.80

114

Strong Leather Co. Badge/Wallet Holder, Part# 
77500-071, Shape – 071, Color:  Black Leather 
Imprinted: DeKalb County, GA Seal Marshal on 
the front, or acceptable equal.

100 $9.49 $949.00 $12.94 $1,294.00 $13.00 $1,300.00

115 Top Line USA round Bag, Part# 639, Size: small, 
no substitutes. 1 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

116
Uncle Mike’s Baton Holder, Part# 7484-2, Mirage 
basket weave, injected molded, for ASP F21C, or 
acceptable equal.

50 $9.92 $496.00 $11.93 $596.50 $11.75 $587.50

117

Uncle Mike’s Tactical Flashlight Holster, Part# 
74187, Mirage basket weave, Black Stinger or 
Pelican M7 or acceptable equal.

50 $11.73 $586.50 $ No Bid $ No bid $14.00 $700.00

118 Uncle Mike’s Black Mirage, Basketweave, Single 
Cuff Case/ with flap, Part# 74782, no substitutes. 50 $14.82 $741.00 $17.83 $891.50 $17.50 $875.00

119 Uncle Mike’s, Magazine/Handcuff Pouch, Part# 
8878-1, no substitutes. 30 $9.92 $297.60 $11.93 $357.90 $11.75 $352.50

120
Uncle Mike’s Outer Ultra Duty Belt with velcro, 
Part# 7092-2, Mirage basket weave, Size: Small, or 
acceptable equal.

50 $27.65 $1,382.50 $33.24 $1,662.00 $32.00 $1,600.00

121

Uncle Mike’s Outer Ultra Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 7093-1, Mirage basket weave, Size: Medium, 
or acceptable equal.

75 $27.65 $2,073.75 $33.24 $2,493.00 $32.00 $2,400.00

122
Uncle Mike’s Outer Ultra Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 7094-1, Mirage basket weave, Size: Large, or 
acceptable equal.

75 $27.65 $2,073.75 $33.24 $2,493.00 $32.00 $2,400.00
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123 Uncle Mike’s Case for Cellular Telephone, Part# 
7453-2, Mirage basket weave, or acceptable equal. 100 $12.59 $1,259.00 $13.86 $1,386.00 $16.00 $1,600.00

124 Uncle Mike’s Case for OC Spray, Part# 7477-
5,Mirage basketweave or acceptable equal. 100 $13.81 $1,381.00 $15.21 $1,521.00 $16.00 $1,600.00

125

Uncle Mike’s Ultra Inner Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 8781-1, Size: X Small-Small, no substitutes. 25 $12.16 $304.00 $13.38 $334.50 $14.25 $356.25

126 Uncle Mike’s Ultra Inner Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 8781-1, Size: Small, no substitutes. 50 $12.16 $608.00 $13.38 $669.00 $14.25 $712.50

127 Uncle Mike’s Ultra Inner Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 8782-1, Size: Medium, no substitutes. 50 $12.16 $608.00 $13.38 $669.00 $14.25 $712.50

128 Uncle Mike’s Ultra Inner Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 8782-1, Size: Large, no substitutes. 50 $12.16 $608.00 $13.38 $669.00 $14.25 $712.50

129
Uncle Mike’s Ultra Inner Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 8782-1, Size: X-Large, no substitutes. 50 $12.16 $608.00 $13.38 $669.00 $14.25 $712.50

130 Uncle Mike’s Ultra Inner Duty Belt with Velcro, 
Part# 8782-1, Size: 2X-Large, no substitutes. 50 $12.16 $608.00 $13.38 $669.00 $14.25 $712.50

131
Uncle Mike’s Web Ultra Duty Belt with Hook & 
Loop, Black Nylon, Part# 8776-1, Size: Small, no 
substitutes.

50 $16.64 $608.00 $18.31 $915.50 $18.50 $925.00

132
Uncle Mike’s Web Ultra Duty Belt with Hook & 
Loop, Black Nylon, Part# 8777-1, Size: Medium, 
no substitutes.

50 $16.64 $608.00 $18.31 $915.50 $18.50 $925.00

133

Uncle Mike’s Web Ultra Duty Belt with Hook & 
Loop, Black Nylon, Part# 8778-1, Size:  Large, no 
substitutes.

50 $16.64 $608.00 $18.31 $915.50 $18.50 $925.00

134
Uncle Mike’s Web Ultra Duty Belt with Hook & 
Loop, Black Nylon, Part# 8779-1, Size: X- Large, 
no substitutes.

50 $16.64 $608.00 $18.31 $915.50 $18.50 $925.00

135
Uncle Mike’s Web Ultra Duty Belt with Hook & 
Loop, Black Nylon, Part# 8779-2, Size: 2X-Large, 
no substitutes.

50 $16.64 $608.00 $18.31 $915.50 $22.00 $1,100.00
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136 Uncle Mike’s Nylon Belt Keeper, Part# 8865-2 
Size: Small, no substitutes. 50 $7.15 $357.50 $7.87 $393.50 $8.25 $412.50

137
Uncle Mike’s Case for Pager, Part# 8552-1, 
Cordura nylon, Size: small, no substitutes. 50 $9.44 $472.00 $ no bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

138 Ballistic ASP Belt Loop Rotating Sidebreak 
Scabbard for 26”, Model# 52635, no substitute. 100 $34.66 $3,466.00 $35.06 $3,506.00 $38.50 $3,850.00

139 Davis & Stanton Police Award Pin: Patrol Rifle # 
J809.  No substitutions. 25 $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $11.75 $293.75

140 Wreck Rulers Template Kit, Part# HS082, dual 
scale, no substitutes. 75 $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

141
Police Patch, Large, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 32. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $1.35 $135.00

142 Police Patch, Medium, no substitutes, see 
minimum specifications on page 32. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $1.15 $115.00

143 Police Patch, Small, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 32. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $0.85 $85.00

144 Police Oval Badge, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 33. 100 $ No bid $ no bid $1.44 $144.00 $1.15 $115.00

145
Police Oval Badge, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 33. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $1.44 $144.00 $1.15 $115.00

146 Police Oval Patch, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 33. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $1.44 $144.00 $1.15 $115.00

147
DeKalb County Police Patch/w Rocker,“BOMB 
SQUAD”, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 34. 

40 $ No bid $ No bid $1.87 $74.80 $2.50 $100.00

148
DeKalb County Police Patch/w Rocker,“BOMB 
SQUAD”, no substitutes, see minimum 
specifications on page 34.

40 $ No bid $ No bid $1.87 $74.80 $2.50 $100.00

149

Master Police Officer Patch w/Rocker,“MASTER 
OFFICER”, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 34.

500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.26 $630.00 $1.15 $575.00
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150
Master Officer Rocker, Patch,“MASTER 
OFFICER”, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 34.

100 $ No bid $ No bid $1.01 $101.00 $0.80 $80.00

151
Master Officer Rocker, Patch,“MASTER 
OFFICER”, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 34.

100 $ No bid $ No bid $1.01 $101.00 $0.80 $80.00

152 S.W.A.T. Patch w/Rocker, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 35. 500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.11 $555.00 $1.05 $525.00

153 S.W.A.T. Patch w/Rocker, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 35. 500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.24 $620.00 $1.15 $575.00

154
S.W.A.T.  Patch w/Rocker, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page . 500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.24 $620.00 $1.15 $575.00

155 DeKalb County Police Patch, Large, no substitutes; 
see minimum specifications on page 37. 500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.06 $530.00 $1.05 $525.00

156 DeKalb County Police Patch, Small, no substitutes; 
see minimum specifications on page 37. 500 $ No bid $ No bid $0.72 $360.00 $0.70 $350.00

157 Narcotics Unit Round Patch, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 37. 500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.06 $530.00 $1.00 $500.00

158 Helicopter Unit Patch, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 37. 200 $ No bid $ No bid $1.06 $212.00 $1.15 $230.00

159
Tactical Response Team Patch, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 38. 500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.24 $620.00 $1.15 $575.00

160 Tactical Response Team Patch, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 38. 75 $ No bid $ No bid $3.67 $275.25 $3.10 $232.50

161 Narcotics Patch w/Rocker, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 39. 75 $ No bid $ No bid $3.67 $275.25 $3.10 $232.50

162 Narcotics Patch w/Rocker, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 39. 75 $ No bid $ No bid $3.67 $275.25 $3.10 $232.50

163
Honor Guard Patch, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 40. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $2.37 $237.00 $1.55 $155.00
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164 DUI Task Force Rocker, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 41. 200 $ No bid $ No bid $0.83 $166.00 $0.72 $144.00

165 DUI Task Force Rocker, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 41. 200 $ No bid $ No bid $0.83 $166.00 $0.72 $144.00

166 K-9 Patch for Strike Force, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 41. 500 $ No bid $ No bid $1.12 $560.00 $0.85 $425.00

167

TAC Unit – Wing and Wheel Patch, no substitutes; 
see minimum specifications on page 41. 200 $ No bid $ No bid $0.91 $182.00 $0.85 $170.00

168 Police Explorer Patches, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 41. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $1.76 $176.00 $1.25 $125.00

169 K-9 Round Patch for Bomb Squad, no substitutes; 
see minimum specifications on page 42. 200 $ No bid $ No bid $1.21 $242.00 $1.15 $230.00

170
Homeland Security Round Patch Gang Unit, no 
substitutes; see minimum specifications on page 
42.

200 $ No bid $ No bid $1.21 $242.00 $1.15 $230.00

171
Chief Four-Star Epaulet, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 43. 20 $ No bid $ No bid $12.76 $255.20 $11.75 $235.00

172 Chief Two Star Epaulet, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 43. 50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.76 $638.00 $11.75 $587.50

173 Homeland / DEMA, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 44. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $1.76 $176.00 $1.30 $130.00

174 Homeland / DEMA, no substitutes; see minimum 
specifications on page 44. 100 $ No bid $ No bid $1.76 $176.00 $1.30 $130.00

175
Whistle, Part# HWC/GPW-1, Color: Gold, or 
acceptable equal. 100 $2.31 $231.00 $2.34 $234.00 $1.90 $190.00

176 Whistle, Part# HWC/NPW-1, Color:  Silver, or 
acceptable equal. 100 $1.92 $192.00 $2.34 $234.00 $1.55 $155.00

177 ASP Chrome Expandable Baton Foam Grip 21”, 
Model#52411, no substitute. 100 $86.28 $8,628.00 $87.28 $8,728.00 $94.00 $9,400.00

178 ASP Chrome Expandable Baton Foam Grip 26”, 
Model#52610, no substitute. 100 $89.75 $8,975.00 $90.78 $9,078.00 $98.00 $9,800.00
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179
Ballistic ASP Belt Loop Rotating Sidebreak 
Scabbard for 21”, Model# 52435, no substitute. 100 $31.19 $3,119.00 $31.56 $3,156.00 $34.00 $3,400.00

180

CRIME SCENE UNIT
Patch, shoulder, “CRIME SCENE 
INVESTIGATION”. Color: Black and Silver; see 
minimum specifications on page 45. 

25 $ No bid $ No bid $1.41 $35.25 $1.30 $32.50

181
SWAT ROCKER, BLACK AND GOLD no 
substitutes; see minimum specifications on page 
45.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $1.41 $35.25 $1.10 $27.50

182
SWAT ROCKER, BLACK AND SILVER no 
substitutes; see minimum specifications on page 
45.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $1.41 $35.25 $1.15 $28.75

183

SERGEANT CHEVRON, Large Patch, no 
substitutes; see minimum specifications on page 
46.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $1.96 $49.00 $1.25 $31.25

184
SERGEANT CHEVRON, Small Patch, no 
substitutes; see minimum specifications on page 
46.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $1.96 $49.00 $1.10 $27.50

185 SERVICE STRIPES, Patch, no substitutes; see 
minimum specifications on page 46. 25 $ No bid $ No bid $0.61 $15.25 $0.75 $18.75

186 Safariland - Bianchi Model, Part #7326 Compact 
Light Holder.  Size 1. No substitutes 100 $10.26 $1,026.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $12.00 $1,200.00

187

Safariland - Bianchi Model:7323, Part #22703 
Adjustable Radio Holder.  Size 1. No substitutes 100 $24.39 $2,439.00 $ No Bid $ No bid $36.50 $3,650.00

188
StreamLight; Strion LED, model #74301; 
Compact, Rechargeable Duty Flashlight W/AC/DC 
Chargers; Black, no substitutes

100 $89.69 $8,969.00 $92.98 $9,298.00 $102.00 $10,200.00

189 StreamLight; Battery Stick (Li-lon), model #74175; 
Replacement Battery for Strion LED light 50 $20.48 $1,024.00 $22.12 $1,106.00 $23.25 $1,162.50
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190

Sergeant Epaulet; shoulder epaulets are to be Black 
with gold embroiderded rank insignia with gold 
stripe on botton; poly,cotton; Size:1 7/8" x 2 1/4" x 
4 1/4". See minimum specifications on page 47.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.76 $638.00 $11.50 $575.00

191

Lieutenant Epaulet; shoulder epaulets are to be 
Black with gold embroiderded rank insignia with 
gold stripe on botton; poly,cotton; Size:1 7/8" x 2 
1/4" x 4 1/4". See minimum specifications on page 
47.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.76 $638.00 $11.50 $575.00

192

Captain Epaulet; shoulder epaulets are to be Black 
with gold embroiderded rank insignia with gold 
stripe on botton; poly,cotton; Size:1 7/8" x 2 1/4" x 
4 1/4". See minimum specifications on page 47.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $12.76 $638.00 $11.50 $575.00

193

Major Epaulet; shoulder epaulets are to be Black 
with gold embroiderded rank insignia with gold 
stripe on botton; poly,cotton; Size:1 7/8" x 2 1/4" x 
4 1/4". See minimum specifications on page 47.

20 $ No bid $ No bid $12.76 $255.20 $11.50 $230.00

194

Chaplain Epaulet; shoulder epaulets are to be Black 
with gold embroiderded rank insignia with gold 
stripe on botton; poly,cotton; Size:1 7/8" x 2 1/4" x 
4 1/4". See minimum specifications on page 47.

20 $ No bid $ No bid $12.76 $255.20 $11.50 $230.00

195

Streamlight-TLR-1 Gun Light; Rail-Mounted 
Tactical Weapon Light; 300 Lumens; Includes keys 
for Glock-style. Picatinny; CR123A Lithium; IPX7 
rated design; Black, no substitutes

100 $99.29 $9,929.00 $104.14 $10,414.00 $114.00 $11,400.00

196 Safariland ALS paddle Holster,Glock; part #6378-
83-411; RH, no substitutes 50 $32.15 $1,607.50 $ No Bid $ No bid $38.00 $1,900.00
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197 Safariland ALS paddle Holster, Glock; part #6378-
83-412; LH, no substitutes 50 $32.15 $1,607.50 $ No Bid $ No bid $38.00 $1,900.00

198 USB to C cable; 6 Ft.; min. 480Mbs, USB 2.0; 
Black 100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

199
USB to Micro-B C; 6 Ft.; min. 480Mbs, USB 2.0; 
Black 100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

200 AC to USB wall charger; Motorola; Model #SSW-
2919UMTJ; Black; no substitutes 100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid

201 DC Cigarette charger; Anker power drive 2; 24W, 
Dual USB car charger adapter; black, no substitutes 100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid

202
External battery pack; model #RP- PB8060; 
RavPower ACE series portable charger, 6700mAh, 
black, no substitutes

100 $ No bid $ No bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No bid $ No bid

203
Galco Miami classic shoulder system-R-Black-
Glock 17; #MC224B; no substitutes 10 $165.63 $1,656.30 $ No Bid $ No bid $172.00 $1,720.00

204 Galco Miami classic shoulder system-L-Black-
Glock 17; #MC225B; no substitutes 10 $165.63 $1,656.30 $ No Bid $ No Bid $172.00 $1,720.00

205 Galco Sc9 cuff case-L- Black; #SC93B; no 
substitutes 10 $39.25 $392.50 $  No Bid $ No bid $37.50 $375.00

206 Galco Sc9 cuff case-R- Black; #SC92B; no 
substitutes 10 $39.25 $392.50 $ No Bid $ No bid $37.50 $375.00

207

Premier Emblem-Commendation 20YR services 
GLD; Part #P4736 Gold Trim, Red 
Background,Two white Diamonds. See minimum 
specifications on page 48.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $4.34 $217.00 $3.60 $180.00

208

Premier Emblem-Commendation 25YR services 
GLD; Part #P4739 Gold Trim, Red 
Background,Two white Diamonds, One white Star. 
See minimum specifications on page 48.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $4.34 $217.00 $3.60 $180.00



ITB No: 20-101218
ITB Name: LAW ENFORCEMENT ACCESSORIES

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING: 02/13/2020
PRICE OPENING: 02/24/2020

TECHNICIAN: LOLA AWONUSI 

ITEM 
No. Commodities/Services

Estimated 
Quantities Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

Company: Dana Safety SupplyGT Distributors Inc. Galls LLC

209

Premier Emblem-Commendation 30YR services 
GLD; Part #P4738 Gold Trim, Red 
Background,Three Ivory Diamonds. See minimum 
specifications on page 48.

30 $ No bid $ No bid $4.34 $130.20 $3.60 $108.00

210

Premier Emblem, Helicopter Unit Patch- Patch, 
round; #APRE21877-14, Size: approx. diameter 4" 
with OD Green background with Black edging and 
lettering; with words DEKALB POLICE in black at 
top; HELICOPTER UNIT in  black at bottom. See 
minimum specifications on page 49.

30 $ No bid $ No bid $2.92 $87.60 $2.25 $67.50

211

Premier Emblem, DEKALB COUNTY POLICE  
PATCH, #A27903-14GM, color: Black & OD 
Green, black background with OD green 
embroidery and edging; with words "DEKALB 
CO" running horizontally in black at top and 
"POLICE" running horizontally in black at bottom; 
with words "SERVICE" and "JUSTICE" running 
vertically on sides; Size:4" high X 3 1/2" wide. See 
minimum specifications on page 49.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $2.92 $146.00 $2.25 $112.50

212

DEKALB COUNTY POLICE  PATCH w/BOMB 
SQUAD Rocker, color: Black & OD Green, black 
background with OD green embroidery and edging; 
with words "DEKALB CO" running horizontally in 
black at top and "POLICE" running horizontally in 
black at bottom; with words "SERVICE" and 
"JUSTICE" running vertically on sides; Size:4 3/4" 
high X 3 1/2" wide. See minimum specifications on 
page 49.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $2.92 $146.00 $2.50 $125.00



ITB No: 20-101218
ITB Name: LAW ENFORCEMENT ACCESSORIES

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING: 02/13/2020
PRICE OPENING: 02/24/2020

TECHNICIAN: LOLA AWONUSI 

ITEM 
No. Commodities/Services

Estimated 
Quantities Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

Company: Dana Safety SupplyGT Distributors Inc. Galls LLC

213

DEKALB COUNTY POLICE  PATCH -w/K-9 
UNIT Rocker, #A17705-14GM color: Black & 
Silver, black background with Silver embroidery 
and edging; with words "DEKALB CO" running 
horizontally in black at top and "POLICE" running 
horizontally in black at bottom; with words 
"SERVICE" and "JUSTICE" running vertically on 
sides; Size:5 3/4" high X 3 3/4" wide. See 
minimum specifications on page 49.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $4.71 $235.50 $3.85 $192.50

214

Blackinton Detective of the Year, Part#BL-A8105-
G, Color: Gold Trim, VHB-52,-DR 6-73,-DR 4-6,-
DR 6-73,-VHB-52. See minimum specifications on 
page 48.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $10.41 $260.25 $12.00 $300.00

215

Blackinton Division Officer of the Year, Part#BL-
A8105-G, Color: Gold Trim, VHB-103,-DR 6-73,-
DR 4-6,-DR 6-73,-VHB-103. See minimum 
specifications on page 48.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $10.41 $260.25 $12.00 $300.00

216

Blackinton Departmental Officer of the Year, Part 
#C17582, Color: Gold Trim, DR 7-5,-DR 4-6,-  
White,-DR 4-6,-DR 7-5, 11-Star DR 4-6 (Center). 
See minimum specifications on page 48.

25 $ No bid $ No bid $10.41 $260.25 $12.00 $300.00

217
Premier Emblem, Dekalb County Police Gang Unit 
3" PVC Circle with Velcro backing; Part# A94951-
19KD. See minimum specifications on page 50.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $4.16 $208.00 $7.75 $397.50

218
Premier Emblem, Dekalb County Police SWAT 
4"PVC Circle with Velcro backing; Part# A91012-
17KDKD. See minimum specifications on page 50.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $5.36 $268.00 $8.45 $422.50



ITB No: 20-101218
ITB Name: LAW ENFORCEMENT ACCESSORIES

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING: 02/13/2020
PRICE OPENING: 02/24/2020

TECHNICIAN: LOLA AWONUSI 

ITEM 
No. Commodities/Services

Estimated 
Quantities Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

Company: Dana Safety SupplyGT Distributors Inc. Galls LLC

219

Premier Emblem, Dekalb County Police Gang Unit, 
shoulder PVC with Velcro backing; 4.5" X 
2.75"Part#. See minimum specifications on page 
50.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $5.36 $268.00 $7.65 $382.50

220

Premier Emblem, Dekalb County Police SWAT 
Unit, shoulder PVC with Velcro backing; 4.5" X 
2.75"Part#. See minimum specifications on page 
50.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $5.36 $268.00 $7.65 $382.50

221
Premier Emblem, Dekalb County Police; shoulder 
PVC with Velcro backing; 4" X 3". See minimum 
specifications on page 50.

50 $ No bid $ No bid $5.36 $268.00 $9.00 $450.00

222

Blackinton  Badge with Dekalb County Police Seal, 
Part # VHB B899; pin and latch on back; Color: 
RHO-GLO/HI-GLO. See minimum specifications 
on page 51.

50 $90.67 $4,533.50 $5.36 $268.00 $94.00 $4,700.00

GT Distributors of Georgia, Inc, 100 McFarland Avenue, Rossville, GA 30741: Items Nos.: 62-64, 68-71, 73-75, 87, 89-92, 94, 96, 97, 99-106, 112-114, 116-138, 177-179, 186-189, 195-197, 203, 204

Witness Signature:

Agent's Signature:

Yes

Smyrna Police Distributors was deemed non-responsive for failure to attend one of the mandatory LSBE meetings.

Yes

Number of Bids Received: 4
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)
LSBE Mandatory Meeting:

Notes:

Yes

Dana Safety Supply, 4729 Nelson Brogdon Boulevard, Sugar Hill, GA 30518: Items Nos: 1-20, 22-24, 26-38, 40-61, 78-85, 88, 147, 148, 158, 185, 214-222
Galls, LLC, 1340 Russell Cave Road, Lexington, KY 405050: Items Nos: 21, 25, 65, 67, 72, 76, 77, 86, 93, 95, 98, 107-111, 139, 141-146, 149-157, 159-176, 180-184, 190-194, 205-213

Recommend award to the lowest, responsive and responsible bidders:

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE: None providedNone provided

Yes
Yes

None provided

Yes
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