ITB No. 21-101359
Name: Variable Speed Drive

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

Price Opening Date: November 24,2021 @10:30 am

Rogers Machinery Company, Inc.

ITEM DESCRIPTION Estimated Number unit of Unit Price Total Price
of Units Measure
1 Variable Speed Drive - Rotary Screw Air Compressor ) EACH $77.000.00 $154.000.00
> Factory filled with Ultra Coolant ) EACH NO BID NO BID
3 Integrated VSD - 460/3/60 Electrics 5 EACH NO BID NO BID
4 XE-70 Microprocessor Controller with ECO Mode 2 EACH NO BID NO BID
5 Standard Low Sound Enclosure 2 EACH NO BID NO BID
6 Mounted Package Pre-Filter ) EACH $665.00 $1,330.00
7 Standard Solenoid Condensate Drain 2 EACH NO BID NO BID
NVC300 230-3-60 Air-Cooled NEMA 1 Nirvana Cycling
8 Refrigerated Dryer with No Loss Drain 2 EACH $8,458.00 $16,916.00
9 (FA400IH), 1 1/2" NPT, 235 SCFM, AUTODRAIN ) EACH NO BID NO BID
10 FA400IG), 1 1/2" NPT, 235 SCFM, AUTODRAIN ) EACH $665.00 $1,330.00
11 |Factory startupd 2 EACH $1,000.00 $2,000.00
12%* Installation 2 EACH $25,337.50 $50,675.00
3% [Removal 2 EACH $1,425.00 $2,850.00

AGENT NAME: Judi Moore



ITB No. 21-101359
Name: Variable Speed Drive

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

Price Opening Date: November 24,2021 @10:30 am

Rogers Machinery Company, Inc.

Estimated Numb Unit of
ITEM DESCRIPTION sHmarea TUMBer nito Unit Price Total Price
of Units Measure
14 Operation/ Maintenance training 1 EACH $2.000.00 $2.000.00
Protecti kagi
15 | rorective packaging 2 EACH NO BID NO BID
Estimated Freight:
16 Deliver to 4124 Flakes Mill Rd, Decatur, Georgia 30034. 1 EACH $5,000.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL $236,101.00
Number of Bids Received: 2 (non-responsive bids are not tabulated)
LSBE Participation: LSBE requirements waived
Notes:

*For Line Item Nos. 12 and 13, the vendor included only total pricing on the Price Schedule. The unit pricing has been calculated to be the total price divided by the estimated number of units.
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