
ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart                    J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 
1 P205/65R15 

1a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

10
Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, 

Tread 9
Firestone All 

Season,(004012) Tread 9 No Bid
General Altimax RT43, 

94 T Ply 4
Doral Spt, Ply 4, 

Tread 8/32
Firestone All Season, 
94T 4 Ply, Tread 9/32

Goodyear Assurance, 
94T 4Ply N/A

FST Fuel Fighter 
(015199), Ply 4, Tread 

10

1b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) $85.57 $73.04 $78.60 No Bid $82.00 $75.00 $73.00 $70.00 $72.65 

1c Total Amount
$4,278.50 $3,652.00 $3,930.00 

No Bid $4,100.00 $3,750.00 $3,650.00 $3,500.00 $3,632.50 

2 P205/75R15 

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

2a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

X X No longer needed

No Bid No Bid X

X X

X X

2b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units) X X
No longer needed

No Bid No Bid X X X X X

2c Total Amount X X No longer needed No Bid No Bid X X X X X

3 P215/60R15 No Bid

3a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

11 No Bid

Bridgestone Ecopia 422 
(002009), Tread 10

No Bid
General Altimax RT43, 

94 T Ply 4
Doral Sport, Ply 4, 

Tread 8/32
Firestone All Season, 
94T 4 Ply, Tread 9/32 N/A

140667, Touring FS, ply 
4, Tread 10

3b
Price Per Unit         
(200 Units) $84.55 No Bid $86.77 No Bid $81.00 $75.00 $82.00 N/A $61.74 

3c Total Amount $16,910.00 No Bid $17,354.00 No Bid $16,200.00 $3,750.00 $16,400.00 N/A $12,348.00 

4 P215/60R16 No Bid N/A

4a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

11
Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, 

Tread 9
Firestone All 

Season,(003816) Tread 9 No Bid
General Altimax RT43, 

9SH, Ply 4
Doral Sport, Ply 4, 

Tread 8/32
Firestone All Season, 

95H, 4 Ply, Tread 9/32
Goodyear Assurance 

A/S, 95T 4Ply N/A
006258, Touring FS, ply 

4, Tread 10

4b
Price Per Unit         
(250 Units)

$93.19 $83.82 $90.08 
No Bid $89.00 $75.00 $82.00 $80.00 N/A $72.57 

4c Total Amount $23,297.50 $20,955.00 $22,520.00 No Bid $22,250.00 $18,750.00 $20,500.00 $20,000.00 N/A $18,142.50 

5 P215/70R14 
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

5a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

X No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

5b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) X
No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

5c Total Amount X No longer needed No longer needed No Bid No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

6 P215/70R15 
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

6a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

X No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

6b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units) X
No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

6c Total Amount X No longer needed No longer needed No Bid No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

7 P225/70R15 
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

7a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

X No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 1 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________



ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart                    J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

7b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) X
No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

7c Total Amount X
No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

8 P225/75R15 
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

8a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

X No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

8b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) X
No longer needed No longer needed

No Bid
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

8c Total Amount X No longer needed No longer needed No Bid No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed
9 P235/70R15 No Bid No bid

9a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

10 No bid
General Altimax RT43, 

(15502710000) Tread 11 No Bid
Goodyear/equal 103T 

4 ply N/A No bid

9b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $99.59 No bid $101.74 No Bid $94.55 N/A No bid

9c Total Amount $9,959.00 No bid $10,174.00 No Bid $9,455.00 N/A No bid

10 P235/75R15 No Bid N/A

10a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

10
Goodyear Trailrunner AT, 

Ply 4, Tread 12
Firestone Dest. LE3  
(005346)   Tread 10 No Bid

General Grabber 
HTS60, 106T, 4 ply

Firestone Dest. LE3, 
105T Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 Goodyear Trailrunner 
AT, 105TPly 4 N/A

Firestone Dest. LE3  
(005346)   Ply 4, Tread 

12

10b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $99.20 $75.29 $115.91 No Bid $98.87 $105.00 $74.00 N/A $91.40 

10c Total Amount $9,920.00 $7,529.00 $11,591.00 No Bid $9,887.00 $10,500.00 $7,400.00 N/A $9,140.00 

11 P235/70R16 No Bid N/A

11a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

General HTS60, Ply 4, 
Tread 10 Goodyear Assurance, Ply 4, 

Tread 9
Firestone All Season 
(003024),Tread 10 No Bid

General Grabber 
HTS60, 105T, 4 ply

Firestone Dest. LE3, 
106T Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
106T 4 Ply, Tread 15/32 N/A

Firestone Dest. LE2  
(097759)   Ply 4, Tread 

12

11b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $112.87 $99.71 $111.38 No Bid $105.90 $100.00 $93.00 N/A $92.85 

11c Total Amount $11,287.00 $9,971.00 $11,138.00 No Bid $10,590.00 $10,000.00 $9,300.00 N/A $9,285.00 

12 P235/70R17 No Bid N/A

12a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

General HTS60, Ply 4, 
Tread 10

Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
Ply 4, Tread 12

Firestone Dest. LE3  
#005372   Tread 10 No Bid

General Grabber 
HTS60, 111T, 4 ply

Firestone Dest. LE3, 
111T Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
111T 4 Ply, Tread 15/32 N/A

Firestone Dest. LE3  
(005362)   Ply 4, Tread 

12

12b
Price Per Unit         
(400 Units) $129.37 $119.05 $102.09 No Bid $121.50 $93.00 $113.00 N/A $119.02 

12c Total Amount $51,748.00 $47,620.00 $40,836.00 No Bid $48,600.00 $37,200.00 $45,200.00 N/A $47,608.00 

13 P255/65R17 No Bid N/A

13a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

General HTS60, Ply 4, 
Tread 10

Goodyear Fortitude HT, Ply 
4, Tread 11

Firestone Dest. LE3  
#005362   Tread 10 No Bid

General Grabber 
HTS60, 110T, 4 ply

Firestone Dest. LE3, 
110T Ply 4, Tread 

10/32 Goodyear Fortitude 
HT,110T  Ply 4 N/A

008450, FS Fusion SUV, 
Ply 4, Tread 12

13b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) $141.78 $101.40 $105.74 No Bid $131.00 $100.00 $98.20 N/A $110.50 

13c Total Amount $7,089.00 $5,070.00 $5,287.00 No Bid $6,550.00 $5,000.00 $4,910.00 N/A $5,525.00 

14 P255/70R16 No Bid N/A

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 2 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________



ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair
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Tire 

14a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

General HTS60, Ply 4, 
Tread 10 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 

Ply 4, Tread 12
Firestone Dest. LE3  
#005342   Tread 10 No Bid

General Grabber 
HTS60, 111S, 4 ply

Firestone Dest. LE3, 
111S Ply 4, Tread 

10/32
Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
111S 4 Ply, Tread 15/32 N/A

Firestone Dest. LE3  
(005342)   Ply 4, Tread 

12

14b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $117.28 $110.35 $125.30 No Bid $111.00 $115.00 $106.00 N/A $112.08 

14c Total Amount $11,728.00 $11,035.00 $12,530.00 No Bid $11,100.00 $11,500.00 $10,600.00 N/A $11,208.00 

15 P235/45R18 No Bid N/A

15a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General Altimax, Ply 4, Tread 

10
Goodyear Eagle LS2, Ply 4, 

Tread 10
Firestone All Season   
#003065   Tread 10 No Bid

General Altimax RT43, 
98V, Ply 4

Firestone All Season, 
98V 4 Ply, Tread 9/32

Goodyear Eagle LS2, 
98V 4 Ply, Tread 10/32 N/A

Firestone All Season   
#003065   Ply 4, Tread 

11

15b
Price Per Unit         

(60 Units) $135.72 $98.79 $114.36 No Bid $127.55 $106.00 $95.00 N/A $125.28 

15c Total Amount $8,143.20 $5,927.40 $6,855.60 No Bid $7,653.00 $6,360.00 $5,700.00 N/A $7,516.00 

16 LT215/85R16 No Bid N/A

16a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

Gen. HD,  10 Ply            
Tread-14

Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
Ply 10, Tread 15

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14,   

#002758
No Bid

General Grabber HD, 
10 PR, 14/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10PR, Tread 

14/32 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
Ply 10PR, Tread 15/32 N/A

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10, Tread 

14,   #002758

16b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $112.17 $117.25 $105.69 No Bid $109.07 $106.00 $112.00 N/A $101.67 

16c Total Amount $11,217.00 $11,725.00 $10,569.00 No Bid $10,907.00 $10,600.00 $11,200.00 N/A $10,167.00 

17 LT225/75R16 No Bid N/A

17a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

Gen. HD,  10 Ply            
Tread-14 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 

Ply 10, Tread 15

Firestone Transforce 
HT2,#002760,Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
General Grabber HD, 

10 PR, 14/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10PR, Tread 

14/32
Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
Ply 10PR, Tread 15/32 N/A

Firestone Transforce 
HT2,#002760,Ply 10, 

Tread 14

17b
Price Per Unit         
(150 Units) $112.29 $112.61 $117.43 No Bid $109.80 $107.00 $108.00 N/A $110.68 

17c Total Amount $16,843.50 $16,891.50 $17,614.50 No Bid $16,470.00 $16,050.00 $16,200.00 N/A $16,602.00 

18 LT225/75R17 N/A No Bid N/A

18a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth N/A No bid

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002774, Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10PR, Tread 

14/32  Ply 10PR, Tread 14/32 N/A

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002774, Ply 

10, Tread 14

18b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units) N/A No bid $145.44 No Bid $106.00 No Answer N/A $138.66 

18c Total Amount N/A No bid $4,363.20 No Bid $3,180.00 No Answer N/A $4,159.80 

19 LT235/85R16 No Bid N/A

19a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

Gen. HD,  10 Ply            
Tread-14 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 

Ply 10, Tread 15

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002759, Ply 10, 

Tread 15 No Bid
General Grabber HD, 

10 PR, 14/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10PR, Tread 

14/32
Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
Ply 10PR, Tread 15/32 N/A

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002759, Ply 

10, Tread 14

19b
Price Per Unit         
(150 Units) $117.27 $121.23 $122.37 No Bid $113.61 $102.00 $116.00 N/A $116.39 

19c Total Amount $17,590.50 $18,184.50 $18,355.50 No Bid $17,041.50 $15,300.00 $17,400.00 N/A $17,458.50 

20 LT245/75R16 No Bid

20a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

Gen. HD,  10 Ply            
Tread-14 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 

Ply 10, Tread 15

Firestone Transforce 
HT2,#002761,  Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
General Grabber HD, 

10 PR, 14/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10PR, Tread 

14/32
Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
Ply 10PR, Tread 15/32

Goodyear Wrangler HT, Ply 
10, Tread 16/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2,#002761,  Ply 

10, Tread 12

20b
Price Per Unit         
(600 Units) $119.10 $115.93 $114.60 No Bid $116.34 $103.50 $110.00 $129.87 $110.26 

20c Total Amount $71,460.00 $69,558.00 $68,760.00 No Bid $69,804.00 $62,100.00 $66,000.00 $77,922.00 $66,156.00 

21 LT245/75R17 No Bid

21a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

Gen. Grabber HD,  10 Ply            
Tread-14 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 

Ply 10, Tread 15

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002777, Ply 10, 

Tread 14 No Bid
General Grabber HD, 

10 PR, 14/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10PR, Tread 

14/32

Goodyear Trailrunner 
AT, Ply 10PR, Tread 

15/32
Goodyear Duratrac, Ply 10, 

Tread 16/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002777, Ply 

10, Tread 14

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 3 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________
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Tire 

21b
Price Per Unit         
(300 Units) $142.68 $135.15 $142.47 No Bid $137.52 $129.00 $124.00 $185.00 $125.29 

21c Total Amount $42,804.00 $40,545.00 $42,741.00 No Bid $41,256.00 $38,700.00 $37,200.00 $55,500.00 $37,587.00 

22 LT265/70R17 No Bid

22a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

Gen. Grabber HD,  10 Ply            
Tread-14 Goodyear Workhorse AT, 

Ply 10, Tread 15

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002768, Ply 10, 

Tread 15 No Bid
General Grabber HD, 

10 PR, 14/32

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10PR, Tread 

14/32

Goodyear Workhorse AT, 
Ply 10PR, Tread 15/32 N/A

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, #002768, Ply 

10, Tread 14

22b
Price Per Unit         

(60 Units) $157.00 $136.47 $155.61 No Bid $144.83 $140.00 $130.00 N/A $133.05 

22c Total Amount $9,420.00 $8,188.20 $9,336.60 No Bid $8,689.80 $8,400.00 $7,800.00 N/A $7,983.00 

23 LT265/75R16
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

23a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

23b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units)
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

23c Total Amount
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

24 LT275/70R18
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

24a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

24b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units)
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

24c Total Amount
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

25 235/75R17.5
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

25a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-16 
and Tread Depth

No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

25b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units)
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

25c Total Amount
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

26 245/70R19.5 N/A

26a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-14 
and Tread Depth

Continental HD3, Ply 14, 
Tread 24

No bid

Firestone 
FS561,#248477, Ply 

14, Tread 18 No Bid
Arisun AS673, Ply 
16, Tread 16/32

Firestone Trans AT, Load 
G, Tread 18/32

Goodyear G647 RSS, 
Tread 15/32

N/A

Firestone 
FS561,#248477, Ply 

14, Tread 16

26b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) $314.34 No bid $306.60 No Bid $200.00 $230.00 $320.00 
N/A $244.85 

26c Total Amount $3,143.40 No bid $3,066.00 No Bid $2,000.00 $2,300.00 $3,200.00 N/A $2,448.50 
27 255/70R22.5 No Bid

27a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-16 & 

Tread Depth

Continental HSR2, Ply 16, 
Tread 23

No bid

Firestone 
FS560,#192982, Ply 

16, Tread 18 No Bid
Ironman 1-181 Hwy, 

Ply 16, Tread 18
Arisun AS673, Ply 
16, Tread 16/32

FST FS560 Ply 16, Tread 
18/32

Goodyear Marathon 
RSS, Tread 15/32 Goodyear Marathon 

Firestone 
FS560,#192982, Ply 

16, Tread 18

27b
Price Per Unit         

(80 Units) $271.62 No bid $288.36 No Bid $249.00 $269.00 $320.00 $332.06 $238.14 
27c Total Amount $21,729.60 No bid $23,068.80 No Bid $19,920.00 $21,520.00 $25,600.00 $26,564.80 $19,051.20 
28 11R22.5 No bid No Bid

28a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply and 

Tread Depth
General RA, Ply 16, Tread 

23 No bid

Firestone FS561 A, 
#012710, Ply 16, Tread 

21 No Bid
FST FS561A, Ply 16, 

Tread 21/32

Goodyear Endurance 
RSA, Ply H, Tread 

22/32

Goodyear Marathon, 
Endurance, Ply 16, Tread 

22/32

Firestone FS560 
Plus,#156558, Ply 

16, Tread 21

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 4 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________
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28b
Price Per Unit         
(300 Units) $289.91 

No bid
$360.93 No Bid $341.00 $355.00 

GY Marathon-$336.00  GY 
Endurance-$363.00

$262.00 

28c Total Amount $86,973.00 

No bid

$108,279.00 No Bid $102,300.00 $106,500.00 
GY Marathon-$100,800.00  
GY Endurance-$108,900.00

$78,600.00 

29 12R22.5 No bid No Bid

29a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply & 

Tread Depth

Continental HSR2, Ply 16, 
Tread 23

No bid Firestone FS561 A, 
#012715, Ply 16, Tread 

21 No Bid
FST FS561A, Ply 16, 

Tread 21/32

Goodyear Marathon 
RSA, Ply H, Tread 

22/32

Goodyear Marathon, 
Endurance , Ply 16, Tread 

23/32

Firestone FS561 A, 
#248494, Ply 16, 

Tread 21

29b
Price Per Unit         
(1000 Units) $321.67 

No bid

$371.64 No Bid $352.00 $370.75 
GY Marathon-$390.00  GY 

Endurance-$449.00

$330.90 

29c Total Amount $321,670.00 

No bid

$371,640.00 No Bid $352,000.00 $370,750.00 
GY Marathon-$390,000.00  
GY Endurance-$449,000.00

$330,90.00

30 12R24.5 No bid No Bid

30a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply & 

Tread Depth
Continental HSC3, Ply 16, 

Tread 24

No bid
Firestone T819 #157368     

Ply 16   Tread 20 No Bid
Firestone  T819, Ply 16, 

Tread 20/32
Goodyear Workhorse 

MSA, Ply H, Tread 22/32
Goodyear Workhorse , Ply 16, 

Tread 24/32

Firestone T819 
#157368     Ply 16   

Tread 20

30b
Price Per Unit         
(250 Units) $613.47 

No bid
$414.75 No Bid $495.00 $425.00 $445.76 

$369.78 

30c Total Amount $153,367.50 No bid $103,687.50 No Bid $123,750.00 $106,250.00 $111,440.00 92,445.00
31 315/80R22.5 No bid No Bid No Bid

31a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply & 

Tread Depth Gabby OA, Ply L, Tread 23

No bid
Firestone FS400, 

#004168, Ply 20, Tread 
18 No Bid

Arisun AZ682, Ply 
20

Firestone  T819, Ply 20, 
Tread 20/32

Goodyear G289 WHA, 
Ply L, Tread 24/32 Goodyear G289,ply 20, tread 

24/32,G289 Duraseal, ply 20, 
tread 24/32,  G291, Ply J18

Firestone FS860, 
#244465, Ply 20, Tread 

24

31b
Price Per Unit         
(500 Units) $384.89 

No bid

$501.90 No Bid $450.00 $395.00 $440.00 

GY G289, $460.00, GY G289 
DUR. $480.00, GY G291 

$453.62

$410.00 

31c Total Amount $192,445.00 

No bid

$250,950.00 No Bid $225,000.00 $197,500.00 $220,000.00 

GY G289, $230,000.00, GY 
G289 DUR. $240,000.00, GY 

G291 $226,810.00

$205,000.00 

32 385/65R22.5 No bid No Bid

32a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-20 & 

Tread Depth
Continental HTR2, Ply 20, 

Tread 21

No bid Bridgestone R244,            
#009031, Ply 20,            

Tread 21 No Bid
FST FS818 Ply 20, Tread 

23/32
Goodyear G-296, Ply 20, 

Tread 23/32
Goodyear G-296, Ply 20, 

Tread 23/32
247780,FST FS818 Ply 

20, Tread 18

32b
Price Per Unit         
(600 Units) $587.42 

No bid

$596.00 No Bid $501.00 $500.00 $524.00 

$462.15 

32c Total Amount $352,452.00 

No bid

$357,600.00 No Bid $300,600.00 $300,000.00 $314,400.00 

$277,290.00 

33 425/65R22.5 No bid No Bid

33a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply-20 & 

Tread Depth
Continental HTR2, Ply 20, 

Tread 22

No bid Firestone FS818, 
#241235, Ply 20,          

Tread 23 No Bid
FST FS818 Ply 20, Tread 

23/32

Goodyear Armor Max 
MSA, Ply 20, Tread 

23/32
Goodyear Armor Max MSA, 

Ply 20, Tread 23/32

Firestone FS818, 
#241235, Ply 20,          

Tread 18

33b
Price Per Unit         
(400 Units) $661.49 

No bid

$573.30 No Bid $553.00 $665.00 $700.00 

$482.15 

33c Total Amount $264,596.00 

No bid

$229,320.00 No Bid $194,000.00 $221,200.00 $266,000.00 $280,000.00 

$192,860.00 

34 11Lx16 No bid No Bid
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ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart                    J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

34a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-10 & Tread 
Depth N/A

No bid Firestone reg. 
Industrial, 50, 

#378355, Ply 12, Tread 
14 No Bid

Hercules F3, Tread 
17/32, Ply 12

Galaxy Workstar, 
Load F, Ply 12R, 

Tread 23/36
Titan F3, Load 12Ply, tread 

18/32

JR57, Deestone, Load 
E, tread 12

34b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) N/A

No bid

$125.72 No Bid $175.00 $175.00 $179.54 

$138.96 

34c Total Amount N/A

No bid

$6,286.00 No Bid $8,750.00 $8,750.00 $8,977.00 

$6,948.00 

35 12x16.5 N/A No bid No Bid

35a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply 10 & Tread 
Depth N/A

No bid GAL111266, Galaxy 
XD2010 R-4, Ply 12, 

Tread 22
No Bid

Galaxy 2010, Load 
F, Ply 12R, Tread 

23/32 Maxam, Ply 10, Tread 22/32

378712, FST 
Regency, Load E, 

Tread 26

35b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) N/A

No bid
$215.00 No Bid $185.00 $201.22 

$132.30 

35c Total Amount N/A No bid $21,500.00 No Bid $18,500.00 $20,122.00 $13,230.00 
36 14x17.5 N/A No bid No Bid

36a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply 16 & 

Tread Depth N/A

No bid #510039, Carlisle Trac 
Chief, Load G, Ply 14, 

Tread 25 No Bid No Bid
Bobcat Lug w/rim Guard Wall, 

tread 24/32

RGO 33 Power king, 
Tread 28

36b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units) N/A
No bid

$399.00 No Bid No Bid $359.76 
$259.00 

36c Total Amount N/A No bid $11,970.00 No Bid No Bid $10,792.80 $7,770.00 
37 14.5-75-16.1 N/A No bid No Bid

37a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply 10 & 

Tread Depth N/A

No bid Maxam MS900  
#MAX60802, Ply 10, Tread 

22 No Bid
Hercules F3, , Tread 

21/32
Maxam MS300, Ply 

20, Tread E-3 Galaxy tread 24/32

204242, Maxim F3, 
Tread 21

37b
Price Per Unit         

(30 Units) N/A
No bid

$299.00 No Bid $340.00 $1,600.00 $359.76 
$279.00 

37c Total Amount N/A No bid $8,970.00 No Bid $10,200.00 $16,000.00 $10,792.80 $8,370.00 
38 17.5x25 N/A No bid No Bid

38a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply 12 & Tread 
E-3/L-3 N/A

No bid
Maxam MS913  

#MAX345006, Ply 16, 
Tread E-3/L-3 No Bid

Samson, Load 16 PR, 
Ply 16,Tread E-3 L-3

Galaxy EXR 300, 
Load H, Ply 16R Constellation, Load 12ply

344458, Maxim E3, 
Load F

38b
Price Per Unit         

(5 Units) N/A
No bid

$939.00 No Bid $840.00 $809.00 $670.73 
$639.60 

38c Total Amount N/A No bid $4,695.00 No Bid $4,200.00 $4,045.00 $3,353.65 $3,198.00 
39 19.5Lx24 N/A No bid No Bid

39a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply & Tread R-4 N/A

No bid
CA6X14793, Carlisle 

Ground Force 625, Load F, 
Ply 12 No Bid

Harvest King, Load 
12PR, Ply 12, Tread R-

4
Galaxy EZ Rider, Ply 

12PR
Firestone, Load E, Ply 

10PR Galaxy, Load 12ply, ply 12

200439, Galaxy E2 
Rider, Load F, Ply 12

39b
Price Per Unit         

(14 Units) N/A
No bid

$741.00 No Bid $660.00 $600.00 $537.37 $502.22 
$448.47 

39c Total Amount N/A No bid $10,374.00 No Bid $9,240.00 $8,400.00 $7,523.18 $7,017.08 $6,278.58 
40 20.5Rx25 N/A No bid No Bid

40a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range, Ply 20 & Tread 
E-3 N/A

No bid

#005499, Firestone 
Versabuilt AP, Ply MS No Bid

Hercules E3/L3, Load 2 
star, Tread 38/32, Ply 

20
Maxam MS300, Ply 

20, Tread E-3
Doublecoin Rem 2, Load 2 

star
#005498, Firestone 
Versabuilt, Load L
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ITB Number:  21-101474
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Tire 

40b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) N/A
No bid

$1,549.96 No Bid $1,560.00 $1,600.00 $1,307.71 
$1,034.72 

40c Total Amount N/A No bid $15,499.60 No Bid $15,600.00 $16,000.00 $13,077.10 $10,347.20 
41 21L-24 N/A No bid No Bid

41a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Ply 16 & 

Tread Depth N/A

No bid CA6X17253, Carlisle 
Ground Force 625,  Ply 14, 

Tread 36 No Bid
Hercules R4, Ply 12, 

Tread 35/32 No Bid
Firestone, Load G, Tread 

35/32 Galaxy tread 28/32

20042,Galaxy, Tread 
R-4

41b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) N/A
No bid

$911.00 No Bid $774.00 No Bid $885.00 $670.73 
$569.00 

41c Total Amount N/A No bid $18,220.00 No Bid $15,480.00 No Bid $17,700.00 $13,414.60 $11,380.00 
42 23.5Rx25 N/A No bid No Bid

42a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range, Ply 20 & Tread 
E-3 N/A

No bid

#005501, Firestone 
Versabuilt AP, Ply MS No Bid

Hercules E3/Le, Load 
2, Ply 2

Galaxy LDSR 300, 
Ply 20, Tread E-3 Maxam MS300

Double Coin Rem 2, Load 2 
star

#005501, Firestone 
Versabuilt, Load L

42b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) N/A
No bid

$2,170.26 No Bid $2,500.00 $2,100.00 $2,250.00 $1,876.80 
$1,867.50 

42c Total Amount N/A No bid $43,405.20 No Bid $50,000.00 $42,000.00 $45,000.00 $37,537.60 $37,250.00 
43 29.5R25 N/A No bid No Bid

43a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#, Load 
Range, Ply & Tread 

Depth E-3 N/A

No bid

#005503, Firestone 
Versabuilt AP, Ply MS No Bid

Maxam MS 3000, 
Tread E-3

Double Coin Rem 2, Load 2 
star,Ply 28

#005503, Firestone 
Versabuilt , Ply 2 Star

43b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) N/A
No bid

$4,092.08 No Bid $3,450.00 $3,185.00 
$3,850.00 

43c Total Amount N/A No bid $40,920.80 No Bid $34,500.00 $31,850.00 $38,500.00 
44 18x7.00-8 N/A No bid No Bid

44a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 
Range-Ply & Tread N/A

No bid T18780002, OTR 
Grassmaster, Load B, 

Ply 4, Tread 8 No Bid

OTR Grassmaster, 
Load C, Ply 6, Tread 

Turf N/A

23746, Deestone, 
Load B, Ply 4

44b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) N/A
No bid

$32.00 No Bid $50.00 N/A
$45.40 

44c Total Amount N/A No bid $640.00 No Bid $1,000.00 N/A $908.00 
45 18x9.50-8 N/A No bid No Bid N/A

45a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 
Range-Ply & Tread N/A

No bid Carlisle Turf Master, 
CA5114131, Load B, Ply 4, 

Tread 22 No Bid
Carlisle Lug, Load B, 

Ply 2

Hercules Turf Trac, 
Load B, Ply 4, Tread 

-Turf
Carlisle Turf, Load B, Ply 

4 N/A

23784, Deestone, 
Load B, Ply 4

45b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) N/A
No bid

$85.00 No Bid $66.83 $50.00 $50.00 N/A
$48.90 

45c Total Amount N/A No bid $850.00 No Bid $668.30 $500.00 $500.00 N/A $489.00 
46 23x10.50-12 N/A No bid No Bid

46a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 
Range-Ply & Tread N/A

No bid GAL485075, Galaxy 
Mighty Mow,  Load C, Ply 

6, Tread 12 No Bid
Carlisle Turf Trac, Load 

B, Ply 4
Wand P332, Ply 4, 

Tread-Turf N/A

14786, Deestone 
Turf, Load B, Ply 6, 

Tread 6

46b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) N/A
No bid

$109.00 No Bid $81.00 $85.00 N/A
$72.96 

46c Total Amount N/A No bid $5,450.00 No Bid $4,050.00 $4,250.00 N/A $4,640.00 
47 24x12.00-12 N/A No bid No Bid

47a
Turf Master-Load 

Range-Ply & Tread N/A

No bid T241212006 OTR 
Grassmaster, Load B, 

Ply 4, Tread X No Bid
Carlisle Turf Trac, Load 

B, Ply 4 Turf Master, Ply 4 N/A

Galaxy, Load B,Ply 
6,Tread 8

47b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) N/A
No bid

$88.00 No Bid $91.53 $99.00 N/A
$92.80 

47c Total Amount N/A
No bid

$4,400.00 No Bid $4,576.50 $4,950.00 N/A
$4,640.00 
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Tire 

48 31x15.50x15 No longer needed
No bid

No longer needed
No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed No longer needed

48a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-10 & Tread X

No bid

X X X X X X

No longer needed

X

48b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) X
No bid

X X X X X X
No longer needed

X

48c Total Amount X No bid X X X X X X No longer needed X

49 28L-26L/S N/A No bid

49a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-20 & Tread N/A

No bid
PrimeX LogMonster 

#PR464518, Load J/L,  
Tread 69 No Bid

Galaxy Logmaster, 
Ply 20

Firestone, Load H, Ply 
16, Tread 21/32

American Log Skid, Load 
20

Maxam MS930, Load Ply 20, 
Tread 54/32

464518, Galaxy, 
Load L, Tread 45

49b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) N/A
No bid

$2,409.00 No Bid $2,400.00 $1,740.00 $2,540.00 $2,238.25 
$2,298.00 

49c Total Amount N/A No bid $24,090.00 No Bid $24,000.00 $17,400.00 $25,400.00 $22,382.50 $27,980.00 
50 215/75R17.5 No bid No Bid

50a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-16 & Tread
Conti. HR2,  Load 16, Tread 

15

No bid

$5546632, Rovelo RS4, 
Load H, Tread 16 No Bid

Prinx AR602, Load H, 
Tread 15/32 Diamond Back

Ironman I-109, Load H, 
Ply 16, Tread 16/32

Goodyear G114, Load H, 
Tread 16/32

Doublecoin RT500, Load H, 
Tread 16/32

248511, FST 561, 
Load H, Tread 18

50b
Price Per Unit         
(500 Units) $206.25 

No bid
$187.00 No Bid $160.00 $140.00 $155.00 $260.00 $173.68 

$380.76 

50c Total Amount $103,125.00 No bid $93,500.00 No Bid $80,000.00 $70,000.00 $77,500.00 $130,000.00 $88,340.00 $190,380.00 
51 ST175/80R13 N/A No bid No Bid

51a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-6 & Tread N/A

No bid
TH16745 Westlake ST100, 

Load C, Tread X No Bid
Arisun St 100, Load 

C, Tread 8/32 N/A
Max V14, Towmax Van, 
Load C, Tread 10

51b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) N/A
No bid

$58.00 No Bid $50.00 N/A
$54.00 

51c Total Amount N/A $508.40 $1,160.00 No Bid $1,000.00 N/A $1,080.00 
52 ST215/75R14 No Bid N/A

52a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 

Range-Ply-8 & Tread
General Altimax, Load 4, 

Tread 10
Goodyear Endurance , Load 

D, Ply 8, Tread 8
TMST17 Trialermaster, 

Load D, Tread 9 No Bid
Arisun St 100, Load 

D, Tread 8/32
Goodyear Endurance, 
Load D, Tread 8/32 N/A

CR02521754C, Cars 
Trail HD, Load D, 

Tread 10

52b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) $87.82 $85.72 $84.00 No Bid $60.00 $88.00 N/A
$60.00 

52c Total Amount $877.20 $857.20 $840.00 No Bid $600.00 $880.00 N/A $600.00 
53 ST225/75R15 N/A No Bid N/A

53a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#, Load 

Range, Ply 8& Tread 
Depth N/A

Goodyear Endurance , Load 
E, Ply 8, Tread 8

GL 1943002253, Gladiator 
QR25, Load E, Ply 10, 

Tread 8 No Bid

Arisun St 100, Load 
E, Ply 16, Tread 

8/32

Goodyear Endurance, 
Load E, Ply 10PR, Tread 

8/32 N/A

003503,Primewell, 
Load D, Tread 10

53b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) N/A $95.67 $109.00 No Bid $75.00 $95.76 N/A
$60.00 

53c Total Amount N/A $956.70 $1,090.00 No Bid $750.00 $957.60 N/A $600.00 
54 ST235/85R16 No Bid N/A

54a

Brand Name & Tire 
Name OPL#-Load 
Range-Ply & Tread

General HD, Load 10, Ply 10, 
Tread 14

Goodyear Endurance , Load 
E,  Tread 15

TMST09 Trailermaster, 
Load F, Ply 12, Tread 9 No Bid

Arisun St 100, Load 
E, Ply 10, Tread 

8/32

Goodyear Endurance, 
Load E, Ply 10PR, Tread 

8/32 N/A

NRM17, National RD, 
Load D, Ply 8, Tread 

10

54b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) $117.57 $131.57 $132.00 No Bid $99.00 $127.00 N/A
$94.59 

54c Total Amount $1,315.70 $1,320.00 No Bid $990.00 $1,270.00 N/A $94,590.00 
55 11R22.5 No Bid
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55a

Goodyear Multi  Hwy 
Duraseal or Equal, 

Load Range H, Ply & 
Tread Depth General HD, Ply 16, Tread 28 No bid

FS561A-012710, Ply 16, 
Tread 21 No Bid

FST FS561, Ply 16, 
Tread 21/32

Goodyear 751MSA 
Duraseal, Ply H, Tread 

24/32
G751 Duraseal, Ply 16, Tread 

22/32 

No Bid

55b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $390.00 No bid $360.93 No Bid $341.00 $500.00 $521.92 

No Bid

55c Total Amount $39,000.00 No bid $36,093.00 No Bid $34,100.00 $50,000.00 $52,192.00 No Bid
56 11R22.5 No bid No Bid

56a

Goodyear or Equal, 
Load Range H, Ply & 

Tread Depth General RA, Ply 16, Tread 23 No bid
FS561A-012710, Ply 16, 

Tread 21 No Bid
FST FS561, Ply 16, 

Tread 21/32
Goodyear Endurance 

RSA, Ply H, Tread 22/32
GY Marathon, Ply 16, Tread 

22/32 

156558, FST 560, Ply 
16

56b
Price Per Unit         
(300 Units) $281.91 No bid $360.93 No Bid $341.00 $355.00 $336.00 

$262.00 

56c Total Amount $84,573.00 No bid $108,279.00 No Bid $102,300.00 $106,500.00 $100,800.00 $78,600.00 
57 12R22.5 No bid No Bid

57a

Goodyear or Equal, 
Load Range H, Ply & 

Tread Depth 
Continental HSR2  Ply 16, 

Tread 23 No bid
FS561A-012715, Ply 16, 

Tread 21 No Bid
FST FS561, Ply 16, 

Tread 21/32
Goodyear Marathon 

RSA, Ply H, Tread 22/32
GY Marathon, Ply 16, Tread 

22/32 

248494,FST 561, Ply 
16, tread 21

57b
Price Per Unit         
(500 Units) $321.67 No bid $371.64 No Bid $352.00 $380.75 $390.00 

$330.90 

57c Total Amount $160,835.00 No bid $185,820.00 No Bid $176,000.00 $190,375.00 $195,000.00 $165,450.00 
58 12R22.5 No bid No Bid

58a

Firestone T-831 or 
Equal, Load Range H, 

Ply & Tread Depth 
Continental HDR2  Ply 16, 

Tread 30 No bid
     BSL320-211019,Ply 

16, Tread 31 No Bid
FST T-831, Ply 16, Tread 

31/32

Goodyear Armor Max 
Prograde MSD, Ply H, 

Tread 33/32 N/A
281581, FST T-831, Ply 

16, Tread 22

58b
Price Per Unit         
(100 Units) $507.24 No bid $472.00 No Bid $383.00 $725.00 N/A

$465.17 

58c Total Amount $50,724.00 No bid $47,200.00 No Bid $38,300.00 $72,500.00 N/A $46,517.00 
59 P265/70R17 No bid No Bid N/A

59a

Firestone or 
Bridgestone only, Load 

Range, Ply & Tread 
Depth Load E,  Ply 10, Tread 14 No bid

Firestone Dest. LE3-
005374, Tread 12 No Bid

Firestone Dest. LE3-Load 
P, Ply 4PR, Tread 10/32 N/A

002768, FS HT2, Load 
E, Ply 10, Tread 14

59b
Price Per Unit         
(150 Units) $156.01 No bid $135.25 No Bid $122.00 N/A $143.05 

59c Total Amount $23,401.50 No bid $20,287.50 No Bid $18,300.00 N/A $21,457.50 

60 LT245/75R17 No bid No Bid N/A

60a

Firestone or 
Bridgestone only, Load 
Range E., Ply & Tread 

Depth  Ply 10, Tread 14 No bid
Firestone Transforce HT2,  

Ply 10, Tread 12 No Bid

Firestone Transforce 
HT2, Ply 10, Tread 

14/32 N/A

002777, Firestone 
Transforce HT2, Ply 10, 

Tread 14

60b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) $142.68 No bid $142.47 No Bid $129.00 N/A $129.11 

60c Total Amount $7,134.00 No bid $7,123.50 No Bid $6,450.00 N/A $6,455.50 

61 LT245/75R17 No Bid

61a

Goodyear Duratrac or 
Eq., Load Range E, Ply 

& Tread Depth General HD, Ply 10, Tread 14
Goodyear Duratrac/eq., Ply 

10, Tread 18
Firestone Transforce AT2-
000184, Ply 10, Tread 17 No Bid Firestone Transforce AT

Goodyear Duratrac Ply 
10 PR, Tread 18/32 

Goodyear Duratrac Ply 10 PR, 
Tread 16/32 No Bid

61b
Price Per Unit         

(50 Units) $142.68 $180.83 $148.63 No Bid $137.77 $174.00 $185.00 No Bid

61c Total Amount $7,134.00 $9,019.00 $7,431.50 No Bid $6,888.50 $8,700.00 $9,250.00 No Bid
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BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart                    J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

62 LT285/75R16 No Bid No Bid

62a

Goodyear Duratrac or 
Eq., Load Range E, Ply 

& Tread Depth 
General Gabber Altx., Ply 10, 

Tread 14
Goodyear Duratrac/eq., Ply 

10, Tread 18
Firestone Dest. MT2-

24561, Ply 10, Tread 20 No Bid Firestone Dest.X/T
Goodyear Duratrac Ply 

10 PR, Tread 18/32 
Goodyear Duratrac, Ply 10, 

Tread 16/32 No Bid

62b
Price Per Unit         

(60 Units) 183.2 $190.09 $172.45 No Bid $144.16 $180.00 $192.60 No Bid

62c Total Amount $10,992.00 $11,405.40 $10,353.00 No Bid $8,649.60 $10,800.00 $11,556.00 No Bid

63 275/70R22.5 No Bid No Bid

63a

Continental or Eq., 
Load Range G, Ply & 

Tread Depth 
Conti. Or Equal, Ply 18, Tread 

23 No Bid

Continental HSR2  SA, 
#05121290000, Ply 20, 

Tread 18 No Bid
Firestone FS561, Ply 18, 

Tread 21/32

Goodyear Endurance 
RSA, Load J, Ply J, Tread 

14/32 N/A No Bid

63b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) $383.00 No Bid $394.00 No Bid $313.00 $502.00 N/A No Bid

63c Total Amount $7,660.00 No Bid $7,880.00 No Bid $6,260.00 $10,040.00 N/A No Bid

64 295/80R22.5 No Bid No Bid N/A

64a

 Michelin Pilote XZ 
Hwy.Only,Load Range, 

Ply & Tread Depth N/A No Bid
BS R268-000282, Load H, 

Ply 16, Tread 21 No Bid

 Michelin Pilote XZ 
Hwy.Only,Load H, Ply 

16, Tread 18/32 N/A

07719, Michelin Pilote 
XZ, Hwy. Only, Load H, 

Ply 16, Tread 19

64b
Price Per Unit         

(25 Units) No Bid No Bid $352.00 No Bid $580.00 N/A $658.00 

64c Total Amount No Bid No Bid $8,800.00 No Bid $14,500.00 N/A $16,450.00 

65 305/70R22.5 No Bid No Bid N/A

65a

Continental or Eq., 
Load Range G, Ply & 

Tread Depth 
Continenta or Equal, Load L, 

ply 20, Tread 23 No Bid

Continental Urban HA3, 
#05140960000, Load h, 

Ply 20, Tread 23 No Bid

Goodyear Endurance 
TSD, Load L, Ply L, 

Tread 28/32 N/A
Continental or Eq., Load 

H, Ply 16, Tread 21

65b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) $495.23 No Bid $505.95 No Bid $710.00 N/A $440.00 

65c Total Amount $4,952.30 No Bid $5,059.50 No Bid $7,100.00 N/A $4,400.00 

66 315/80R22.5 No Bid No Bid

66a

Goodyear Multi 
position. or Eq., Load 

Range J/L, Ply & Tread 
Depth 

Continental HSR2SA, Ply 20, 
Tread 23 No Bid

#05350150000-Gen. 
Grabber OA, Ply 20, Tread 

23 No Bid
Firestone T819, Ply 20, 

Tread 20/32
Goodyear G-289 WHA, 

Ply L, Tread 24/32
Goodyear G-296 Multi/equal, 

Hwy/Eq., Tread 23/32

244465, FST FS860, 
Load J/O, Ply 20,Tread 

21

66b
Price Per Unit         
(500 Units) $487.02 No Bid $395.00 No Bid $395.00 $440.00 $453.62 $440.00 

66c Total Amount $243,610.00 No Bid $197,500.00 No Bid $197,500.00 $220,000.00 $226,810.00 $220,000.00 

67 385/65R22.5 No Bid No Bid

67a

Goodyear G-296 Hwy. 
or Eq., Load Range 
J/L, Ply 20 & Tread 

Depth 
Continental HSR2, Ply 20, 

Tread 21 No Bid
BS R244-009031, Tread 

21 No Bid
FST FS818, Ply 20, 

Tread 23/32
Goodyear G-296 /eq., 

Tread 23/32
Goodyear G-296, Tread 

23/32

BST R244, 009031, 
Load J/O, Ply 20, tread 

21

67b
Price Per Unit         
(1000 Units) $583.42 No Bid $596.00 No Bid $501.00 $500.00 $524.00 $860.00 

67c Total Amount $583,420.00 No Bid $596,000.00 No Bid $501,000.00 $500,000.00 $524,000.00 $860,000.00 

68 425/65R22.5 No Bid No Bid

68a

Goodyear G-296 Hwy. 
or Eq., Load Range L, 
Ply 20 & Tread Depth 

Continental HSR2, Ply 20, 
Tread 22 No Bid

BS R244-225221, Tread 
21 No Bid

FST FS818, Ply 20, 
Tread 23/32

Goodyear AmorMax 
MSA, tread 23/32

GY 296 Hwy/eq. AmorMax, 
tread 23/32

247780, FST818, Tread 
21

68b
Price Per Unit         
(600 Units) $659.49 No Bid $646.00 No Bid $553.00 $665.00 $700.00 $543.00 

68c Total Amount $395,694.00 No Bid $387,600.00 No Bid $331,800.00 $39,000.00 $420,000.00 $325,800.00 

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 10 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________



ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart                    J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

69 P265/65R18 No Bid No Bid N/A

69a

Goodyear or Equal, 
Load Range-S, Ply & 

Tread Depth
General HB60, Ply 4, Tread 

10 No Bid
Firestone Dest.LE3, 
005389,  Tread 10 No Bid

Firestone Dest.LE3, Ply 
4PR, Tread 10/32 N/A

241235,Firestone 
Dest.LE3, Ply 4,  Tread 

12

69b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) $145.00 No Bid $123.47 No Bid $113.00 N/A $115.00 

69c Total Amount $2,900.00 No Bid $2,469.40 No Bid $2,260.00 N/A $2,300.00 

70 P265/70R16 No Bid No Bid N/A

70a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-S, Ply & Tread 

Depth
General HTS60, Ply  4, Tread 

10 No Bid
Firestone Dest.LE3, 
005354,  Tread 10 No Bid

Firestone LE3, Ply 4PR, 
Tread 10/32 N/A

Firestone Dest.LE3, 
005354,  Ply 4, Tread 

12

70b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) $126.00 No Bid $133.40 No Bid $121.00 N/A $155.18 

70c Total Amount $2,520.00 No Bid $2,668.00 No Bid $2,420.00 N/A $3,103.60 

71 P255/70R17 No Bid No Bid N/A

71a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-S, Ply & Tread 

Depth
General HTS60, Ply  4, Tread 

10 No Bid
Firestone Dest.LE3, 
005371,  Tread 10 No Bid

Firestone LE3, Ply 4PR, 
Tread 10/32 N/A

Firestone Dest.LE2, 
136043,  Ply 4, Tread 

12

71b
Price Per Unit         

(20 Units) $148.00 No Bid $126.51 No Bid $114.00 N/A $184.20 

71c Total Amount $2,960.00 No Bid $2,530.20 No Bid $2,280.00 N/A $3,684.00 

72 P195/65R15 No Bid No Bid N/A

72a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-S, Ply & Tread 

Depth N/A No Bid
Firestone All Season-

006252, Tread 10 No Bid

Bridgestone Ecopia 
Ep422,Ply 91H, Tread 

11/32 N/A
015131, FST Fuel 

Fighter, Ply 4, Tread 10

72b
Price Per Unit         

(10 Units) N/A No Bid $75.11 No Bid $67.00 N/A $65.90 

72c Total Amount N/A No Bid $751.10 No Bid $670.00 N/A $659.00 

73 P225/60VR16 RSA No Bid N/A

73a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-S, Ply & Tread 

Depth
General Justice, Ply 4, Tread 

10 Ply 6, Tread 12
#15553910000, Ply SL,  

Tread 10 No Bid

Gen. Justice, Load  
98V,Ply PR, Tread 

10/32

BF Goodrich, 
Pursuit, Load 198V, 

Ply 98V Firestone Pursuit

Goodyear RSA, Load 
98V, Ply 4PR, Tread 

10/32 N/A
1555391,GMAX, Ply 4, 

Tread 10

73b
Price Per Unit         
(1000 Units) $105.00 $96.90 $115.00 No Bid $99.00 $90.00 $91.80 N/A $97.66 

73c Total Amount $105,000.00 $96,900.00 $115,000.00 No Bid $99,000.00 $90,000.00 $91,800.00 N/A $97,666.00 

74 P235/55R17 RSA No Bid N/A

74a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-S, Ply & Tread 

Depth
General Justice, Ply 4, Tread 

10 Ply 6, Tread 11
#15553940000, Ply SL,  

Tread 10 No Bid

Gen. Justice, Load  
99W,Ply 4PR, Tread 

10/32
BFG, Pursuit, Load 
103W, Ply 103W

Firestone Pursuit, Load 
W, Ply 4PR, Tread 9/32

Goodyear RSA, Load 
99W, Ply 4PR, Tread 

10/32 N/A
1555394, Ply 4, Tread 

10

74b
Price Per Unit         
(2000 Units) $114.18 $116.27 $125.32 No Bid $109.32 $105.00 $99.24 $110.14 N/A $109.32 

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 11 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________



ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart                    J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

74c Total Amount $228,360.00 $232,540.00 $250,640.00 No Bid $218,640.00 $210,000.00 $198,480.00 $220,280.00 N/A $218,640.00 

75 P265/60R17 RSA No Bid N/A

75a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-108V-S, Ply & 

Tread Depth
General Justice, Ply 6, Tread 

10 Ply 6, Tread 10
#15553960000, Ply 6,  

Tread 10 No Bid

Gen. Justice, Load  
108V,Ply 4PR, Tread 

10

BF Goodrich, 
Pursuit, Load 108V, 
Ply 108V, Tread 10

Firestone Pursuit, Load 
108V, Ply 4PR, Tread 

9/32
Goodyear RSA, Load 

108V, Ply 4PR, Tread 10 N/A 1555396 GMAX

75b
Price Per Unit         
(2000 Units) $133.33 $129.31 $145.00 No Bid $129.00 $116.00 $110.54 $122.50 N/A $130.00 

75c Total Amount $266,660.00 $258,620.00 $290,000.00 No Bid $258,000.00 $232,000.00 $221,080.00 $245,000.00 N/A $260,000.00 

76 P235/50r18 No Bid N/A

76a
Goodyear or equal. - 

Extra Load,Ply & Tread
General Justice, Ply 6, Tread 

10 Ply 6, Tread 11
#15553930000, Ply XL,  

Tread 10 No Bid

Gen. Justice, Extra 
Load  101W,Ply 4PR, 

Tread 10/32

BF Goodrich, 
Pursuit, Load 
101WXL, Ply 

101WXL

Firestone Pursuit, Extra 
Load V, Ply XL, Tread 

9/32

Goodyear RSA, EXTRA 
Load 101W, Ply 4PR, 

Tread 10/32 N/A
1555393 GMAX, Ply XL, 

Tread 10

76b
Price Per Unit         
(2000 Units) $118.32 $140.45 $130.00 No Bid $114.00 $114.00 $125.70 $132.00 N/A $114.50 

76c Total Amount $236,640.00 $280,900.00 $260,000.00 No Bid $228,000.00 $228,000.00 $251,400.00 $264,000.00 N/A $229,000.00 

77 P225/60r18 No Bid N/A

77a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-S, Ply & Tread 

Depth
General Justice, Ply 4, Tread 

10 Ply 6, Tread 11
#15553920000, Ply SL,  

Tread 10 No Bid

Gen. Justice, Load  
100W,Ply 4PR, Tread 

10/32
Firestone Pursuit, Load 
W, Ply 4PR, Tread 9/32

Goodyear RSA, Load 
100W, Ply 4PR, Tread 

10/32 N/A
1555392 GMAX, Ply 4, 

Tread 10

77b
Price Per Unit         
(400 Units) $122.55 $123.29 $132.67 No Bid $116.67 $103.35 $116.67 N/A $116.67 

77c Total Amount $49,020.00 $49,316.00 $53,068.00 No Bid $46,668.00 $41,340.00 $46,668.00 N/A $46,668.00 

78 P275/55r20 N/A

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 12 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________



ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart                    J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

78a

Goodyear or Eq.-Load 
Range-S, Ply & Tread 

Depth
General Justice, Ply 4, Tread 

10 Ply 6, Tread 11 Ply SL, Tread 10 No Bid

Gen. Justice, Load  
113V,Ply 4PR, Tread 

10/32
Firestone Pursuit, Load 
V, Ply 4PR, Tread 9/32

Goodyear RSA, Load 
113V, Ply 4PR, Tread 

10/32 N/A
1559081 GMAX, Ply 4, 

Tread 10

78b.
Price Per Unit         
(400 Units) $138.26 $145.26 $149.39 No Bid $133.39 $148.55 $137.50 N/A $135.39 

78c. Total Amount $55,304.00 $58,104.00 $59,756.00 No Bid $53,356.00 $59,420.00 $55,000.00 N/A $54,156.00 

79 11R22.5 No Bid

79a
26/32 mud/Snow 

(Tread & Unit Price)
Cont. Techno Tread W/L, 26Z, 

$159.00 No bid
BDM-666645 Tread 26/32 

$186.00 Tread 26  $164.90  No Bid Tread 26/32  $128.76
BDM Tread 26/32, 

$127.97

79b.

Deepest Tread 
offered-mud/Snow 

(Unit Price)
Cont. HDL3, 28 tread, 

$181.89 No bid Tread 26/32  $186.00 Tread 26  $164.90  No Bid Tread 26/32  $128.76 N/A

Section with Cap $25.00 No bid $15.00 

R-120-$21.00, R-122-
$23.00, R-130-$27.00, 

R-135-$35.00 No Bid $146.76 $12.00 

Spot w/Cap $5.00 No bid $5.00 $4.00 No Bid $136.76 $0.00 

80 12R22.5 No bid No Bid

80a.
26/32 mud/Snow 

(Tread & Unit Price)
Cont. Techno Tread W/L, 26, 

$163.00 No bid
BDM-666653 Tread 26/32 

$192.00 Tread 26  $170.00  No Bid Tread 26/32  $140.78
BDM Tread 26/32, 

$129.00

80b.

Deepest Tread 
offered-mud/Snow 

(Unit Price)
Cont. HDL3, 28 tread, 

$192.00 No bid Tread 26/32 $192.00 Tread 26  $170.00  No Bid Tread 26/32  $140.78 N/A

Section w/Cap $25.00 No bid $15.00 

R-120-$21.00, R-122-
$23.00, R-130-$27.00, 

R-135-$35.00 No Bid $158.78 $12.00 
Spot w/Cap $5.00 No bid $5.00 $4.00 No Bid $148.78 $0.00 

81 315/80R22.5 No bid No Bid

81a.
26/32 mud/Snow 

(Tread & Unit Price)
Cont. Techno Tread W/L, 26, 

$167.30 No bid
BDM-667064 Tread 32/32 

$192.00 Tread 26  $186.00 No Bid Tread 26/32  $141.15
BDM Tread 26/32, 

$164.90

81b.

Deepest Tread 
offered-mud/Snow 

(Unit Price)
Cont. HDL3, 28 tread, 

$201.23 No bid 32/32 $192.00 Tread 26  $186.00 No Bid Tread 26/32  $141.15 N/A

Section w/Cap $25.00 No bid $15.00 

R-120-$21.00, R-122-
$23.00, R-130-$27.00, 

R-135-$35.00 No Bid $159.15 $12.00 

Spot w/Cap $5.00 No bid $5.00 $4.00 No Bid $149.15 $0.00 

82
215/75R17.5 Trailer 

Tire N/A No bid No Bid No Bid

82a.

Tread 
(15/32),Tread 

offered & Unit price N/A No bid
MetroMax Rib-672238, 
Tread 16/32, $214.00 N/C No Bid Tread 15/32, $96.00

BRSS, Tread 16/32, 
$102.00

82b.
Highway Tread  

(Tread & Unit Price) N/A No bid Tread 16/32 $214.00 No Bid No Bid Tread 15/32, $96.00
BRSS, Tread 16/32, 

$102.00

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 13 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________



ITB Number:  21-101474
ITB NAME:  Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: March 29, 2022
Tammy Shew

ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive Midtown Tire Southern Tire Mart  J&R Tire Inc. Nextire (Bid 1) Nextire (Bid 2) Nextire (Bid 3) Nextire (Bid 4) Action Tire
Atlanta Commercial 

Tire 

Section w/Cap N/A No bid $15.00 No Bid $114.00 $12.00 

Spot w/Cap N/A No bid $5.00 R-120, $20.00 No Bid $104.00 $0.00 

83

12R24.5-Tread 
(32/32)-Tread offered 

& Unit Price N/A No bid
BDM3-011354, Tread 

32/32  $228.00 Tread 26  $170.00  No Bid N/A

84

385/65R22.5-21/32 
Mud & Snow-Tread 
offered & Unit Price N/A No bid

BRM-WB-215090, Tread 
20/32 $189.00 Tread 21  $225.00 No Bid Tread 21/32, $219.85 Tread 22/32, $172.00

84a. Section with Cap N/A No bid $15.00 N/A No Bid $237.85 $12.00 

84b. Spot w/Cap N/A No bid $5.00 N/A No Bid $227.85 $0.00 

84c. 
Bidding On: (Name 

or System) N/A N/A BANDAG
Marangoni 

Unitread/Ringtread No Bid Bandag

Note:  Item No. 77 for NexTire Commercial, Inc. was calculated wrong on the total amount and was corrected to the following:  $41,420.00 to $41,340.00.  ($103.35 x 400=$41,340.00)

Recommended Vendors:

Action Tire Co.

410 Lees Mill Rd.  
Forest Park, GA  30297

Atlanta Commercial Tire
6590 Button Gwinnett Dr.

Doraville, GA  30340

Best Drive Tire, LLC.
100 Hill Ind. Blvd.

Forest Park, GA  30297

J&R Tire
350 Bohannon Rd.

Fairburn, GA  30213

Nextire Commercial, Inc. 
PO Box 81

Avondale Estates, GA  30002

Southern Tire Mart, LLC.
75 pinyon Rd.

Covington, GA  30016

Number of bids received:  10

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ 14 BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________
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