17-100828 DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING ) Bid Opening Date:JULY 7 @3:00 pm

ITB NAME: Wastewater Treatment Servicessnua conmacr) BID TABULATION AGENT NAME: Judi Moore
ITEM DESCRIPTION nomper o |unrr| VENDOR | VENDOR | VENDOR | VENDOR | VENDOR VENDOR | e nor naME|vENDOR NaME| vEnDOR name| VENDOR | VENDOR
UNITS NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME
CHEMRITE | BRENNTAG MID-| SOUTHERN GEO SPECIALTY PVC CHEMICAL CARMEUSE PREMIER
POLYDYNE SOUTH INC. ionics | CES CHEMICALS |+ eniicals CHEMTRADE | soLuTion, Inc. UNIVAR UME & STONE | MAGNESIA
RTamTOT SUTTaTe, o B aeTveTea
3000 — 4000 gallon tank truck as Liquid
L A b T 5200 Ton NO BID Bid on 2 items NO BID NO BID 797,940.00 951,496.00 | $ 1,164,800.00 NO BID $1,488,500.00 NO BID NO BID
be responsibility of the contractor, per

specifications.

olymer, dry to be delivered in 30

pound bags after previous jar tests and

2 |Snapfinger Plant, 100% miscible with 40,000 LBS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
water, per specifications.

Polymer, either liquid emulsion or /

dispersion type with minimum 35%
active ingredients after trials been
conducted at Pole Bridge and Snapfinger|

dispersion type with minimum 35%
4 |pctive ingredients after trials been 82,800 es J{ $112,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
conducted at Scott Candler, per
|specification.
UicKNme, Nigh calcium quic iNg,
90% available Ca0, rotary kiln, 25 ton lot
to be blown into silos by shipper truck in
accordance with AWWA current
applicable standards and per
| fications
Liquid Chlorine, 1-ton containers, to be
delivered in varying quantities of two (2)

or more but probably not more than ten
I(lD) at any one time per specification

211,200 LBS $171,072.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID

L 5,500 TON NO BID 1,1003,750 NO BID NOEID NQ BID NO 8ID NO BID NO BID NOBID $1,226,500.00 NO EBID

360 TON NO BID NO BID I $143,964.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID

Sadium Bisulfite Liquid to be delivered
in tank truck as liquid 38 percent to 40
percent sol as NaHso3 and pumped by
vendor into county storage tanks’ with
clean up after delivery the responsibility
of contractor,

Witness Signature: % z '&"--.....
5 .

ng—
Agent Signature: 'ﬁ(ﬂa/u, Purchasing Director Signature: BOC Award Approval Date:

1,800,000 LBS NO B1D NO BID NO BID $358,340.00 NO BID NO BID S 414,000.00 $330,740.0 NO BID NO BID NO BID




17-100828
ITB NAME: Wastewater Treatment Servicesunua conmacer)

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

Bid Opening Date:JULY 7 @3:00 pm
AGENT NAME: Judi Moore

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED
NUMBER OF

UNITS

UNIT

VENDOR
NAME

VENDOR
NAME

VENDOR
NAME

VENDOR
NAME

VENDOR
NAME

VENDOR
NAME

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR
NAME

VENDOR
NAME

ium Hypocnlorte rade,
delivered in bulk, per specification.
Bidding on:

420,000

POLYDYNE

CHEMRITE

BRENNTAG MID-
SOUTH INC.

SOUTHERN
IONICS

C&S5 CHEMICALS

Gallon

NOQ BID

NO BID

$257,670.00

NO BID

NO BID

GEO SPECIALTY
CHEMICALS

NO BID

CHEMTRADE

NO BID

PVC CHEMICAL
SOLUTION, INC.

UNIVAR

CARMEUSE
LIME & STONE

PREMIER
MAGNESIA

NO BID

$261,660.00

NO BID

NO BID

Caustic Soda, drive, pellet form {100%
NaOH) to be delivered on palletsin
approx. 50 pound waterproof paper
bags; per Specifications.

54,00

LBS

NO 8ID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$2,629.80

NOBID

NOQ BID

10

11

Sodium Hydroxide {Caustic Soda), 50%
Grade, deliver in bulk tank trucks of
3000 - 5000 gallon capacity, Contractor
to transfer material to storage tanks,
cleanup after delivery is the
responsibility of the contractor, per
specifications.

1200

TON

NO BID

$694,800.00

$641,400.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID

$655,200.00

NO BID

NC BID

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%grade,
delivered in bulk tank trucks of 4,500 —
S000 gallon capacity, per specifications

420,000

Gallon

NQ BID

NO BID

$257,670.00

01 0]

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NG BID

NO BID

$261,660.00

NO BID

NO BID

12

Sodium Bicarbonate, NaHCO3, Technical
Grade, free-flowing, delivered on pallet
in approx. 50 pounds net weight paper
bags; per enclosed Specifications.

200

b0 |b Bag

NO BID

NOBID

$1,620.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO 8ID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

13

Liquid Oxygen refrigerated (Hospital
Grade), delivered in bulk tank trucks
4,500-500 gallons Contractor shall
provide means of transferring liquid to
plant storage tank; per specifications.

540, 000

Gallon

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO 8ID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

14

Magnestum Hydroxide (Milk Magnesia)
53% to 56% Grade, delivery to be made
in bulk tank trucks of 4,500 - 5,000
gallon capacity, Contractor to transfer
material to storage tank(s) per
specification.

55000

Gallen

NO BID

NO BID

$12,000.00

NO BID

NGO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NC BID

$11,400.00

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:

Purchasing Director Stgnature:

BOC Award Approval Date:




17-100828

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING

Bid Opening Date:JULY 7 @3:00 pm

ITB NAME: Wastewater Treatment ServiceSnwua contaacty 81D TABULATION AGENT NAME: Judi Moore
ITEM DESCRIPTION Nomber or |unrr{ VENDOR | VENDOR | VENDOR | VENDOR | VENDOR VENDOR 1, nor naME|vENDOR NAME| vENDOR Name| VENDOR | VENDOR
MBER NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME NAME
CHEMRITE BRENNTAG MID-| SOUTHERN GEQ SPECIALTY PVC CHEMICAL CARMEUSE PREMIER
POLYDYNE SOUTH INC. ONICS e CHEMICALS Sl SOLUTION, INC. DAL LIME & STONE MAGNESIA

Recommend award to the lowest, responsive and responsible hidders:

Item No. 2,3, & 4 Polydyne, Inc., 1 Chemical Plant Road, Riceboro, GA 31323
Estimated Amount Not To Exceed $408,000.00

Item No.1 C&S Chemicals, 4180 Providence Road, Suite 310, Marietta, GA 30062
Estimated Amount Not To Exceed $957,600.00

Item Nos. 6, 8,9, 10,11 & 12
Brenntag Mid - South Inc., 3200 Moon Station Road, Kennesaw, GA 30144
Estimated Amoount Not To Exceed: $1,565,900.00

Item No. 7
PVS Chemical Solutions, Inc., 10900 Harper Avenue, Detroit, MI 48213
Estimated Amount Not To Exceed: $397,000.00

Item No. 5
*Chemrite, 5202 Belle Wood Court, Suite 104, Buford, GA 30518
Estimated Amount Not To Exceed: $1,471,800.00

Non-Responsive Bidders

Cheney Lime & Cement Company, Inc., Airgas USA, LLC, and Affinity Chemlcal, LLC
Bidder did not comply with Page 5, Section A, Paragraph 1, of Invitation To Bid Procedures, Bidder Information. "Iincluding the Price Schedule
In any area outside of its separate, sealed envelope will result in Bidder's Bid being deemed non-responsive.

Allied Universal Corporation
Bidder did not comply with Page 6, Section A, Paragraph 12, Item b of Invitation To Bid Procedures, Bidder Information. "It is required that
all responding Bidders attend the mandatory LSBE meeting within two-weks of the solicitation advertisement in order to remain responsive.”

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature: Purchasing Director Signature:

BOC Award Approval Date:




