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ITB No. 18-101038 Department of Purchasing & Contracting  Bid Opening: 12/11/2018
ITB Name: Ammunition {Annual with Two Options To Renew) Price Opening 12/19/2018
Bid Tabulation Cynthia W. Ferrell
Vendors Gulf State Specialty Cartridges
Handgun and Submachine Gun Ammunition
Estimated #
ITEM DESCRIPTION of Units Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Speer Gold Dot, Part# 53966, Grain: 230. Caliber: .
1 45, Case of 500, No substitutes. 45 $399.00 $17,955.00 No Bid
Winchester Ranger T Series, Part# RA40T, Grain:
2 180. Caliber: 40 Smith & Wesson or acceptable 50 No Bid No Bid
equal. Case of 500. No substitutes,
Atlanta Arms, Full Metal Jacket and training
3 reload, Part# AAAL40180, Grain: 180. Caliber: 213 No Bid $205.00 $43,665.00
A40. Case of 1000. No substitutes.
Atlanta Arms, Caliber: 38 Grain: 148. Case of .
4 1000. No substitutes. 10 No Bid $265.00 $2,650.00
Atlanta Arms, Grain: 115, Caliber: 9mm. Case of .
5 1000. No substitutes. 10 No Bid $181.00 $1,810.00
Atlanta Arms, Grain; 230. Caliber: 45. ACP. Case .
6 of 1000. No substitutes. 150 No Bid £255.00 $38,250.00
Winchester Ranger T Series, Part #RA45T, Grain: . .
7 230. Caliber: 45 Auto. Case 500, No substitutes. 0 No Bid HOLL
Winchester Ranger T Series 147 grain. 9mm Part , .
. # RAIT. Case of 500. No substitutes. 150 Bl No Bid
Winchester Ranger T Series, Part #RA45T, Grain: .
9 230. Caliber: 45 Auto, Case 500. No substitutes. = No Bid — L TERLY
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Winchester Ranger T Series, Part #RA45T, Grain:
230. Caliber: 45 Auto. Case 500. No substitutes.

No Bid

$280.00

£560.00

Atlanta Arms, Part # AAAL4OF, Caliber: .40 lead
free frangible training rounds or acceptable equal.
Casc of 1000. No substitutes,

No Bid

$375.00

$3,750.00

Atlanta Arms, 147 grain TCJ 9mm practice
rounds. Case of 1000. No Substitutes.

500

No Bid

£185.00

$92,500.00

Atlanta Arms, Grain; 145. Caliber: .45 or
acceptble equal. Case of 500, No substitutes.

10

No Bid

$350.00

$3,500.00

Homady .223 caliber 62 grain Barrier TAP
part#HORB83285 case of 200. No substitutes,

$125.00

$875.00

No Bid

15

Hornady .40 caliber 175 grain Critical Duty part #
HOR91375 case of 500. No substitutes.

$205.00

$1,435.00

No Bid

HOTGUN

AND RIFLE AMMUNITION

Remington 12 gauge reduced recoil 00 buckshot,
Part# RR12BK800, Case of 250. No substitutes.

No Bid

No Bid

Federal 12 gauge standard recoil, 00 buckshot, ¢
pellets or acceptable equal. Case of 250.
Maunfacturer Name & Item No. Federal
LEI32-00

50

3116.50

$5,825.00

Na Bid

Federal American Eagle Full Metal Jacket, Pan#
FEDXMI193F or Part# AE223 or AE223BK,
Grain: 55. Caliber: 5.56 mm or .223 mm, practice
rounds. Case of 500. No substitues. AE223J
500 cs

424

$161.00

$68,264.00

No Bid

19

Federal American Eagle FMJ Part# AE223 Grain:
55 Caliber: 5.56 or .223 Case: 500. No
substitues.

75

$161.00

$12,075.00

No Bid
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Federal Tactical Rifle Urban Ballistic Tips, Part#
T223F, Grain: 55. Caliber: 5.56 mm, duty rounds.
Case of 500. No substitutes. T223T is the new
part #, same round just new part #.

100

$259.00

$25,900.00

No Bid

21

Homady TAP, Part# HOR83276, Grain: 55.
Caliber: 5.56 mm, duty |. Case of 200. No
|substitues.

$125.00

$2,000.00

No Bid

Homady TAP Barrier, Caliber: .223, Grain
weight: 62, Part# 83285, No substitutes.

10

$125.00

$1,250.00

Neo Bid

23

Federal Gold Metal Boat Tail Hollow Point, Part#
GM 308M, match grade, Grain: 168. Caliber:
.308. Case of 500. No substitutes.

25

$359.00

£8,975.00

No Bid

24

Ruag Swiss P Styx Action HPBT. Grain : 69,
Caliber: .223 Case: 1000 No Substitutes. Part #
3-949-4-1000

$625.00

$3,125.00

No Bid

25

Ruag Swiss P Target HPBT. Grain: 168, Caliber
308, Case: 200. No substitues Part# 3-074-4-
0200

§259.00

$518.00

No Bid

26

Ruag Swiss P Styx Action HPBT. Grain: 167,
Caliber: 308, Case: 200. No Substitutes Part#
3-905-4-0200

[

£369.00

$738.00

Ne Bid

27

CTG Swiss P Tactical. Grain: 164, Caliber: .308,
Case: 200. No substitues. Part#3-458-4-0300

$638.00

£1,276.00

No Bid

28

Swiss P Tactical FNBT, Grain: 250, Caliber; .338,
Case: 200, No substitucs. Part#3-108-4-0200

$617.00

$1,234.00

No Bid

Swiss P Armor Piercing. Grain: 260, Caliber:
338, Case: 200. No substitutes. Part# 3-655-4-
0200

$£1,007.00

$2,034.00

No Bid
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Swiss P Target HPBT. Grain: 250, Caliber: .338,
Case: 200. No substitutes. Part# 3-615-4-0200

$639.00

$3,195.00

No Bid

31

Federal Gold Metal Boat Tail Hollow Point, Part#
GM 3006M, maich grade, Grain: 168. Caliber:
3006 or acceptable equal. Case of 200,
Manufacturer Name & ltem No. Federal
GCM3606M

10

$245.00

$2,450.00

No Bid

Federal Tactical Load, Part¥LE223TI, Grain: 55
or accepable equal. Case of 500.
Manufacturer Name & Item No.  Federal
LE223TI1

$205.00

$1,230.00

$475.00

$2,850.00

33

Atlanta Arms, lead free frangible training rounds,
Partt AAA223F, Grain: .45. Caliber: .223 or
acceptable equal. Case of 1000,

Manufacturer Name & Item No.

No Bid

$500.00

$2,500.00

LESS LETHA

L AMMUNITION

34

12 Gauge No. 7.5 Birdshot, target load or
acceptable equal. Case of 250. Manufacturer
Name & Item No. Federal TGL12H 7.5

50

$69.00

£3,450,00

No Bid

35

12 Gauge, 2 % Popper Rounds (Blanks) or
acceptable equal. Case of 250 Manufacturer
Name & Item No.

70

No Bid

No Bid

36

Speer Force on Force marker Training
ammunition. Caliber: 9mm. Case of 500. No
substitutes. All colors, FF9R2, FF9G2, FF9B2

300

§245.00

§73,500.00

No Bid

37

Speer Force maker Training ammunition, Caliber:
5.56/223. Case of 500. No substitutes., All
colors FFSS661, FFSS6B1, FF558R1

150

$289.00

$43,350.00

No Bid

38

Combined Tactical Systems CTS, Part# 2581
Super-Sock 12 gauge. 5 rounds per box and yearly
certification. Ne substitutes.

30

No Bid

No Bid
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Combined Tactical Systems CTS Part# 9230,

39 Sting Ball 10 No Bid No Bid

Combined Tactical Systems CTS Part# 9290, 50 No Bid No Bid
40 Flash Bang

OwBE:& Tactical Systems CTS Part# 9590, 10 No Bid No Bid
41 Sting Ball

Pepper Ball Inert. Training Round, Part# PC3 - . .
42 P375. 375 rounds per jar. No Substitutes 8 HOLL No Bid

Pepper Ball PAVA Hot Pepper Round, Part# PP- . .
43 R10X. 375 rounds per round 4 . No Bid

Defense Technology Spede Heat 37 tom Short . .
44 |Renge, Part#2003. SAF - Smoke. No substitues. % Nogxd NoBid

Defense Technology Spede Heat 37 mm Long . -
45 Range, Part#]183. SAF - Smoke. No substitutes. 100 B Joil No Bid

Defense Technology Spede Heat 37 mm Long

Range CS, Part#]182C. SAF - Smoke. No 50 No Bid No Bid
46 substitutes,

Defense Technology Spede Heat CS 37mm Short . N
. Range, Part# 2002CS. No substitutes. 0 b No Bid

Defense Technology 37mm Multiple Foam Baton, . .
48 Part# 2002CS. No substitutes. = No Bid No Bid

Defense Technology SAF-Simoke Greneade, pant# . .
49 1063 No Substifutes. 10 No Bid No Bid
50 C8 Tri Chamber Flameless, Part#1032 25 No Bid No Bid
31 C8 Tri Chamber Flameless, Part#1030 25 No Bid Ne Bid

Homady 12 GA Shotgun Tap Light Magnum 00

Buck, Parv#86276, 20 boxes per case. New Part 6 $89.00 $534.00 No Bid

# 86275 same spec. 100 rounds case
52

GRAND TOTAL - Awarded per line item for each Vendor $281,188.00 $195,710.00

Number of Bids Received:
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LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE NO NO

Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No) Yes Yes

Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No) Yes Yes
NOTES - DETAIL JUSTIFICATION

Recommend award to the lowest, responsible and responsive bidders:
Guilf State Distributors, 6000 East Shirley Lane, Montgomery, AL 36117
{Item Nos.: 1, 14-15, 17-32, 34, 36, 37 and 52)

Specialty Cartridges dba Atlanta Arms, 7129 Wheat Street NE, Covington, GA 30014
{Item Nos.: 3-6, 9-13 and 33}

Note 1: NO LSBE or GFE was completed by any vendors, therefore all were on the same playing field.

Note 2: Vendors deemed Non-responsive:

Precision Delta Corporation - Failure to submit price in separate sealed envelope and to submit entire ITB document per the solicitation requirements.
GT Distributors, Inc. - Failure to attend Mandatory LSBE meeting as mandated in the solicitation.

Smyrna Police Distributors Inc. - Failure to submit entire ITB document and required documents per the solicitation requirements.
SRT Supply - Failure to attend Mandatory LSBE meeting as mandated in the solicitation.

Witness Signature: 7 4 Q\?&u\ ;NWN\N
Agent Signature: n“ 2 &\ §
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