ITB Nurber: 18-101046

BID TABULATION
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair
Southern Tire Mart
(Bid Na. 1} Atlanta Atlanta
Southarn Tire Mart G Tire clal Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive {Bld Ne. 2) J&R Tira Inc. MNaxtire Goodyear Tire {8id 1) {Bld 2} Action Tire Midtown Tire
1 P205/65R1S
T Name & Tre Ten Athmazx Goudyear Assurance| aTnEon Fud Goodyear Guadyear |
Name OPLS Py and | General Atimax, Ply 4, Treaa RT43 & 15494940000 Goodyedar Assurance, | A/S, Ply 947, Tread | Figner, Piy 6, Fuzian, Ply 6, Assurarce, Py 4 Asturance, Ply 4,
1a Tread Depth 10 Tread 10 Firestone FR710, Tread 11 Ho Bid Ply 4, Tread 9 9 Tread 10 Tread 19 Tread 9 Tread 9
PrILE Por Ut
1b {50 Units) $62.00 $59 73 $67 D0 Ho Bid \.m....a/ $56. 64 $61.54 $60.56 $51 00 $56.64
$3,100.00 $2,986.50 $3.350.00
1 Total Amount Ho Bid $2.720.00 $2,832.00 $3.177 00 $3.028 00 43,050 03 $2,832 00
2 P205/75R15 Na Bict
~Grand Hame & e Goudyear
r ot o o | Gen- Grabver AT2, Piy 4, | Gen. Grabber AT2 | Fuestone Winlerforce condvem ﬂ..wm_ﬂe...w.ﬂ.._nh Firestone T I A
e ¥ Tread-14 21546380000 2, Tread L2 year Assurance, 2 Ply 97T, Tread | wintarforce Pl ugion, Pty 4, surande, Py 4, |Goodyear Assurance
2a Tread Depth Tread-14 ' Na Bld Ply 4, Tread 9 ] 4 Treag 17 Lt Tread 12 Tread 9 AfS, Ply 4, Tread 9
Price Fer Umit $85 74
2b {30 Units) $83.00 $846.00 Nao Bld $£31.00 46585 $B5.34 37135 $70.00 $65.85
2¢ Total Amount $2.640.00 $1.572.20 $2.640.00 No Bid ’:.maa L] \ $1,975.50 42,560 20 $2,140.50 $2,106.00 $1,975.50
3 P215/BORLS No Bid N~ 7
frand Hame & Tire Gen. Atlimax Bridgestane Ecopla 422 FST Champion Fuet
Nama CPL# -Ply and | General Altimazx, Fly 4, Tread RTA3215495010000 Plus, Tread 10 Ironeman, Ply 4, Tread Fighter, Ply &, Futien, Ply 4, Sailun/Atrezzo, Piy
Ja Tread Depth 11 Tread: 11 Mo B 10 Mo Bid Tread 10 Tread 10 m} No &id
Price Per Ualt
3b (200 Unsts) $64.98 $62.79 $93.00 Ho Bid Mo 8id $63.58 $5% .40 $49 00 No Bid
e Tatal Amount $12,996.00 $12,558 00 $18,600.00 Mo Bt No Bid $12,716.00 $11,880.00 \s9,80000 / No Bid
S
4 P215/60R16 Ho Bl
Brand Mame & Tire Gen, Athmax Goodyear Assurance) Goodyear
Hame GPL#-Ply and | General Alimax, Py 4, Tread RT43x 15497810009 KyLemans/Ironman, | AfS, Ply 95T, Tread |FST Al Season, Ply|  Fuzion, Ply 4 Assurance, Py 6, |Goodyear Assurance
43 Tread Depth 11 Tread-11 Firestone FR710, Tread 10 Ho Bid Pty 4, Tread 10 9 4 Tread 12 Tread 12 Tread 9 AJS, Py 4, Tread 9
Price Per Unit $7397 $71.71 $80.00
4b {250 ualts) Mo Biit 359 00 $65.00 $72 60 36111 $70.00 $65.00
4ac Total Amount $18,492.50 $17,927.50 $20.000.00 No Bid f:a_uma‘no M $16.250.¢0 $1B8.150 00 f $15.777 mo\_ $17,500.00 $1.£25 00
5 P15/70R14 o Bit 7 A 7
Brand Hame & Tire Gen. Atlimax Firestone Winterforce , Cont Atlimax, Firestane Firestone Uniroyal Tizer AWF
Name QPL#-Ply and { General Alimax, Ply 4, Teead RT43215495050000 Tread 13 Py Tread Winterfaree Ply | Winterforce Py [pty 6 Tread
5a Tread Depth 12 Tread-12 Ho B4 11 Mo Bld 4, Tread 12 4, Tread 12 9 No Bid
PEILE Per tant
b {20 Units}) $59.41 \Ga $92.00 Ho Bid 158.00 No $B89.85 $89.85 $77 00 Nao Bid
5¢ Total Amount $1.158 20 f $L18H \ $1,840.00 Ho Bed 40,160 00 No 8id $1,797.00 $1.797.00 $1,530 00 Mo Bid
B P215//0R15 g S
Brand Nama & Tire Firestone Chamption Fuel| Firestone Champion Goodyear AssuranceiFST Champice Fuel Goodyear
Hame GPL#-Ply and | General Atimax, Ply 4, Tread Fighter 2014910 Fuet Fighter, Tread 11 Ironman Hwy , Ply 4. { A/S_ Ply 98T, Tread | Fighter, Ply 4, Fuzion, Py 4, Assurance, Ply 6, | Goodyear Integrity,
62 Tread Depth 12 No B2 Tread 10 9 Tread 12 Tread 17 Tread 9 v_.“_\.\_._.dsﬁa
Price Per Unit
6b (30 Units} $64 51 $59.2t $59.21 No B 35500 $60.19 358 21 56357 $66.00 552 86
6C Total Amount $1,935 30 $1,776.30 $1,776 30 o Bid $1.650 00 $1,805.70 $1.746 30 $1.304 10 $1,980.00 / $1 58580 \
! P225/70RLS Ho B . ey
Brand Hame & Tire Gen. Atlimax Firestane Dest LEZ, Goodyear Wrangler | Firestone Dest. | Firestone Dest.
Name OPLT-Ply and | General Altlmax, Py 4, Teead AT43# 15495060000 Tread 12 Tronman, Ply 4, Tread SRA, Py 1005, LE2, Py 4, Tread |LE2, Ply 4, Tread Goodyear Wrangler | Goodyear Wrangler
7a Tread Depth 12 Tread-12 Mo Bid 10 Tread 11 12 12 SRA, Ply 6, Tread 11|SRA, Piy 4, Tread 11
Price Per Unit
7b {20 Units) $73.95 $70.95 $88.53 Mo Bi $70.00 $42.57 $84.50 $84.50 $98.00 $92.57
ic Tatal Amaunt 31.479.00 $1.419.00 $1,770 60 No i f §1.400.00 _. $1,851 40 $1.690 00 $1,690 .00 $1.96Q U0 $1,.851.40
[] PZ25/75R15 ho Bid / \
— Firestone Dest. | Firestone Dest.
Brangt Hame & Tire Goocyear Wrangler |) g3 Ply 4, Tread |LE2, Ply 4, Tread Goodyear Wrangter
Name OPL#-Ply and Firestone Viinterforge 2 UV | Flrestone Wintesforce 2 trenman, Py 4, Tread SRA, Ply 1025, 12 12 year \Wrangler | Trall AT, Py
8a Tread Depih Powerking, Pty 8, Tread 10 7148419 UV ¥148419, Tread 13 Mo B 10 Tread 11 SRA, Py 6, Tread 11 4, Tread 12
Price Per Unit
ab (20 Units) \\Mglj $113.00 $112.00 ta @I 172,00 496.77 $119 B0 $119.80 $99.00 $90 23
Be Total Amount [EE.\ $2.260.00 $2,260.00 Na B2 140000 $1.93540 32,396 0O 31,396 00 $1.980 Q0 $1.804 60
E] P235/70RES Ho Bz

Witness Signalure:

Agent Si

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Approval Date:

Tammy Shew




ITB Number: 18-101046

a

BID TABULATION
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair
Soulth:
A Atlanta Atlanta
) Southern Tire Ma [ clal Tire | € il Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive {Bid Na. 2) JaR Tire Inc. Nextira Goodysar Tira (Bid 1) (8id 2) Actlon Tire Midtown Tire
Brand Hame & Tire Gen, Atlimax Firestone Dest. AT, Cant. Atlimax, Gooayear Wrangter | FEstOne Dest. | Firestone Dest.
Name OPL3 -Piy and | General Alumas, Fiy 4, Tréad RT43 71552710000 Tread 13 Ply 4 Tread-| SRA, Ply tozs, [LE2. Ply 4, Tread|LE2, Ply 4, Tread| goodyear wrangler ’ o
1 Tread Depth 12 Tread 12 Mo Bid 12 Tread tt 12 12 SRA, Py 6, Teaad 11 |SRA, Ply 4, Tread 11
Frice Per Unlt
ik {100 units) $76.00 9 $¥ 00 Mo g $77.00 $90.00 $131.32 $133.32 $96.00 $90.00
Total Ameunt $2,600 .00 f/ §T A7 aan\ $9,500 00 Na Big $7,700.00 $9,000.00 $13,332.00 411,332 00 $9,600.00 $9,600.00
P235/75R15 e Mg B
Gerneral HTS, Ply 4, Tread Gen Grabber HTS Firestone Dest,
Brand Name & Tire 12 204503120000 Gaodyear Wrangler |\ 2, ply 4, Tread
Hame OPL7-Ply and Tread-12 Flrestone Dest. LE2 Roadtour/Mex, Ply 4, | Raglal, Py 10585, 12 Furion AT, Ply 4, | Goodyear Wrangler | Goadyear Wrangter
10a Tread Depth Tread 12 No Bid Tread 10 Tread 13 Tread 12 SRA, Ply 6, Tread 13]SRA, Py 4, Tread 11
Price Per Unit
100 (100 Units) 59109 56197 39791 o 566,00 $65.70 $100.21 h@j 370 00 $90.00
10¢ Total Amount $9,100 0o 38,497 00 $9,791.00 No St $6,800.00 uo.mwn.a $10,021.00 /m?..ao 00 \ $7.000 00 $9,000.00
1 P235/70R16 Wo B —
Brand Name & Tire | General HTS, Ply 4, Tread | Gen. Grabber HTS60 Goodyear e Goodyear
Hame OPL# Pty and 12 204504670000 Bridgestone Dueler H/L Goodyear Assurance, AJS, Ply 100T,  |FST AN Seasen, Ply|  Fuzlan, Ply 4, A , Fiy 6, ¥
1la Tread Depth Tread-12 421, Tread 10 No Bid Py 4, Tread 10 Tread 9 4, Tread 12 Tread 12 Tread 13 ASS, Ply 4, Tread 10
Price Per Unit
11b {100 Units) $07.79 385 74 391 39 ta Bid $76.00 37800 %1 52 % 584 00 378,00
11c Total Amount $8,719.00 $8,574.00 49,139 00 Ho Bid $7,600.00 $7.800.00 $9.152 00 / $7.564 00 \ $4.400 00 $7.800 00
12 P235770R17 Ha Bid pa————
General HTS, Py 4, Tread Firestone Dest. | Firestone Dest
Brand Hame & Tire 12 Googyear \Wiangler LE2, Py 4, Tread |LE2, Piy 4, Tread Gecdyear Wriargler
Hame OQPL#-Ply ang firestone Dest LEX Frestone Dest LE2 Goodyear Furtitude, Fortitude, Ply i pm. " __u. Fortitude, Fiy 8, | Gooayear Fortitude
12a Tread Depth 2097776 Tread 13 097776 Tread 13 N= Bid Ply 4, Tread 12 110X4, Tread 12 Tread 12 HT, Fiy 4, Tread 12
PTCE Per Ut
120 (400 Units) $107.79 $103.02 $103 02 H= Bid \ 96 uy $102 00 597 27 497 27 $101.00 $102 00
12¢ Total Amount $43,116.00 $41,208 00 $41,208 00 Hao Big /mum.wan cc\ $40,800.00 $38,908 90 438,908 U0 340,400 Q0 $40,800 00
13 P255/65R17 o & ~
General HTS, Ply 4, Tread | Gen. Grabber HTS60 Firestone Dest. AT, Firestone Dest. [ Firestane Dest
Brand Hame & Tire = Goodyear Wranglar | o+ Goodyear Wrangler
Name OPL#-Ply and L] o...u_.ma“.w.._pouc_uc Tread 13 Goodyear Fortitude, | Fortitude, Py 180T, Lol <~n~. Tread | AT, v:.a&u. Tread Fortitude, Ply §, | Goodyear Fortitude
13a Tread Depth e No Bid Pty 4, Tread 11 Tread 11 Tread 1t HT, Ply 4 Tread 11
FhiLe Per Oml
13b {50 Units} $115.00 $11277 311700 Ma Bid $98 00 $103.49 $110.87 $110.87 $107.00 5103 4%
1ic fotal Amount $5, 75000 35,638 50 35850 00 Ha Big -/ $4,900.C0 \ 5,174 50 45,543 50 $5,543.50 +5,350.00 35,174 50
14 P2357 JOR16 o Bia ——
Brand Hame & Tre | OENETS x._.mp.n_.._x 4, Tread mm_._u. %.Mwwwm%%.mmc Seodyear Assurance _.mmmamu._n:m m.n.w”_a Goody y 3
Hame OPL#-Ply and s Fisestone Dest LE2 KyLemans/ironman, | CS Fuel Max, Ply ey u_ Fupion, Py 4 Assurance, Ply 6, | €S Fuel Max, Piy 4,
142 Tread Depth Tread-12 Treas 13 N i Ply 4, Tread 12 1117, Tread 11 g Tread 12 Tread 11 Tread 11
Frice Fer Oml
14b {100 Units) $95 98 $93.64 $117 &2 Na lud $89.00 $106.00 311310 A.. 58 $10% 90 $106.00
4L Tetal Amount $9,548.00 $9,364 00 $11,700 CG No e $8,500 00 $19,608. 00 $1,210 00 /:. 458,00 $10,900.00 $10.600.00
15 PZI5745R18 BT e ——
Beand Name B Tire General GMAX, Piy 4, Goodyear agle
Name OPL#-Piy and Tread 11 Flrestone All Season Firgstase AN Season Ironman, Ply 4, Tread |RSA, ply 94V, Tread| FST Firehawk AS, |Fuzion Touring, Ply| Gaodyear Eagle Goodyear Eagle
153 Tread Depth #003065 Tread 10 #00306% Tread 10 bz Bt 10 11 Ply 4. Tread 12 4, Tread 17 RSA, ply &, Tread 11 |RSA, ply 4, Tread 11
FIe Per Uit
156 {60 Units) $118.00 $111.00 $113 00 Ha Bid $78.00 $100.00 $107 17 \mum o0 / $105.00 $100 00
15¢ iotal Ameount 47,080 00 36,780 00 $6,780 00 Ha Big $4,660.00 $6,000.00 $6,430.20 / 4 500 00 K 36,300 00 $6,000.00
16 LT215/80R16 tiz ta e
Brand Name & Tire | Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Gen. Grabter HD Firestone Transforce Firestore Firestone
Nama OPLE-Py and Tread: 14 204507140000 10 Ply [ HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14 Goodyear Wrangier - | Goodyear Weangler | Transforce HT2, | Transforce HTZ, | Goodyear Wrangler | Goodyear Wrangler
163 Tread Depth Tread-14 He Eid HT, Ply 10, Tread 13 [T, Py 10, Tread 13 pty 10, Tread 14| Py 10, Tread 14 |HT. Piy 10, Fread 13| HT. Py 10, Tread 13
PTG Por Unit
16b (100 Unlts) $103.86 $99.44 $102 67 Ha Bid $103 00 $103.00 $100,00 }on.aﬁ/ $108.00 $109 0D
16C Total Amount $10,186 00 (w.fs oc\\ $10 267 00 Ho Big :e__.m.m..,cc $10.900 00 $10,000.00 /n_b.ccc.n_.._ \ 410,800 QO $10.900.00
17 LT1225/75R16 Ho Bid S
Brand Hame & Tire | Gen, Grabber HD, 13 Ply Gen, Grabzer HO Frestone Transforce Firestone
Hame CPLE-Ply and Tread-14 204507160000 10 Ply | HT2, Py 10, Tread 14 Ironman AX, Ply 19, | Goodyear Wrangler | Transfgrce HT2, |Fuzion Touring, Ply] Goodyear Wrangter | Goodyear Wrangier
17a Tread Depth Teead 1a k Mo Beg Teead 14 HT, Py 10, Treadd 14] piy 11} Troad 34| 10, Tread 14 {HT Ply 10. Tread 14 |HT, Ply 10, Tread 14
VLG Pl Ol \u
17b {130 Units) $108.94 $104.65 111 ¢ Ha Bid $102 CO $110.09 $110 G mm.my $109.00 $110.00
17¢ Total Amount $16,341.00 $15,697 50 $16,650 00 Mo G $15,300.00 516,500 00 $16.500 00 /M.wu’&.l.% $16,350.00 $1b,500.00
Witness 5ig
Agent Sig 1

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Awaid Approval Date:

Tammy Shew




ITB Number: 18-101046 BID TABULATION
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repalr
Southern Tire Mart
(Bid No. 1) Attanta Atlanta
Sowthern Tire Mart Commarclal Tire | Commercial Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION Bast Drive {Bld No. 2) J&R Tire tnec. Nextira Goodyanr Tira {Bid 1) {Bid 2} Actlon Tira Midtown Tire
t8 LT225/75R17 Ho Bl
Brand Name & Tire | Cooper HTS, Ply 10, Tread | Firestone Transforce HTZ2 Firestone Transforce Firestone Transforce Firestone Firestone
Hame OPLe -Ply and 14 #002774 Py 19 HT2, Py 10, Tread 14 HT2, Ply 10, Tread Transtorce HT2, | Fransforce HT2, | Cooper HT3, Ply 10
104 Tread Depth Tread 14 No Bid 14 No But Pty 10, Tread 14 | Ply 10, Tread 14 Tread 12 Ho Bid
FIICE Per UMt
1486 {30 Units) $132.00 $108.46 5108 46 Na Bid }-nm oo/ No Bid 512574 31251 $149.00 No Bia
18c Total Amoint $3.560 00 33,253 80 $3,25180 Ha Bid \ $329005 ) He Bid $3,772.20 $3,772.20 $4,470.00 No 8id
19 Li235/85R16 No Bid e —
Brand Hame & The | Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Gen, Grabber HD Firestone Transforce Firgstone Fireszone Goodyear Virangler
Name OPL¥-Ply and Tread-14 204507170000 tOPly | HT2, Ply 10, Tread 15 lronman Allfc, Ply 10, { Goodyear Wrangler | Transforce HT2, | Transforte HT2, | Goodyear wrangler | HTS, Ply 10, Tread
198 Tréad Depth Tread-14 No 8id Treag 15 HT, Ply 10, Tread 14] Ply 10, Tread 14 | Ply 10, Tread 14 |HT, Piy 10, Teead 14 14
Frice Par Uil
150 (150 Unlts) $114.77 314077 $114.39 No tud $106.00 $121.40 $119.39 $119.39 $120 00 $121.00
15C Total Amount $17.215 50 $16,615.50 $17,158 50 o Bt - N\, $15.900.00 / 316,150 00 517,908 50 $17,5908.50 $18,000 00 $18,150 00
20 LT245%/75R16 Ho it pa—
Brand Hame & Tire Gen, Grabber HD, 10 Ply Gen. Grabber HD Firestone Transiorce Gen. Grabber , 10 Flrestone Firestong
Namea CFL2 -Ply and Tread-t14 #04507180000 10 Pty | HTZ, Ply 10, Tread 14 Ply Tread-14 Goodyear Wrangler Transforce HT2, | Transforge HYZ, | year Wrangter : g
0a Tread Depah Tread-14 Ha Bid HT, Biy 10, Tread 13| PIY 10, Tread 15| Ply 10, Tread 14| yr 010 Tread 13|6T, Piy 10, Trasd 13
FriLe n.mu ﬂ .n.
{600 Units} $106.27 $105 16 $109 50 Ho Bld $106 00 $115 00 $104 50 \2? my $112.00 $115.00
Z0c lotal Amount 363,762 00 $63,096.00 $65,700 00 Tio Bid $63,600 00 $69 COC.00 $62,700.00 N, $62,700.00 7 $67,800.00 $6%,000.00
21 LT245/75R17 Hha Bid i
Brand Name & Tie | Gen. Grabber HD, 10 m< Gen, Grabber HD Firesione Transforce Goudyear Wrangler Firestone Firgstone Goodyear Wrangler | Goodyear Wrangier
Hame OPLZ-Py and Tread-14 20450720000 10 #ly | HT2, Ply 10, Tread 14 fronman All Ciry, Piy | SRA, Piy 10, Tread | fransiorce HT2, | Transfonce HT2, | SRA, Py 10, Tread | SRA, Py 10, Treag
213 Tread Depth 5 Teead-14 Ha Bid 10, Tread 15 14 Fly 10, Tread 15 | Pty 10, Tread 14 14 14
— Fiwe Per Gt —
2th {300 Units) $124 20 $120.00 $120.96 o Bid $115.00 $140.00 $110 96 $110.96 5139 00 $140 00
¢ Total Amount $37,290 00 36,000 00 $36,288 090 Ho Bid $34.500 00 $42,000.60 $33,288.00 \ $33.288.00 } $41,700 00 $37,000 0O
22 L1265/ 70R17 Wio B -
Brand Hame & Tire | ©en, Grabber HD, 10 Ply Gen. Grahber HD Firestene Transforce Goodyear Wrangler Firestone Goodyear Wrangter | Goodyear Wrangler
Name OPL#-Ply and Tread-14 204507220000 10 Ply | HT2, Pty 10, Tread 15 Ky Lemans SuV, Ply | SRa, Pry 10, Tread | Transforce MT2, | Fuzion, iy 38, | SR, Piy 10, Tread | SRA, Piy 10, Tread
223 Tread Depth Tread-t4 Mo Bid 10, Tread 15 15 Ply 10, Tread 14 Tread 14 15 15
Frice per Omit
22b {60 Unlts} $135.00 $130.37 $134 56 No Bid $119.00 $160.00 3127 56 Baa.uy $160.00 $160.00
22c Total Amount $8,100.00 $7.622.20 $8,073.60 No thd $7,130 00 $9,b00.00 37 65360 \ 36,561.60 J 49,600.00 $9.600.00
23 LT265/75R16 No Bid i ——
Brand Name & Tire | Gen. Grabber HO, 10 Ply Gen. Grabber HO Firestone Transiarce Goadyear Wrangler Firestone Goodyear Wrangler | Goodyear Wrangler
Name OPL#-Ply and Tread-14 04507190000 10 Py | HTZ, Ply 10, Tread 15 Ky Lemans SUV, Ply | SRA, Ply 10, Treag | Transforce HT2, 1 gyzion, Pty 10, | SRa, Pty 10, Traad | SRA, Ply 10, Tread
23a Tread Depth Tread-14 No fid 10, Tread 15 14 Ply 10, Tread 14 Tread 14 14 14
THCE Fer Ol
23t {50 Units) $124.88 312071 $126 29 Mo Bt $117.00 $145.00 $12t 29 \Gu uy 3145 00 $145.00
43¢ Total Amount $6.245.00 $6,015.50 $6,314.50 o Bid $5,850.00 $7.250.00 $6,064 50 N, $4.861.00 7 $7,250.00 $7 250.00
24 L1275/ 7OR1B tie Bia ——
Gen. Grabber HD, 10 Ply Firgstone Transforce Firestone Furestone
Brand Name & Tire Tread-14 estone Transforce HT2 | 12, Ply 10, Tread 16 Goodyear Transforce HT2, | Transforce HT2, | Goodyear Wrangler Goodyaar
Name DPL£ Ply and 2002778 Py 10 fronman All Ctry, Ply | Tralrunner AT, Ply Ply 10, Tread 14 | Ply 10, Tread 14 Trailiznner, Ply 10, | Tratrunner AT, Pty
243 Tread Depth Tread 16 Na Big 10, Tread 15 10. Tread 15 E : Tread 15 10, Tread 15
Frice Per Omt
24b {20 Units) $151.00 $145.65 $145.65 No Bl }uwu au/ $176.41 $13565 $135865 $177 00 $176 41
24¢ Total Amount $3,0J0.00 $2,913 00 $2,913.00 Ho Bt \$264000 J $3.528 20 $2,71300 $2.71300 $3.540.00 33528 20
25 245/ 75R17.5 Ho BiT S——
Brand Name & Tire | Continental HTRZ, Ply 16, | Teyo M1430 =520540 Continental HTR2, Goodyear Regional Double Co'n Goodyear Regional
Mame QPLF-Piy-16 Tread 16 Ply 18 Tread L5 Tread 16 Ironman 1-109 Hwy, | RMS, Ply 16, Tread | CN HTRZ, Ply 16, | CN HTRZ. Py 16, |RTSAC, Load J, Ply | RHS, Ply 16, Tread
25a and Tread Depth Ho Bed Pty 16, Tread 16 16 Trean 15 Tread 15 18 Tread 16 18
Price Per umit
25b {30 Units) $209.97 $200.57 $207 50 Mo Bid 312900 $275.00 $215.00 $215 00 $165 00 $275 00
25¢ Total Amount $6,299.10 $8.017.10 $6,215.00 o tid \ 3417000 $48.250.00 $6,450.00 36,450 00 33,950 00 $8,250.00
FE] 735/70R39.5 o tia e
Brand Hame & Twe | Continental HS3, Ply 14, Toyo M143 #562020 Firestone FS560 Plus, CN Hybrid HS3, Deubie Coin Mo Bid
Hame OPLE-Ply-13 Tread 18 Ply 16 Tread 16 Tread 17 Ironman 1-109 Hwy Kelly Armorsteel | FST FS563 Py 14, Tread 17 RT&LO, Load H,
263 and Tread Depth No Bid Ply 16, Tread L& RSA_TFread 16 Tread 17 Py 14, Tread 16
Fhice ver ot Tio Bid
26b (10 Units) $249.00 $184.18 $250.50 Ha Bid )mu.my $190 00 $112 99 $219.00 3170 00
260 iotal Amaunt $1,a9000 $1.841.80 $2.505.00 Ho Bio N $1.570.00 F $1.900.00 $2.129 90 $2,190.00 $1,700 0O No Bid
27 255/70R22'S No Bid

Withett Signature:

Agent Signatuse:

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Approval Date

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 18-101046
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION

Southern Tire Mart
(BId No. 1) . Atlanta Atlants
Southern Tire Mart Commarclsl Tire | Commuercia) Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive {Bid No. 2) J&R Tire Inc. Nextire Goodyear Tire {Bid 1) {Bid 2) Action Tire Midtown Tire
Brand Wame & Jire | Continenta! _Ezn..m._« 16.] Teyo M122 =548150 Continental HSR2, CN HSR2 SA, Bouble Coin No Bid
Hame QPLE Ply-16 & Tread 23 Ply 16 Tread 17 Tread 18 d lronmar 1:181 Hwy, | Goodyear Marathon | FST FSS60 Piy 16, Tread 21 RT500, Tread 16
272 Tread Depth o a3 Ply 1%, Tread 18 RSA, Tread 18 Tread 21
Price Per Unit Na Bid
276 {80 Units) $234 97 56 .50 423250 Ha B 516500 $265 00 $249.50 $225.00 $205.00
22 Total Amount. $10,797 jo /ﬁu.ﬂn.cc\ $18,600.00 Mo Bad 111.200.00 $21 200 00 $19,960.00 $18.000.C0 $16,900 00 No Bid
<8 11R22 5 e ——— Ho B No Big
Brat! Mame & Tire | Continental HSR2, Ply 16, | Toya M170 xS46000 Firestone FS560 Plus, Goodyear Marathon CMN HSR2, Ply | Goodyear Marathon No Bid
Name OPLZ Py and Tread 23 Fly 16 Tread 19 Pty 16, Tread 19 Goodyear Marathon | ASS, Ply 16, Tread { FST FS560 Ply 16, | 16, Tread 21 RSA, Py 16, Tread
282 Tread Depth Ho Bid RSS, Py 16, Tread 18 18 Tread 21 2
FriLE Per Ot Ni Bd
280 (300 Unlts) $302.93 $205.86 $275 50 Ho Bid $251 00 $260.00 $288.00 $303.00 $276.00
2BC Total Amount $90,879.90 f $61,758.00 \ $82,050 OO No Bid $75.200.00 $72,000.00 $86,400.00 $#90.500 00 $82,800 00 No Bid
29 12R22 5 S— o Bia e Bid
T THante & 10g TSl o COITENa TSR TR ToDUYTaT PTG COTTyaar T TaTa oI
1 H |
Name OPL5 -Fry & non_"an:."wg amww (PIY 16| 0512088 Ply 18 Treac no::.ﬁdﬂ.m_mww » Fly Goodyear Marathon | RSA, Ply 16 Tread | FST F5560 7y 16, m_.m. J_.m..”wmn._ ww RSA, Pty 16, Tread e
29a Tread Depth 3 ‘ Ho 8id ASA, Ply 16 Tread 22 12 Tread 21 ’ 22
WIRE Per Onil No B1d
29 (1000 Units) 5279 11 5277 50 3277 50 o B 5320.00 5325 00 $341 00 \zs oy $324.00
29¢ Total Amount $27%,110.00 $272,50000 $277,500 00 Ho Bid $320,000.00 $325 000 00 $341.000.00 f uuua.:::bn\ $124.000.00 No B
30 12R24.5 fio Ba p No Bid
Brand Hame & Tiwe Goodyear Firestone Pref. Firestone Pref  |Goodysar Workhorse MNo Bid
Hame QPL2-Pty B Continental HSC, Py 16, Firestona TB19 #£157368 | Firestone TB19 2157368 Goodyear Workhorse | Workhorse MSA, Piy| 1819, Py 16, T819, Py 16, RSA, Ply 16, Tread
30a Tread Depth Tread 24 Py 16 Tread 20 Ply 16 Tread 20 Ho Bd MSA, Piy 16, Tread 22 16, Tread 22 Tread 23 Tread 21 21
TTiCE Fer Ol No Bd
Itk {250 Units) $395.00 auu.mc $377.50 Ho B $3J8%.00 $390 92 $350 00 $290.00 $3%1.00
3uc Total Amount $968.750.00 $94,275.00 \ $94,375.00 Ho B« $97,250.00 $97,7240.00 $97,500.00 $97,500.00 $972.750.0u No Bid
31 315/90R24.5 P Mo Bl Ho Bid
AN e w v T =z 4
Name OPLE-Ply & Caontinental HAY, Pty 20, ﬂoko M_meﬂ.w% wam ? Genezal Grabber OA, Py Ironman, Ply 20, Tread) Goodyear G291, Pty | Bridgestone MB70, mm_”..qﬂ”u%.z_.. Goodyear G291, Ply Bl
31a Tread Depth Tread 24 v 20, Tread 24 No Bid 22 18(1), Tread 18 Ply 20, Tread 22 4.-...:_. ww__ ‘ 18, Tread 18
No Bid
Price Per Unit
b {500 Units) $329.13 $316.72 $327.50 Ho Bid $110.00 $410.00 4451 .45 $329 00 $410.00
No B
k) Total Amount $164,565. 00 $158,360.00 $161,750.00 /L3 r:mm.aaa.aa\ $205,000 00 4225,725.00 $164,500 cO $205,000.00
3z 3B5/65REL5 fio Bia S No Bid
Brand Hame & Tire Toyo M149 2562010 Duratzag A/P or Ng 8id
Hame OPLE -Piy-20 8 Continental HR1, Ply 20, Pty 20 Tread 20 General Grabber OA, Ply Dunlap, Pty 20, Tread Dunlop 5£231, FST FS818B Ply 20, | General Grabber, Doublecoin 900
32a Tread Depth Tread 23 24, Tread 21 Ho Bl 21 Tread 20 Tread 22 Tread 22 Tread 12
Mg Ba)
Price Per Unit Turatrag {$391.00}
32 {600 Units) $404.36 $353 96 4178.50 No Bid Dunlop ($421.00) §444 00 $4%3 87 $171.00 $338 00
t-.fllll\\ {
Duratrac o B
(5234,600.00) Dunlop
32 Total Amount $242,616 00 $215,976 00 $227,100 00 Ho fua ($258,600.00) $266,400.00 $372,322.00 $222,600.00 $202.800.00
33 425/6502.2.5 Ho B:3 e e Bid
Brand Name & Tire Toyd M149 2562090 Mo Bd
Hame OPLY-Ply-208 |  Continental HR1, Ply 20, Ply 20 Tread 21 General Grabber DA, Piy Ironman or Duntag, Duntop SP2B1, | ¥ST FSB1B Py 20, | General Grabber, | Doublecoln 300
33a Tread Depth Tread 23 20, Tread 21 He Big Tread 23 Tread 24 Tread 22 Tread 22 Tread 22
Price Per Linit fronman {$428.00) it e
33 {400 Units) $474.16 $346.98 $411.50 Ho Bid Dunlop ($459 00) $485.00 $495 00 $405.00 $410.00
N B
fronman
{$171,200.0C} Dunlop
33 Total Amount 189,743 00 $138,792.00 $164,600 00 No Bid {$183,600 00} 4194,000.00 $196.000.00 4162.000.00 $164.000.00
34 1ilxlb i No Bid Mo Bid
Hame UPLa-Load Gladlator £-3 Gladlator F-3 No Bid
Range-Ply-10 & Tread | Harvest King, Load E, Tread | 201 1594931164 Ply 12| 2GL1594931164, Load Herc. F3, Load F, Pty | Goodyear Laborer, |Harvest King, Loaa|Harvest king. Load| Mazam MS900, piy
3a Deptn 16 Tread 11 F, Ply 12 Tread 11 No Bid 12, Trean 17 Load E, Tread 10 E, Tread 14 E, Traad 14 12. Tread 17/32
No Bid
Frice Per Uait
346 {50 Units) $98.51 9 38459 to Rudt $139 G $152.00 11528 115 15 4149 12

Witness Signature;

Agent Signature:

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opentng: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Approval Date

Tammy Shew




ITB Number: 18-101046 BID TABULATION
IT8 NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair
South rt
a::__._:z.......ﬁu_.. " Attanta Attanta
Southern Tire Mart Commerclal Tire | Commaercial Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive {Bid No. 2) Nextire Goodyear Tirn {Bid 1) {8ld 2) Action Tire HMidtown Tire
Mo Bid
J4r Tatal Amouat $4.915 50 4,219 50 34,229 50 Ha B 6,950 02 47,600 DO $5,762.50 $5,762.50 $7,459 .60
EEY 1dx16.5 WO W0 Bid
LI IR Gladiator Skic Steer Gladiator Skil Stees Guadyear American %o Bid
Hama OPL¥ -Load um_.._.mu_.whmmMmma Load un_.-mw%_.mmwm.“m& Load Miner Skid Steer, | Powerking Super, | Powerking Super,
Range-Fiy 10 & Tread F, Ply 12 Tread 19 F. Ply 12 Tread 19 Carlisle Tras Chiel, Load F12, Ply 12, Load E, Ply 1D, Load E, Piy 10, Haxam M5918, Py
354 Depth Pawerking, Load E, Tread 20 ’ N B Bad oad E, Tread 23 Tread 49 Tread 14 Tread 14 10, Teead 23/32
PTicE Per Umit No Bid
35t (100 Units) $106.43 \Sq ua/ $37 28 $134 00 $172 00 3129 93 $122.99 $144 5§
35¢ Total Amount $10.643 00 / $9,738.00 \ $9.735.00 $13.400 00 $17,200.00 $12,999.00 $12.999.00 $14,455.00 No Bid
ED) 14x17.5 S No B
Brand Mame & Tira No Bid
Hame OPLY Pty 16 & Maxam M5907 Skid Steer | Maxam M5907 Skid Steer Carliste Trac Chief, Pawerking 227, Powerking 227, Maxam M5916,
36a Tread Depth Powerking, Tread 23 2 MAX50702 Tread 46 FHMAXB0702 Tread 46 Na Bed Load G, Tread 25 Ho Bid Py 16, Tread 14 | Piy 16, Tread 14 Tread 25/32
Price Fer Gt No 84
Jev {30 Units) \uu—u uy $457 39 5457 93 Vir By $24%.00 Mo Bid $2147 00 $247.00 $306.73
36¢ Total Amcunt 36,396 00 7 $13,737.90 $13,707 90 W5 Bio 7470 00 fin nd 37.410.00 $7,310.00 3920050 No Bid
37 14.5-75-16,1 — NE Bid No Bit
Brand Hamne & Tee No Bid Mo Bid
Name OPLE-PIy 10 B Maxam M5500 Maxaen MSS0G Goodyear Ind Galazy Ind. Rib, Galaxy tnd. Rib Maxam M5900,
37a Tread Depth SMAXB0502 Tread 22 FMAXED802 Tread 22 No Bid Hercules, Tread 21 Yorque, Tread 26 | Ply 12, Tread 19 | Py t2. Tread 19 Tread 22
Price Per omt No Bid
370 (30 units) o Bid /515033 N 5250 73 o i 5272.00 5397.00 3269 91 5269.91 5283 67
37¢ otal Amount No Bid \ 3752198 J 37,521 90 g Bid 38,310 00 $11,910.00 38,097 30 $8,097.30 %8,510. 30 No Bid
K] 175225 P Na Bl Ng Bid
trand Name & lire No Btg No Bid
Hame OPL=-Load
Range-Ply 17 K Tread Agdusa 2260 £100135 Agdura 2260 £100135, Goagyear GAL DLIA, |Goodyear GRL DLIA| Maxam 913, Load | Maxam 913, Load |Maxam M3913, Load
28a E-3/L-3 Load H Load H, Ply 16 Ho Bid Load OTR iz F, Ply 12, Tread 34]F, Pty 12, Tread 34 H, Ply 16
Price Per Uit No B
38b {5 Units) No B $460 10 $460 10 Mo B $650 00 $650.00 $625 56 463556 $738.42
Jac 1otal Amount Ha But /u~ KT \ $2 300.50 titr Bac) $3,250.00 $3,25000 33,127 80 /mu.:q 80 $3,692 10 No B:d
39 19.51x24 e o Big m—— No Bid
No Bd
Narme OPL 7 -Loag Galaxy EZ Rider Galaxy EZ Rider
Range-Ply & Tread R- #GAL20043%, Laad F, Ply | #GAL200439, Load F, Ply Goodyear American [ Goodyear American | Galaxy EZ Rider | Gatary EZ Rider |Titan R4, Load F, Pty
3%a 4 BKT, Load E, Ply IO 12 12 Ho Bl Backhoe, Load GTR | Backhoe 34, Bly 34 | Piy 12, Tread 34 | Pty 12, Tread 34 11
PTRE Pei UMt Ha Bid
39b (14 units) $531.05 auuowy $330 58 Nz B $500.00 $500 00 4389 &1 $389.6¢ $900.52
EE Total Amount $7.462.70 / §$3,028.12 \ 41,628 12 Ho Baf $7,000 0O uw.ﬂ‘nu $5,454.54 $9,454.54 $6,727 78 No Bid
4{ 20.5/x25 e Ho B No Bid
Wand Hame & e No Bid
Name OPLE-Load Maxar MS200 Maxam M510%
Range, Ply 20 & Tread 2MAXGIE20] Load 193, THAXQ21203 Load 19) Goody GRL DLIA, ¥ GRL DLIA] Maxam MSI00, Maxara M5300, [Mazam MS301, Load
40a (3] Powerking XAT, Load 2* Tread Tread 2 Na Bia Load OTR 36 Load L, Tread 59 Tread 59 2 star
I PEr G No Bid
40b {10 Units} $1,099.00 éwm,uq $1,056.37 Ho Bid $1,200 00 51,200 00 $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $1,332 63
a0c Total Amount a_c.wmm._ 00 /. $10,56].70 \ $10,561 20 Na Bl u:_o.mm (5] $12,000.00 $11.500.00 $11,500.00 $13,326 30 No Bid
41 21L-24 s o i No Bid
Brand Name & Tire No Bid Firestone Al Traction ho Bid
Hame OPL#-Ply 16 & Firestong All Traction Utitity | Usiity 2327727, Tread R Goodyear Amezican Galazy EZ Rider Galaxy EZ Rider [Titan R4, Load F, Ply
41a Tread Depih 2327727, Tread R-4 4 [[EY:] Backhoe Mo Bid Ply 12, Tread 35 | Ply 12, Tread 15 12, Tread 35
Price Per Uit No 8d
41b (10 unalts} Ho Bid $833.50 $811 50 Mo Bid $630.00 No Big 3540.46 \um&a.aﬁ/ $642.48
4lc Tetal Amount Ho Bid $10.b70 00 $lo.670 00 Ha Bis 312,600 00 No Bid $10,809 20 /Q—G.ucw FLl \ 312,849 00 Hp B8id
42 23.5Ax25 S No 8.
BTN e & e No Big
Hame QPL2-Load Maxam M5300 Haxam M5300 °
Range, Ply 10 & Tread SMAXQI1204 Lead 201, Py| sMAX0I1204 Load 201, Goodyear GRL DL3A, |Goodyear GAL BLIA] Maxam MSI00, Mazam MSIC0D, |Maxam M5304, Load
42a E-1 Powerking XRT, Load 2* 2 Ply 2 Nz Big Load OTR an Load L, Tread 63 Tread 63 2 star
FILE Tor Gt Ho Bud
42b {20 Units} $1,413.39 A a7 $1,384 17 N B $1.5%0 00 $1 550 00 41,555 00 $1,555.00 $1.802 85
4ic Total Amount 328,207 .86 /a-.omu .—c\ $27,683 40 Mg D $11,000 0O u:.a,cc $21,100.01 $31,200.00 $16,057 10 Mo Bid
43 29.5R25 e Ho By No Bid

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Qpening: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Appioval Date

Tammy Shew



ITB Numbher: 18-101046

BID TABULATION
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair
Southern Tire Mart Atlanta Atlanta
i . 1
(Bld Ho. 1) i< elal Tire | C lal Thre
ITEM DESCRIFTION Bast Drive {Bld Na. 2) J&R Tire Ine. Naxtlre Goodyear Tire {8ld 1) (Bid 2} Action Tlra Midtown Tire
Name OPLZ, Load Maxam MSico to B
Range, My A Tread Maxam M5 SMAXQ1247 , Load 216, Gaodyear RTIB, toad | Goodyear RT3, Ply [Maxam M$300, Pty|Marem MS200, Piy[#axam MS301. Load
43a etk E-J Powerking XAY, Load 2* THAXO031247 , Py ] Ply 2 Mo Bid OTR 3 stars, Tread L3 20. Tread 74 I0, Teeas 74 2 star
LS AL Ho Bid
43b {10 Units}) $2.913 10 $1,606 17 42,606 17 Ho Bld $4,800.00 $4.300 00 $2.695 G0 $2.695.00 $3549.28
43c Total Amount $29,133 00 /ﬂobmp N/ §$26,061 70 Ho B 448,000 0O $48,000 00 $26,950 00 $26.950.00 $35,492 80 No 8id
a4 18x7.00-4 e Ho B No Bigd
MR & Tre | “Harvest King, L6ad B, 4 | Carlisie MUt~ e Metl T riiste M-I, TSRy Ve ong. 1a
Name OPL ¢ Load g M_.N.” ._..,nsnM.n 4:“ 8 nnbmqhmum— .“.h_wu_wnn? :MMM_W.“WMW “_.bw.wnw nmv_< 4 ._.wnwn % = Kenda Super Turd, Harking, Ply 4 HanKing, Pty 4, | Load 4,Ply 4, Tread i
445 Range-Fly & Tread " ‘.. N Pl h ’ Ho B ‘ Pty 6, Tread 10 Tread 10 Tread 10 8732
PACE ver Gt No Bid
40 (20 Units} 32539 $38 B0 336,80 Mo Bad $53.00 $73.00 43140 $31.40 $29 00
Adc Toral Amount f 350080 \ 377600 776,00 Mo Bid $1,160 00 $1,460.00 1625 00 $628.00 $580.00 No Bid
an 18x9.50-F P fia Bid No Bid
Brand Hame & Tire Gladlator Turf Master, Gladiator Tuef Master, NanKing Powerking, No Bd
Name OPL2-Load Super Turf, Load 8, Ply 4, #GL1646708B0B Load B, | #GLIG4A70BBOS Load B, Super Tutf, Ply &, | Pawerking, Ply 4, { Powerking, Pty 4. | Load 4.Ply 4, Tread
a5 Range-Ply & Tread Tread & Plyd Py d . Mo Bid Herc/Carlisle, Py 4 Tread 10 Tread 10 Tread 10 B/32
Frice Pt O o Bid
4Lh (10 units) $25 56 \ln ay $19 46 $32.00 $78.00 $32 35 $32 35 33300
45% Total Amount 3255 60 N 1560 7 $194.60 $190 00 $7B0 00 $323 50 3343 50 533000 Teo Bid
5 23x10.50-12 No Bid
Brand Hame & Tire Gladlator Turf Master, Cladlatar Furf Master, Carfisle Turf Master, Hanking Powerking, No Bid
Hame OPL#-Load TBC Turl, Load B, Py 4, IGLIGABTOI21] Loat B, | 2611648701213 Load B, Cariiste T SAV. Fiy 4, | Load 16, Ply 10, |Deestone, Load B, | Deestone, Lead 8, | Load B,Ply 4, Tread
46a Range-Ply & Tread Tread 12 Pty 4 Ply 4 Ho Bud Tread 12 Tread 10 Ply 4, Tread 12 Ply 4, Tread 12 8
FIn¢ Far Ut No Bid
469 {50 Units) $47.27 $18.64 $28.64 Ho Big $69.00 481.00 565 88 46588 $66 GO
464 Total Amount $2,061.50 / $1.432.00 \ $1,432.00 $3,450.00 $4.050.00 $3,294 ¢ $3,194 .00 $3.300 0Q No Bid
47 24x12.00-12 — No B No Bid
Brand Name & Tire Carliste  #CA5114091, {Carlisle 2CA5114091, No Bid
Hame OPLE -Load TBC Turl, Load 8, Py 4, Load 6, Piy 4 Load B, Ply 4 Carlisle or Hirun, Pty 4,| Turf Master, Load | Powesking, Load | Powerking, Load | Powerking, Load
473 Range-Ply & Tread Tread 12 No Bii Tread 12 16, Py 10, Tread 10| B,Ply 4, Tread 12 | B,Piy 4, Tread 12 B,Ply 4. Tread 8
Price Per umt Carhisie ($89.00) Mrun No 8d
47b (50 Lnits) $55.58 $75.09 $75.89 Mo Bid 69.00) 581 00 $55.80 $55 80 $60.00
Canisic ($3450.00] Ho Bid
47c Total Amount 42,779 00 $3,794 50 $3,794. 50 Na Bid Hireis ($3450 00} $4.050.00 $2,790.00 $2,790.00 43,000 0D
a8 A1x15.50x15 e No Bail Mo Bd
Trand Hame & Tre Galaxy Super Trencher souddeal Traction | Soiiddeal Teaction Mo Big
Kame OPL# -Leag Powerking, Load E,Pty 10, Galaxy Super Trencher #GAL160174 Load O, Ply Master, Load E, Master, Load E, | Titan, Lead €, Tread
432 Range-Ply-10 & Tread Tread 25 #GALLED174 Load D, Ply B a Ho fid Trencher, Tread 29 Ho Bud Tread 24 Tread 24 24
FIe Fer Gl Na 8id
48b {10 Units) $187.37 aw.uw/ $148.32 NG Bad $165.00 Ho Big $184 51 $184 51 $209.00
48¢C Total Avnount $1.B7.70 /uu..zu...nc \ Tio Hed $650 G0 Ha Bid 31,84%.10 $1,845 10 $2.09¢.00 No Bid
49 28L-26L/5 pa— Ne Bid
No Bid
Brand Hama B Tire Goodyear American
Mame OPL s -Load PrimeX LogMonster PrimeX LogMonster Log Skidder, Load Primex Master, Primex Master, Maxam MS931, Pty
492 Range-Ply-20 & Tread No Bid ZPRAB4S 1B Tread 69 *PR464518 Tread 60 Ha B ho Bt H, Ply 16, Tread 25 | Load L, Tread 69 | Load L, Tread 69 20, Tread 64732
Fhee Per Ol Na Bd
49b (10 Linits) HNo Bid }.T—a my 31,644 B3 No Bia Ho Bid $2,053 00 $1,888.96 $1.683.96 $1,984.82
A9¢ Total Amnount Ho Bid \ 516,438 90 F $16,348 40 o 6 T B $20.530 00 $18,889 60 318,889 60 319,848 20 No Bid
S0 215/75R17.5 ™ No Bt No Bid
Brand Hame & Tire Dlamond Back DB&BS Dlarmend Back CBEBS Ne.Bi
flame OPLE:sad | Seewtomo ST719 Load 16, | sDIAI015DB6B520 Load | sDIA1015DBEA526 Load Ironman, Load H, Gaoodyear G114, Saitun, Load H, | Saitun, Load H Doubtecoin 500, _
502 f Ranga-Ply-16 & Tread Tread 16 H;Tread 18 H, Tread 1B fo Bla Tread 16 Load H, Tread 16 Tread 15 Tread 15 Load H. Tread 16/32
Fiice Per gl Ma Bid
500 {500 Units) $148.17 \umn Wy $80.56 No Bla 312800 $215 0O $132.87 $13287 314300
Suc Total Amount $73,08% 00 / usc.nwn.cm\ $40,280.C0 Ho fud /ug.cco,cc\ $107,500 00 366435 00 $bb,415 00 $75.500.00 Mo Bid
51 51175/80R13 R Ho Bid e— No Big
Brand Hame & Tire Triangle TR652 No Bid
Name OPL2-Load TBC Towmax, Lead C, Tread Trtangla TRES) #TR110146530010 Load Hirun Hwy, Load C, Primewrell, Load C, | Primewell, Load C, | TBC Trailer, Load D,
S1a Range-Ply-6 & Tread 9 #TR110146530010 Load C = Ho Bid Tread 6 No Tread 10 Tread 10 Fly B, Tread 13/32
Fhils For omt No Bid
51k {20 Uaits) $36.04 \anm,au / §$2542 No Bict $49 00 Ho Bid $15.86 $35.86 $49 00
31c Total Amount $720.80 N, $508.40 \ 3508 40 Ho Bt $980 00 10 Bid N7 3717 20 $980 00 No Bt
52 Si215/75R14 s — Ho Bid No Bl
Witness Signature:
Agent Signature: [

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Approval Date

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 18-101046 BID TABULATION
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair
South Ties Mart
suﬂuﬂan..i: Atlanta Atlanta
Southern Tira Mart Commarclal Tire | Commercial Tite
ITEM DESCRIPTION Bast Drive {Bld No. 2) JBR Tire Inc. Nextira Goodyear Tirn (Bid 1} (Bid 2} Action Tira Midtawen Tire
Brand Hame & Tire Triangle TRES3 Triangle TRES2 Goodyear LLILT
Mame OPL# Load | TBC Towmax, Load ©, Tread | 2 TR11046530030 Load C, | 2TiRY1046530030 Load Hirun H183, Load C, | Endurance ST, Load | Primewell, Load D, | Primewall, Load D, | TBC Trailer, Load D,
523 Range-Ply-8 & Tread 10 . Py & C. Py 6 No Bid Ply 6, Tread B 105H, Tread 8 Tread 10 Tread t0 Py 8, Tread 1373}
PTiLE PEr Ut No Bid
{10 Unlts) $55.37 $3280 $22 80 Mo Bid $51.00 $99.20 $50 62 $50 62 $57.00
fotal Amount 35491 720 / 332600 \ FEEERTT) Na Bid 3530 00 3943100 1506 20 $506 20 34570 00 No Big
51225/ 75R15 —— Mo Bid No Bid
TTaU TIenTE oL s
Hame OPLs, Load Goodyear LI
Range, Ply 85 Tread | TBC Towmax. Lead D, Tread fan JKY2, Lo Endurance ST, Load | Primewell, Load D. | Primewell, Load O, | TBE Trailer, 1oad E,
53a Depth 16 Trlangte TRSS) Load D Trlangle TR65) Load D No Bid Tread 9 105H, Tread 8 Tread t0 Tread 10 Ply 18, Treac 14732
Price Par omt No Bid
g3k {10 Units) 557 12 9 $45.06 No Bid $76.00 $109.96 $59.46 $59 46 $67.00
EES Total Amount $571 20 f 3450 60 \ $450 60 Ho Bid $760.00 $1,09Y9 60 $594.60 4594 60 10.00 No Bid
24 ST235785R10 e Ho g No Bid
Mo Bul
Brand Nama & Tire Goodyear Sailun Traller,
Name OPLx Loag TBC Trailguida, Load E, Ply | Triangle TGS Load F, Py | Friangia TRES) 1oad F, Hirun, Load E, My 10, | Endurance ST, Load | Omnicargo, Load | Omanicargo, Load Load F, Pty 12,
S4a Range:Ply & Tread 10p, Tread 10 12 Py 12 He Bz Tread 11 taSN, Tread B C, Ply 6,Tread 10 | C, Ply 6,Tread 10 Tread 16/32
Frice Per Gl Mo Bud
54b (10 units} $95.50 % $50.98 No s $99 00 $124 72 397 67 $97 67 $107.00
54c¢ Tetal Amount $955.50 / 3609 B0 \‘ $609.80 Ho Big $990.00 $1.247.20 976 70 3970 70 $1.07¢ 00 No Bid
55 11R22.5 p——— Ha s Mo Bug
No Bid
Goodyear G-316 Hwy Goadyear G-116 Goodyear G-316
Durazseal or Equal, Geadyear G-316 Hwy |Hwy Duraseal or #q. Hwy Duraseal or
Load Aanga H, Ply & |Continental HO, Ply 16, Tread| Toyo M170, Py 16, Tread | Firestone FS561, Ply 15, Duraseat or eq., Ply | (X3& 42}, Py 16, [FSTFS560, Piy 16,{ General RA, Ply Equal, Load G, Ply
55a TFread Depth 13 19 Tread 21 Mo Bid 16, Tread 12 Tread 12 Tread 21 16,Tread 21 14, Tread 12/32
Frice Fer Omt No Big
55b (100 Units) $299 CO $205 86 $297.50¢ Mo Bid $328.00 $118.00 $288 00 $239.00 $338.00
EES Total Amoint $249,900.00 $20.,586.00 $29,750.00 Ho Bid ﬂ uu?mu:.uu\ $33 800.00 $28,BOG. 00 $13,900.00 $11,800.00 No Bid
St L1R22.5 Ha Bl e Ne Bid
M Bl
Goggyear Encurance
Hwy Duraseal of Goocdyear Endurance Goodyear Goodyear Endurance
Equal, Load Range H, | Continental HSR2 Ply 15, Toyo M170, Ply 16, Tread | General RA, Py 16, Tread Hwy,eq, Py 16, Tread| Endurance RSA, Ply [FST FS560, Piy 16, | Continental HSR2 | RSA, Ply 16, Tread
ELT Py & Tread Depth Tread 23 19 20 tie pad 2 16, Tread 2 Tread 21 Ply 16, Tread 21 22/32
PLE Pt Ul WO Bd
S6b {300 Units} 330293 $105 86 $251.50 Ho Bea 3321 00 $330.00 $168 00 $303.00 $330.00
S6C Total Amount $90,5879 00 361,758.00 $7%,450.00 ho Bz f $96. 30000 \ $99,000.00 $86,400.00 $40,900 00 $99,000.00 Mo Bid
57 R22.5 Ho Bidl N Na Bid
Goodyear Endurance N2 Bid
Hwy or Equal, Load Gocdyear Endurance Goodyear Goodysar Marathon
Range H, Ply & Tread [ Continental HSR2 Ply 16, Continental HSR2 Ply 16, | Continental HSR2 iy 16, Hwy,eq , Ply 16, Tread| Endurance RSA, Pty | FST 561, Ply 16, | Continental HSR2 | RSA, Py 16, Tread
57a Depth Tread 21 Tread 33 Tread 23 Ho Bic 2 16. Tread 22 Tread 21 Ply 16, Tread 2t 22132
FhCe POT TRl N Big
570 {500 Units) $279.11 $277.50 $277.50 Ho Biet $376.00 $385.00 5341.00 $270.00 $325 00
Sic Total Amount $139,555.00 $138,750. 00 $138,750.00 Ho Bet f #188,000 au\ $1492,500 00 $170.500.00 $135.000.00 $162.500 00 No Bid
EL) 12R22.5 Mo Bia Sy N Bicd
Goodyear No Fid
Fisestone T-831 or Workhoise MSA Goadyaat Arpnormax
Equal, Load Range M, [ Continental HOR2 Ply 16, | Toyu M170, Ply 16, Tread | Firestone T-831, Pty 16, Gy Marathon RSA, Pty | (X3 6.B2), Ply 16, | FST T-831, Ply 16 | FST T-831. Piy 16, |MSD, Ply 16,
S8a Py & Tread Depth Yread 76 19 Tread 31 Ho Bid 16, Tread 22 Tread 28 Tread }1 Tread 31 Tread 33/32
TILE Fer Ot Ho B
58b {100 Unlts} $292.14 $106.71 \ 3419 mo/ Ho Bid $32000 $500.00 $432 00 4412 00 $500.0¢
S8¢ Total Amount $29,414 00 $30.671 .00 / $41950.00 \ LEET $32,000.00 $50 000 .09 $43,200 00 333,200 00 450,000 00 Ko Bl
59 F2657 JURLT — fiz Bg
Brand ame & Twe
Name QPL#, Load Goodyear Wrangler Gaodyear Wrangter | Goodyear Virangler
Range, Ply & Tread | General Grabber HD, Ply 4, | General Graboer HTS68, |Firestone Dest. LE2, Tread Goodyear Wrangler SRA, Ply 113R, | Furion AT, Load B, | Wild Trail, Load B, | SRA, Load € , Pty | SRA, Load 4, Pty 4
5% Depth Tread 12 oad S, Tread 12 13 Ho Bid SRA, Pty SL, Tread 13 Tread 12 Ply 4, Trzad 13 Ply 4, Tread 13 10. Tread 14)32 Tread 12
FricE Per Ot
S9b {150 Units) $109 33 310843 $115.00 Ha Bid $167 00 $112.00 \mn _.n/ $96 00 $115.00 $112 00
akc Totat Amount 416,399 50 $106,264 50 $17,250.00 Ho Bid $16,05000 $16.800.00 /nnu.c»u.co \ $14,400 00 $L7.250 00 $16,800 00
60 L1245/ 75R17 Ho Bid e

Witness Signature;

Agent Signature:

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

B0C Award Approval Date:

Tammy Shew




ITB Number: 18-101045
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair

BID TABULATION

Southarn Tira Mart
(Bid No. 1) Attanta Atlanta
Southern Tiro Mart Commarclal Tire | Commarcial Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION Bast Drive {Bid No. 2) JAR Tire Inc. Nextire Goodyear Tire {Bid 1) (Bld 1) Action Tire Midtown Tira
LORLE]
Name OPL#, Load Goodyear Wrangter Firestone
Range €, Ply & Tread | General Grabber HO, Ply 10, | General Grabber H(, Ply | Firestone Transforca HT2, Firestone Transforce |SRA, Ply 10 (119R), | Transforce HT2, { wild Tradl, Ply 10, | Toyo /T, Py 10, Goodysar Wrangler
50a Depth Tread t4 10, Tread 14 Tread 14 No Bid HT, Ply 10,Tread 13 Tread 14 Ply 10, Tread 35 Tread 15 Tread 15/32 SAA, Piy B, Tread 14
PIe Fer UTWL
60t {50 Unlts) $122.69 $122 00 $120.96 Mo Bid $119.00 1140.00 $115.95 $91.00 $145.00 $140.00
ol Total Amount $6,134.50 $6,100.00 $6,048 00 Ho Bid $5,950.00 $7,000.00 $5.798 00 / $4,550.00 \ 47,250.00 $7,000 00
a1 LT2a5/75R17 Ha Bid pa———
Goodyear Duratrac or Gaoodyear Goodyear Duratrac, Fliestone General Gratber | Goodyear Duratrac | Goodyear Duratrac
Eq., Load Range £, Ply General Grabber D, Ply | Firestone Trangforce AT2, Duratrac/eq., Py 10, Pty 10 {1214Q], Transforte ATZ, | WD, Piy 19, Tread for Eq., Pty 10, Tread |or Eq., Ply IO, Tread
6la & Tread Depth Ho Bid 10, Tread 14 Ply 10, Tread 17 Ho Bid Tread 1B Tread 18 Py 10, Tread 14 14 16/32 t8
1 | I
:31] {50 Units) Ho g $120.00 $125.00 No Bid \ﬂwu,aa $170.00 $120 20 5120 00 $16%.00 $170 00
6lc Total Amount Ho Big 46,000 CO $6,250.00 No i) f 38,250 00 $8,500.00 $6,010 ul_m $6,000.00 58,450 00 $8,500 00
62 LT285/75K16 Mo tig No B e
Goodyear Duratrac or Goodysar Goodyear Duratrac, Goodyear Duratrae | Goodyear Duratrac
Eq.. Load Range E, Ply General Grabber ATx, Ply { Firestona Transforce AT2, Duratracseq, Ply 10, Ply 10 (121Q}, Firestone Dest AT, [ Flrestone Dest. AT, {or Eq., Pty 10, Tread {or Eq., Ply 10, Tread
adn & Tread Depth No Bid 10, Tread 1% Ply 10, Tread 15 b Bad Tread 18 Tread 18 Ply 10, Tread 14 | Ply 10, Tread 14 16/32 18
Frice Por uml
&Ik {60 Units) Na fud 5i44.17 $153.00 Poss $175.00 $180.00 $145.12 $145.11 $179.00 18000
62¢ Total Amount Ho fid 59,000 o0 4,180 00 No Bid /.:.c S00.00 \ $11.160 00 38,707 20 $8,702 20 $19,740.00 $10,800.00
[E) 275/ JURZZ.5 Yo Bid e
Coogyear
Continental of £q., Goodyear Endurance | Endurance RSA, | Continental HSR2 | Conunental HSR2 |Goodyear Endurance
Load Range G, Ply & | Continental or Equal, Ply 16, [ Continental HSR2 SA, Ply | Cantinental HSR2 SA, Ply RSA, Load ), Piy 14, Load I, Ply 1B, SA, Ply 14, Tread | SA, Ply 14, Tread | RSA, Ply 14, Tread
63a Tread Depth Tread 23 18, Tread 18 18, Tread 18 Ho 8id Tread 19 Tread 19 21 22 22712 Ho Bid
FRiCE Per o,
63h {20 Units) 334011 $330 50 3130.50 Ho Bid $184.00 $295.00 $324.00 huln.n_m/ 4295 00 No Bid
CXI4 iotal Armount $4,081.32 46,610 00 $6,610.00 Ho Bit $%,680.00 $5,900.00 $6,460 00 /u_u.acn [£1] $5,900 00 he B
&4 295/80R22.5 o B p——
Michelin Pilote XZ Hichelin Hiote Michelin Pilote
Hwy Only,Load XZA Michehn Pilote X2
Range, Ply & Tread Gy 670/Hwy ., Load H, Hwy Cnly load H, | Hwy Only,Load H,
64a Depth No Bid Ho Rid Ho Bid Mo Bid Ply 16, Tread 16 No Bud Fiy £6, Tread 21 | Piy 16, Tread 21 | Ply 16, Treaq 22/32 Mo Bid
PTiCE Fer umt
640 {25 units} Ho Bid Ho Bid Ho Bid $427.00 No Bid $580 00 $580.00 $650.92 No Bid
Gac Total Amoum o Bid o Bid o B 31067500 fio Bid $13,500 00 | $13.50000 J| 31627308 Tio B
(2 3057700225 e
Continental or Eq., Conttnental Urban | Continental Uiban | Mizhelin Interaity,
Load Range G, Ply & Toyo M144, Load L, Ply 20, | Continental Urban HA3, Toyo Mi44. Load H, HAQ, Load L. Ply HAZ, Load L, Ply Load t, Py 20,
65%a Tread Depth Continentat, Load 1, Tread 21 Tread 19 ioad L, Treag 23 Ha Bid Ply 20, Tread 19 Na Bid 20, Tread 21 20, Tread 21 Tread 22/32 Ho Bid
PICE Per oml
65k {10 Units} 3440 Q0 $277 59 $427 50 Na Bl $199.00 No Bid $420.00 $420.00 $359.00 Ho Bid
B5¢C fotal Amount $4,400.00 $2,775 90 $34,275 00 ho Bid 33.990.00 Ho Big 54,200 0¢ f $4,200 00 \ 43,990 00 ho tid
66 315/80R22.5 o Bt ——
Goodyear 291 Hwy. of, Gooayedr G-291 CH HAJ City Goodyear G-291
Eq., Load Range 171, Continental HA3, Ply 10, Toye M153, Load L, Piy 20, | Continental HA3, Ply 20, Goodyear G 191 Hwy, Hwy, Ply )/18, BST MB70, Py 20, Service, Piy 20 Hwy/Eq., Tread
E&6a Py & Tread Depth Tread 24 Tread 26 Tread 26 Mp Bid Py /18, Tread 18 Teead 18 Tread 21 Tread 23 23/32 Ho Bid
Price Fef Ol
66b {500 Units) $329.13 $316 72 $336.50 No Bid \muoo nn/ $410.00 $451 45 $329.00 $408.00 Ho Bid
ebe Tctal Amount $164,565 00 $158,300.00 $168,250.00 No Bid /awce.ucc,cc\ 4$205,000 00 $225 125 00 $164,500 00 §204 000 00 Mo Bid
67 385/60R22.D No Bid ——
Loadyear G296 Hwry.
or Eq., L6ad Range Goodyear G-296
7L, Ply 20 B Tread Continental HRY, Py 20, Toyo M149, Load L, Ply 20, Goecdyear G 296 Hwy, Hwy, Ply /18, FST #3814, Tread | CN HTCL, Py 20, | Goodyear G-296
673 Cepin Tread 23 Tread 2Q General OA, Tread 21 No Bud Ply J/18, Tread 23 Tread 23 22 Tread 22 feq, Tread 22/32 Ho Bia
Prce vor Ut
&7b {1000 Units} 340436 $159 96 $378 50 No B3 )..mn,oy $460.00 $453.87 $396.00 $465.00 No Bid
Blc Total Asmpunt $404,260.00 $359,960 00 $378,500.00 Ble Be2 / $450,000 cc\ $468,900 00 $453,870.00 $3%96,000 00 $465,000.00 No Bid
] 425/05R22.5 Hio Bia D
Goodyear G-296 Hwy Goodyear G-296
or Eq., Load Range L, { Continental HR1, Ply 10, Toyo M149, Load L, Ply 20, Googyear G-296 Hwy, | Hwy, Ply 20, Tread | FST FSB18, Tread | CH#IC1, Py 20 Goooyear G-296
&Ba Ply 20 & Tread Depth Tread 23 Tread 21 General OA, Tread 21 He Bid Tread 23 23 22 Tread 21 feq, Treaa 22/32 Ho B
Witness Signature:
Agert Signalure: L

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Awatd Approval Date

Tammy Shew



IT8 Number: 18-101046

BID TABULATION
iTB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repalr
Southern Tire Mart
(8ld No. 1) Atlanta Atlanta
Southern Tire Mart Commaercisl Tire | Commarcial Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive {Bid Mo. 2} Nextira Goodyaar Tire (Bid 2) {Bid 2} Action Tire Midtown Tira
rie Per 1
68b {600 Units) 474 34 $319 08 $41L 5D Na [d € $500.00 495 0D $436 &2 $498.00 No M
BBC Total Amount $284,616 C0 $191 558 0% $246 w2 No Big (3255 BI0 Cm $100.000.00 #197.000 0 $261,600 tU $298,807 00 Na Bid
69 PI65/05R1E No TG
Brand Name & Tire
Hame OPL#-Load Goody ! General Grabber | Goodyear Wrangter
Range-S, Ply & Tread | General Grabber HTSE0, Ply | General Grabber HTS6D, Bildgestone Dueter HT, lronman, Piy 4, Tread | Fortitude, Ply 1127, | Dest LE2, Py a, HTSGO, Pty 4, Fortitude, Ply 4, GY Assurance CS
69a Depth S, Traad 12 Load S, Tread 12 Tread 1t Ho fud 11 Tread 11 Tread 10 Tread 10 Tread 16/32 FM. Pty 4, Tread 11
PITCE Per ot
69k (20 Units) 12369 $121.69 $174.00 Ho Bid s118.00 $134 52 $125 77 \n!:w 69 $139.00 $128.49
YC 1gtal Amount $2,473.80 $2,4311.80 $3,380.00 Ha Bid N $2,690 40 $2,515 40 L 32353580 $2,780.00 $2,569.80
i P265/70R16 Ho Bid T — S
Brand Kame & Tire
Hame OPL#-Load Goodyear Vrangler Goodyear Wrangtar | Goodyear Yirangler
Range-S, Ply & Tread | General Grabber HTSE0, Ply | General Grabber HTS60, | Firestone Dest AT, Tread Ironman, Py 4, Tread | Fortitude, Pty 115T, | Fution AT, Py 4, | Fuzion AT, Py 4, Fertitude, Py 4, Fortitude HT, Ply 4,
Toa Depth S, Tread 11 Load S5, Tread 12 13 HNo Big 12 Tread 17 Tread 10 Tread 10 Tread 16/12 Tread 11
PTiCE Fer umt
it (20 Units} $101.00 $99.00 8127 00 Ho Big $95.00 $9%.70 37312 \«3.:/ 3105 00 $99 69
= Tetal Amaunt $2,020.00 $1 98000 $2.540.00 No Bid 41,400 00 $1,994.00 $1.462.40 / 41,462 40 \. $2,100 00 $1.593.80
71 P2LETTORT 7 Ho Bid S
Brand Name & Tire Goodyear Wrangler Firestone General Grabber GY Vrangler
Hame OPL# -Load General Grabber WTSGD, Fiy | General Grabber HTRAD Bridgestone Dueler HT, SRA, Ply 110S, Dest.LE2, Ply 4, | HTS, Ply 4, Tread | Goodyear SRA, Ply | Trailrunner AT, Ply
714 Range S, By & Tread 5. Tread 11 Leac &, Tread L Tread 10 No Bid Kelly Edge, Ply 4 Tread 12 Tread 10 10 4, Tread 16732 4, Tread 12
FIiCE Per Gt
7k (20 Urs) $115.C0 $113 28 $157 00 No Bid $110.00 $125.18 $121.18 $111 12 $130.00 $122.07
71t Total Amount $2. 300 00 ¥Z,205 00 $3.140 OO No Bid /uw.ucc 00 \ 32,503.60 $2,423 60 $2,222.40 $2,600.00 32,4410
i P1Y5/65R15 No gid —
Firestone Fitestane
Brand Nama & Tire Gootlyear 2| Champion Fuel Chacngion fuel | Goodyear Assurance
Hame OPLE Load | Gemeral Altimax, Ply S, Tread | Firestone Champion Fuel | Firestone Champion Fuel lenman, Py 4, Tread | A/S, Ply 91T, Tread [ighter, Pty 4, Traad|Nghter, Py 4, Tread| A/S, Ply 4, Tread | Goodyear Assurance
72a Range 5, Ply & Tread it fghter, Tread 10 fghter, Tread 10 hoo Baa 10 9 10 10 12/32 A/S, Pty 4, Tread 9
Price Fer Gk
720 (10 units} $59 92 $56.90 45690 R B \umn ny $5594 454 50 $54 99 $60.00 $55 93
[FL Tetal Amourit $599.20 3569 00 3569 0D Nz Ba / $540.00 n\ $559 40 $349.00 f $549.00 \ $600.00 $55%.30
73 P225/60VR1E H= B — S
Gen. GMAX, Ld
98vV,Ply 5, Tr 10 or Gy
Brand Name & Tire Eag., 1d, 97V, Ply 6, Goodyear Eagle Goodyear Eagle
Hame OPLs-Load | General GMAX Justice, Ply 4, | General GMAX Justice, | Firestone Firehawk PV4L, Tr 12or BFGood Ld |RSA, Ply 97V, Tread| General GMAK, Ply | General GMAX, Pty ASA, Load 97V
73a Range 5, Ply & Tread Tread 10 Tread 10 Tread 11 M Big 98Y, Py 5.7r 10 12 4, Tread 10 4, Tread 10 HNo Bid Ply &, Tread 12
GHAX' $72 .00
Price Per Unit s
730 {1000 Units) $75 53 377 65 5% Hu Bid BF Gootdrich i $90 00 $75.66 $75.66 Ho Bid $90.00
o, e
\ax“ E.Say/
Gyear: $84,250 00
BF Goodrich
73 Tota! Arsdunt $75.510 00 $77.660 00 $97.050 39 Hao B / $71,000 00 \_ $90.000.00 $75,660.00 $75,660 00 Ho Bid $90,000 00
74 [FERTELCTF /-r L Ho Bia e Ho B
Gen GMAX, Ld
99w, Ply 5, Tr 10 ar Gy
Brand Hame & Tire Eag., Ld 98W, Ply 5, Goodyear Eagle Goodyear Eagle
Hame OPLr Load General GMAX Justice, Ply 4, General GMAX Justice, Firestone Firehawk GTZ, Tr. 11 or BfGood Ad. RSA, Ply 90w, General GMAX, Pty | General GMAX. Ply RSA, Load 98W,
748 Range 5, Ply & Tread Tread 10 Traad 10 Traad 12 Ha Bd 29w - Ply 5, Tr. 10 Tread 11 4, Tread 10 4; Tread 10 o Mg Py 6, Tread 1t
Price Per Lnjt
748 {2000 Laits) $87 93 490 o8 S5 M Nz Bid Gogdnch: $8200 |y $107 00 $82.08 $83.08 iy Bl
e — o —
[-GHAY. $156.500 D0
BF Goodrich
74c Total Astount $175, 82000 180,180 50 $3231.484.00 Mo Bad $164,000.00 $214,000 00 $166,160 0% $166,160 00 Ho Bid
7% PG50/ — Tis Bl Mo Big
Withess Signature:
Agent Signature: 9

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Approval Date: _

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 18-101046

BID TABULATION
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repair
Southern Tire Mart
{Bld No, 1) Atlanta Attanta
Southern Tire Mart [ eial Tire | € Inl Tire
ITEM DESCRIPTION (Bld No, 2} J&R Tire Inc. HNextire Goodyerr Tire {Bld 1) {Bid 2} Actlon Tire Midtown Tire
Brand Name & Tire Gen. GMAX, Py 5 o Goodyear Eagle Gocdyear Eagle
Hame OPL#-Load General GMAX Justice, Firegtone Firehawk GTV, Gy Eag. or BFG RSA, Ply 108v, RSA, Load 108Y, Ply
T5a Range S. Ply & Tread General GMAX Justice Tread 30 Tread 11 No Big Advant., Ply 5 Tread 11 Ganerad GMAX Geperal GHAX tea g &, Tread 10
Price Per Unit i $109.25
750 (2000 Units) $108.79 $116 %5 $122 40 No Bid $107 95 $107 55 tia BLIT OO
TEC Total Amount @ §221,500 00 o Big o £206,000 E_ll\\.V 3234 000 15,900 @ N Bl 4204 GO0 0D
i P235/50r18 e Ho g g N Bd
Gen, GMAX, Load
1011L0,Pty S, Tread 10
of Gy
Eag RSA,La 99W, Ply
Brand Name & Tre 5. 7Tr 21, or BF Goodyear Eagle Goodyear Eagle
Hame OPLE- Extra [General GMAX Justice, Ply XL,| General GMAX Justice, Firestone Firehawk GT2, Gooadrich Advant , RSA, Ply 39V, General GMAX, Ply | General GMAX, Py RSA, Load 99w, Py
763 Load,Ply & Tread Tread 10 Tread 10 Tread 10 Ho B LOTW, Ply 5, Tr 10 Tread 11 X1, Tread 10 X1, Tread 10 Mo Bad &, Tread 11
L~
GHAK: Eﬂy
Price Per Unit Gyear: $111 10 B8F
76b (2000 Units} st v $111.17 $137 98 No B odrich: quE.v\ 1900 $110.27 LI 27 Fo stiwon
- s —
\nﬁx\wzgg
Gyear $271,200.00
BF Goodrich:
T6¢ Total Amount 212,220 00 $226,540 00 $279.960 DO No Bio 212,000.0, $230,000 00 #420,540.00 4220,540.00 lie Bl #3238.000.00
S 100W,Ply 5, Tread 10 "
or Gy
Eaq RSA,L0 $9W, Ply
6, Tr 11, or BF
Goodeich Acvant ,
7 P225/60rt8 o Bid L 100V, Piy 5, Tr 10 tia Bid
Tl GRAX, toad
1C0V¢, Pty 5, Tread 10
or Gy
Eag.RS5A,Ld 99W, Ply
Brand Name & Tire 6, Tr 11, or BF Goodyear Eagle Goodyear Eagle
Hacte OPLE, Load S, | General GMAX Justice, Ply 4, General GMAX Justice, Firestone Frehawk GT2, Goodrich Advant., RSA, Piy 99W, | General GMAX, Piy | General GMAX, Ply RSA, Load 99V, Py
77a Ply & Tread Tread 10 Tread 10 Tread I Ho Bid L1900V, Py 5, Tr 10 Tread 11 4, Tread 10 4, Tread 10 Rin B4 6, Traad 11
d_ Gmax s9a.00
Price Per Unit G BF
77b (400 Units} \\alﬁ!uwj $99.39 $115.94 Ha Bid ¢ Goodrich: $95.00 11500 596 39 Mo Bid LI bR ]
e —
¢ TGHMAX $37,600.00
BF Goodrich!
77c Total Amount $38.904 00 $39,756 .00 §47,176.00 Ho Bid $28,000.00 §42,000 00 #18,556 0O [T
78 TIR2..5
26/32 mud/Snow Cont. HOL1 ) 2632 $119 30
783 (Tread & Unit Price) 26 $135.00 16/ §111 00 26/32 $111.00 Marangani Unitread 27 $17345 a6 5116 31 2632 $11B.00 Ho Bid
.l!l.llllll‘ll\
R-120-$20.00, R-133
Sectlon w/Cap $20.00 10 w $25.00, R-1235-430 00 Ho g $25 00 i 1o $136 00 Ho Bit
Spot wrtap $3.00 o Cost No Cost 3 N G $1.00 [T 0T 312009 Ho Bid
DECpPeat 1TCa0
offered-mud/Snow
788 {Unit Price) 26/32 $111.00 26/3r 311100 26712 8119.30 Ho Big 32%171.50 Na Bid No Bd No Bid Ho Bid
R-120-320.00, R 133
Section w/Cap Ho Bid 1w 16 $25.00, R 135-530.00 No Bid $25 00 Ho Bid Ho Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Spat wylap Ha Bt No Cost Ha Cost [T No Bid 1 o0 No bid Ho Bid No B Ho Bid
79 12R22.5 No Ba No tid
Witness Signature:
Agent Signature: 0

Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Approval Date:

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 18-101046 BID TABULATION
ITB NAME: Purchase of Tires Including Recapping Repakr
Southern Tira Mart
(Bld Na. 1} Atlanta Atlanta
Southern Tire Mart Commnarcial Tire | Commarcial Tira
ITEM DESCRIPTION Best Drive {Bld No. 2) JAR Tire Inc. Nextira Goodyear Tire {pid 1) (Bid 2) Action Tire Midtown Tire
26/32 mud/Snow Cont. HOL1 26/32 $122.10-
792 {Tread & Unit Price) 26313604 dk11 $119.00 26/32 3119 00 Marangani Unitread Moo B 27 ¢181 31 26 $311%.00 16/32 3130 43 No Bid
R120-520 00, R-133
Section w/Cap $20 59 10 1w $25.00, R-135-330.00 N B $25.00 190 $138 0O No Bid
Spot w/Cap 3400 No Cast No Cost H/C Nos B0 $1.00 $0.00 $132 00 No Bid
Ocepest Tiesy
oifered-mud/Snow
3 {Unit Price) Mo Bid 26/32 $119 00 V13 $11% 09 25/32 5112.10 Ho Bid 32 $185 2 No Bl Ho Bid lo ud Ho B
R-120-$20.00, R+133
Sactlon w/Can Ho Bid 10 1 $25.00, R-135-530.00 Ho 8id $25.00 Ho 8id Wo Bid Ho bid Ho Bid
Spot wiCap Ho gid é nona\\ Hp Cast [ Ho By $1.00 Ho Bia Ho tid Ho Bid Ho Sig
A 115/80R22.5 NG Bid Ho Bid
26732 mud/Snow Comt HDLL 26/32 $145.50
A0a ead B Unlt Price) 26 5165 S0 31737 $162.00 J1/3E 5 A0 8 Marangani Usitread Mo Bid 27 $193 10 26 §154 22 26§15 72 26/32 $128.00 No Bid
.ll.l.lll.'l\l
R120-$20.00, R-133- S—
Sectlon w/Cap $20.00 10 100 $25.00, R-135-$30.00 No i $25.00 10 $146.00 Mo Bid
Spat w/Cap 8400 Mo Cost \-\Eﬁl.’r No Bld $100 30 00 300 $130.00 No Bid
ummumu" read
offered -mud/Snow
a0 {Unit Price) No Bid 32732 $160.00 32/32 316000 26/32 $145 50 Ho Bid 32 $214 47 Ho Bid Ho Bld Ho Bid No Bid
A-120-520 00, R-133
Sectlon w/Cap No Bld 1o Loy ’umm,oo. R-135 430.00 Ho Bt $25.00 No Bid Ho Blid No Bid
Spot w/Cap Na Bid No Cost Ho Cost kN h/C / Ho Sed $100 o B fio Bic Na Big
215/75R17 5 Tradler S
B1 Tire Ho Bid Ha B
15/32 (Tread Depth 15732 8107 .60
g1a & Unit Price) 15 $60 00 16/32 $72.00 16732 $72.00 Maranganl Uniread tio Bid 16 585 11 RN GrET TE-T [T
e
Sectlon w/Cap $20.00 1 10 R-120, $2063 Mo Bd 1 98 96 e Bid
Spot wiCap $4.00 Na Cost Ho Cost (U Ha il £000 $84 9 =R
Highway Tread
81b {Tread & unit Price) No Bid 16/32 571 DD 16/32 $72.00 15732 $103 00 N Bid 1637338 Mo Bict Ho Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Lection w/Cap No Bid /L.mpl\\ 1w R-120, $ 20 0O N Bad $25. 00 No B No Big) Mo Bid No Bid
Spot wiCap hin Bid Hag Cost Ho Cast HiC Ho Bed $1.00 ho Bxd No Bia HNo Bid No Big
12RZ24.5-Tread \.\IIIJ//
(32/32):Tread offered 26/32 $131 S0
a2 & unie Price Ho Bid 32/32 4159 00 32/32 8159 00 s Marangani :::RLQ Ho Bid 312707 500 B4 26 $136.00 26 $136.00 32/32 $163 00 Mo Bl
385/65R22.5-21/32
Mud & Snow-Tread 21432 3210 00 21814500 21 $145 00 10732 $149.00
83 oHered B Unit Price Ha Big 20/32 $135 00 20/32 513500 Rngtread Mo Bad 2135239.96 Bandag Bandag (Qliver Pre Cuze) o Big
Seclon wilap Ho Bia 10 10° Ho Bad $25.00 1 wr $167.00 ho B
SPOL w/Lap Ho Bid No Cast to Cost HiA Ho 3 $LU00 30 00 $0 00 $151.00 No Bid
a1
Participation/GFE
{Yes/No) Yex Yes Yes Yes Wl ey es Ve Ve Yl
= -
mandatory LSBE
Meetlag (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Ves Ve Tes T Ve Yes
Vengor subimitied Lost
in Separate Sealed
Envelope (Yet/No) Yes Yas Yes Yes Féi Vex Yk Vad Yes 1]
Vendor Included
Cost In Other Areas
Qutside of Separate
Seated Envelope
{Yes/No) Ha No Ho No Ha /] ke
Witness Signature:

Agent Sigi

Bld Opening Date: January 3, 2019
Cost Opening: January 17, 2019

BOC Award Approval Date.

Tammy Shew



ITB Number: 18-101046

BID TABULATION Bid Opening Date: January 3, 2019

178 NAME: Purchase of Tires tncluding Recapping Repair Cost Opening: January 17, 2019
Tarmmy Shew

-
E.ﬁﬂ:z._.a_...n uz-..n Atlanta Atlanta
Southern Fire Mart Commercial Tize | Commercial Tira
ITEM DESCRIFTION Bast Drive {Bld No. 2) J&R Tira Inc. Neuxtira Goodyaar Tire (bid 1) (bld 2} Action Tirs Midtown Tire
Recommend Awarg 1o the Lowest, Rasponsive and Responsible Bidders
Southern Tire Mart Best Drive Tire, LLC J&R Tire Neatire Comenercial, tne,  Atlanta Commercial Tire Actlan Tire Co. Midtown Tlre
BOO Hwy. 98 10O Hilldnd. Blvd. 350 Bohannon Rd. PO Box 8] 6590 Button Gwinnett Dr 410 Lees Mill Rd. 2916 N. Druid Hills Re.
Columbia, MS 39429 Forest Park, GA 30297 fairburn, GA 20213 Avondale Estates, GA 3000  Doravifle, GA 30340  Forest Park, GA 30297  Attanta, GA 30329
i

BOC Award Approval Date




