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DeKalb County

ITB No.
ITB Name:

19-101074
Sand

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

Bid Opening: 3/21/19

Price Schedule Opening: 4/25/19

Agent: Angel Frazier

Company

@. Shelton

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Estimated #
of Units

Unit

Unit Price

Amount

Sand, price per ton for delivery of 1
to 4 tons to DeKalb County job sites.

2,000

Ton

No Bid

No Bid

Sand, price per ton for DeKalb County
truck pickup of 1 to 4 tons at
Contractor's Facility

2,000

Ton

$22.44

$44,880.00

Sand, price per ton for delivery of 5
or more tons to DeKalb County job
sites.

2,000

Ton

$27.50

$55,000.00

Sand, price per ton for DeKalb County
truck pickup of 5 or more tons at
Contractor's Facility

2,000

Ton

$22.44

$44,880.00

Sand, top dressing or root zone mix,
price per ton for delivery of 1 to 4
tons to DeKalb County job sites.

1,200

Ton

No Bid

No Bid

Sand, top dressing or root zone mix,
price per ton for DeKalb County truck
pickup of 1 to 4 tons at Contractor's
Facility.

1,200

Ton

$22.44

$26,928.00

Sand, top dressing or root zone mix,
price per ton for delivery of 5 or
more tons to DeKalb County job
sites

1,200

Ton

$27.50

$33,000.00

Sand, top dressing or root zone mix,
price per ton for DeKalb County truck
pickup of 5 more tons at Contractor's
Facility

1,200

Ton

$22.44

$26,928.00
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DeKalb County

Sand, washed river, price per ton for
delivery of 1 to 4 tons to DeKalb
County job sites.

1,000

Ton

No Bid

No Bid

10

Sand, washed river, price per ton for
DeKalb County truck pickup of 1 to 4
tons at Contractor's Facility

1,000

Ton

$14.75

$14,750.00

11

Sand, washed river, price per ton
delivery of 5 or more tons to DeKalb
County job sites

1,000

Ton

$35.70

$35,700.00

12

Sand, washed river, price per ton for
DeKalb County truck pickup of 5 or
more tons at Contractor's Facility

1,000

Ton

$14.75

$14,750.00

13

Sand, fine aggregate, price per ton for
delivery of 1 to 4 tons to DeKalb
County job sites

1,000

Ton

No Bid

No Bid

14

Sand, fine aggregate, price per ton for
DeKalb County truck pickup of up to 1
to 4 tons at Contractor's Facility

1,000

Ton

$22.44

$22,440.00

15

Sand, fine aggregate, price per ton for
delivery of 5 or more tons to DeKalb
County job sites

1,000

Ton

$27.50

$27,500.00

16

Sand, fine aggregate, price per ton for
DeKalb County truck pickup of 5 or
more tons at Contractor's Facility

1,000

Ton

$22.44

$22,440.00

17

Sand, masonry, price per ton for
delivery of 1 to 4 tons to DeKalb
County job sites

1,000

Ton

No Bid

No Bid

18

Sand, masonry, price per ton for DeKalb
County truck pickup of 1 to 4 tons at
Contractor's Facility

2,000

Ton

$29.38

$58,760.00

19

Sand, masonry, price per ton per
delivery of 5 or more tons to DeKalb
County job sites

2,000

Ton

$36.88

$73,760.00
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DeKalb County
County truck pickup of 5 or more tons

20 at Contractor's Facility 2,000 Ton $29.38 $58,760.00
TOTAL *$555,988.00
Number of Bids Received:
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE YES
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No) YES
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No) YES

NOTES - DETAIL JUSTIFICATION

* The total price submitted by the vendor was incorrect, F.M. Shelton clarified the pricing and stated the actual total price should be $560,476.00.

Recommendation:
F. M. Shelton Inc.

1434 Ralph D. Abernathy Blvd. SW #1
Atlanta, GA 30310

Witness Signature: Judi Moore :

Digitally signed by Judi Moore

ontracting Department,
Date: 2019.06.03 13:59:07 -0400°

Agent Signature:

Digitally signed by Angel M Frazier
DN: cn=Angel M Frazier, o=Dekalb
. County, ou=Purchasing and
Angel M Frazier contacting,
email=amfrazier@dekalbcountyga.
gov, c=US
Date: 2019.06.03 13:05:53 -04'00"
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