ITB NUMBER: 18-101030 DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING PRICE OPENING: 11/07/2019

ITB NAME: DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE (ANNUAL CONTRACT W/2 OTR) BID TABULATION AGENT NAME: JUDI MOORE
ITEM DESCRIPTION F.M. SHELTON, INC. FORTILINE, INC. CORE & MAIN LP
Estimated
Number of Unit Unit Price | Extended Amount | Unit Price | Extended Amount | Unit Price | Extended Amount
Units

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 3-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
1 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 500 L/F No Bid No Bid $33.45 $16,725.00 $31.79 $15,895.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 4-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
2 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 200 L/F $19.77 $3,954.00 $15.77 $3,154.00 $14.99 $2,998.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 6-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
3 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 8,000 L/F $12.70 $101,600.00 $12.35 $98,800.00 $11.74 $93,920.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 8-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
4 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 100,000 L/F $20.53 $2,053,000.00 $17.41 $1,741,000.00 $16.55 $1,655,000.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 10-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
5 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 1,000 L/F $27.03 $27,030.00 $22.91 $22,910.00 $21.77 $21,770.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 12-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
6 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 5,000 L/F $34.24 $171,200.00 $29.09 $145,450.00 $27.65 $138,250.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 16-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
7 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 2,000 L/F $49.88 $99,760.00 $42.18 $84,360.00 $40.08 $80,160.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 20-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
8 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 1,000 L/F $65.38 $65,380.00 $55.26 $55,260.00 $52.51 $52,510.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 24-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
9 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 500 L/F $82.66 $41,330.00 $69.58 $34,790.00 $66.11 $33,055.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 30-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
10 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 100 L/F No Bid No Bid $105.72 $10,572.00 $100.44 $10,044.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 36-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in
11 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal. 100 L/F No Bid No Bid $142.69 $14,269.00 $135.57 $13,557.00

Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 42-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in

12 accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal 100 L/F No Bid No Bid $188.63 $18,863.00 $179.21 $17,921.00
13 |Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 48-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in 100 L/F No Bid No Bid $272.93 $27,293.00 $259.29 $25,929.00
accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal.
Witness Signature: Randy Webb for Angel Frazier Digitally signed by Randy
Randy Webb =
Agent Signature: Randy Webb for Judi Moore y Date: 2019.12.27 Purchasing Director Signature: BOC Award Approval Date:

18:00:53 -05'00'



ITB NUMBER: 18-101030
ITB NAME: DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE (ANNUAL CONTRACT W/2 OTR)

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

PRICE OPENING: 11/07/2019
AGENT NAME: JUDI MOORE

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.M. SHELTON, INC. FORTILINE, INC. CORE & MAIN LP
Estimated
Number of Unit Unit Price | Extended Amount | Unit Price | Extended Amount | Unit Price | Extended Amount
Units

14  |Pipe, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 54-inch x 18-ft. long, Class 51; in 100 F No Bid No Bid $351.17 $35,117.00 $333.62 $33,362.00
accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal.

15 |Pie, water, ductile iron, cement lined, 54-inch x 18-ft. long, Class S1; in 100 LF No Bid No Bid $424.98 $42,498.00 $403.74 $40,374.00
accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal.
Adapter, Prestressed concrete, 30” Transition, LCP PJ Bell x SPIGOT, Ductile . . . .

16 iron to Concrete (wiaccessories) (use w/7000097) 2 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,185.00 $10,370.00
Adapter, prestressed Concrete 30” Transition, LCP PJ SPIGOT x SPIGOT. . . . .

17 (wiaccessories) (Use w/ 7000096) 2 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,185.00 $10,370.00

18 Adapter, prestressed concrete, 36” transition, LCP PJ Bell x SPIGOT. Ductile 4 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,576.00 $22,304.00
iron to concrete[(w/accessories) (use w/7000099)

19 Adapter, prestress concrete36” Transition, LCP PJ SPIGOT x SPIGOT. Ductile 4 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,576.00 $22,304.00
iron to concrete (w/accessories) (use w/7000098)

20 {\dapter, prestressed concrete. 427, transition, LCP PJ SPIGOT X SPIGOT Ductile 5 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,521.00 $13,042.00
iron to concreter (w/accessories) (use w/ 70000101)

21 Adapter, prestressed concrete 42” transition LCP PJ SPIGOT x SPIGOT, Ductile 2 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,521.00 $13,042.00
iron to Concrete(w/accessories) (use w7000100)

22 Adapter, prestressed concrete 48” transition, LCP PJ BELL x SPIGOT. Ductile 2 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,117.00 $14,234.00
iron to Concrete (w/accessories) (use w/7000103)

23 Adapter, prestressed concrete48” transition, LCP PJ SPIGOT x SPIGOT. (use 5 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,117.00 $14,234.00
w/70000102)
Adapter prestressed concrete 54” transition, LCP PJ BELL x SPIGOT. Ductile . . . .

24 iron to Concrete (w/accessories) (use w/7000104) 1 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,169.00 $9,169.00
Adapter prestressed concrete 54” transition, LCP PJ BELL x SPIGOT. Ductile . . . .

25 iron to Concrete (w/accessories) (use w/7000105) 1 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,169.00 $9,169.00
Adapter, prestressed concrete 60” transition, LCP PJ BELL Xx SPIGOT. Ductile . . . .

26 Iron to Concrete (wiaccessories ) (use w/ 7000107) 1 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,169.00 $9,169.00
Adapter, prestressed concrete 60” transition, LCP PJ BELL Xx SPIGOT. Ductile . . . .

27 Iron to Concrete (w/accessories ) (use w/ 7000107) 1 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,237.00 $10,237.00

Witness Signature: Randy Webb for Angel Frazier

Agent Signature: Randy Webb for Judi Moore

Purchasing Director Signature:

BOC Award Approval Date:




ITB NUMBER: 18-101030

ITB NAME: DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE (ANNUAL CONTRACT W/2 OTR)

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

PRICE OPENING: 11/07/2019
AGENT NAME: JUDI MOORE

ITEM DESCRIPTION F.M. SHELTON, INC. FORTILINE, INC. CORE & MAIN LP
Estimated
Number of Unit Unit Price | Extended Amount | Unit Price | Extended Amount | Unit Price | Extended Amount
Units
Adapter, prestressed concrete 60” transition, LCP PJ SPIGOT x SPIGOT. Ductile ] . . .
28 Iron to Concrete) (w/accessories) (use w/70000106) 1 EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,237.00 $10,237.00
TOTAL - $2,563,254.00- $2,351,061.00- $2,402,626.00>
\/‘

Number of Bids Received: 5%

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE (Yes or No) Yes Yes Yes

Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes or No) Yes Yes Yes

Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes or No) Yes Yes Yes

Core & Main LP
670 Hancock Industrial Way
Athens, GA 30605

Recommend award to the lowest, responsive and responsible bidder:

*Only the Price Schedules for responsive bids were opened and included on this bid tabulation.

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc. and Hayes Pipe Supply, Inc. were deemed non-responsive for failing to meet the LSBE participation benchmark of 20% or demonstrate a Good Faith Effort (GFE).

Witness Signature: Randy Webb for Angel Frazier

Agent Signature: Randy Webb for Judi Moore

Purchasing Director Signature:

BOC Award Approval Date:




	DESCRIPTION: 
	Pipe water ductile iron cement lined 3inch x 18ft long Class 51 in accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications or acceptable equal: 
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