Award recommendation for [FB2000002431

Cost Comparison for IFB 2000002431

Part |

Part I

SCONOGMAWN

11
12
13
Part lll
14
15

Red Wing Brands

18% vendor's retail price shhet

Red
Wing
Price

List

$198.35

%

Discount

18%

RedWing

Price
after

Discount

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$168.09

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Offerred 3 styles

0% accessories discount

Lehigh ValleySafety Shoes

10% vendor's retail price sheet

Lehigh
Price
List
$154.95

$144.95

$184.95
$129.95
$154.95
$189.95
$219.95
$89.95

%

Discount

10%

10%

10%

10%
10%
10%
10%
10%

Lehigh
Price
after

Discount

$139.46
No Bid
$130.46
No Bid
$166.46
$116.96
$139.46
$170.96
$197.96
$80.96
No Bid
No Bid

Offerred 245 styles
0% accesssories discount

Saf-
Gard's
Price List
$186.00
$172.00
$230.00
$120.00
$258.00

$160.00

Saf-Gard Safety Shoe
25% vendor's retail price
sheet

% Discount
25%

25%
25%
25%
25%
25%

Offerred 44 styles
25% accessories discount

Saf-Gard
Price
after

Discount

$139.50
No Bid
$129.00
No Bid
$172.50
$90.00
No Bid
No Bid
$193.50
No Bid
$120.00
No Bid






